1840

RULES AND REGULATIONS

Title 122—COMMERCE,
TRADE AND LOCAL
GOVERNMENT

DEPARTMENT OF COMMUNITY AND ECONOMIC
DEVELOPMENT

[12 PA. CODE CH. 145]
Industrial Housing and Components

The Department of Community and Economic Develop-
ment (Department), under section 5 of the Industrialized
Housing Act (act) (35 P. S. § 1651.5), amends Chapter 145
(relating to industrialized housing and components). The
purpose of this final-form rulemaking is to eliminate the
exception for energy conservation for industrialized
homes, adopt the model code requirements for energy
efficiency bringing industrialized housing on par with the
Pennsylvania Construction Code Act (35 P.S.
88 7210.101—7210.1103) and reduce the number of re-
quired inspections by the Department.

Introduction

The act authorizes the Department to promulgate rules
and regulations to interpret and make specific the provi-
sions of the act. Under section 5 of the act, the rules and
regulations are to be amended to “assure the health,
safety and welfare of the people of Pennsylvania by
requiring safe and sanitary industrial housing and shall
include provisions imposing requirements reasonably con-
sistent with recognized and accepted model codes.” The
purpose of this final-form rulemaking is to provide parity
with conventional housing constructed under the Pennsyl-
vania Construction Code Act and industrialized housing
constructed for other states. Adoption of the model energy
standards will improve energy efficiency in housing pro-
duced and allow manufacturers to utilize newer technol-
ogy in designing heating and cooling systems.

Following the public comment period, minor changes
were made to the proposed rulemaking to clarify the
standards. In § 145.42(a)(2)(iv) (relating to alternate
standards), “stairs” was replaced with “stairways” to
clarify that this standard applied to each stair in the
stairway. In 8§ 145.42(a)(2)(v), the tense of a verb was
changed to make the sentence consistent.

Analysis

Section 145.41 (relating to adoption of standards) is
amended to adopt the ICC International Energy Conser-
vation Code and the ICC International Residential Code
as additional standards applicable to the industrialized
housing and housing components for purposes of this
chapter and to remove the energy conservation and stair
geometry exceptions to the ICC International Building
Code.

Section 145.42 is amended to provide the International
Energy Conservation Code and Pennsylvania’s Alterna-
tive Residential Energy Provisions as the alternatives to
§ 145.41 with respect to energy efficiency. The ICC
International Residential Code is removed as an alterna-
tive because it is a standard in § 145.41. The amendment
also provides alternate standards regarding stairway
construction.

Section 145.93 (relating to factory inspections; right of
entry) is amended to replace the biannual inspection
requirement with an annual inspection requirement.

Fiscal Impact

Commonwealth. While striving to reduce the number of
required inspections per year at each plant, the Depart-
ment estimates the total number of inspections will
remain unchanged. This is in part a result of additional
production facilities seeking approval each year and
increased inspections at warranted plants once granted
the ability to focus Department inspection efforts.

Political subdivisions. There will be no fiscal impact on
political subdivisions.

Public. Increased costs to the industry will be negli-
gible. The majority of manufacturers presently exceeds
the current provisions and builds homes that comply with
the proposed standard.

Paperwork

The final-form rulemaking will not change existing
paperwork requirements.

Regulatory Review

Under section 5(a) of the Regulatory Review Act (71
P. S. 8 745.5(a)), on July 7, 2006, the Department submit-
ted a copy of the notice of proposed rulemaking, published
at 36 Pa. B. 3820 (July 22, 2006), to the Independent
Regulatory Review Commission (IRRC) and the Chairper-
sons of the House Commerce and Economic Development
Committee and the Senate Community and Economic
Development Committee for review and comment.

Under section 5(c) of the Regulatory Review Act, IRRC
and the Committees were provided with copies of the
comments received during the public comment period, as
well as other documents when requested. In preparing
the final-form rulemaking, the Department has consid-
ered all comments from IRRC, the House and Senate
Committees and the public.

Under section 5.1(j.2) of the Regulatory Review Act (71
P. S. 8§ 745.5a(j.2)), on April 4, 2007, the final-form rule-
making was deemed approved by the House and Senate
Committees. Under section 5(g) of the Regulatory Review
Act, the final-form rulemaking was deemed approved by
IRRC, effective April 4, 2007.

Effective Date/Sunset Date

The final-form rulemaking will become effective on
June 20, 2007. The regulations are monitored on a
regular basis and updated as needed.

Contact Person

Interested persons are invited to submit in writing
comments, suggestions or objections regarding the final-
form rulemaking to Matthew J. Speicher, Assistant Coun-
sel, Office of Chief Counsel, Department of Community
and Economic Development, Commonwealth Keystone
Building, 4th Floor, 400 North Street, Harrisburg, PA
17120, (717) 720-7317; or Mark Conte, Chief, Housing
Standards Division, Office of Community Development,
Department of Community and Economic Development,
Commonwealth Keystone Building, 4th Floor, 400 North
Street, Harrisburg, PA 17120, (717) 720-7416.

Findings
The Department finds that:

PENNSYLVANIA BULLETIN, VOL. 37, NO. 16, APRIL 21, 2007



RULES AND REGULATIONS 1841

(1) Public notice of intention to adopt the amendments
adopted by this order has been given under sections 201
and 202 of the act of July 31, 1968 (P. L. 769, No. 240) (45
P. S. 88 1201 and 1202) and the regulations thereunder, 1
Pa. Code 8§ 7.1 and 7.2.

(2) The final-form rulemaking is necessary and appro-
priate.

Order

The Department, acting under the authorizing statute,
orders that:

() The regulations of the Department, 12 Pa. Code
Chapter 145, are amended by amending 8§ 145.41 and
145.93 to read as set forth at 36 Pa.B. 3820 and by
amending § 145.42 to read as set forth in Annex A.

(b) The Department shall submit this order, 36 Pa.B.
3820 and Annex A to the Office of Attorney General and
the Office of General Counsel for approval as to legality
as required by law.

(¢) The Secretary shall certify this order, 36 Pa.B. 3820
and Annex A and deposit them with the Legislative
Reference Bureau as required by law.

(d) This order shall take effect June 20, 2007.

DENNIS YABLONSKY,
Secretary

(Editor’s Note: For the text of the order of the Indepen-
dent Regulatory Review Commission, relating to this
document, see 37 Pa.B. 1197 (March 10, 2007).)

Fiscal Note: Fiscal Note 4-85 remains valid for the
final adoption of the subject regulations.

Annex A

TITLE 12. COMMERCE, TRADE AND LOCAL
GOVERNMENT

PART V. COMMUNITY AFFAIRS AND
DEVELOPMENT

Subpart C. COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT AND
HOUSING

CHAPTER 145. INDUSTRIAL HOUSING AND
COMPONENTS

STANDARDS
§ 145.42. Alternate standards.

(&) As an alternative to the primary codes specified in
§ 145.41 (relating to adoption of standards), a manufact-
urer may elect to satisfy the requirements of the following
alternate standards. Copies of these documents are avail-
able through the respective promulgating agencies as
defined in § 145.47 (relating to acquisition of adopted
codes and amendments):

(1) As an alternate to the ICC International Residen-
tial Code, Chapter 11, regarding energy efficiency, the
manufacturer may use one of the following:

(i) The prescriptive methods for residential buildings in
the International Energy Conservation Code compliance
guide containing State maps, prescriptive energy pack-
ages and related software published by the United States
Department of Energy, Building Standards and Guide-
lines Program (REScheck™).

(if) Pennsylvania’s Alternative Residential Energy Pro-
visions developed by the Pennsylvania Housing Research
Center at the Pennsylvania State University.

(2) As an alternate to the ICC International Residen-
tial Code, Chapter 3, regarding building planning, in
regards to stairway construction, the manufacturer may
use the following standard:

(i) The maximum riser height must be 8 1/4 inches.
There may be no more than 3/8 inch variation in riser
height within a flight of stairs. The riser height is to be
measured vertically between leading edges of the adjacent
treads.

(ii) The minimum tread depth must be 9 inches mea-
sured from tread nosing to tread nosing. There may be no
more than 3/8 inch variation in tread depth within a
flight of stairs.

(iii) Treads may have a uniform projection of not more
than 1 1/2 inches when solid risers are used.

(iv) Stairways may not be less than 3 feet in clear
width and clear head room of 6 feet 8 inches must be
maintained for the entire run of the stairway.

(v) Handrails may project from each side of a stairway
a distance of 3 1/2 inches into the required width of the
stairway.

(b) Except as provided in § 145.43 (relating to amend-
ment policy), the codes must be the latest edition. The
effective date of code changes must be in accordance with
88 145.44 and 145.122(b) (relating to adoption and effec-
tive dates—code amendments; and effective date).

[Pa.B. Doc. No. 07-680. Filed for public inspection April 20, 2007, 9:00 a.m.]

Title 58—RECREATION

PENNSYLVANIA GAMING CONTROL BOARD

[58 PA. CODE CHS. 401, 433, 435, 437,
441 and 443]

Licensing, Permitting, Certification and Registra-
tion Programs for Principals, Employees, Ven-
dors and Slot Machine Licensees

Under the Pennsylvania Gaming Control Board's
(Board) Resolutions No. 2005-3-REG, 2005-6-REG and
2005-4-REG the Board has the authority to amend the
temporary regulations adopted on June 16, 2005, Novem-
ber 2, 2005, and July 21, 2005 as it deems necessary in
accordance with the purpose of 4 Pa.C.S. Part Il (relating
to gaming), enacted by the act of July 5, 2004 (P. L. 572,
No. 71) (Act 71), as amended by the act of November 1,
2006 (P. L. 1243, No. 135) and to further the intent of Act
71. To respond to changes in the Board’s licensing,
permitting, certification and registration programs for
principals, employees, vendors and slot machine licensees,
the Board has decided to make changes to the temporary
regulations, dated June 16, 2005, November 2, 2005, and
July 21, 2005, as deposited with the Legislative Reference
Bureau (Bureau) and published at 35 Pa.B. 4045 (July 16,
2005), 35 Pa.B. 6411 (November 19, 2005) and 35 Pa.B.
4543 (August 6, 2005).

Therefore, the Board has deposited with the Bureau
amendments to Chapters 401, 433, 435, 437 and 441 and
the rescission of Chapter 443. The amendments and
rescission are effective as of March 27, 2007.

PENNSYLVANIA BULLETIN, VOL. 37, NO. 16, APRIL 21, 2007



1842 RULES AND REGULATIONS

The temporary regulations of the Board in Chapters
401, 433, 435, 437, 441 and 443 are amended by amend-
ing Chapters 401, 433, 435, 437 and 441 and rescinding
Chapter 443 to read as set forth in Annex A.

Order

The Board, acting under the authorizing statute, orders
that:

(@) The Board, acting under the authority of Act 71,
adopts the amendments to the temporary regulations
adopted by resolution at the March 27, 2007, public
meeting. The amendments to the temporary regulations
pertain to the Board’s licensing, permitting, certification
and registration programs for principals, employees, ven-
dors and slot machine licensees.

(b) The following temporary regulations of the Board,
58 Pa. Code, Chapters 401, 433, 435, 437, 441 and 443,
are amended by amending 88 401.4, 435.1, 435.3—435.6,
435.8—435.10, 437.1—437.3, 437.5, 437.7, 437.10, 441.1—
441.3 and 441.8; by adding 88 433.101—433.109, 435.4a,
435.9a, 437.4a, 437.4b, 437.4c, 437.4d, 437.13, 441.4a,
441.5a, 441.6a, 441.7a, 441.9a, 441.10a, 441.114a, 441.12a,
441.13a, 441.14a, 441.15a, 441.16a, 441.17a, 441.18a,
441.19a, 441.20, 441.21a, 441.22a and 441.23a; and by
deleting 88 433.1, 435.2, 435.7, 437.4, 437.6, 437.8, 437.9,
437.11, 437.12, 441.4—441.7, 441.9—441.19, 441.21—
441.23 and 443.1—443.5 to read as set forth in Annex A,
with ellipses referring to the existing text of the regula-
tions.

() The amendments are effective March 27, 2007.

(d) The amendments to the temporary regulations shall
be posted in their entirety on the Board’'s website and
published in the Pennsylvania Bulletin.

(e) The Chairperson of the Board shall certify this
order and deposit the amendments to the temporary
regulations with the Bureau as required by law.

THOMAS A. DECKER,
Chairperson

Fiscal Note: 125-65. (1) Pennsylvania Gaming Fund;

Board State Police

(2) Implementing Year $10,454,000 $372,000
2006-07 is

(3) 1st Succeeding Year $9,696,000 $387,000
2007-08 is

2nd Succeeding Year $10,083,000 $402,000
2008-09 is

3rd Succeeding Year $10,487,000 $418,000
2009-10 is

4th Succeeding Year $10,906,000 $435,000
2010-11 is

5th Succeeding Year $11,342,000 $452,000
2011-12 is

Board State Police

(4) 2005-06 Program— $13,200,000 $0

2004-05 Program— $2,900,000 $0

2003-04 Program— $0 $0

(7) Board Budget and State Police Budget; (8) recom-
mends adoption.

Annex A
TITLE 58. RECREATION
PART VII. GAMING CONTROL BOARD
Subpart A. GENERAL PROVISIONS
CHAPTER 401. PRELIMINARY PROVISIONS
§ 401.4. Definitions

The following words and terms, when used in this part,
have the following meanings, unless the context clearly
indicates otherwise:

* * * * *

Gaming employee—

(i) An employee of a slot machine licensee, including:
(A) Cashiers.

(B) Change personnel.

(C) Count room personnel.

(D) Slot attendants.

(E) Hosts or other persons authorized to extend compli-
mentary services.

(F) Machine mechanics or computer machine techni-
cians.

(G) Security personnel.
(H) Surveillance personnel.
() Supervisors and managers.

(J) Personnel with SLOTS Link security administrator
access and responsibilities.

(if) Employees of a licensed supplier, manufacturer or
manufacturer designee whose duties are directly involved
with the installation, repair, service or distribution of slot
machines and associated equipment sold or provided to a
licensed facility within this Commonwealth.

(iii) Employees of a licensed manufacturer or manufact-
urer designee whose duties require the employee’s pres-
ence on the gaming floor or in a restricted area of a
licensed facility.

(iv) Other employees that the Board determines, after
a review of the work being performed, require a permit
for the protection of the integrity of gaming.

* * * * *

Key employee—
An individual who is:

(i) Employed in a director or department head capacity
and who is empowered to make discretionary decisions
that regulate slot machine operations in this Common-
wealth, including the general manager and assistant
manager of the licensed facility, director of slot opera-
tions, director of cage operations, director of surveillance,
director of marketing, director of management informa-
tion systems, director of security, director of human
resources, comptroller and any employee who supervises
the operations of these departments or to whom these
department directors or department heads report.

(ii) Employed by a slot machine licensee, manufacturer
licensee or supplier licensee whose duties affect or require
contact with slot machines, slot monitoring systems,
casino management systems, player tracking systems and
wide-area progressive systems for use or play in this
Commonwealth, whether or not the individual is assigned
to gaming operations in this Commonwealth.

PENNSYLVANIA BULLETIN, VOL. 37, NO. 16, APRIL 21, 2007



RULES AND REGULATIONS 1843

(iii) A sales representative seeking to sell slot machines
and associated equipment for use in this Commonwealth
on behalf of a licensed manufacturer, manufacturer desig-
nee or supplier

(iv) Employed in other positions which the Board will
determine based on detailed analyses of the employee’s
duties or the job descriptions.

* * * * *

Nongaming employee—An employee of a slot machine
licensee or certified vendor who is not included within the
definition of “principal,” “key employee” or “gaming em-
ployee” and:

(i) Whose job duties require the employee:

(A) To be on the gaming floor but do not require the
employee to touch or have contact with slot machines or
associated equipment other than exterior cleaning.

(B) To be in a restricted area and the employee:

(1) Is under the constant supervision of an employee of
the slot machine licensee who is licensed or permitted
and has appropriate access clearance to be in the re-
stricted area.

(1) Is not required to touch or have contact with slot
machines or associated equipment other than exterior
cleaning.

(ii) Who the Board determines, after a review of the
work being performed, requires registration for the pro-
tection of the integrity of gaming.

* * * * *

CHAPTER 433. PRINCIPAL LICENSES
§ 433.1. (Reserved).
§ 433.101. Definitions.

The following words and terms, when used in this
chapter, have the following meanings, unless the context
clearly indicates otherwise:

Applicant—A person that has submitted an application
to the Board for a slot machine license, manufacturer
license, manufacturer designee license, supplier license,
management company license or junket enterprise li-
cense.

Director—A director of a corporation or any person
performing similar functions with respect to an entity,
whether incorporated or unincorporated.

Entity—A person, other than an individual.

Holding company—A person, other than an individual,
that, directly or indirectly, owns, has the power or right to
control or has the power or right to vote 20% or more of
the outstanding voting securities of a corporation or other
entity. A holding company indirectly has, holds or owns
that power, right or security if it does so through an
interest in a subsidiary or successive subsidiaries.

Indirect ownership interest—An ownership interest in
an entity that has a direct ownership interest in an
applicant or licensee, or a direct ownership interest in an
entity that has a ownership interest in an applicant or
licensee through one or more intervening entities.

Individual—A natural person.

Licensee—A person who has been issued a slot machine
license, manufacturer license, manufacturer designee li-
cense, supplier license, management company license or
junket enterprise license.

Lending institution—A person who has been issued a
license to lend money by a state or federal agency or a
person who satisfies the definition of “qualified institu-
tional buyer” under 17 CFR 230.144a (relating to private
resales of securities to institutions).

Officer—A president, chief executive officer, chief oper-
ating officer, secretary, treasurer, principal legal officer,
principal compliance officer, principal financial officer,
comptroller, principal accounting officer, chief engineer or
technical officer of a manufacturer, or principal slot
operations officer of a slot machine licensee and any
person routinely performing corresponding functions with
respect to an entity whether incorporated or unincorpo-
rated.

Principal affiliate—An intermediary or holding com-
pany of an applicant or licensee.

Principal entity—An entity that meets the definition of
principal in section 1103 of the act (relating to definitions)
or is otherwise required to be licensed as a principal and
is not an intermediary or holding company of an appli-
cant or licensee.

Private investment fund—An entity that meets the
definition of “investment company” under section 3(a)(1)
of the Investment Company Act of 1940 (15 U.S.C.A.
80a-3(a)(1)), but is otherwise exempt from the definition
of “investment company” under section 3(c)(7) of the
Investment Company Act of 1940.

Registered investment adviser—An investment adviser
that has registered with the SEC under the Investment
Advisers Act of 1940 (15 U.S.C.A. 88 80b-1—80b-21).

Registered investment company—An investment com-
pany that has registered with the SEC under the Invest-
ment Company Act of 1940 (15 U.S.C.A. §§ 80a-1—80a-
64).

Voting security—A security or other interest which
entitles the owner to vote for the election of:

(i) A director of a corporation.

(ii) A person performing functions similar to a director
with respect to an organization, whether incorporated or
unincorporated.

§ 433.102. Directors or officers.

(@) Each officer and director of an applicant or licensee
shall be licensed as a principal.

(b) Each officer and director of an intermediary, subsid-
iary or holding company of a slot machine applicant or
licensee shall be licensed as a principal.

(c) Each officer and director of an intermediary or
holding company of a licensed supplier, licensed manu-
facturer, licensed manufacturer designee, licensed junket
enterprise or licensed management company shall be
licensed as a principal.

(d) Notwithstanding subsection (b), an officer or direc-
tor of a publicly traded intermediary or holding company
of a slot machine applicant or licensee, who is not a
member of the audit committee, may request that the
Board waive his requirement to be licensed as a principal
if he is not actively involved in the affairs of the slot
machine applicant or licensee. The waiver request shall
be submitted on a Principal/Key Employee Waiver Form,
and require that the officer certify that he is not actively
involved in the affairs of the slot machine applicant or
licensee.

PENNSYLVANIA BULLETIN, VOL. 37, NO. 16, APRIL 21, 2007



1844 RULES AND REGULATIONS

(e) Notwithstanding subsection (c), an outside director
of an publicly traded intermediary or holding company of
a licensed supplier, licensed manufacturer, licensed manu-
facturer designee, licensed junket enterprise or licensed
management company who is not a member of the audit
committee of the intermediary or holding company may
not be licensed as a principal unless the Board deter-
mines that the licensure of the individual is necessary to
protect the integrity of gaming in this Commonwealth.

(f) Notwithstanding subsection (c), an officer of a pub-
licly traded intermediary or holding company of a licensed
supplier, licensed manufacturer, licensed manufacturer
designee, licensed junket enterprise or licensed manage-
ment company may request that the Board waive his
requirement to be license as a principal if he is not
actively involved in the affairs of the applicant or licen-
see. The waiver request shall be submitted on a Principal/
Key Employee Waiver Form and require that the officer
certify that he is not actively involved in the affairs of the
applicant or licensee.

§ 433.103. Individual ownership.

(a) An individual who has a direct ownership interest
in, or has a right to any profit, distribution or benefit
directly from, an applicant or licensee shall be licensed as
a principal.

(b) An individual who, indirectly or directly, has the
power to control or direct the management or policies of
an applicant or licensee shall be licensed as a principal.

(¢) An individual who has a direct ownership interest
in, or has a right to any profit, distribution or benefit
directly from, an intermediary or holding company of a
slot machine applicant or licensee shall be licensed as a
principal.

(d) An individual that has a 1% or greater indirect
ownership interest in an applicant or licensee shall be
licensed as a principal. An ownership interest that is held
indirectly by an individual through one or more interven-
ing entities will be determined by successive multiplica-
tion of the ownership percentages for each link in the
vertical chain.

(e) Notwithstanding any provision to the contrary in
this section, an individual who holds less than 5% of the
voting securities of an applicant or licensee or an inter-
mediary or holding company of an applicant or licensee
that is a publicly traded company is not required to be
licensed as a principal.

(f) Each individual who is a grantor, trustee or benefi-
ciary of a trust that is required to be licensed as a
principal under this chapter shall be licensed as a
principal.

(g) The Board may require any individual who has a
financial interest in, or receives an economic benefit from,
an applicant or licensee to be licensed as a principal.

§ 433.104. Entity ownership.

(a) An intermediary, subsidiary or holding company of
an applicant or licensee shall be licensed as a principal.

(b) An entity that, indirectly or directly, has the power
to control or direct the management or policies of an
applicant or licensee shall be licensed as a principal.

(c) An entity that has a direct ownership interest in, or
has a right to any profit, distribution or benefit directly
from, an applicant or licensee shall be licensed as a
principal.

(d) An entity that has a direct ownership interest in, or
has a right to any profit, distribution or benefit directly
from, an intermediary, subsidiary or holding company of a
slot machine applicant or licensee, shall be licensed as a
principal.

(e) An entity that has an indirect ownership interest of
5% or greater in an applicant or licensee shall be licensed
as a principal. An ownership interest that is held indi-
rectly by an entity through one or more intervening
entities will be determined by successive multiplication of
the ownership percentages for each link in the vertical
chain.

(f) Notwithstanding subsection (e), a private invest-
ment fund, including its feeder funds, that has an
indirect ownership interest in an applicant or licensee,
shall be exempt from obtaining a principal license if the
following apply:

(1) Neither the private investment fund, nor the inves-
tors in the private investment fund have any voting
rights or any other power to control or to influence the
applicant or licensee.

(2) At least 20% of the investors in the private invest-
ment fund are ‘“institutional investors” as defined in
§ 401.4 (relating to definitions).

(3) No investor in the private investment fund has a
right to redeem his interest in the private investment
fund within 2 years of the purchase of the interest.

(4) Each individual and entity that has the ability to
control the management of the private investment fund is
licensed as a principal.

(5) The private investment fund agrees to provide the
Board with information the Board deems necessary to
evaluate the integrity of the private investment fund and
its investors, and their compliance with this section.
Information provided to the Board will be confidential.

(6) Each individual required to be licensed as a princi-
pal in paragraph (4) shall as part of his principal license
application sign a notarized statement affirming, at a
minimum, the following:

(i) The private investment fund's investment in the
applicant or licensee will not violate any applicable
United States, Commonwealth of Pennsylvania or inter-
national laws and regulations, including anti-money laun-
dering regulations or conventions, the Internal Revenue
Code of 1986, the Employee Retirement Income Security
Act of 1974, the Securities Act of 1933, the Securities
Exchange Act of 1934, the Investment Company Act of
1940 and the Investment Advisers Act of 1940.

(if) To his best knowledge, no investor in the private
investment fund:

(A) Holds an interest in the private investment fund in
contravention of any applicable United States, Common-
wealth of Pennsylvania or international laws and regula-
tions, including anti-money laundering regulations or
conventions, the Internal Revenue Code of 1986, the
Employee Retirement Income Security Act of 1974, the
Securities Act of 1933, the Securities Exchange Act of
1934, the Investment Company Act of 1940 and the
Investment Advisers Act of 1940.

(B) Is directly or indirectly affiliated with, a prohibited
country, territory, individual or entity on the List of
Specially Designated Nationals and Blocked Persons
maintained by the United States Treasury Department's
Office of Foreign Asset Control.

PENNSYLVANIA BULLETIN, VOL. 37, NO. 16, APRIL 21, 2007



RULES AND REGULATIONS 1845

(C) Is currently charged with or is under indictment for
any felony or gambling offense in any jurisdiction.

(D) Has been convicted of a felony where 15 years have
not elapsed from the date of expiration of the sentence for
the offense.

(g) A private investment fund that does not qualify for
the exemption under subsection (f) solely on the basis
that it fails to satisfy paragraph (3) of that subsection,
may still qualify for an exemption from licensure if the
private investment fund satisfies all of the other condi-
tions under subsection (f) and its indirect ownership
interest in the applicant or licensee is less than 10%.

(h) Notwithstanding any provision to the contrary, the
Board may require any entity that has a financial
interest in, or receives any economic benefit from, an
applicant or licensee to be licensed as a principal.

§ 433.105. Institutional investors.

(@) Notwithstanding any provision to the contrary in
this chapter, an institutional investor that owns less than
15% of the outstanding voting securities of a publicly
traded intermediary or holding company of an applicant
for or holder of a manufacturer license, manufacturer
designee license, supplier license, management company
license or junket enterprise license shall not be required
to be licensed as a principal if the following conditions are
satisfied:

(1) The institutional investor or the applicant or licen-
see files a notice with the Board containing a description
of the institutional investor’'s interests.

(2) The institutional investor has filed a Schedule 13G
with the SEC, and the institutional investor continues to
be eligible to file the Schedule 13G.

(b) Notwithstanding any provision to the contrary in
this chapter, an institutional investor that owns less than
10% of the outstanding voting securities of an intermedi-
ary or holding company of a slot machine licensee or
applicant shall be eligible to be receive a waiver from the
requirements of licensure from the Board by filing a
Principal/Key Employee Waiver Form. The waiver request
must include, at a minimum, a certification by the
institutional investor stating that the institutional inves-
tor has no present involvement in, and no intention of
influencing or affecting the affairs of, the slot machine
applicant or licensee or an intermediary or holding com-
pany of the slot machine applicant or licensee and will
give the Board 30 days notice if the institutional investor
intends to do so.

(c) Notwithstanding subsection (b), an institutional in-
vestor that has been granted a waiver shall be permitted
to vote on matters put to the vote of the outstanding
security holders.

(d) A holding company of an institutional investor may
file a notice or waiver request on behalf of its institu-
tional investor subsidiaries provided that the holding
company does not own more than 5% or more of the
securities of the intermediary or holding company of the
applicant or licensee.

(e) A registered investment adviser or a holding com-
pany of a registered investment adviser may file a notice
or waiver request, when permitted, on behalf of the
registered investment companies that hold securities ben-
eficially owned by the registered investment adviser.

§ 433.106. Lenders and underwriters.

(@) Each lender of a slot machine applicant or licensee
shall be licensed as a principal.

(b) Notwithstanding subsection (a), a lender that is a
bank or lending institution which makes a loan to a slot
machine applicant or licensee in the ordinary course of
business is not required to be licensed as a principal. The
Board may require a bank or lending institution to
provide information or other assurances to verify its
eligibility for this exemption.

(c) An underwriter that acquires the securities of a slot
machine applicant or licensee shall be licensed as a
principal.

(d) An underwriter or lender of an intermediary, sub-
sidiary or holding company of a slot machine applicant or
licensee shall be required to be licensed as a principal if
the Board determines that the suitability of the under-
writer or lender is at issue and is necessary to consider a
pending application for a slot machine license.

(e) Notwithstanding any provision to the contrary in
this section, the Board may require the licensure of any
lender or underwriter of a licensee or any holding or
intermediary company or subsidiary of a licensee to
produce information, documentation and assurances con-
cerning the lender or underwriter if the Board has
probable cause to believe that the lender or underwriter
would not satisfy the character requirements of section
1310(a) of the act (relating to slot machine license
application character requirements).

§ 433.107. Trusts.

(a) A trust or similar business entity that holds a direct
ownership interest in an applicant or licensee shall be
licensed as a principal.

(b) A trust or similar business entity that holds a 1% or
greater indirect ownership interest in an applicant or
licensee shall be licensed as a principal. An ownership
interest that is held indirectly by an entity through one
or more intervening entities will be determined by succes-
sive multiplication of the ownership percentages for each
link in the vertical chain.

(c) A trust or similar business entity that receives any
payment, percentage or share of revenue, profits or
receipts directly from an applicant or licensee shall be
licensed as a principal.

(d) A trust or similar business entity will not be issued
a principal license unless each trustee, grantor and
beneficiary, including a minor child beneficiary, has been
granted a principal license.

(e) Notwithstanding any provision to the contrary in
this section, a trust is not required to be licensed as a
principal if the holdings of the trust consist of less than
5% of the voting securities of a publicly traded company.

§ 433.108. Principal applications.

(@) An individual required to be licensed as a principal
shall file a completed Multi Jurisdictional Personal His-
tory Disclosure Form and the Pennsylvania Supplement
to the Multi Jurisdictional Personal History Disclosure
Form and submit the applicable application fee.

(b) A principal entity required to be licensed as a
principal shall file a completed Principal Entity Form and
submit the applicable application fee.

(c) A principal affiliate shall apply for the principal
license as if were itself applying for the slot machine
license, manufacturer license, manufacturer designee li-
cense, supplier license, management company license or
junket enterprise license.

PENNSYLVANIA BULLETIN, VOL. 37, NO. 16, APRIL 21, 2007



1846 RULES AND REGULATIONS

(d) In addition to the materials required under subsec-
tions (a) or (b), an applicant for a principal license shall:

(1) Promptly provide information requested by the
Board relating to the principals’ application or regulation
and cooperate with the Board in investigations, hearings
and enforcement and disciplinary actions.

(2) Comply with the general application requirements
in Chapters 421 and 423 (relating to general provisions;
and applications).

§ 433.109 Principal license term and renewal.

(&) A principal license or renewal shall be valid for 1
year from the date on which the license or renewal is
approved by the Board.

(b) A renewal application and renewal fee shall be filed
at least 2 months prior to the expiration of the current
license.

(c) A principal license for which a completed renewal
application and fee has been received by the Board will
continue in effect until the Board sends written notifica-
tion to the holder of the principal license that the Board
has approved or denied the license.

CHAPTER 435. EMPLOYEES
§ 435.1. General provisions.

(&) An individual seeking a key employee license, occu-
pation permit or nongaming employee registration shall
apply to the Board as required by this chapter.

(b) In addition to the materials required under
88 435.3, 435.4 and 435.5 (relating to key employee
license; occupation permit; and nongaming employee reg-
istration), an applicant shall:

(1) Promptly provide information requested by the
Board relating to its application or regulation and cooper-
ate with the Board in investigations, hearings and en-
forcement and disciplinary actions.

(2) Comply with the general application requirements
in Chapters 421 and 423 (relating to general provisions;
and applications).

(¢) An individual who receives a license, permit or
registration under this part shall have the continuing
duty to report to the Board an arrest, charge, indictment
or conviction for an offense under 18 Pa.C.S. (relating to
crimes and offenses), or an offense under 75 Pa.C.S.
§ 3802 (relating to driving under influence of alcohol or
controlled substance) or of comparable offenses in other
states or foreign jurisdictions.

(d) The holder of a key employee license, occupation
permit or nongaming employee registration shall provide
an updated photograph at the request of the Board.

(¢) An individual may not be employed in this Com-
monwealth by an applicant for or holder of a license,
certification or registration under this part in any capac-
ity unless the individual is a citizen of the United States
or can demonstrate that he holds a current and valid
work authorization and is not restricted from working in
the capacity for which employment is sought or held.
Authorization to work in the United States may be
demonstrated by submitting one of the following:

(1) A permanent resident alien card.
(2) A temporary employment authorization card.

(3) A document which the Board deems to be sufficient
evidence or authorization.

(f) A license or permit will not be issued to an indi-
vidual who has been convicted of a felony or gambling
offense in any jurisdiction unless 15 years have elapsed
from the date of expiration of the sentence for the offense.

(9) When considering an application for a registration
from an individual who has been convicted of a felony or
gaming offense in any jurisdiction or an application for a
license or permit from an individual who has been
convicted of a felony or gaming offense in any jurisdiction
when 15 years have elapsed from the date of expiration of
the sentence for the offense, the Board will consider:

(1) The nature and duties of the applicant’'s position
with the licensed entity.

(2) The nature and seriousness of the offense or con-
duct.

(3) The circumstances under which the offense or con-
duct occurred.

(4) The age of the applicant when the offense or
conduct was committed.

(5) Whether the offense or conduct was an isolated or a
repeated incident.

(6) Evidence of rehabilitation, including good conduct
in the community, counseling or psychiatric treatment
received and the recommendation of persons who have
substantial contact with the applicant.

(h) An individual who holds a license or permit may
not wager at any licensed facility in this Commonwealth.

(i) A registrant or employee who is not required to
obtain a license or a permit may not wager at the
licensed facility in which the registrant or employee is
employed.

(i) A licensed, permitted or registered employee shall
wait at least 30 days following the date that the employee
either leaves employment with a slot machine licensee or
is laid off or terminated from employment with a slot
machine licensee before the employee may wager at the
licensed facility in which the employee was formerly
employed.

(k) An individual required to obtain a license or permit
by this part shall demonstrate that he is current and not
in arrears on any financial obligation owed to this
Commonwealth or any subdivision thereof, including
court-ordered child support payments.

§ 435.2. (Reserved).
§ 435.3. Key employee license.

(@) An applicant for a key employee license from the
Board shall submit:

(1) An original and three copies of the Multi Jurisdic-
tional Personal History Form and the Principal/Key Em-
ployee Form—Pennsylvania Supplement to the Multi
Jurisdictional Personal History Disclosure Form unless
otherwise directed by the Board.

(2) A nonrefundable application fee.

(b) In addition to the materials required under subsec-
tion (a), an applicant for a key employee license shall:

(1) Promptly provide information requested by the
Board relating to its application or regulation and cooper-
ate with the Board in investigations, hearings and en-
forcement and disciplinary actions.

(2) Comply with the general application requirements
in Chapters 421 and 423 (relating to general provisions;
and applications).

PENNSYLVANIA BULLETIN, VOL. 37, NO. 16, APRIL 21, 2007



RULES AND REGULATIONS 1847

(c) In addition to the information under subsections (a)
and (b), the Board may require letters of reference from
law enforcement agencies under section 1310(b) of the
act.

(d) An applicant for a key employee license will be
required to reimburse the Board for any additional costs,
based on the actual expenses incurred by the Board, in
conducting the background investigation.

(e) After review of the information submitted under
subsections (a), (b) and (c), including the background
investigation, the Board may issue a key employee license
if the individual applicant has proven by clear and
convincing evidence that the individual is a person of
good character, honesty and integrity and is eligible and
suitable to be licensed as a key employee.

(f) A license issued under this section will be nontrans-
ferable.

() An individual who is a key employee may request
in writing that the Board waive the obligation to be
licensed as a key employee by:

(1) Filing an original and three copies of a Principal/
Key Employee Waiver Form.

(2) A nonrefundable waiver application fee.

(h) As part of the waiver request, the individual shall
be required to demonstrate one of the following:

(1) The individual is not assigned to an applicant’'s or
licensee’s gaming operations in this Commonwealth.

(2) The individual’'s duties do not have an effect on or
require contact with slot machines for use or play in this
Commonwealth.

(i) The request for a waiver must include, at a mini-
mum, the following:

(1) A description of the individual’s title, duties and
responsibilities with the applicant, licensee or with any of
its affiliates, intermediaries, subsidiaries or holding com-
panies.

(2) A certification by the chief executive officer stating
that the employee is not assigned to the licensee’s gaming
operations in this Commonwealth or that the employee’s
duties do not have an effect on or require contact with
slot machines for use or play in this Commonwealth

(J)) An applicant for a key employee waiver will be
required to reimburse the Board for any additional costs,
based on the actual expenses incurred by the Board, in
conducting the background investigation.

§ 435.4. Occupation permit.
(@) An applicant for an occupation permit shall submit:

(1) An original and three copies of the Gaming Em-
ployee Application and Disclosure Information Form or an
electronic application using the SLOTS Link system.

(2) A nonrefundable application fee.

(3) Verification of an offer of employment from a li-
censed entity.

(b) In addition to the materials required under subsec-
tion (a), an applicant for an occupation permit shall:

(1) Promptly provide information requested by the
Board relating to its application or regulation and cooper-
ate with the Board in investigations, hearings, and
enforcement and disciplinary actions.

(2) Comply with the general application requirements
in Chapters 421 and 423 (relating to general provisions;
and applications).

(c) An applicant for an occupation permit may be
required to reimburse the Board for any additional costs,
based on the actual expenses incurred by the Board, in
conducting the background investigation.

(d) After review of the information submitted under
subsections (a) and (b), including a background investiga-
tion, the Board may issue a permit if the individual has
proven that the individual is a person of good character,
honesty and integrity and is eligible and suitable to hold
an occupation permit.

(e) An individual who wishes to receive an occupation
permit under this chapter may authorize an applicant for
or holder of a slot machine, management company, manu-
facturer, manufacturer designee or supplier license or
vendor certification to file an application on the individu-
al's behalf.

(f) A permit issued under this section shall be non-
transferable.

§ 435.4a. Key employee license and occupation per-
mit term and renewal.

(&) A key employee license or occupation permit issued
under this chapter will be valid for 1 year from the date
of Board approval.

(b) A renewal application shall be submitted to the
Board at least 60 days prior to the expiration of a key
employee license or occupation permit.

(c) A key employee license or occupation permit for
which a completed renewal application and fee has been
received by the Board will continue in effect until the
Board sends written notification to the holder of the key
employee license or occupation permit that the Board has
approved or denied the key employee license or occupa-
tion permit.

§ 435.5. Nongaming employee registration.

(@) An applicant for a nongaming employee registration
shall submit:

(1) An original and three copies of the Nongaming
Employee Registration Form or an electronic application
using the SLOTS Link system.

(2) A nonrefundable application fee.

(b) In addition to the materials required under subsec-
tion (a), an applicant for a nongaming employee registra-
tion shall:

(1) Promptly provide information requested by the
Board relating to its application or regulation and cooper-
ate with the Board in investigations, hearings, and
enforcement and disciplinary actions.

(2) Comply with the general application requirements
in Chapters 421 and 423 (relating to general provisions;
and applications).

(c) After review of the information required under
subsections (a) and (b), the Board may register the
individual if the individual has proven that he is eligible
and suitable to be registered under this section.

(d) An individual who wishes to receive a nongaming
employee registration under this chapter may authorize
an applicant for or holder of a slot machine license or a
vendor certification to file an application on the individu-
al's behalf.

PENNSYLVANIA BULLETIN, VOL. 37, NO. 16, APRIL 21, 2007



1848 RULES AND REGULATIONS

§ 435.6. Board credentials.

(@) The following individuals shall obtain a Board
credential:

(1) A principal whose duties are required to be per-
formed at a licensed facility in excess of 12 days in a
12-month period.

(2) Key employees.
(3) Gaming employees.
(4) Nongaming employee registrants.

(5) State employees whose duties require the employ-
ee’s presence at a licensed facility more frequently than
once a month.

(b) The credential will contain the following informa-
tion:

(1) The name, address, date of birth, sex, height,
weight, hair color and eye color of the licensee, permittee
or registrant.

(2) A photograph of the face of the individual to whom
the credential has been issued which meets the standards
of the Commonwealth Photograph Imaging Network.

(3) The inscription “Pennsylvania Gaming Control
Board.”

(4) The seal of the Commonwealth.

(5) A license, permit or registration number.

(6) The type of license, permit or registration.

(7) An expiration date.

(8) The signature of the employee.

(9) Other security features as determined by the Board.

(¢) An individual required to obtain a Board credential
shall carry the Board credential on his person at all times
while engaged in the performance of his duties on the
premises of a licensed facility.

(d) Except as provided in § 435.8 (relating to emer-
gency credentials), slot machine and management com-
pany licensees are prohibited from allowing a principal
who is required to obtain a credential, key employee,
gaming employee or nongaming employee registrant to
perform his duties on the premises of a licensed facility
unless the employee has his Board-issued credential.

(e) Notwithstanding subsection (a), the Board may,
upon written request by a slot machine or management
company licensee and upon a showing of good cause,
exempt certain positions, titles or persons from the
requirements of this section.

(f) An employee whose license, permit or registration
has been suspended or revoked by the Board shall
surrender the Board credential to the Board.

§ 435.7. (Reserved).
§ 435.8. Emergency credentials.

(@) An emergency credential obtained from the Board
may be issued by the security department of a slot
machine licensee to a principal, key employee, gaming
employee or nongaming employee of the slot machine
licensee who does not have the credential on his person,
or whose credential has been stolen, lost or destroyed, to
enable the employee to perform the employee’s duties at
the licensed facility, if the security department of the slot
machine licensee performs the following prior to issuing
the emergency credential:

(1) Verifies that the employee is listed in the slot
machine licensee’s current employee status report.

(2) Verifies that the employee holds a valid license,
permit or registration.

(3) Confirms the employment and licensure, permit or
registration information of the employee with the supervi-
sor of the employee.

(4) Verifies that fewer than 12 emergency credentials
have been issued to the particular employee in the past
12 months.

(5) Maintains, in writing, an emergency credentials log
containing the following information:

(i) The name and license, permit or registration num-
ber of the employee to whom the emergency credential
was issued.

(if) The date and time that the emergency credential
was issued.

(iii) The name and license, permit or registration num-
ber of the slot machine licensee security department
employee issuing the emergency credential.

(iv) The badge number of the emergency credential
that was issued.

(b) Each slot machine licensee shall submit a copy of
its emergency credential log for the preceding year to the
Bureau of Licensing by January 15 of the following year.

(c) Emergency credentials:

(1) Will be valid for a time period not to exceed 72
hours.

(2) Will be sequentially numbered.

(3) Must be stored in the offices of the security depart-
ment and distributed by that department in accordance
with this section and the slot machine licensee’s proce-
dures submitted to and approved by the Board.

§ 435.9. Temporary credentials for principals and
key employees.

(@) A temporary credential may be issued by the Board
to a principal or a key employee whose investigation for
licensure by the Board is pending but whose presence is
necessary in the licensed facility.

(b) A temporary credential issued under this section is
void 120 days after the date of its issuance.

(c) The Board may extend the expiration date of a
temporary credential if the Board determines additional
time is needed to complete the investigation for licensure.

§ 435.9a. Temporary credentials for nongaming em-
ployees.

(@) A temporary credential may be issued by the Board
to a nongaming employee if:

(1) The applicant has submitted all of the application
materials required under § 435.5 (relating to nongaming
employee registration).

(2) The applicant has been fingerprinted and photo-
graphed by the Pennsylvania State Police.

(b) Temporary credentials for nongaming employees
will be issued by the Bureau.

(c) A temporary credential issued under this section
will be valid for 30 days.

PENNSYLVANIA BULLETIN, VOL. 37, NO. 16, APRIL 21, 2007



RULES AND REGULATIONS 1849

§ 435.10. Loss or destruction of credentials.

(@) As soon as possible, but no later than 24 hours,
following the loss or destruction of a Board credential,
emergency credential or temporary credential, the person
to whom the credential was originally issued shall notify
the security department of the slot machine licensee.

(b) The security department of the slot machine licen-
see shall notify the Board in writing within 24 hours and
may issue an emergency credential in accordance with
§ 435.8 (relating to emergency credentials).

(¢) An employee who has lost his Board credential may
request a duplicate Board credential by submitting a
Request for Duplicate PGCB Credential form and the fee
established by the Board to the Bureau of Licensing.

CHAPTER 437. VENDOR CERTIFICATION AND
REGISTRATION

§ 437.1. General vendor requirements.

(&) A vendor seeking to conduct business with a slot
machine applicant or licensee, except as provided in
8 437.10 (relating to emergency vendor), shall apply to
the Board for registration if:

(1) The total dollar amount of business will be or is
anticipated to be greater than $15,000 but $200,000 or
less with a single slot machine applicant or licensee
within a consecutive 12-month period.

(2) The total dollar amount of business will be or is
anticipated to be greater than $15,000 but $500,000 or
less with multiple slot machine applicants or licensees
within a consecutive 12-month period.

(b) A vendor seeking to conduct business with a slot
machine applicant or licensee, except as provided in
§ 437.10 shall apply to the Board for certification if:

(1) The total dollar amount of business will be or is
anticipated to be greater than $200,000 with a single slot
machine applicant or licensee within a consecutive 12-
month period.

(2) The total dollar amount of business will be or is
anticipated to be greater than $500,000 with multiple slot
machine applicants or licensees within a consecutive
12-month period.

(3) The vendor's employees will have access to re-
stricted areas or the gaming floor.

(4) The Board notifies the vendor that certification is
required based upon the Board's analysis of the vendor’s
services.

(c) The following persons are exempt from the vendor
registration and the vendor certification requirements of
this chapter:

(1) Public utilities which provide only one or more of
the following services to a slot machine applicant or
licensee:

(i) Water.

(ii) Sewerage.
(iii) Electricity.
(iv) Natural gas.

(2) Regulated insurance companies providing insurance
to a slot machine applicant or licensee and its employees.

(3) Employee benefit and retirement plans and related
administrator including incorporated 401K plans and
employee stock purchase programs.

(4) National or local professional associates that receive
funds from the slot machine applicant or licensee for the
cost of enrollment, activities and membership.

(5) State, Federal and municipal operated agencies.

(6) Manufacturers and suppliers of liquor, wine and
beer regulated by th