
NOTICES
DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE

General Quarantine Order; Swine Exhibition Re-
quirements

Recitals
A. African Swine Fever is a highly contagious hemor-

rhagic viral disease affecting domestic and wild swine.
B. There is no vaccine to protect swine against African

Swine Fever, nor is there a known cure or treatment for
this dangerous transmissible disease.

C. African Swine Fever has a high environmental
resistance and can be spread by domestic or wild swine,
whether alive or dead, and through raw and processed
pork products. African Swine Fever does not cause dis-
ease in humans and is not a public health threat.

D. African Swine Fever is known to be transmissible
from infected to uninfected swine through contact and via
contaminated feed and fomites (non-living objects) such
as shoes, clothes, vehicles, equipment and any other
goods, products, facilities, specific insect vectors (soft
ticks), containers and other objects with which infected
swine—alive or dead—may come into contact.

E. Section 2321 of the Domestic Animal Law (Law)
establishes a list of ‘‘dangerous transmissible diseases’’
and provides for the designation of additional dangerous
transmissible diseases through regulation or temporary
order (3 Pa.C.S.A. § 2321).

F. African Swine Fever (ASF) is specifically designated
as a dangerous transmissible disease at section 2321(a)(3)
of the Law (3 Pa.C.S.A. § 2321(a)(3)).

G. The Domestic Animal Law (Law) (3 Pa.C.S.A.
§§ 2301—2389) and section 1702 of the Administrative
Code of 1929 (71 P.S. § 442), provides the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture (PDA) broad authority to
regulate the keeping and handling of domestic animals to
exclude, contain or eliminate dangerous transmissible
diseases, such as ASF.

H. This includes authority, set forth at section 2329 of
the Law, to establish and enforce quarantine orders
‘‘Whenever a dangerous transmissible disease. . .exists
anywhere within or outside of this Commonwealth. . .the
department shall have the power to establish and enforce
quarantines of any such infected, exposed, contaminated,
suspected or susceptible domestic animal. In addition, a
quarantine may apply to any goods, products, facilities,
containers, vehicles or materials that may carry danger-
ous transmissible disease. . .and may be applied on or in
or against any premises, area or locality. . .’’ (3 Pa.C.S.A.
§ 2329(a)).

I. Section 2329(d) of the Law provides specific author-
ity to establish and enforce a general quarantine order
‘‘. . .against any area or locality within this Common-
wealth for any of the reasons set forth in subsection (a) to
prevent a dangerous transmissible disease. . .from being
carried into, within, from or out of the area or locality
that is subject to the quarantine. A general quarantine
order may include any domestic animals, conveyances,
containers, goods, products or materials that may carry
dangerous transmissible disease. . .and may include any
area or locality, including all buildings, structures, prem-
ises and equipment located therein.’’ (3 Pa.C.S.A.
§ 2329(d))

J. ASF is found in countries around the world, particu-
larly in sub-Saharan Africa. To date, 11 Asian countries
have reported outbreaks since August 2018, including
Indonesia, Mongolia, North Korea, South Korea, China,
the Philippines, Vietnam, Laos, Cambodia, Myanmar and
Timor-Leste. China has confirmed more than 163 cases of
ASF and has lost an estimated 200 million swine which
amounts to thirty-three percent of all the pigs in the
world. The disease is also spreading within the European
Union (EU), and the virus has reached 10 member states
of the EU.

K. Although ASF has not been detected in North
America, Central America or South America, it is impor-
tant to note ASF is rapidly spreading and has reached
South Korea and the Philippines. Currently, there are
only 6,000 miles separating the continental United States
from this devastating disease.

L. Pennsylvania is ranked 12th nationally for pork
production and 5th nationally for number of swine pro-
cessed. ASF presents serious threats to animal health and
the economic vitality of the Commonwealth’s swine pro-
duction industry. Introduction of ASF into the commercial
swine herds of this Commonwealth would result in severe
economic losses to the infected herd owners as well as
loss of valuable National and International trade opportu-
nities for all of Pennsylvania’s pork producers.

M. The PDA through this Quarantine Order estab-
lishes reasonable requirements to allow for movement of
swine and products within this Commonwealth for exhibi-
tion purposes, while protecting against the introduction of
ASF into this Commonwealth’s commercial production
swine population.

Order of Quarantine:

With the foregoing recitals incorporated into this Order
of Quarantine by reference, the Pennsylvania Department
of Agriculture (PDA) under authority of the Domestic
Animal Law, at 3 Pa.C.S.A. § 2329(d) and section 1702 of
the Administrative Code of 1929 (71 P.S. § 442), hereby
establishes a General Order of Quarantine related to the
dangerous transmissible disease African Swine Fever
(ASF) and the shipment and holding of swine, alive or
dead, and any conveyances, containers, goods, products or
materials capable of harboring ASF, within and through
the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania. The following are
the conditions, restrictions and requirements of this Or-
der:

1. Quarantine Area. The area covered by this General
Quarantine Order is the entire Commonwealth of Penn-
sylvania.

2. Applicability and Time Period of Order. The terms,
provisions and requirements of this Order are applicable
to all live and dead swine, swine manure, swine offal and
swine germplasm, and any conveyances, containers,
goods, products or materials capable of harboring ASF
located within or to be shipped through or in the
Commonwealth of Pennsylvania (Quarantine Area), from
the effective date of this Order until the time this Order
is rescinded in writing by the PDA.

3. Definitions. The following terms when used in this
Order have the following meanings:

Accredited veterinarian. A licensed veterinarian jointly
accredited by APHIS-USDA and the Department in the
state the veterinarian is licensed to perform official duties
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on behalf of APHIS-USDA or the Department in the state
the veterinarian is licensed to practice veterinary medi-
cine. See accreditation standards established by 9 CFR
Parts 160 and 161 (relating to definition of terms; and
requirements and standards for accredited veterinarians
and suspension or revocation of such accreditation).

Animal Exhibition. Any temporary spectacle, display,
event, exhibition or act featuring performing animals
including, but not limited to, circuses, pony rides, animal
exhibits, weight pull events, and petting zoos. This
definition shall exclude zoologic exhibits and Pennsylva-
nia Game Commission menagerie permit holders.

Breeding swine. A sexually intact swine 6 months of age
or older or a sexually intact swine 5 months of age or
younger selected for producing offspring.

Certificate of Veterinary Inspection (ICVI). An official
document issued by a federal, state, tribal, or accredited
veterinarian certifying that the animals identified on the
document have been inspected and were found to satisfy
the regulations pertaining to their intended movement—
within the same state, between states, or internationally.

Direct movement to slaughter. Transported to a facility
for slaughter, without stops or unloading except for
feeding and watering, during which the animals are not
commingled with any other animals unless all are des-
tined for slaughter.

Market swine. A swine that is registered and entered in
a PDA-sponsored market swine class, weighing at least
210 pounds and approximately 6 months old.

Pennsylvania health certificate. A legible official docu-
ment, made on a form (AAI-13) provided by the Depart-
ment, prepared by an accredited Pennsylvania veterinar-
ian or a representative of the Department certifying the
health of animals described therein according to the
health requirements established by this chapter.

Recognized slaughter establishment. A slaughter estab-
lishment operated under the Federal Meat Inspection Act
(21 U.S.C.A. §§ 601—623, 641—645, 661, 671—680 and
691) or a State inspected slaughter establishment.

Slaughter market. An animal market approved by the
Department for the sale of slaughter animals in accord-
ance with Chapter 5 (relating to animal markets) and the
act of June 22, 1931 (P.L. 650, No. 225) (3 P.S. §§ 431—
439), known as the Farm Animal Dealer or Broker
License Law.

Swine Health Monitor. A Swine Health Monitor (SHM)
is a person who is familiar with swine and can recognize
when swine are sick, has met the training and standards
set forth in this quarantine order, and has been appointed
by a fair board or livestock show committee to assess
swine health.

Veterinarian-Client-Patient Relationship. A veterinarian-
client-patient-relationship (VCPR) is defined by the
American Veterinary Medical Association as the basis for
interaction among veterinarians, their clients, and their
patients and is critical to the health of an animal. A
VCPR means that all of the following are required:

a. The veterinarian has assumed the responsibility for
making clinical judgments regarding the health of the
patient and the client has agreed to follow the veterinar-
ians’ instructions.

b. The veterinarian has sufficient knowledge of the
patient to initiate at least a general or preliminary
diagnosis of the medical condition of the patient. This
means that the veterinarian is personally acquainted

with the keeping and care of the patient by virtue of a
timely examination of the patient by the veterinarian, or
medically appropriate and timely visits by the veterinar-
ian to the operation where the patient is managed.

c. The veterinarian is readily available for follow-up
evaluation or has arranged for the following: veterinary
emergency coverage, and continuing care and treatment.

d. The veterinarian provides oversight of treatment,
compliance, and outcome.

e. Patient records are maintained.

4. Swine health monitor requirements. A Swine Health
Monitor (SHM) shall meet the following standards, dem-
onstrate the following skills and perform the following
duties.

a. A SHM shall undergo annual web-based training
provided by the Pennsylvania Department of Agriculture.

b. At the conclusion of such training, the SHM appli-
cant shall be required to pass an examination, meaning
the applicant shall obtain a score of 75% or better, and
upon successful completion, will be granted a certificate of
completion allowing them to seek appointment, as set
forth in this Order, to perform swine health monitoring
duties for one year.

c. A SHM shall maintain a current working knowledge
base, to be able to recognize animal health parameters,
and identify clinical signs suggestive of foot and mouth
disease (FMD), Classical Swine fever (CSF), and African
Swine Fever (ASF), and other diseases that may become
of consequence.

d. As part of their duties, a SHM shall monitor and
assess the health of exhibition animals prior to unloading
upon arrival, and on a daily basis during the totality of
the animal exhibition.

e. Upon arrival of any swine at an animal exhibition, a
SHM shall assess the health of each animal prior to the
swine being allowed to unload from the conveyance.

f. A SHM shall not permit any animal showing any
form of sickness or illness or any clinical signs suggestive
of ASF, CSF or FMD, or any other animal on the same
conveyance, to unload from the conveyance and shall
notify the Veterinarian holding the VCPR with the fair
board or livestock show committee (VCPR veterinarian)
for examination and final health assessment of all ani-
mals on the conveyance prior to unloading.

g. Where the SHM finds it necessary to notify the
VCPR veterinarian, no swine or animal on the convey-
ance shall be unloaded until the VCPR veterinarian has
completed a final examination and health assessment of
all animals on the conveyance and provided written
documentation to the SHM that each animal if free from
ASF, CSF, FMD, and any other suspected or identified
disease of consequence.

h. During the exhibition, the SHM shall daily observe
all swine at the exhibition and keep daily records of those
observations to be reviewed with the VCPR veterinarian.

i. The SHM shall immediately report, and document
such report in writing, providing the identification of the
animal, date of report and suspicious disease signs, any
clinical signs suggestive of FMD, CSF, ASF, or any other
suspected or identified disease of consequence, to the
VCPR veterinarian.

j. The VCPR veterinarian shall follow up on the SHM
report by examining the animal and notify the State
Animal Health Official (SAHO) when appropriate. All
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such examinations shall be documented by the VCPR
veterinarian in writing and provide the identification of
the animal examined, the date of the examination, what
disease assessment or testing was done and the final
health assessment of the VCPR veterinarian.

5. Exhibition Requirements. Fair boards and livestock
show committees shall establish a VCPR veterinarian and
appoint a SHM for all animal exhibitions. No swine
species shall be unloaded at an animal exhibition or
exhibited in this Commonwealth unless each animal
meets all the following criteria:

a. Is accompanied by a Pennsylvania health certificate
or ICVI that was issued by a licensed and accredited
veterinarian not more than 14 days before the date of the
animal exhibition.

b. Shall be permanently identified by an official
840 series radio frequency identification (RFID) ear tag
and the ear tag number recorded on the Pennsylvania
health certificate or ICVI.

c. Any swine that does not have an 840 RFID tag at
the time of arrival at the animal exhibition, shall not be
unloaded and shall be returned to the premises from
which it originated.

d. Where the swine does not have an 840 RFID tag at
the time of purchase by an exhibitor, a tag may be
acquired by one of the following methods:

i. Apply for premises ID through PDA and purchase
840 RFID tags through a distributor.

ii. Request an 840 RFID tag from an accredited veteri-
narian whom you hold with a veterinarian-client-patient-
relationship.

e. Has been visually inspected for signs of disease prior
to unloading at the exhibition by an accredited veterinar-
ian, VCPR veterinarian or a SHM appointed by the fair
board or livestock show committee or both, as required by
Section 4. of this Order.

f. The SHM shall immediately report, in the manner
required by Section 4 of this Order, any clinical signs of
disease to the VCPR veterinarian holding the
veterinarian-client-patient-relationship with the fair
board or livestock show committee.

g. The VCPR veterinarian shall immediately follow up
by examining the animal and notify the SAHO when
appropriate and shall issue such written reports as are
required in Section 4 of this Order.

h. Any swine showing signs of illness upon arrival at
the animal exhibition shall not be permitted to unload
and shall be reported to the accredited veterinarian
holding the veterinarian-client-patient-relationship with
the show or fair board.

6. Exhibition Timing and Order. All breeding swine
animal exhibitions are to occur prior to the arrival of any
market swine. Breeding swine shall be removed from the
animal exhibition premises prior to any market swine
arriving. Breeding swine animal exhibitions, excluding
birthing or educational displays which are not competing,
shall arrive, exhibit, and depart in a period no greater
than 72 hours.

7. Birthing Exhibitions. Swine birthing exhibitions and
educational displays which are not competing may occur
concurrently with market swine animal exhibition as long
as reasonable precaution is taken to ensure separation of
the birthing swine and market swine, no cross-
contamination between the two separate exhibition areas
and the biosecurity of the swine birthing exhibition or
educational display.

8. PDA sponsored animal exhibitions. All market swine
exhibited in PDA sponsored animal exhibitions, fairs and
market shows, along with meeting all other requirements
of this Order, shall move directly to a PDA or USDA
licensed slaughter facility following the animal exhibition
and may not be diverted to premises other than a
recognized slaughter establishment or a slaughter market
in which the sales are designated slaughter only sales.

9. Non-PDA sponsored animal exhibitions. Non-PDA
Sponsored animal exhibitions and shows including jack-
pot shows and 4-H roundups not occurring during a PDA
sponsored animal exhibition, fair or show, where arrival,
exhibition and departure of the swine occur within a
72 hour window and there is no public access to the
animals other than observation during competitions,
while being required to meet all other requirements of
this Order, shall be exempt from the terminal slaughter
requirement listed in paragraph 8.

10. Conveyance, goods and other materials. All convey-
ances, containers, goods, products or materials in contact
with swine being shipped within or through the Common-
wealth of Pennsylvania for animal exhibition shall be
cleaned and disinfected in accordance with the following:

a. A conveyance used for the transportation of swine to
animal exhibitions, fairs and shows shall be cleaned and
disinfected by an exhibitor prior to each use and shall be
free of visible accumulations of manure, bedding and
other organic materials.

b. At the conclusion of swine animal exhibitions, fairs
and shows and after all swine have left the premises, the
fair board or livestock show committee shall ensure all
holding pens and animal exhibition areas have had all
bedding and other organic material removed and all
areas, including fences, gates, stalls, holding pens, con-
tainers, housing, coming in contact with or through which
swine were moved shall be put through the fair board or
livestock show committee’s cleaning and disinfection pro-
cess.

11. Violations/Penalties. Any person violating the re-
quirements of this Order shall be subject to enforcement
and penalties as are allowed under the provisions of the
Domestic Animal Law (3 Pa.C.S.A. § 2301 et seq.), which
include, revocation of license, criminal prosecution, civil
penalties of up to $10,000 per violation, injunctive relief
or any combination of these penalties.

12. No Restriction on Further Action by PDA. This
Order shall not be construed as limiting PDA’s authority
to establish additional quarantine or testing requirements
or take any actions otherwise permitted under applicable
statute or regulation.

13. Contact information. Questions regarding this Gen-
eral Quarantine Order is to the Commonwealth of Penn-
sylvania, Department of Agriculture, Bureau of Animal
Health, 2301 North Cameron Street, Harrisburg, PA
17110 or by telephone at 717-772-2852, or email at
RA-ahds@pa.gov.

14. Effective Date. This Order replaces any previous
order related to swine exhibition requirements and is
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immediately effective upon the date of publication in the
Pennsylvania Bulletin, and shall remain in effect unless
rescinded or modified by subsequent order.

RUSSELL C. REDDING,
Secretary

[Pa.B. Doc. No. 21-1123. Filed for public inspection July 16, 2021, 9:00 a.m.]

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE
Interstate and International Quarantine Order;

Swine Exhibition Requirements

Recitals
A. African Swine Fever (ASF) is a highly contagious

hemorrhagic viral disease affecting domestic and wild
swine.

B. There is no vaccine to protect swine against African
Swine Fever, nor is there a known cure or treatment for
this dangerous transmissible disease.

C. African Swine Fever has a high environmental
resistance and can be spread by domestic or wild swine,
whether alive or dead, and through raw and processed
pork products. African Swine Fever does not cause dis-
ease in humans and is not a public health threat.

D. African Swine Fever is known to be transmissible
from infected to uninfected swine through contact and via
contaminated feed and fomites (non-living objects) such
as shoes, clothes, vehicles, equipment and any other
goods, products, facilities, specific insect vectors (soft
ticks), containers and other objects with which infected
swine—alive or dead—may come into contact.

E. Section 2321 of the Domestic Animal Law (Law)
establishes a list of ‘‘dangerous transmissible diseases’’
and provides for the designation of additional dangerous
transmissible diseases through regulation or temporary
order (3 Pa.C.S.A. § 2321).

F. African Swine Fever (ASF) is specifically designated
as a dangerous transmissible disease at section 2321(a)(3)
of the Law (3 Pa.C.S.A. § 2321(a)(3)).

G. The Domestic Animal Law (Law) (3 Pa.C.S.A.
§§ 2301—2389) and section 1702 of the Administrative
Code of 1929 (71 P.S. § 442), provides the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture (PDA) broad authority to
regulate the keeping and handling of domestic animals to
exclude, contain or eliminate dangerous transmissible
diseases, such as ASF.

H. This includes authority, set forth at section 2329 of
the Law, to establish and enforce quarantine orders
‘‘Whenever a dangerous transmissible disease. . .exists
anywhere within or outside of this Commonwealth. . .the
department shall have the power to establish and enforce
quarantines of any such infected, exposed, contaminated,
suspected or susceptible domestic animal. In addi-
tion, . . .a quarantine may apply to any goods, products,
facilities, containers, vehicles or materials that may carry
dangerous transmissible disease. . .and may apply on or
in or against any premises, area or locality. . .’’
(3 Pa.C.S.A. § 2329(a)).

I. Section 2329(c) of the Law provides specific authority
to establish and enforce an interstate and international
quarantine order, stating, ‘‘An intestate or international
quarantine may be established and enforced by order of

the department against any place or places outside this
Commonwealth for any of the reasons set forth in subsec-
tion (a) or where dangerous transmissible diseases. . .are
reported to exist. An intestate or international quarantine
may prohibit the bringing of any domestic animals,
conveyances, containers, goods, products or materials into
this Commonwealth except in accordance with the re-
quirements set forth in the quarantine order. . .’’
(3 Pa.C.S.A. § 2329(c)).

J. ASF is found in countries around the world, particu-
larly in sub-Saharan Africa. To date, 11 Asian countries
have reported outbreaks since August 2018, including
Indonesia, Mongolia, North Korea, South Korea, China,
the Philippines, Vietnam, Laos, Cambodia, Myanmar and
Timor-Leste. China has confirmed more than 163 cases of
ASF and has lost an estimated 200 million swine which
amounts to thirty-three percent of all the pigs in the
world. The disease is also spreading within the European
Union (EU), and the virus has reached 10 member states
of the EU.

K. Although ASF has not been detected in North
America, Central America or South America, it is impor-
tant to note ASF is rapidly spreading and has reached
South Korea and the Philippines. Currently, there are
only 6,000 miles separating the continental United States
from this devastating disease.

L. Pennsylvania is ranked 12th nationally for pork
production and 5th nationally for number of swine pro-
cessed. ASF presents serious threats to animal health and
the economic vitality of the Commonwealth’s swine pro-
duction industry. Introduction of ASF into the commercial
swine herds of this Commonwealth would result in severe
economic losses to the infected herd owners as well as
loss of valuable National and International trade opportu-
nities for all of Pennsylvania’s pork producers.

M. The PDA through this Quarantine Order estab-
lishes reasonable requirements to allow for movement of
swine and products into and within this Commonwealth
for exhibition purposes, while protecting against the
introduction of ASF into this Commonwealth’s commercial
swine population.

Order of Quarantine:

With the foregoing recitals incorporated into this Order
of Quarantine by reference, the Pennsylvania Department
of Agriculture (PDA) under authority of the Domestic
Animal Law, at 3 Pa.C.S.A. § 2329(c) and section 1702 of
the Administrative Code of 1929 (71 P.S. § 442), hereby
establishes an Interstate and International Order of
Quarantine related to the dangerous transmissible dis-
ease African Swine Fever (ASF) and the importation or
shipment of swine, alive or dead, and any conveyances,
containers, goods, products or materials capable of har-
boring ASF, into and through the Commonwealth of
Pennsylvania. The following are the conditions, restric-
tions and requirements of this Order:

1. Quarantine Area. This Interstate and International
Quarantine Order is applicable to all states and territo-
ries of the United States and foreign countries and
territories and the entire Commonwealth of Pennsylva-
nia.

2. Applicability and Time Period of Order. The terms,
provisions and requirements of this Order are applicable
to all live and dead swine, swine manure, swine offal and
swine germplasm, and any conveyances, containers,
goods, products or materials capable of harboring ASF to
be shipped through, in or into the Commonwealth of
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Pennsylvania, from the effective date of this Order until
the time this Order is rescinded in writing by the PDA.

3. Definitions. The following terms when used in this
Order have the following meanings:

Accredited veterinarian. A licensed veterinarian jointly
accredited by APHIS-USDA and the Department in the
state the veterinarian is licensed to perform official duties
on behalf of APHIS-USDA or the Department in the state
the veterinarian is licensed to practice veterinary medi-
cine. See accreditation standards established by 9 CFR
Parts 160 and 161 (relating to definition of terms; and
requirements and standards for accredited veterinarians
and suspension or revocation of such accreditation).

Animal Exhibition. Any temporary spectacle, display,
event, exhibition or act featuring performing animals
including, but not limited to, circuses, pony rides, animal
exhibits, weight pull events, and petting zoos. This
definition shall exclude zoologic exhibits and Pennsylva-
nia Game Commission menagerie permit holders.

Breeding swine. A sexually intact swine 6 months of
age or older or a sexually intact swine 5 months of age or
younger selected for producing offspring.

Direct movement to slaughter. Transported to a facility
for slaughter, without stops or unloading except for
feeding and watering, during which the animals are not
commingled with any other animals unless all are des-
tined for slaughter.

Interstate Certificate of Veterinary Inspection (ICVI). An
official document issued by a federal, state, tribal, or
accredited veterinarian certifying that the animals identi-
fied on the document have been inspected and were found
to satisfy the regulations pertaining to their intended
movement—within the same state, between states, or
internationally.

Market swine. A swine that is registered and entered in
a PDA-sponsored market swine class, weighing at least
210 pounds and approximately 6 months old.

Recognized slaughter establishment. A slaughter estab-
lishment operated under the Federal Meat Inspection Act
(21 U.S.C.A. §§ 601—623, 641—645, 661, 671—680 and
691) or a State inspected slaughter establishment.

Slaughter market. An animal market approved by the
Department for the sale of slaughter animals in accord-
ance with Chapter 5 (relating to animal markets) and the
act of June 22, 1931 (P.L. 650, No. 225) (3 P.S. §§ 431—
439), known as the Farm Animal Dealer or Broker
License Law.

Swine Health Monitor. A Swine Health Monitor (SHM)
is a person who is familiar with swine and can recognize
when swine are sick, has met the training and standards
set forth in this quarantine order, and has been appointed
by a fair board or livestock show committee to assess
swine health.

Veterinarian-Client-Patient Relationship. A veterinarian-
client-patient-relationship (VCPR) is defined by the
American Veterinary Medical Association as the basis for
interaction among veterinarians, their clients, and their
patients and is critical to the health of an animal. A
VCPR means that all of the following are required:

a. The veterinarian has assumed the responsibility for
making clinical judgments regarding the health of the
patient and the client has agreed to follow the veterinar-
ians’ instructions.

b. The veterinarian has sufficient knowledge of the
patient to initiate at least a general or preliminary

diagnosis of the medical condition of the patient. This
means that the veterinarian is personally acquainted
with the keeping and care of the patient by virtue of a
timely examination of the patient by the veterinarian, or
medically appropriate and timely visits by the veterinar-
ian to the operation where the patient is managed.

c. The veterinarian is readily available for follow-up
evaluation or has arranged for the following: veterinary
emergency coverage, and continuing care and treatment.

d. The veterinarian provides oversight of treatment,
compliance, and outcome.

e. Patient records are maintained.

4. Swine health monitor requirements. A Swine Health
Monitor (SHM) shall meet the following standards, dem-
onstrate the following skills and perform the following
duties.

a. A SHM shall undergo annual web-based training
provided by the Pennsylvania Department of Agriculture.

b. At the conclusion of such training, the SHM appli-
cant shall be required to pass an examination, meaning
the applicant shall obtain a score of 75% or better, and
upon successful completion, will be granted a certificate of
completion allowing them to seek appointment, as set
forth in this Order, to perform swine health monitoring
duties for one year.

c. A SHM shall maintain a current working knowledge
base, to be able to recognize animal health parameters,
and identify clinical signs suggestive of foot and mouth
disease (FMD), Classical Swine Fever (CSF), and African
Swine Fever (ASF), and other diseases that may become
of consequence.

d. As part of their duties, a SHM shall monitor and
assess the health of exhibition animals prior to unloading
upon arrival, and on a daily basis during the totality of
the animal exhibition.

e. Upon arrival of any swine at an animal exhibition, a
SHM shall assess the health of each animal prior to the
swine being allowed to unload from the conveyance.

f. A SHM shall not permit any animal showing any
form of sickness or illness or any clinical signs suggestive
of ASF, CSF or FMD, or any other animal on the same
conveyance, to unload from the conveyance and shall
notify the Veterinarian holding the VCPR with the fair
board or livestock show committee (VCPR veterinarian)
for examination and final health assessment of all ani-
mals on the conveyance prior to unloading.

g. Where the SHM finds it necessary to notify the
VCPR veterinarian, no swine or animal on the convey-
ance shall be unloaded until the VCPR veterinarian has
completed a final examination and health assessment of
all animals on the conveyance and provided written
documentation to the SHM that each animal if free from
ASF, CSF, FMD, and any other suspected or identified
disease of consequence.

h. During the exhibition, the SHM shall daily observe
all swine at the exhibition and keep daily records of those
observations to be reviewed with the VCPR veterinarian.

i. The SHM shall immediately report, and document
such report in writing, providing the identification of the
animal, date of report and suspicious disease signs, any
clinical signs suggestive of FMD, CSF, ASF, or any other
suspected or identified disease of consequence, to the
VCPR veterinarian.
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j. The VCPR veterinarian shall follow up on the SHM
report by examining the animal and notify the State
Animal Health Official (SAHO) when appropriate. All
such examinations shall be documented by the VCPR
veterinarian in writing and provide the identification of
the animal examined, the date of the examination, what
disease assessment or testing was done and the final
health assessment of the VCPR veterinarian.

5. Exhibition Requirements. Fair boards and livestock
show committees shall establish a VCPR veterinarian and
appoint a SHM for all animal exhibitions. No swine
species shall be unloaded at an animal exhibition or
exhibited in this Commonwealth unless each animal
meets all the following criteria:

a. Is accompanied by a ICVI that was issued by a
licensed and accredited veterinarian not more than
14 days before the date of the animal exhibition.

b. Shall be permanently identified by an official 840
series radio frequency identification (RFID) ear tag and
the ear tag number recorded on the ICVI.

c. Any swine that does not have an 840 RFID tag at
the time of arrival at a Commonwealth animal exhibition,
shall not be unloaded at the exhibition or any place
within the Commonwealth and shall be returned to the
premises from which it originated.

d. Has been visually inspected for signs of disease prior
to unloading at the exhibition by an accredited veterinar-
ian, VCPR veterinarian or a SHM appointed by the fair
board or livestock show committee or both, as required by
Section 4. of this Order.

e. The SHM shall immediately report, in the manner
required by Section 4 of this Order, any clinical signs of
disease to the VCPR veterinarian holding the
veterinarian-client-patient-relationship with the fair
board or livestock show committee.

f. The VCPR veterinarian shall immediately follow up
by examining the animal and notify the SAHO when
appropriate and shall issue such written reports as are
required in Section 4 of this Order.

g. Any swine showing signs of illness upon arrival at
the animal exhibition shall not be permitted to unload
and shall be reported to the VCPR accredited veterinar-
ian holding the veterinarian-client-patient-relationship
with the show or fair board.

6. Exhibition Timing and Order. All breeding swine
animal exhibitions are to occur prior to the arrival of any
market swine. Breeding swine shall be removed from the
animal exhibition premises prior to any market swine
arriving. Breeding swine animal exhibitions, excluding
birthing or educational displays which are not competing,
shall arrive, exhibit, and depart in a period no greater
than 72 hours.

7. Birthing Exhibitions. Swine birthing exhibitions and
educational displays which are not competing may occur
concurrently with market swine animal exhibition as long
as reasonable precaution is taken to ensure separation of
the birthing swine and market swine, no cross-
contamination between the two separate exhibition areas
and the biosecurity of the swine birthing exhibition or
educational display.

8. PDA sponsored animal exhibitions. All market swine
exhibited in PDA sponsored animal exhibitions, fairs and
market shows, along with meeting all other requirements
of this Order, shall move directly to a PDA or USDA
licensed slaughter facility following the animal exhibition

and may not be diverted to premises other than a
recognized slaughter establishment or a slaughter market
in which the sales are designated slaughter only sales.

9. Non-PDA sponsored animal exhibitions. Non-PDA
Sponsored animal exhibitions and shows including jack-
pot shows and 4-H roundups not occurring during a PDA
sponsored animal exhibition, fair or show, where arrival,
exhibition and departure of the swine occur within a
72 hour window and there is no public access to the
animals other than observation during competitions,
while being required to meet all other requirements of
this Order, shall be exempt from the terminal slaughter
requirement listed in paragraph 8.

10. All swine imported into the Commonwealth for
animal exhibition shall meet interstate health require-
ments established at section 3.131 of PDA’s regulations
(7 Pa. Code § 3.131).

11. Conveyance, goods and other materials. All convey-
ances, containers, goods, products or materials in contact
with swine being shipped within or through the Common-
wealth of Pennsylvania for animal exhibition shall be
cleaned and disinfected in accordance with the following:

a. A conveyance used for the transportation of swine to
animal exhibitions, fairs and shows shall be cleaned and
disinfected by an exhibitor prior to each use and shall be
free of visible accumulations of manure, bedding and
other organic materials.

b. At the conclusion of swine animal exhibitions, fairs
and shows and after all swine have left the premises, the
fair board or livestock show committee shall ensure all
holding pens and animal exhibition areas have had all
bedding and other organic material removed and all
areas, including fences, gates, stalls, holding pens, con-
tainers, housing, coming in contact with or through which
swine were moved shall be put through the fair board or
livestock show committee’s cleaning and disinfection pro-
cess.

12. Violations/Penalties. Any person violating the re-
quirements of this Order shall be subject to enforcement
and penalties as are allowed under the provisions of the
Domestic Animal Law (3 Pa.C.S.A. § 2301 et seq.), which
include, revocation of license, criminal prosecution, civil
penalties of up to $10,000 per violation, injunctive relief
or any combination of these penalties.

13. No Restriction on Further Action by PDA. This
Order shall not be construed as limiting the PDA’s
authority to establish additional quarantine or testing
requirements or take any actions otherwise permitted
under applicable statute or regulation.

14. Contact information. Questions regarding this In-
terstate and International Quarantine Order is to
the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania, Department of Agri-
culture, Bureau of Animal Health, 2301 North Cameron
Street, Harrisburg, PA 17110 or by telephone at 717-
772-2852, or email at RA-ahds@pa.gov.

15. Effective Date. This Order replaces any previous
order related to swine exhibition requirements and is
immediately effective upon the date of publication in the
Pennsylvania Bulletin, and shall remain in effect unless
rescinded or modified by subsequent order.

RUSSELL C. REDDING,
Secretary

[Pa.B. Doc. No. 21-1124. Filed for public inspection July 16, 2021, 9:00 a.m.]
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DEPARTMENT OF BANKING AND SECURITIES
Actions on Applications

The Department of Banking and Securities (Department), under the authority in the Banking Code of 1965 (7 P.S.
§§ 101—2204), the Department of Banking and Securities Code (71 P.S. §§ 733-1—733-1203) and 17 Pa.C.S. (relating to
Credit Union Code), has taken the following actions on application received for the week ending July 6, 2021.

Under section 503.E of the Department of Banking and Securities Code (71 P.S. § 733-503.E), any person wishing to
comment on the following applications, with the exception of branch applications, may file comments in writing with the
Department of Banking and Securities, Bank Supervision or Credit Union and Trust Supervision (as applicable),
17 North Second Street, Suite 1300, Harrisburg, PA 17101-2290. Comments must be received no later than 30 days from
the date notice regarding receipt of the application is published in the Pennsylvania Bulletin. The nonconfidential
portions of the applications are on file at the Department and are available for public inspection, by appointment only,
during regular business hours. To schedule an appointment, for banks (717) 783-8240 and for credit unions and trust
companies (717) 783-2253. Photocopies of the nonconfidential portions of the applications may be requested consistent
with the Department’s Right-to-Know Law Records Request policy.

BANKING INSTITUTIONS

Holding Company Acquisitions
Date Name and Location of Applicant Action
07-01-2021 Fidelity D & D Bancorp, Inc.

Dunmore
Lackawanna County

Effective

Application for approval to acquire 100% of Landmark Bancorp, Inc., Pittston, PA, and
thereby indirectly acquire 100% of Landmark Community Bank, Pittston, PA.

Consolidations, Mergers and Absorptions
Date Name and Location of Applicant Action
07-01-2021 The Fidelity Deposit and Discount

Bank
Dunmore
Lackawanna County

Effective

Merger of Landmark Community Bank, Pittston, PA, with and into The Fidelity Deposit and
Discount Bank.
All Branch offices of Landmark Community Bank became branch offices of The Fidelity
Deposit and Discount Bank including the former main office:

3016 Pittston Avenue
Scranton
Lackawanna County

383 South Poplar Street
Hazleton
Luzerne County

781 Airport Road
Hazle Township
Luzerne County

1000 Wyoming Avenue
Wyoming
Luzerne County

2 South Main Street
Pittston
Luzerne County

Branch Applications

De Novo Branches
Date Name and Location of Applicant Location of Branch Action
05-07-2021 Farmers and Merchants Trust Co.

of Chambersburg
Chambersburg
Franklin County

4050 Crums Mill Road
Suite 301
Harrisburg
Dauphin County
(Limited Service Facility)

Opened

07-06-2021 LINKBANK
Camp Hill
Cumberland County

2057 EG Drive
Suite 500
Harrisburg
Dauphin County

Opened

Branch Discontinuances
Date Name and Location of Applicant Location of Branch Action
06-30-2021 Univest Bank and Trust Co.

Souderton
Montgomery County

23 West Highland Avenue
Philadelphia
Philadelphia County

Closed
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Date Name and Location of Applicant Location of Branch Action
06-30-2021 Univest Bank and Trust Co.

Souderton
Montgomery County

545 Constitution Avenue
Perkasie
Bucks County

Closed

06-30-2021 Univest Bank and Trust Co.
Souderton
Montgomery County

5829 Easton Road
Doylestown
Bucks County

Closed

Articles of Amendment
Date Name and Location of Institution Action
07-01-2021 Atlantic Community Bankers Bank

Camp Hill
Cumberland County

Filed

Amendment to Article Sixth of the institution’s Articles of Incorporation to provide
authorization of a class of 15,000 shares of preferred stock and empower the Bank’s Board of
Directors to issue such shares as a class or in one or more series, with such voting, dividend,
redemption, sinking fund, conversion, exchange, liquidation and other rights as are
determined by the Board of Directors, without further shareholder approval.
Articles of Amendment provide for the institution’s Articles of Incorporation to be amended
and restated in their entirety.

CREDIT UNIONS
Articles of Amendment

Date Name and Location of Institution Action
07-01-2021 Viriva Community Credit Union

Warminster
Bucks County

Filed

Amendment to Article IV.7 of the institution’s Articles of Incorporation provides for a change
in the Credit Union’s field of membership.
Articles of Amendment provide for the institution’s Articles of Incorporation to be amended
and restated in their entirety.

The Department’s web site at www.dobs.pa.gov includes public notices for more recently filed applications.
RICHARD VAGUE,

Secretary
[Pa.B. Doc. No. 21-1125. Filed for public inspection July 16, 2021, 9:00 a.m.]

DEPARTMENT OF CONSERVATION
AND NATURAL RESOURCES

Grant Funding for ATV or Snowmobile Projects
and Programs

The Department of Conservation and Natural Re-
sources (Department), Bureau of Recreation and Conser-
vation (Bureau) announces the All-Terrain Vehicle (ATV)
and Snowmobile Program’s (Program) fall grant round.
The Program awards grants from the ATV and Snowmo-
bile Management Restricted Accounts for projects propos-
ing land acquisition, planning, development, rehabilita-
tion, maintenance, equipment purchase or educational
programs for ATV or snowmobile trails and facilities.
Eligible applicants include for-profit organizations, non-
profit organizations and municipalities in this Common-
wealth.

Grant funding will be awarded through a competitive
grant application process. Applicants can apply for this
funding starting Monday, August 2, 2021, and due by
4 p.m. on Thursday, September 30, 2021, by means of the
Department’s online grant application portal. More infor-
mation about these grant opportunities and the applica-
tion process is available at https://brcgrants.dcnr.pa.gov.
For assistance with the portal, contact the Depart-
ment’s Grants Customer Service Center, (800) 326-7734,
DCNR-Grants@pa.gov.

Bureau staff are available to assist applicants with de-
veloping a competitive application. Staff contact informa-
tion can be found on the Bureau’s web site at http://elibrary.
dcnr.pa.gov/GetDocument?docId=1753442&DocName=
d_001184.pdf.

CINDY ADAMS DUNN,
Secretary

[Pa.B. Doc. No. 21-1126. Filed for public inspection July 16, 2021, 9:00 a.m.]
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DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION
Applications, Actions and Special Notices

APPLICATIONS

THE PENNSYLVANIA CLEAN STREAMS LAW AND THE FEDERAL CLEAN
WATER ACT

APPLICATIONS FOR NATIONAL POLLUTANT DISCHARGE ELIMINATION
SYSTEM (NPDES) PERMITS AND WATER QUALITY MANAGEMENT (WQM)

PERMITS UNDER THE CLEAN STREAMS LAW AND FEDERAL CLEAN WATER
ACT

This notice provides information about persons who have applied to the Department of Environmental Protection (DEP)
for a new, renewed, or amended NPDES or WQM permit, or a permit waiver for certain stormwater discharges, or have
submitted a Notice of Intent (NOI) for coverage under a General Permit. The applications and NOIs concern, but are not
limited to, effluent discharges from sewage treatment facilities and industrial facilities to surface waters or groundwater;
stormwater discharges associated with industrial activity (industrial stormwater), construction activity (construction
stormwater), and municipal separate storm sewer systems (MS4s); the application of pesticides; the operation of
Concentrated Animal Feeding Operations (CAFOs); and the construction of sewage, industrial waste, and manure
storage, collection and treatment facilities. This notice is provided in accordance with 25 Pa. Code Chapters 91 and 92a
and 40 CFR Part 122, implementing The Clean Streams Law (35 P.S. §§ 691.1—691.1001) and the Federal Clean Water
Act (33 U.S.C.A. §§ 1251—1376). More information on the types of NPDES and WQM permits that are available can be
found on DEP’s website (visit www.dep.pa.gov and select Businesses, Water, Bureau of Clean Water, Wastewater
Management, and NPDES and WQM Permitting Programs).
Section Category
I Individual and General WQM Permit Applications/NOIs Received, General NPDES Permit NOIs Received,

and All Transfer and Minor Amendment Applications/NOIs Received
II Individual NPDES Permits—New, Renewal, and Major Amendment Applications and Draft Permits for

Discharges Relating to Sewage, Industrial Waste, Industrial Stormwater, MS4s, Pesticides and CAFOs
III Individual NPDES Permit Applications for Discharges of Stormwater Associated with Construction Activity

Section I identifies the following applications and NOIs that have been received by DEP:

• Individual and General WQM Permit Applications Received—DEP provides a 15-day public comment period for
Individual WQM Permit Applications for new and reissued permits. There is no public comment period for General WQM
Permit NOIs.

• General NPDES Permit NOIs Received—There is no public comment period for General NPDES NOIs received.

• All Transfer and Minor Amendment Applications/NOIs Received—Transfer and Minor Amendment Applications/NOIs
received for Individual and General WQM Permits and Individual and General NPDES Permits are identified but do not
have public comment periods. DEP provides a 15-day public comment period for Individual WQM Permit Applications for
amendments.

Additional information on these applications and NOIs may be reviewed by generating the ‘‘Applications and NOIs
without Comment Periods Report’’ or, for Individual WQM Permit Applications, the ‘‘Applications Received with Comment
Periods Report’’ on DEP’s website at www.dep.pa.gov/CWPublicNotice.

Section II identifies individual NPDES permit applications received and draft permits issued by DEP relating to
sewage, industrial waste, industrial stormwater, MS4s, pesticides and CAFOs. A 30-day public comment period applies to
these applications, except when a site-specific water quality criterion is used to establish effluent limitations, in which
case a 45-day public comment period applies. The period for comment may be extended at the discretion of the
Department for one additional 15-day period. Additional information, including links to draft permits and fact sheets that
explain the basis for DEP’s tentative determinations may be reviewed by generating the ‘‘Applications Received with
Comment Periods Report’’ on DEP’s website at www.dep.pa.gov/CWPublicNotice. Notification of 15-day extensions for
comment will be provided in the ‘‘Applications Received with Comment Periods Report’’ (Comments column).

Section III provides notice of applications and draft individual permits for stormwater discharges associated with
construction activities. Where indicated, DEP has made tentative determinations, based on preliminary review, to issue
permits subject to proposed effluent limitations consisting of best management practices identified in the erosion and
sediment control (E&S) plans and post-construction stormwater management (PCSM) plans submitted with the
applications, as well as other terms and conditions based on the permit applications. A 30-day public comment period
applies to these applications.

Applications and NOIs may be reviewed at the DEP office that received the application or NOI. Contact information for
each DEP office for Sections I & II is listed as follows. Contact information for Section III is available within the table.
Members of the public are encouraged to use DEP’s website to obtain additional information as discussed previously.
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Comments received within the appropriate comment periods for WQM and NPDES permit applications will be retained
by DEP and considered in the final determinations regarding the applications. A comment submittal should include the
name, address and telephone number of the writer and a concise statement to inform DEP of the exact basis of a
comment and the relevant facts upon which it is based.

DEP office contact information to review applications and NOIs in Sections I & II and to submit comments for those
application and NOIs, when applicable, is as follows:

DEP Southeast Regional Office (SERO)—2 E. Main Street, Norristown, PA 19401-4915. File Review Coordinator:
484.250.5910. Email: RA-EPNPDES_SERO@pa.gov.

DEP Northeast Regional Office (NERO)—2 Public Square, Wilkes-Barre, PA 18701-1915. File Review Coordinator:
570.826.5472. Email: RA-EPNPDES_NERO@pa.gov.

DEP Southcentral Regional Office (SCRO)—909 Elmerton Avenue, Harrisburg, PA 17110. File Review Coordinator:
717.705.4732. Email: RA-EPNPDES_SCRO@pa.gov.

DEP Northcentral Regional Office (NCRO)—208 W. Third Street, Suite 101, Williamsport, PA 17701. File Review
Coordinator: 570.327.3693. Email: RA-EPNPDES_NCRO@pa.gov.

DEP Southwest Regional Office (SWRO)—400 Waterfront Drive, Pittsburgh, PA 15222. File Review Coordinator:
412.442.4286. Email: RA-EPNPDES_SWRO@pa.gov.

DEP Northwest Regional Office (NWRO)—230 Chestnut Street, Meadville, PA 16335. File Review Coordinator:
814.332.6340. Email: RA-EPNPDES_NWRO@pa.gov.

DEP Bureau of Clean Water (BCW)—400 Market Street, Harrisburg, PA 17105. File Review Coordinator: 717.787.5017.
Email: RA-EPNPDES_Permits@pa.gov.

DEP will also accept requests or petitions for public hearings on applications. The request or petition must indicate the
interest of the party filing and the reasons why a hearing is warranted. A hearing will be held if the Department
determines that there is a significant public interest. If a hearing is scheduled, a notice of the hearing will be published
in the Pennsylvania Bulletin and a newspaper of general circulation within the relevant geographical area. DEP will
postpone its final determination until after a public hearing is held.

Persons with a disability who require an auxiliary aid, service, including TDD users, or other accommodations to seek
additional information should contact the Department through the Pennsylvania Hamilton Relay Service at (800)
654-5984.

I. Individual and General WQM Permit Applications/NOIs Received, General NPDES Permit NOIs Received,
and All Transfer and Minor Amendment Applications/NOIs Received.

Application
Number Permit Type

Application
Type Applicant Name & Address Municipality, County

DEP
Office

3292202 Industrial Waste
Individual WQM
Permit

Amendment Keystone Conemaugh Project
LLC
175 Cornell Road
Suite 1
Blairsville, PA 15717

West Wheatfield
Township
Indiana County

NWRO

6308202 Industrial Waste
Individual WQM
Permit

Transfer PA Transformer Tech Inc.
30 Curry Avenue
Canonsburg, PA 15317-1786

Cecil Township
Washington County

SWRO

0421800 Joint DEP/PFBC
Pesticides Permit

New Steven Dyson &
Samantha Brewer
352 Thompson Run Road
Beaver Falls, PA 15010-6833

North Sewickley
Township
Beaver County

SWRO

1521825 Joint DEP/PFBC
Pesticides Permit

New Ken & Nicki Graham
415 Valley Park Road
Phoenixville, PA 19460

Schuylkill Township
Chester County

SERO

2021805 Joint DEP/PFBC
Pesticides Permit

New Pineview Camplands
15075 Shermansville Road
Linesville, PA 16424-1637

Summit Township
Crawford County

NWRO

2321805 Joint DEP/PFBC
Pesticides Permit

New Episcopal Academy
1785 Bishop White Drive
Newtown Square, PA
19073-1300

Newtown Township
Delaware County

SERO

3521801 Joint DEP/PFBC
Pesticides Permit

New Shiney Mountain Sportsman
4 Chapman Street
Dupont, PA 18641

Spring Brook Township
Lackawanna County

NERO

4513841 Joint DEP/PFBC
Pesticides Permit

Renewal Ray Price
P.O. Box 127
Shawnee On Delaware, PA
18356-0127

Middle Smithfield
Township
Monroe County

NERO

3870 NOTICES

PENNSYLVANIA BULLETIN, VOL. 51, NO. 29, JULY 17, 2021



Application
Number Permit Type

Application
Type Applicant Name & Address Municipality, County

DEP
Office

4521804 Joint DEP/PFBC
Pesticides Permit

New Matt Kull
263 Cherry Lane Road
Bartonsville, PA 18321

Pocono Township
Monroe County

NERO

4521805 Joint DEP/PFBC
Pesticides Permit

New Matt Kull
263 Cherry Lane Road
Bartonsville, PA 18321

Pocono Township
Monroe County

NERO

4521806 Joint DEP/PFBC
Pesticides Permit

New Bruce George Paving &
Excav Inc.
843 Kuehner Drive
Kunkletown, PA 18058-7116

Eldred Township
Monroe County

NERO

6121804 Joint DEP/PFBC
Pesticides Permit

New Carleen Czolba Latess
713 Gibson Hill Road
Oil City, PA 16301-5005

Oakland Township
Venango County

NWRO

1921201 Manure Storage
Facilities
Individual
WQM Permit

New Joel D Knoebel
110 Center School Road
Elysburg, PA 17824-9142

Cleveland Township
Columbia County

NCRO

NOEXSE012 No Exposure
Certification

Renewal Moog Component Group Inc.
750 W Sproul Road
Springfield, PA 19064

Springfield Township
Delaware County

SERO

PAG032280 PAG-03 NPDES
General Permit
for Industrial
Stormwater

New General Dynamics OTS
(Wilkes-Barre) LLC
1500 Highway 315
Wilkes-Barre, PA 18702

Plains Township
Luzerne County

NERO

PAG034882 PAG-03 NPDES
General Permit
for Industrial
Stormwater

New Digger Specialties Inc.
3639 Destiny Drive
Bremen, IN 46506-9076

Montgomery Borough
Lycoming County

NCRO

PAG046211 PAG-04 NPDES
General Permit
for Small Flow
Treatment
Facilities

Transfer Amy S & William D Hoffer Jr.
148 Hoffer Lane
Acme, PA 15610-2217

Black Township
Somerset County

SWRO

PAG123804 PAG-12 NPDES
General Permit
for CAFOs

Amendment Michael D Martin
2050 W Main Street
Ephrata, PA 17522-1114

Clay Township
Lancaster County

SCRO

1021411 Sewage
Treatment
Facilities
Individual
WQM Permit

New Advanced Polymer Tech Corp.
P.O. Box 160
109 Conica Lane
Harmony, PA 16037-0160

Harmony Borough
Butler County

NWRO

1169402 Sewage
Treatment
Facilities
Individual
WQM Permit

Amendment Windber Area Authority
Somerset County
1700 Stockholm Avenue
Windber, PA 15963-2059

Richland Township
Cambria County

SWRO

2021411 Sewage
Treatment
Facilities
Individual
WQM Permit

New Keith & Vicky Fox
42452 State Rte 27
Titusville, PA 16354

Oil Creek Township
Crawford County

NWRO

2521407 Sewage
Treatment
Facilities
Individual
WQM Permit

New Joe Rimdzius
10071 Old Route 99
McKean, PA 16426-1729

McKean Township
Erie County

NWRO

2521416 Sewage
Treatment
Facilities
Individual
WQM Permit

New Vergil Taylor
4549 Nye Road
West Springfield, PA 16443-2017

Elk Creek Township
Erie County

NWRO
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Application
Number Permit Type

Application
Type Applicant Name & Address Municipality, County

DEP
Office

2521417 Sewage
Treatment
Facilities
Individual
WQM Permit

New Kim Danielson
9330 Dewey Road
Waterford, PA 16441-2414

Greene Township
Erie County

NWRO

3670415 Sewage
Treatment
Facilities
Individual
WQM Permit

Transfer Ridgewood Manor MHC, LLC
98 Breneman Road
Manheim, PA 17545-9802

Rapho Township
Lancaster County

SCRO

3705402 Sewage
Treatment
Facilities
Individual
WQM Permit

Amendment Ellwood City
525 Lawrence Avenue
Ellwood City, PA 16117-8528

Ellwood City Borough
Lawrence County

NWRO

5600402 Sewage
Treatment
Facilities
Individual
WQM Permit

Transfer Amy S & William D Hoffer Jr.
148 Hoffer Lane
Acme, PA 15610-2217

Black Township
Somerset County

SWRO

5691406 Sewage
Treatment
Facilities
Individual
WQM Permit

Amendment Conemaugh Township
1120 Tire Hill Road
Johnstown, PA 15905-7707

Paint Township
Somerset County

SWRO

0221400 Sewer Extensions
and Pump
Stations
Individual
WQM Permit

New Upper St Clair Township
3300 Preble Avenue
Pittsburgh, PA 15233-1025

Pittsburgh City
Allegheny County

SWRO

0692402 Sewer Extensions
and Pump
Stations
Individual
WQM Permit

Amendment PA American Water Co.
852 Wesley Drive
Mechanicsburg, PA 17055

Exeter Township
Berks County

SCRO

1121400 Sewer Extensions
and Pump
Stations
Individual
WQM Permit

New Greater Johnstown
Water Authority
416 Main Street
Suite 200
Johnstown, PA 15901-1828

West Taylor Township
Cambria County

SWRO

WQG02222101 WQG-02 WQM
General Permit

New West Hanover Township
Water & Sewer Authority
7901 Jonestown Road
Harrisburg, PA 17112-9728

West Hanover
Township
Dauphin County

SCRO

II. Individual NPDES Permits—New, Renewal, and Major Amendment Applications and Draft Permits for
Discharges Relating to Sewage, Industrial Waste, Industrial Stormwater, MS4s, Pesticides and CAFOs.

Southeast Regional Office

PA0025917, Sewage, SIC Code 4952, Chalfont New Britain Township Joint Sewer Authority Bucks County,
1645 Upper State Road, Doylestown, PA 18901-2624. Facility Name: Chalfont New Britain Township Joint Sewer
Authority. This existing facility is located in Doylestown Township, Bucks County.

Description of Existing Activity: The application is for a renewal of an NPDES permit for an existing discharge of
treated sewage.

The receiving stream(s), Neshaminy Creek (TSF, MF), is located in State Water Plan watershed 2-F and is classified for
Migratory Fishes and Trout Stocking, aquatic life, water supply and recreation. The discharge is not expected to affect
public water supplies.
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The proposed effluent limits for Outfall 001 are based on a design flow of 4.625 MGD.—Limits.
Mass Units (lbs/day) Concentrations (mg/L)

Parameters Average
Monthly

Weekly
Average

Minimum Average
Monthly

Weekly
Average

IMAX

Copper, Total (Permit effective to
Completion of 58th Month)

XXX XXX XXX Report XXX XXX

Copper, Total (Beginning of 59th
month to Permit Expiration)

0.91 1.42 XXX 0.023 0.036 0.058

The proposed effluent limits for Outfall 001 are based on a design flow of 4.625 MGD.—Limits.
Mass Units (lbs/day) Concentrations (mg/L)

Parameters Average
Monthly

Weekly
Average

Minimum Average
Monthly

Weekly
Average

IMAX

Flow (MGD) Report Report
Daily Max

XXX XXX XXX XXX

pH (S.U.) XXX XXX 6.0 XXX 9.0
Max

XXX

DO XXX XXX 5.0 XXX XXX XXX
CBOD5

Raw Sewage Influent
XXX XXX XXX Report XXX XXX

Nov 1 - Apr 30 540 810 XXX 14 21 28
May 1 - Oct 31 270 405 XXX 7 10.5 14

BOD5
Raw Sewage Influent

Report XXX XXX Report XXX XXX

TSS
Raw Sewage Influent

Report XXX XXX Report XXX XXX

TSS 1,157 1,736 XXX 30 45 60
Fecal Coliform (No./100 ml)

May 1—Sep 30 XXX XXX XXX 200
Geo Mean

XXX 1,000

Oct 1—Apr 30 XXX XXX XXX 200
Geo Mean

XXX 1,000*

Nitrate-Nitrite
Nov 1 - Jun 30

347 XXX XXX Report XXX XXX

Nitrate-Nitrite as N
Jul 1 - Oct 31

347 XXX XXX 9.0 XXX 18

Ammonia
Nov 1 - Apr 30

231 XXX XXX 6.0 XXX 12

May 1 - Oct 31 77 XXX XXX 2.0 XXX 4
Total Phosphorus

Nov 1 - Mar 31
77 XXX XXX 2.0 XXX 4

Apr 1 - Oct 31 39 XXX XXX 1.0 XXX 2
Total Aluminum 0.0352 0.054 XXX 0.9 1.4 2.2
Dissolved Iron XXX XXX XXX Report XXX XXX
Total Iron 0.11 0.171 XXX 2.84 4.43 7.11
Total Lead XXX XXX XXX Report XXX XXX
Total Zinc XXX XXX XXX Report XXX XXX
Chronic WET - Ceriodaphnia

Survival (TUc)
XXX XXX XXX XXX 1.9

Daily Max
XXX

Chronic WET - Ceriodaphnia
Reproduction (TUc)

XXX XXX XXX XXX 1.9
Daily Max

XXX

Chronic WET - Pimephales
Survival (TUc)

XXX XXX XXX XXX 1.9
Daily Max

XXX

Chronic WET - Pimephales Growth
(TUc)

XXX XXX XXX XXX 1.9
Daily Max

XXX

The proposed effluent limits for Outfall 002 are based on a Storm event.
Mass Units (lbs/day) Concentrations (mg/L)

Parameters Average
Monthly

Average
Weekly

Minimum Daily
Maximum

Maximum IMAX

pH (S.U.) XXX XXX XXX Report XXX XXX
Carbonaceous Biochemical Oxygen

Demand (CBOD5)
XXX XXX XXX Report XXX XXX

Chemical Oxygen Demand (COD) XXX XXX XXX Report XXX XXX
Total Suspended Solids XXX XXX XXX Report XXX XXX
Oil and Grease XXX XXX XXX Report XXX XXX
Fecal Coliform (CFU/100 ml) XXX XXX XXX Report XXX XXX
Total Kjeldahl Nitrogen XXX XXX XXX Report XXX XXX
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Mass Units (lbs/day) Concentrations (mg/L)
Parameters Average

Monthly
Average
Weekly

Minimum Daily
Maximum

Maximum IMAX

Total Phosphorus XXX XXX XXX Report XXX XXX
Iron, Dissolved XXX XXX XXX Report XXX XXX

In addition, the permit contains the following major special conditions:
• No Stormwater in Sewers
• Obtain Necessary Property Rights
• Proper Sludge Disposal
• Chlorine Minimization
• Small Stream Discharge
• Notification of Responsible Owner
• Develop O&M Manual
• Fecal Coliform Reporting
• POTW Pretreatment Program Implementation
• Water Quality Based Effluent Limitations for Toxic Pollutants/TRE
• Whole Effluent Toxicity (WET)
• Requirements Applicable to Stormwater Outfalls
You may make an appointment to review the DEP files on this case by calling the File Review Coordinator at

484-250-5910.
The EPA Waiver is not in effect.
PAI130522, MS4, Edgmont Township Delaware County, P.O. Box 267, Gradyville, PA 19039-0267.
The application is for a renewal of an individual NPDES permit for the discharge of stormwater from a regulated

municipal separate storm sewer system (MS4) to waters of the Commonwealth in Edgmont Township, Delaware
County. The receiving stream(s), Rocky Run (HQ-CWF, MF), Unnamed Tributary to Big Run (HQ-TSF, MF), and
Unnamed Tributary to Chester Creek (TSF, MF), is located in State Water Plan watershed 3-G and is classified for
Migratory Fishes, High Quality—Cold Water, Migratory Fish, Trout Stocking, and High Quality Waters—Trout Stocking,
aquatic life, water supply and recreation. The applicant is classified as a small MS4.

The applicant has submitted the following plan(s) with the application to reduce pollutant loads to impaired waters:
• A Pollutant Reduction Plan (PRP)
You may make an appointment to review the DEP files on this case by calling the File Review Coordinator at

484-250-5910.
The EPA waiver is in effect for small MS4s and is not in effect for large MS4s.
Northeast Regional Office
PA0061671, Sewage, SIC Code 4952, Greenfield Township Sewer Authority Lackawanna County, P.O. Box 501,

Carbondale, PA 18407-0501. Facility Name: Greenfield Township Sewer Authority Sewage Treatment Plant. This existing
facility is located in Greenfield Township, Lackawanna County.

Description of Existing Activity: The application is for a renewal of an NPDES permit for an existing discharge of
treated sewage.

The receiving stream(s), Unnamed Tributary to Dundaff Creek (WWF), is located in State Water Plan watershed 4-F
and is classified for Warm Water Fishes, aquatic life, water supply and recreation. The discharge is not expected to affect
public water supplies.

The proposed effluent limits for Outfall 001 are based on a design flow of .14 MGD.—Interim Limits.
Mass Units (lbs/day) Concentrations (mg/L)

Parameters Average
Monthly

Average
Weekly

Minimum Average
Monthly

Maximum IMAX

Copper, Total (ug/l) Report Report
Daily Max

XXX Report Report
Daily Max

XXX

Zinc, Total (ug/l) Report Report
Daily Max

XXX Report Report
Daily Max

XXX

The proposed effluent limits for Outfall 001 are based on a design flow of .14 MGD.—Final Limits.
Mass Units (lbs/day) Concentrations (mg/L)

Parameters Average
Monthly

Average
Weekly

Minimum Average
Monthly

Maximum IMAX

Copper, Total (ug/l) 0.015 0.022
Daily Max

XXX 13.0 18.9
Daily Max

32.6
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Mass Units (lbs/day) Concentrations (mg/L)
Parameters Average

Monthly
Average
Weekly

Minimum Average
Monthly

Maximum IMAX

Zinc, Total (ug/l) Report 0.2
Daily Max

XXX Report 0.167
Daily Max

0.167

The proposed effluent limits for Outfall 001 are based on a design flow of .14 MGD.—Limits.
Mass Units (lbs/day) Concentrations (mg/L)

Parameters Average
Monthly

Weekly
Average

Instant.
Minimum

Average
Monthly

Weekly
Average

IMAX

Flow (MGD) Report Report
Daily Max

XXX XXX XXX XXX

pH (S.U.) XXX XXX 6.0 XXX XXX 9.0
Dissolved Oxygen XXX XXX 6.0 XXX XXX XXX
Total Residual Chlorine (TRC) XXX XXX XXX 0.04 XXX 0.09
Carbonaceous Biochemical Oxygen

Demand (CBOD5)
29.2 46.7 XXX 25.0 40.0 50.0

BOD5 Minimum % Removal (%) 85
Min Mo Avg

XXX XXX XXX XXX XXX

Total Suspended Solids 35.0 52.5 XXX 30.0 45.0 60.0
Total Suspended Solids

Minimum % Removal (%)
85

Min Mo Avg
XXX XXX XXX XXX XXX

Fecal Coliform (No./100 ml)
Oct 1 - Apr 30

XXX XXX XXX 2,000
Geo Mean

XXX 10,000

May 1 - Sep 30 XXX XXX XXX 200
Geo Mean

XXX 1,000

Ultraviolet light intensity
(mW/cm2)

XXX XXX Report XXX XXX XXX

Nitrate-Nitrite as N Report Report
Daily Max

XXX Report Report
Daily Max

XXX

Nitrate-Nitrite as N (Total Load,
lbs) (lbs)

Report
Total Mo

XXX XXX XXX XXX XXX

Total Nitrogen Report Report
Daily Max

XXX Report Report
Daily Max

XXX

(Total Load, lbs) (lbs) Report
Total Mo

XXX XXX XXX XXX XXX

Ammonia-Nitrogen
Nov 1 - Apr 30

8.7 Report
Daily Max

XXX 7.5 Report
Daily Max

15.0

May 1 - Oct 31 2.9 Report
Daily Max

XXX 2.5 Report
Daily Max

5.0

(Total Load, lbs) (lbs) Report
Total Mo

XXX XXX XXX XXX XXX

Total Kjeldahl Nitrogen Report Report
Daily Max

XXX Report Report
Daily Max

XXX

(Total Load, lbs) (lbs) Report
Total Mo

XXX XXX XXX XXX XXX

Total Phosphorus Report Report
Daily Max

XXX Report Report
Daily Max

XXX

(Total Load, lbs) (lbs) Report
Total Mo

XXX XXX XXX XXX XXX

Lead, Total Report Report
Daily Max

XXX Report Report
Daily Max

XXX

The proposed effluent limits for Internal Monitoring Point/Outfall 101 are based on a design flow of NA MGD.—Limits.
Mass Units (lbs/day) Concentrations (mg/L)

Parameters Average
Monthly

Daily
Maximum

Minimum Average
Monthly

Daily
Maximum

IMAX

Biochemical Oxygen Demand
(BOD5)
Raw Sewage Influent

Report Report XXX Report Report XXX

Total Suspended Solids
Raw Sewage Influent

Report Report XXX Report Report XXX

In addition, the permit contains the following major special conditions:

• Stormwater prohibition; Necessary property rights; Residuals management; Chlorine minimization; Dry stream; SBR
batch discharges; Responsible operator; O&M Plan; High Flow Management Plan (HFMP); Hauled-In wastewater
condition; Changes to existing stream/discharge condition; Required SCADA system upgrades; Chesapeake Bay Nutrient
Definitions; Solids management; water quality-based effluent limitations for toxic pollutants (Copper and Zinc)
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You may make an appointment to review the DEP files on this case by calling the File Review Coordinator at
570-826-5472.

The EPA Waiver is in effect.
PA0062758, Industrial, SIC Code 4941, Shenandoah Borough Municipal Authority Schuylkill County, P.O. Box

110, Shenandoah, PA 17976-0110. Facility Name: Shenandoah WTP. This existing facility is located in West Mahanoy
Township, Schuylkill County.

Description of Existing Activity: The application is for a renewal of an NPDES permit for an existing discharge of
treated industrial waste (Water Treatment Plant effluent).

The receiving stream(s), Lost Creek (CWF), is located in State Water Plan watershed 6-B and is classified for Cold
Water Fishes, aquatic life, water supply and recreation. The discharge is not expected to affect public water supplies.

The proposed effluent limits for Outfall 001 are based on a design flow of .22 MGD.—Interim Limits.
Mass Units (lbs/day) Concentrations (mg/L)

Parameters Average
Monthly

Daily
Maximum

Minimum Average
Monthly

Daily
Maximum

IMAX

Total Residual Chlorine (TRC) XXX XXX XXX 0.50 XXX 1.00
Aluminum, Total 4.27 Report XXX 4.000 8.000 10.000
Cadmium, Total (ug/L) Report Report XXX Report Report XXX
Copper, Total Report Report XXX Report Report XXX
Iron, Total 2.14 Report XXX 2.000 4.000 5.000
Lead, Total Report Report XXX Report Report XXX
Acrylamide Report Report XXX Report Report XXX

The proposed effluent limits for Outfall 001 are based on a design flow of .22 MGD.—Final Limits.
Mass Units (lbs/day) Concentrations (mg/L)

Parameters Average
Monthly

Daily
Maximum

Minimum Average
Monthly

Daily
Maximum

IMAX

Total Residual Chlorine (TRC) XXX XXX XXX 0.05 XXX 0.17
Aluminum, Total 1.38 Report XXX 0.750 0.927 0.927
Cadmium, Total (ug/L) 0.0001 0.0003 XXX 0.27 0.27 0.25
Copper, Total (ug/L) 0.005 0.007 XXX 5.0 3.73 3.73
Iron, Total 2.14 Report XXX 1.883 2.938 4.708
Lead, Total 0.0009 0.0010 XXX 0.003 0.003 0.0012
Acrylamide (ug/L) 0.0005 0.0008 XXX 0.28 0.43 0.69

The proposed effluent limits for Outfall 001 are based on a design flow of .22 MGD.—Limits.
Mass Units (lbs/day) Concentrations (mg/L)

Parameters Average
Monthly

Daily
Maximum

Minimum Average
Monthly

Daily
Maximum

IMAX

Flow (MGD) Report Report XXX XXX XXX XXX
pH (S.U.) XXX XXX 6.0

Inst Min
XXX XXX 9.0

Total Suspended Solids Report XXX XXX 30.0 Report 60
Manganese, Total 1.07 Report XXX 1.000 2.000 2.5
Nickel, Total (ug/L) Report Report XXX Report Report XXX
Selenium, Total (ug/L) Report Report XXX Report Report XXX
Zinc, Total (ug/L) Report Report XXX Report Report XXX

The proposed effluent limits for Internal Monitor Point/Outfall 101 (intake) are based on a design flow of NA
MGD.—Limits.

Mass Units (lbs/day) Concentrations (mg/L)
Parameters Average

Monthly
Daily

Maximum
Minimum Average

Monthly
Daily

Maximum
IMAX

Flow (MGD)
Intake

Report Report XXX XXX XXX XXX

Aluminum, Total
Intake

Report Report XXX Report Report XXX

Cadmium, Total (ug/L)
Intake

Report Report XXX Report Report XXX

Copper, Total (ug/L)
Intake

Report Report XXX Report Report XXX

Iron, Total
Intake

Report Report XXX Report Report XXX

Lead, Total
Intake

Report Report XXX Report Report XXX

Manganese, Total
Intake

Report Report XXX Report Report XXX
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Mass Units (lbs/day) Concentrations (mg/L)
Parameters Average

Monthly
Daily

Maximum
Minimum Average

Monthly
Daily

Maximum
IMAX

Nickel, Total (ug/L)
Intake

Report Report XXX Report Report XXX

Selenium, Total (ug/L)
Intake

Report Report XXX Report Report XXX

Zinc, Total (ug/L)
Intake

Report Report XXX Report Report XXX

In addition, the permit contains the following major special conditions:

• Necessary property rights; Residuals management; BAT/ELG; Relationship to WQM permits; Chlorine minimization;
Stream/effluent quality; Sludge drying beds; Dry stream; Schedule of compliance (TRC); WQBELs for toxics (Aluminum,
Cadmium, Copper, Lead, Total Iron, Acrylamide); WQBELs below quantitation limits; Chemical additives

You may make an appointment to review the DEP files on this case by calling the File Review Coordinator at
570-826-5472.

The EPA Waiver is in effect.

PAS112206, Storm Water, SIC Code 3084, Prime Conduit, Inc., 6500 Interpace Street, Oklahoma City, OK
73135-4443. Facility Name: Prime Conduit. This existing facility is located in Upper Nazareth Township, Northampton
County.

Description of Existing Activity: The application is for a renewal of an NPDES permit for an existing discharge of
treated industrial stormwater.

The receiving stream(s), Unnamed Tributary to Bushkill Creek (HQ-CWF), is located in State Water Plan watershed
1-F and is classified for High Quality Waters—Cold Water Fishes, aquatic life, water supply and recreation. The
discharge is not expected to affect public water supplies.

The proposed effluent limits for Outfall 001 are based on a design flow of 0 MGD (stormwater).
Mass Units (lbs/day) Concentrations (mg/L)

Parameters Average
Monthly

Average
Weekly

Minimum Average
Monthly

Maximum IMAX

pH (S.U.) XXX XXX 6.0
Inst Min

XXX XXX 9.0

Total Suspended Solids XXX XXX XXX XXX XXX 100.0
Zinc, Total XXX XXX XXX XXX Report XXX

The proposed effluent limits for Outfall 002 are based on a design flow of 0 MGD (stormwater).
Mass Units (lbs/day) Concentrations (mg/L)

Parameters Average
Monthly

Average
Weekly

Minimum Average
Monthly

Maximum IMAX

pH (S.U.) XXX XXX 6.0
Inst Min

XXX XXX 9.0

Total Suspended Solids XXX XXX XXX XXX XXX 100.0
Zinc, Total XXX XXX XXX XXX Report XXX

The proposed effluent limits for Outfall 003 are based on a design flow of 0 MGD (stormwater).
Mass Units (lbs/day) Concentrations (mg/L)

Parameters Average
Monthly

Average
Weekly

Minimum Average
Monthly

Daily
Maximum

IMAX

pH (S.U.) XXX XXX 6.0
Inst Min

XXX XXX 9.0

Total Suspended Solids XXX XXX XXX XXX XXX 100.0
Zinc, Total XXX XXX XXX XXX Report XXX

In addition, the permit contains the following major special conditions:

• Stormwater Outfalls and Authorized Non-Stormwater Discharges

• Best Management Practices (BMPs)

• Routine Inspections

• Preparedness, Prevention and Contingency (PPC) Plan

• Stormwater Monitoring Requirements

You may make an appointment to review the DEP files on this case by calling the File Review Coordinator at
570-826-5472.

The EPA Waiver is in effect.
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Northcentral Regional Office

PA0028738, Sewage, SIC Code 4952, Ralpho Township Municipal Authority, 206 S Market Street, Suite 1,
Elysburg, PA 17824-9782. Facility Name: Ralpho Township Municipal Authority Wastewater Treatment Plant. This
existing facility is located in Shamokin Township, Northumberland County.

Description of Existing Activity: The application is for a renewal of an NPDES permit for an existing discharge of
treated sewage.

The receiving stream(s), Shamokin Creek (WWF), is located in State Water Plan watershed 6-B and is classified for
Warm Water Fishes, aquatic life, water supply and recreation. The discharge is not expected to affect public water
supplies.

The proposed effluent limits for Outfall 001 are based on a design flow of 0.819 MGD.
Mass Units (lbs/day) Concentrations (mg/L)

Parameters Average
Monthly

Weekly
Average

Minimum Average
Monthly

Weekly
Average

Instant.
Maximum

Flow (MGD) Report Report
Daily Max

XXX XXX XXX XXX

pH (S.U.) XXX XXX 6.0
Inst Min

XXX XXX 9.0

Dissolved Oxygen XXX XXX Report
Inst Min

XXX XXX XXX

Total Residual Chlorine (TRC) XXX XXX XXX 0.5 XXX 1.6
Carbonaceous Biochemical Oxygen

Demand (CBOD5)
170 270 XXX 25.0 40.0 50

Biochemical Oxygen Demand
(BOD5)
Raw Sewage Influent

Report Report
Daily Max

XXX Report XXX XXX

Total Suspended Solids
Raw Sewage Influent

Report Report
Daily Max

XXX Report XXX XXX

Total Suspended Solids 200 305 XXX 30.0 45.0 60
Fecal Coliform (No./100 ml)

Oct 1 - Apr 30
XXX XXX XXX 2,000

Geo Mean
XXX 10,000

May 1 - Sep 30 XXX XXX XXX 200
Geo Mean

XXX 1,000

E. Coli (No./100 ml) XXX XXX XXX XXX XXX Report
Nitrate-Nitrite as N XXX XXX XXX Report XXX XXX
Nitrate-Nitrite as N (Total Load,

lbs) (lbs)
Report

Total Mo
XXX XXX XXX XXX XXX

Total Nitrogen XXX XXX XXX Report XXX XXX
Total Nitrogen (Total Load, lbs)

(lbs)
Report

Total Mo
XXX XXX XXX XXX XXX

Ammonia-Nitrogen Report XXX XXX Report XXX XXX
Ammonia-Nitrogen (Total Load, lbs)

(lbs)
Report

Total Mo
XXX XXX XXX XXX XXX

Total Kjeldahl Nitrogen XXX XXX XXX Report XXX XXX
(Total Load, lbs) (lbs) Report

Total Mo
XXX XXX XXX XXX XXX

Total Phosphorus XXX XXX XXX Report XXX XXX
(Total Load, lbs) (lbs) Report

Total Mo
XXX XXX XXX XXX XXX

The proposed monitoring requirements and effluent limits for implementation of Pennsylvania’s Chesapeake Bay
Watershed Implementation Plan are as follows for Outfall 001.

Mass Units (lbs/day) Concentrations (mg/L)
Parameters Monthly Annual Monthly Monthly

Average
Maximum Instant.

Maximum
Total Nitrogen (Total Load, lbs)

(lbs)
XXX Report

Total Annual
XXX XXX XXX XXX

Effluent Net XXX 13,132
Total Annual

XXX XXX XXX XXX

Ammonia-Nitrogen (Total Load, lbs)
(lbs)

XXX Report
Total Annual

XXX XXX XXX XXX

Total Phosphorus (Total Load, lbs)
(lbs)

XXX Report
Total Annual

XXX XXX XXX XXX

Effluent Net XXX 1,751
Total Annual

XXX XXX XXX XXX

3878 NOTICES

PENNSYLVANIA BULLETIN, VOL. 51, NO. 29, JULY 17, 2021



* This permit contains conditions which authorize the permittee to apply nutrient reduction credits to meet the Net
Total Nitrogen and the Net Total Phosphorus effluent mass limits, under the Department’s Chapter 96 regulations. The
condition includes the requirement to report the application of these credits in Supplemental Discharge Monitoring
Reports (DMRs) submitted to the Department.

You may make an appointment to review the DEP files on this case by calling the File Review Coordinator at
570-327-3693.

The EPA Waiver is not in effect.

Southwest Regional Office

PA0022306, Sewage, SIC Code 4952, Brownsville Municipal Authority, P.O. Box 330, Brownsville, PA 15417-2009.
Facility Name: Shady Ave STP. This existing facility is located in Brownsville Borough, Fayette County.

Description of Existing Activity: The application is for a renewal of an NPDES permit for an existing discharge of
treated sewage.

The receiving stream(s), Dunlap Creek (WWF), is located in State Water Plan watershed 19-C and is classified for
Warm Water Fishes, aquatic life, water supply and recreation. The discharge is not expected to affect public water
supplies.

The proposed effluent limits for Outfall 001 are based on a design flow of .96 MGD.—Limits.
Mass Units (lbs/day) Concentrations (mg/L)

Parameters Average
Monthly

Weekly
Average

Instant.
Minimum

Average
Monthly

Weekly
Average

IMAX

Flow (MGD) Report Report
Daily Max

XXX XXX XXX XXX

pH (S.U.) XXX XXX 6.0 XXX XXX 9.0
Dissolved Oxygen XXX XXX 4.0 XXX XXX XXX
Carbonaceous Biochemical Oxygen

Demand (CBOD5)
200 300 XXX 25.0 40.0 50

Biochemical Oxygen Demand
(BOD5)
Raw Sewage Influent

Report Report
Daily Max

XXX Report XXX XXX

Total Suspended Solids 240 360 XXX 30.0 45.0 60
TSS Raw Sewage Influent Report Report

Daily Max
XXX Report XXX XXX

Fecal Coliform (No./100 ml)
Oct 1 - Apr 30

XXX XXX XXX 2,000
Geo Mean

XXX 10,000

May 1 - Sep 30 XXX XXX XXX 200
Geo Mean

XXX 1,000

Ultraviolet light transmittance (%) XXX XXX Report XXX XXX XXX
Ammonia-Nitrogen

Nov 1 - Apr 30
60 XXX XXX 7.5 XXX 15

May 1 - Oct 31 20 XXX XXX 2.5 XXX 5
Total Nitrogen XXX XXX XXX XXX Report

Daily Max
XXX

Total Phosphorus XXX XXX XXX XXX Report
Daily Max

XXX

You may make an appointment to review the DEP files on this case by calling the File Review Coordinator at
412-442-4000.

The EPA Waiver is in effect.

PA0255009, Sewage, SIC Code, National Park Service, P.O. Box 911, Shanksville, PA 15560-0911. Facility Name:
Flight 93 National Memorial. This existing facility is located in Stonycreek Township, Somerset County.

Description of Existing Activity: The application is for a renewal of an NPDES permit for an existing discharge of
treated sewage.

The receiving stream(s), Lamberts Run (CWF), is located in State Water Plan watershed 18-E and is classified for Cold
Water Fishes, aquatic life, water supply and recreation. The discharge is not expected to affect public water supplies.

The proposed effluent limits for Outfall 001 are based on a design flow of .005 MGD.—Final Limits.
Mass Units (lbs/day) Concentrations (mg/L)

Parameters Average
Monthly

Average
Weekly

Minimum Average
Monthly

Maximum IMAX

Flow (MGD) Report XXX XXX XXX XXX XXX
pH (S.U.) XXX XXX 6.0 XXX 9.0 XXX
Dissolved Oxygen XXX XXX 4.0 XXX XXX XXX
Total Residual Chlorine (TRC) XXX XXX XXX 0.5 XXX 1.6
Carbonaceous Biochemical Oxygen

Demand (CBOD5)
XXX XXX XXX 25 XXX 50
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Mass Units (lbs/day) Concentrations (mg/L)
Parameters Average

Monthly
Average
Weekly

Minimum Average
Monthly

Maximum IMAX

Total Suspended Solids XXX XXX XXX 30 XXX 60
Fecal Coliform (CFU/100 ml)

Oct 1 - Apr 30
XXX XXX XXX 2,000

Geo Mean
XXX 10,000

May 1 - Sep 30 XXX XXX XXX 200
Geo Mean

XXX 1,000

Ammonia-Nitrogen
Nov 1 - Apr 30

XXX XXX XXX Report XXX Report

May 1 - Oct 31 XXX XXX XXX 25 XXX 50

The proposed effluent limits for Outfall 001 are based on a design flow of .005 MGD.—Limits.
Mass Units (lbs/day) Concentrations (mg/L)

Parameters Average
Monthly

Average
Weekly

Minimum Average
Monthly

Maximum IMAX

Total Nitrogen XXX XXX XXX XXX Report
Daily Max

XXX

Total Phosphorus XXX XXX XXX XXX Report
Daily Max

XXX

Aluminum, Total XXX XXX XXX XXX Report
Daily Max

XXX

Iron, Total XXX XXX XXX XXX Report
Daily Max

XXX

Manganese, Total XXX XXX XXX XXX Report
Daily Max

XXX

In addition, the permit contains the following major special conditions:

• Solids management for non-lagoon systems.

You may make an appointment to review the DEP files on this case by calling the File Review Coordinator at
412-442-4000.

The EPA Waiver is in effect.

PA0255912, Sewage, SIC Code 8800, Darrell Pearson, 2627 Springfield Pike, Connellsville, PA 15425-6429. Facility
Name: Pearson Property SRSTP. This proposed facility is located in Daugherty Township, Beaver County.

Description of Proposed Activity: The application is for a new NPDES permit for a new discharge of treated SRSTP
sewage.

The receiving stream, Unnamed Tributary to the Beaver River (WWF), is located in State Water Plan watershed 20-B
and is classified for Warm Water Fishes, aquatic life, water supply and recreation. The discharge is not expected to affect
public water supplies.

The proposed effluent limits for Outfall 001 are based on a design flow of 0.0004 MGD.—Limits.
Mass Units (lbs/day) Concentrations (mg/L)

Parameters Annual
Average

Average
Weekly

Instant.
Minimum

Annual
Average

Maximum IMAX

Flow (MGD) Report XXX XXX XXX XXX XXX
pH (S.U.) XXX XXX 6.0 XXX XXX 9.0
Biochemical Oxygen Demand

(BOD5)
XXX XXX XXX 10.0 XXX 20.0

Total Suspended Solids XXX XXX XXX 10.0 XXX 20.0
Fecal Coliform (No./100 ml) XXX XXX XXX 200 XXX XXX

You may make an appointment to review the DEP files on this case by calling the File Review Coordinator at
412-442-4000.

The EPA Waiver is in effect.

PA0216607, Industrial, SIC Code 4922, Texas Eastern Transmission LP, 5400 Westheimer Court, Houston, TX
77056-5353. Facility Name: Delmont Compressor Station. This existing facility is located in Salem Township,
Westmoreland County.

Description of Existing Activity: The application is for a renewal of an NPDES permit for an existing discharge of
treated industrial waste.

The receiving stream(s), Beaver Run (HQ-CWF), is located in State Water Plan watershed 18-B and is classified for
High Quality Waters—Cold Water Fishes, aquatic life, water supply and recreation. The discharge is not expected to
affect public water supplies.
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The proposed effluent limits for Outfall 001 are based on a design flow of 0.008 MGD.—Limits.
Mass Units (lbs/day) Concentrations (mg/L)

Parameters Average
Monthly

Daily
Maximum

Instant.
Minimum

Average
Monthly

Daily
Maximum

IMAX

Flow (MGD) Report Report XXX XXX XXX XXX
pH (S.U.) XXX XXX 6.0 XXX XXX 9.0
PCBs, Total (ug/L) XXX XXX XXX 1.75 1.75 XXX

The proposed effluent limits for Outfall 002 are based on a design flow of 0.013 MGD.—Limits.
Mass Units (lbs/day) Concentrations (mg/L)

Parameters Average
Monthly

Daily
Maximum

Instant.
Minimum

Average
Monthly

Daily
Maximum

IMAX

Flow (MGD) Report Report
Daily Max

XXX XXX XXX XXX

PCBs, Total (ug/L) XXX XXX XXX 1.75 1.75 XXX

The proposed effluent limits for Outfall 002 are based on a design flow of 0.013 MGD.—Limits.
Mass Units (lbs/day) Concentrations (mg/L)

Parameters Average
Monthly

Daily
Maximum

Instant.
Minimum

Average
Quarterly

Daily
Maximum

IMAX

pH (S.U.) XXX XXX 6.0 XXX XXX 9.0
Carbonaceous Biochemical Oxygen

Demand (CBOD5)
XXX XXX XXX 10.0 XXX 20.0

Oil and Grease XXX XXX XXX 15.0 XXX 30.0

The proposed effluent limits for Outfall 002 are based on a design flow of 0.013 MGD.—Limits.
Mass Units (lbs/day) Concentrations (mg/L)

Parameters Average
Monthly

Average
Weekly

Minimum Semi-Annual
Average

Daily
Maximum

IMAX

Total Suspended Solids XXX XXX XXX XXX XXX 60.0

You may make an appointment to review the DEP files on this case by calling the File Review Coordinator at
412-442-4000.

The EPA Waiver is in effect.

PA0219380, Industrial, SIC Code 3900, Pureon Inc., 1101 Mt View Drive, Smithfield, PA 15478. Facility Name:
Fayette Business Park. This existing facility is located in Georges Township, Fayette County.

Description of Existing Activity: The application is for a renewal of an NPDES permit for an existing discharge of
treated industrial waste.

The receiving stream(s), Georges Creek (WWF), is located in State Water Plan watershed 19-G and is classified for
Warm Water Fishes, aquatic life, water supply and recreation. The discharge is not expected to affect public water
supplies.

The proposed effluent limits for Outfall 001 are based on a design flow of 0.016 MGD.—Limits.
Mass Units (lbs/day) Concentrations (mg/L)

Parameters Average
Monthly

Daily
Maximum

Instant.
Minimum

Average
Monthly

Daily
Maximum

IMAX

Flow (MGD) Report Report XXX XXX XXX XXX
pH (S.U.) XXX XXX 6.0 XXX XXX 9.0
Total Residual Chlorine (TRC) XXX XXX XXX 0.5 1.0 XXX
Temperature (°F) XXX XXX XXX XXX XXX 110.0
Copper, Total XXX XXX XXX XXX XXX Report
Zinc, Total XXX XXX XXX XXX XXX Report

You may make an appointment to review the DEP files on this case by calling the File Review Coordinator at
412-442-4000.

The EPA Waiver is in effect.

PA0253391, Industrial, SIC Code 5015, Dansers Auto Repair & Salvage, 1655 State Route 130, Greensburg, PA
15601-6300. Facility Name: Dansers Auto Repair & Salvage. This existing facility is located in Unity Township,
Westmoreland County.

Description of Existing Activity: The application is for a renewal of an NPDES permit for an existing discharge of
stormwater associated with industrial activity from an auto recycling facility.

The receiving stream(s), Unnamed Tributary of Sewickley Creek (HQ-CWF), is located in State Water Plan watershed
19-D and is classified for High Quality Waters—Cold Water Fishes, aquatic life, water supply and recreation. The
discharge is not expected to affect public water supplies.
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The proposed effluent limits for Outfall 001 are based on a design flow of 0 MGD.
Mass Units (lbs/day) Concentrations (mg/L)

Parameters Average
Monthly

Daily
Maximum

Daily
Minimum

Average
Monthly

Daily
Maximum

IMAX

Flow (MGD) XXX Report XXX XXX XXX XXX
pH (S.U.) XXX XXX XXX XXX Report XXX
Total Suspended Solids XXX XXX XXX XXX Report XXX
Oil and Grease XXX XXX XXX XXX Report XXX
Total Kjeldahl Nitrogen XXX XXX XXX XXX Report XXX
Aluminum, Total XXX XXX XXX XXX Report XXX
Iron, Total XXX XXX XXX XXX Report XXX
Lead, Total XXX XXX XXX XXX Report XXX

You may make an appointment to review the DEP files on this case by calling the File Review Coordinator at
412-442-4000.

The EPA Waiver is in effect.

III. Individual NPDES Permit Applications for Discharges of Stormwater Associated with Construction
Activity.

Application
Number

Application
Type Applicant Name & Address Municipality, County Office

PAD460057-1 Amend DPD-Bridgeview, LP
740 Sansom Street
Suite 501
Philadelphia, PA 19106-3236

Bridgeport Borough
Montgomery County

SERO

PAD400044 New PPL Electric Utilities
Corporation
Luke Portieles
2 North 9th Street
GENN4
Allentown, PA 18101-1139

Salem Township
Luzerne County

NERO

PAD450130 New Winds West, Inc.
P.O. Box 1672
Eagle, CO 81631

Middle Smithfield Township
Monroe County

NERO

PAD480155 New Jaindl Land Company
3150 Coffeetown Rd
Orefield, PA 18069

Hanover Township
Northampton County

NERO

PAD540024 New The Espoma Company
6 Espoma Rd.
Milville, NJ 08332

Frailey Township
Schuylkill County

NERO

PAD050012 New SAC, Inc.
4588 Business 220
Bedford, PA 15522

South Woodbury Township
Bedford County

SCRO

PAD060050 New Fanelli Group Properties, LLC
1 Field of Dreams Drive
Pottsville, PA 17901-8419

Maxatawny Township
Berks County

SCRO

PAD060053 New JoJaz Properties, LLC
8 Willow Street
Industrial Park
Fleetwood, PA 19522

Maidencreek Township
Berks County

SCRO

PAD060055 New Governor Mifflin School District
101 South Waverly Street
Shillington, PA 19607

Shillington Borough
Berks County

SCRO

PAD210067 New Karns Prime & Fancy Food Ltd.
675 Silver Spring Road
Suite 4
Mechanicsburg, PA 17050

South Middleton Township
Cumberland County

SCRO

PAD210070 New 121 Will Farm, LLC
2325 Paxton Church Road
Harrisburg, PA 17110

Middlesex Township
Cumberland County

SCRO

PAD670053 New Red Mill Crossings, LLC
1737 West Main Street
Ephrata, PA 17522

Newberry Township
York County

SCRO
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Application
Number

Application
Type Applicant Name & Address Municipality, County Office

PAD020018 A-1 Individual
NPDES

Hammock Beach Partners, LLC
251-305 Old Mill Road
Fox Chapel, PA 15238

Fox Chapel Borough
Allegheny County

Allegheny County
Conservation District
33 Terminal Way
Suite 325B
Pittsburgh, PA 15219
412-291-8010

PAD020045 Individual
NPDES

TC Pursuit Services, Inc.
833 East Pittsburgh
McKeesport Boulevard
North Versailles, PA 15137

North Versailles Township
Allegheny County

Allegheny County
Conservation District
33 Terminal Way
Suite 325B
Pittsburgh, PA 15219
412-291-8010

PAD260019 Individual
NPDES

North Fayette County
Municipal Authority
1634 University Drive
P.O. Box 368
Dunbar, PA 15431

Dunbar Township
Fayette County

Fayette County
Conservation District
10 Nickman Plaza
Lemont Furnace, PA
15456
724-438-4497 x 201

PAD030005 New PADOT District 10
2550 Oakland Avenue
Indiana, PA 15701

Plumcreek Township
Armstrong County

NWRO

STATE CONSERVATION COMMISSION

PROPOSED NUTRIENT MANAGEMENT PLANS RELATED TO APPLICATIONS
FOR NPDES PERMITS FOR CAFOs

This notice provides information about agricultural operations that have submitted nutrient management plans (NMPs)
for approval under 3 Pa.C.S. Chapter 5 and that have or anticipate submitting applications for new, amended or renewed
(National Pollutant Discharge Elimination System) NPDES permits, or Notices of Intent (NOIs) for coverage under a
general permit, for CAFOs, under 25 Pa. Code Chapter 92a. This notice is provided in accordance with 25 Pa. Code
Chapter 92a and 40 CFR Part 122, implementing The Clean Streams Law and the Federal Clean Water Act.

Based upon preliminary reviews, the State Conservation Commission (SCC) or County Conservation Districts (CCD)
working under a delegation agreement with the SCC have completed an administrative review of NMPs described. These
NMPs are published as proposed plans for comment prior to taking final actions. The NMPs are available for review at
the CCD office for the county where the agricultural operation is located. A list of CCD office locations is available at
http://www.nacdnet.org/about/districts/directory/pa.phtml or can be obtained from the SCC at the office address listed or
by calling (717) 787-8821.

Persons wishing to comment on an NMP are invited to submit a statement outlining their comments on the plan to the
CCD, with a copy to the SCC for each NMP, within 30-days from the date of this public notice. Comments received within
the respective comment periods will be considered in the final determinations regarding the NMPs. Comments should
include the name, address and telephone number of the writer and a concise statement to inform the SCC of the exact
basis of the comments and the relevant facts upon which they are based. Comments should be sent to the SCC,
Agriculture Building, Room 310, 2301 North Cameron Street, Harrisburg, PA 17110.

Persons with a disability who require an auxiliary aid, service, including TDD users or other accommodations to seek
additional information should contact the SCC through the Pennsylvania Hamilton Relay Service at (800) 654-5984.

ACT 38
NUTRIENT MANAGEMENT PLANS

CAFO PUBLIC NOTICE SPREADSHEET—APPLICATIONS

Agricultural Operation
Name and Address County

Total
Acres

Animal
Equivalent

Units
Animal

Type

Special
Protection

Waters (HQ
or EV or NA)

Renewal/
New

GNH Farms LLC
224 White Church Rd.
Elysburg, PA 17824

Columbia 763.9 624.17 Layers,
Finishing

Swine, Beef
Cattle, Sheep

Mugser Run
HQ-CWF

Renewal

Dean Stump
48 Rehrersburg Road
Richland, PA 17087

Berks 18.7 416.14 Poultry N/A Renewal
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PUBLIC WATER SUPPLY PERMITS
Under the Pennsylvania Safe Drinking Water Act

(35 P.S. §§ 721.1—721.17), the following parties have
applied for PWS permits to construct or substantially
modify public water systems.

Persons wishing to comment on permit applications are
invited to submit statements to the office listed before the
application within 30 days of this public notice. Com-
ments received within this 30-day comment period will be
considered in the formulation of the final determinations
regarding an application. A comment should include the
name, address and telephone number of the writer and a
concise statement to inform the Department of the exact
basis of a comment and the relevant facts upon which it
is based. A public hearing may be held after consideration
of comments received during the 30-day public comment
period.

Following the comment period, the Department will
make a final determination regarding the proposed per-
mit. Notice of this final determination will be published
in the Pennsylvania Bulletin at which time this determi-
nation may be appealed to the Environmental Hearing
Board.

The permit application and related documents are on
file at the office listed before the application and available
for public review. Arrangements for inspection and copy-
ing information should be made with the office listed
before the application.

Persons with a disability that require an auxiliary aid,
service or other accommodations to participate during the
30-day public comment period should contact the office
listed before the application. TDD users may contact the
Department through the Pennsylvania Hamilton Relay
Service at (800) 654-5984.

SAFE DRINKING WATER

Applications Received Under the Pennsylvania Safe
Drinking Water Act (35 P.S. §§ 721.1—721.17).

Northcentral Region: Safe Drinking Water Program
Manager, 208 West Third Street, Williamsport, PA 17701.

Permit No. 4920511, Major Public Water Supply.

Applicant PA America Water Company—
White Deer

Township or Borough Milton Township

County Northumberland

Responsible Official Bruce Aiton
852 Wesley Drive
Mechanicsburg, PA 17055

Type of Facility Public Water Supply

Consulting Engineer Peter J. Lusardi P.E. GHD, Inc.
1240 North Mountain Road
Harrisburg, PA 17112

Application Received
Date

December 12, 2020

Description of Action Construction of a new high
service pump station and a new
390,000 gallon partially buried
finished water clearwell at the
existing water treatment plant
site.

Southwest Region: Safe Drinking Water Program Man-
ager, 400 Waterfront Drive, Pittsburgh, PA 15222-4745.

Permit No. 0221520, Public Water Supply.
Applicant Pittsburgh Water and Sewer

Authority
1200 Penn Avenue
Pittsburgh, PA 15222

Township or Borough City of Pittsburgh
County Allegheny
Responsible Official Barry King, PE, PMP
Type of Facility Water system
Consulting Engineer Mott MacDonald

Two Allegheny Center
Nova Tower 2
Suite 1301
Pittsburgh, PA 15212

Application Received
Date

June 18, 2021

Description of Action Construction of a temporary
bypass booster pump station at
the existing Lincoln Pump
Station site.

Permit No. 0221520, Public Water Supply.
Applicant Pittsburgh Water and Sewer

Authority
1200 Penn Avenue
Pittsburgh, PA 15222

Township or Borough City of Pittsburgh
County Allegheny
Responsible Official Barry King, PE, PMP
Type of Facility Water system
Consulting Engineer Mott MacDonald

Two Allegheny Center
Nova Tower 2
Suite 1301
Pittsburgh, PA 15212

Application Received
Date

June 18, 2021

Description of Action Installation of new aeration
systems to reduce THM’s.

Permit No. 0221522, Public Water Supply.
Applicant West View Water Authority

210 Perry Highway
Pittsburgh, PA 15229

Township or Borough Franklin Park Borough
County Allegheny
Responsible Official Robert Christian

Executive Director
Type of Facility Water system
Consulting Engineer MS Consultant

300 Corporate Center Drive
Suite 200
Moon Township, PA 15108

Application Received
Date

June 23, 2021

Description of Action Construction of a liquid
ammonia sulfate feed system at
the Franklin Park Pump Station.
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LAND RECYCLING AND
ENVIRONMENTAL REMEDIATION

UNDER ACT 2, 1995
PREAMBLE 1

Acknowledgment of Notices of Intent to Remediate
Submitted Under the Land Recycling and Envi-
ronmental Remediation Standards Act (35 P.S.
§§ 6026.101—6026.908).

Sections 302—305 of the Land Recycling and Environ-
mental Remediation Standards Act (Act) require the
Department of Environmental Protection (Department) to
publish in the Pennsylvania Bulletin an acknowledgment
noting receipt of any Notices of Intent to Remediate. An
acknowledgment of the receipt of a Notice of Intent (NOI)
to Remediate is used to identify a site where a person
proposes to, or has been required to, respond to a release
of a regulated substance at a site. Persons intending to
use the background standard, Statewide health standard,
the site-specific standard, or who intend to remediate a
site as a special industrial area, must file a (NOI) to
Remediate with the Department. A NOI to Remediate
filed with the Department provides a brief description of
the location of the site, a list of known or suspected
contaminants at the site, the proposed remediation mea-
sures for the site, and a description of the intended future
use of the site. A person who demonstrates attainment of
one, or a combination of the cleanup standards, or who
receives approval of a special industrial area remediation
identified under the Act, will be relieved of further
liability for the remediation of the site for any contamina-
tion identified in reports submitted to and approved by
the Department. Furthermore, the person shall not be
subject to citizen suits or other contribution actions
brought by responsible persons not participating in the
remediation.

Under Sections 304(n)(1)(ii) and 305(c)(2) of the Act,
there is a 30-day public and municipal comment period
for sites proposed for remediation using a site-specific
standard, in whole or in part, and for sites remediated as
a special industrial area. This period begins when a
summary of the NOI to Remediate is published in a
newspaper of general circulation in the area of the site.
For the following identified site(s), proposed for remedia-
tion to a site-specific standard or as a special industrial
area, the municipality, within which the site is located,
may request to be involved in the development of the
remediation and reuse plans for the site if the request is
made within 30-days of the following specified date.
During this comment period the municipality may re-
quest that the following identified person, as the remedia-
tor of the site, develop and implement a public involve-
ment plan. Requests to be involved, and comments,
should be directed to the remediator of the site.

For further information concerning the content of a
NOI to Remediate, please contact the Environmental
Cleanup Program Manager in the Department of Envi-
ronmental Protection Regional Office under which the
notice appears. If information concerning this acknowl-
edgment is required in an alternative form, contact the
Community Relations Coordinator at the appropriate
Regional Office listed. TDD users may telephone the
Department through the Pennsylvania Hamilton Relay
Service at (800) 654-5984.

The Department of Environmental Protection has re-
ceived the following Notice(s) of Intent to Remediate:

Southeast Region: Environmental Cleanup & Brown-
fields Program Manager, 2 East Main Street, Norristown,
PA 19401, 484-250-5787, Charline Bass.

Philadelphia Energy Solutions Refinery Units
136/137, 3144 West Passyunk Avenue, Philadelphia, PA
19153, City of Philadelphia, Philadelphia County.
Jeffrey Smith, PG, Langan Engineering and Environmen-
tal Services, 1818 Market Street, Philadelphia, PA 19108
on behalf of Anne Garr, Philadelphia Energy Solutions
Refining & Marketing LLC, 111 South Wacker Drive,
Suite 3000, Chicago, IL 6060 submitted a Notice of Intent
to Remediate. The portion of the site has been found to be
contaminated with petroleum products which have con-
taminated soil on the site. The site will be used for
nonresidential commercial/industrial use. The proposed
cleanup standard for the site is Statewide health stan-
dard. The Notice of Intent to Remediate was published in
the Philadelphia Inquirer on June 3, 2021.

2944 Samuel Drive, 2944 Samuel Drive, Bensalem,
PA 19020, Bensalem Township, Bensalem County.
Natalie Griffith, REPSG, Inc., 6901 Kingsessing Avenue,
Suite 201, Philadelphia, PA 19142 on behalf of Howard
Weiss, 2944 Samuel Drive, Inc., 4250 Wissahickon Av-
enue, Philadelphia, PA 19129 submitted a Notice of Intent
to Remediate. Soil and groundwater have been contami-
nated with 1,4-dioxane, arsenic, benzo(b)fluoranthene,
naphthalene, pentachlorophenol, arsenic and naphtha-
lene. The proposed cleanup standard for the site is
site-specific standard/Statewide health standard. The No-
tice of Intent to Remediate was published in the Bucks
County Courier Times on June 9, 2021.

Northeast Region: Environmental Cleanup & Brown-
fields Program Manager, 2 Public Square, Wilkes-Barre,
PA 18701-1915, 570-826-2511.

Contact: Eric Supey, Environmental Program Manager.

364 West Susquehanna Street, 364 West Susque-
hanna Street, Allentown, PA 18103, Allentown City,
Lehigh County. Earth Engineering, 115 West German-
town Pike, Suite 200, East Norriton, PA 19401, on behalf
of HRES Allentown Susquehanna, LLC, 5601 Mariner
Street, Suite 100, Tampa, FL 33609, submitted a Notice
of Intent to Remediate. Soil was contaminated with
petroleum from underground storage tanks. Future use of
the site will be nonresidential. The Notice of Intent to
Remediate was published in The Morning Call on June
28, 2021.

Air Products & Chemicals—Schoeneck Road Lot
1, 3262 Schoeneck Road, Macungie, PA 18062, Lower
Macungie Township, Lehigh County. Leidos, 4640
Trindle Road, Camp Hill, PA 17011, on behalf of Air
Products and Chemicals, Inc., 7201 Hamilton Boulevard,
Allentown, PA 18195, submitted a Notice of Intent to
Remediate. Soil was contaminated by releases of petro-
leum and pesticides. Future use of the site will be
nonresidential. The Notice of Intent to Remediate was
published in The Morning Call on June 3, 2021.

Henry’s Service Station, 4024 Mountain View Drive,
Danielsville, PA 18038, Lehigh Township, Northampton
County. JMT Industrial & Environmental Contracting
Services, 710 Uhler Road, Easton, PA 18040, on behalf of
Preston Henry, 4024 Mountain View Drive, Danielsville,
PA 18038, submitted a Notice of Intent to Remediate. Soil
was contaminated by a release of gasoline from a tanker
truck. Future use of the site will be nonresidential. The
Notice of Intent to Remediate was published in The
Lehigh Valley Press on June 9, 2021.
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Southcentral Region: Environmental Cleanup and
Brownfields Program Manager, 909 Elmerton Avenue,
Harrisburg, PA 17110.

Kuhn Property, 720-724 North Hanover Street, Car-
lisle, PA 17013, North Middleton Township, Cumberland
County. Hull & Associates, P.O. Box 260, New Brighton,
PA 15066, on behalf of Real Estate Collaborative, LLC,
53 West South Street, Suite 1, Carlisle, PA 17013 submit-
ted a Notice of Intent to Remediate site soil contaminated
with TCE. The site will be remediated to the Background
Standard. Future use of the site will be a combination of
residential and/or nonresidential uses, compatible with
the surrounding area. The Notice of Intent to Remediate
was published in The Sentinel on June 14, 2021.

Former Tyco Property, 759 Hamilton Street, Car-
lisle, PA 17013, Carlisle Borough, Cumberland County.
Hull & Associates, LLC, P.O. Box 260, New Brighton, PA
15066, on behalf of Real Estate Collaborative, LLC,
53 West South Street, Suite 1, Carlisle, PA 17013,
submitted a Notice of Intent to Remediate site soil
contaminated with historical VOCs from aboveground
storage tanks. The site will be remediated to the site-
specific standard. Future use of the site is for residential
use. The Notice of Intent to Remediate was published in
The Sentinel on June 11, 2021.

Northwest Region: Environmental Cleanup and
Brownfields Program Manager, 230 Chestnut Street,
Meadville, PA 16335-3481.

Powder Mill Works, 3000 Howard Drive, New Castle,
PA 16102, Mahoning Township, Lawrence County. En-
vironmental Resource Management, 75 Valley Stream
Parkway, Suite 200, Malvern, PA 19355 on behalf of Cytec
Industries, Inc., 504 Carnegie Center, Princeton, NJ
08540 and The Chemours Company, 1007 Market Street,
Wilmington, DE 19899 has submitted a Notice of Intent
to Remediate. Historically, the site has been used to
manufacture and store explosives, store electrical equip-
ment and supplies, and manufacture specialty metals
that has resulted in site soil contaminated with 4-amino-
2,6-DNT, 2-amino-4,6-DNT, aroclor-1260, 1,3-dinitro-
benzene, 2,4-dinitrotoluene, 2,6-dinitrotoluene, 2,4,6-
trinitrotoluene, benzo(a)pyrene, PCBs, arsenic, copper,
iron, lead, manganese, mercury, thallium and site ground-
water contaminated with 1,3,5-trinitrobenzene, 1,3-dinitro-
benzene, 2,4,6-trinitrotoluene, 2,4-dinitrotoluene, 2,6-
dinitrotoluene, 2-amino-4,6-dinitrotoluene, 2-nitrotoluene,
3-nitrotoluene, 4-nitrotoluene, RDX, nitrobenzene,
p-cresol, antimony, arsenic, cobalt, and manganese. Fu-
ture use of the property will be industrial. The Notice of
Intent to Remediate was published in the New Castle
News on June 2, 2021.

DETERMINATION OF APPLICABILITY FOR
RESIDUAL WASTE GENERAL PERMITS

Application(s) for Determination of Applicability
Received Under the Solid Waste Management Act
(35 P.S. §§ 6018.101—6018.1003); the Municipal
Waste Planning, Recycling and Waste Reduction
Act (53 P.S. §§ 4000.101—4000.1904); and Residual
Waste Regulations for a General Permit to Oper-
ate Residual Waste Processing Facilities and/or
the Beneficial Use of Residual Waste Other Than
Coal Ash.

Northeast Region: Regional Solid Waste Manager, 2
Public Square, Wilkes-Barre, PA 18701-1915.

General Permit Application No. WMGR123-NE007.
Eureka Resources LLC, 315 Second Street, Williams-

port, PA 17701. An application for determination of
applicability for the processing, transfer and beneficial
use of oil and gas liquid waste at a facility located in
Dimock Township, Susquehanna County. The applica-
tion for determination of applicability was received by the
Regional Office on June 18, 2021 and deemed administra-
tively complete on July 2, 2021.

Comments concerning the application should be di-
rected to Roger Bellas, Environmental Program Manager,
Waste Management Program, Northeast Regional Office,
2 Public Square, Wilkes-Barre, PA 18701-1915 at 570-
826-2511. TDD users may contact the Department
through the Pennsylvania Hamilton Relay Service, (800)
654-5984. Public comments must be submitted within
60 days of this notice and may recommend revisions to,
and approval or denial of the application.

AIR QUALITY
PLAN APPROVAL AND OPERATING

PERMIT APPLICATIONS
The Department has developed an ‘‘integrated’’ plan

approval, State Operating Permit and Title V Operating
Permit program. This integrated approach is designed to
make the permitting process more efficient for the De-
partment, the regulated community and the general
public. This approach allows the owner or operator of a
facility to submit permitting documents relevant to its
application for all sources related to a facility or a
proposed project, affords an opportunity for public input,
and provides for a decision on the issuance of the
necessary permits.

The Department received applications for Plan Approv-
als or Operating Permits from the following facilities.
Copies of the application, the Department’s analysis, all
pertinent documents used in the evaluation of the appli-
cation and subsequently prepared proposed plan
approvals/operating permits are available for public re-
view during normal business hours at the appropriate
Department Regional Office. Appointments for scheduling
a review must be made by calling the appropriate Depart-
ment Regional Office. The address and phone number of
the Regional Office is listed before the application notices.

Persons wishing to file a written protest or provide
comments or additional information, which they believe
should be considered prior to the issuance of a permit,
may submit the information to the Department’s Regional
Office. A 30-day comment period from the date of this
publication will exist for the submission of comments,
protests and information. Each submission must contain
the name, address and telephone number of the person
submitting the comments, identification of the proposed
Plan Approval/Operating Permit including the permit
number and a concise statement regarding the relevancy
of the information or objections to issuance of the permit.

A person wishing to request a hearing may do so during
the 30-day comment period. A public hearing may be held,
if the Department, in its discretion, decides that a
hearing is warranted based on the information received.
Persons submitting comments or requesting a hearing
will be notified of the decision to hold a hearing by
publication in the newspaper, the Pennsylvania Bulletin
or by telephone, when the Department determines this
type of notification is sufficient. Requests for a public
hearing and any relevant information should be directed
to the appropriate Department Regional Office.

Permits issued to the owners or operators of sources
subject to 25 Pa. Code Chapter 127, Subchapter D or E,
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or located within a Title V facility or subject to
25 Pa. Code § 129.51(a) or permits issued for sources
with limitations on their potential to emit used to avoid
otherwise applicable Federal requirements may be sub-
mitted to the United States Environmental Protection
Agency for review and approval as a revision to the State
Implementation Plan. Final Plan Approvals and Operat-
ing Permits will contain terms and conditions to ensure
that the sources are constructed and operating in compli-
ance with applicable requirements in the Air Pollution
Control Act (35 P.S. §§ 4001—4015), 25 Pa. Code Chap-
ters 121—145, the Federal Clean Air Act (42 U.S.C.A.
§§ 7401—7671q) and regulations adopted under the Fed-
eral Clean Air Act.

Persons with a disability who wish to comment and
require an auxiliary aid, service or other accommodation
to participate should contact the Regional Office listed
before the application. TDD users may contact the De-
partment through the Pennsylvania Hamilton Relay Ser-
vice at (800) 654-5984.

Intent to Issue Plan Approvals and Intent to Issue
or Amend Operating Permits under the Air Pollu-
tion Control Act (35 P.S. §§ 4001—4015) and
25 Pa. Code Chapter 127, Subchapter B. These
actions may include the administrative amend-
ments of an associated operating permit.

Northcentral Region: Air Quality Program, 208 West
Third Street, Williamsport, PA 17701.

Contact: Muhammad Q. Zaman, Program Manager,
(570) 327-3648.

49-00033F: Watsontown Brick Co. (P.O. Box 68, Wat-
sontown, PA 17777) for the modification of Source ID
P301, a 5.5 TPH, 31 MMBtu/hr, natural gas-fired molded
brick kiln (Kiln # 3), said modification consisting of a
9 TPY increase in SOx emissions and a 0.43 TPY increase
in PM/PM10/PM2.5 emissions. This modification is the
result of the production of up to 5,400 TPY of molded buff
bricks containing up to 60% by weight clay and the
balance consisting of shale. The air contaminant emis-
sions from Kiln # 3 are controlled by a dry sorbent
injection system (ID C301A) and two fabric collectors
(ID C301B and ID C301C), in parallel. This kiln is located
at the Watsontown Plant located in Delaware Township,
Northumberland County.

The Department of Environmental Protection’s (Depart-
ment’s) review of the information submitted by the com-
pany indicates that the air contamination source will
comply with all regulatory requirements, including moni-
toring, recordkeeping, and reporting requirements, and
pertaining to air contamination source and the emission
of air contaminants including 25 Pa. Code Chapter 123,
the best available technology requirement (BAT) of
25 Pa. Code §§ 127.1 and 127.12 and 40 CFR 64, Compli-
ance Assurance Monitoring. Based on this finding, the
Department proposes to issue a plan approval for the
proposed modification.

The emissions from Kiln # 3 will not exceed the
following limits:

Particulate Matter (PM): 1.15 lbs/hr, 3.40 tons in any
12 CMP and 0.005 gr/dscf;

VOCs: 0.14 lbs/hr & 0.61 ton in any 12 CMP;
Hydrogen Fluoride (HF): 0.46 lbs/hr & 2.03 tons in any

12 CMP;
Hydrogen Chloride (HCl): 0.09 lbs/hr & 0.37 ton in any

12 CMP;

Total HAPs: 0.57 lbs/hr & 2.62 tons in any 12 CMP;
SOx: 11.59 lbs/hr & 16.10 tons in any 12 CMP;
NOx: 3.26 lbs/hr & 14.3 tons in any 12 CMP;
CO: 6.71 lbs/hr & 29.4 tons in any 12 CMP.
In addition to the emission limitations, the following is

a brief description of the conditions the Department
intends to place in the plan approval in order to ensure
compliance with all applicable air quality regulatory
requirements:

1. The only clay/shale that may be processed by Source
ID P301 shall be (a) mixtures of clay and Watsontown
shale with a clay content not to exceed 60% by weight; or
(b) 100% Watsontown shale. Additionally, the permittee
shall not process more than 3 tons per hour and 5,400
tons per year of the clay/shale mixture identified previ-
ously in (a).

2. Within a 180 days from the date of buff brick firing
in Source ID P301, the permittee shall source test P301
for hydrogen fluoride (HF), hydrogen chloride (HCl) and
sulfur oxides (SOx). In addition, the permittee shall
conduct particulate matter, nitrogen oxides and carbon
monoxide stack testing at the outlet of the dry lime
injection system’s fabric collector to determine the mass
emission rate (pounds per hour) of the respective air
contaminants. The testing shall be performed while the
kiln is firing 60% clay buff bricks at the maximum
production rate of 3 tons per hour. The permittee shall
follow the testing requirements specified in Section C,
Site Level Requirements, of this plan approval for this
testing. This emissions testing shall also include the
initial performance evaluation of the required bag leak
detection systems for fabric collectors C301B and C301C
in order to satisfy the requirements of 40 CFR 64.4(e).

3. Control device IDs C301B and C301C shall be
equipped with bag leak detection systems by the time
source testing is conducted on Source ID P301.

4. (a) The permittee shall adhere to a range of 1�—5� of
water column for pressure drop across ID C301B and
C301C so that operation within that range shall provide a
reasonable assurance of compliance. A departure from the
specified range at any time shall be defined as an
excursion. The permittee shall continue to comply with
this condition until such time as the bag leak detection
systems are installed, calibrated and put into operation.
Thereafter, the data collected from the bag leak detection
systems during the initial performance test shall be used
to provide a reasonable assurance of compliance. (b) The
permittee shall adhere to a range of 0%—5% opacity from
the exhaust of ID C301B and C301C so that operation
within that range shall provide a reasonable assurance of
compliance. A departure from the specified range at any
time shall be defined as an excursion. (c) The permittee
shall adhere to having a chemical feed rate of no less
than 50 pounds (40 pounds hydrated lime and 10 pounds
sodium bicarbonate) per hour to ID C301A when process-
ing 100% Watsontown shale, and no less than 72 pounds
per hour of sodium bicarbonate to ID C301A when
processing a mixture of 60% clay (maximum) and the
balance being Watsontown shale, so that operation at that
rate shall provide a reasonable assurance of compliance.
A departure from the specified range at any time shall be
defined as an excursion. (d) The permittee shall utilize
approved QA/QC practices that are adequate to ensure
continuing validity of data and proper performance of the
pressure drop gauge installed on ID C301B and C301C.
Once the bag leak detection systems have been installed,
calibrated and put into operation, the permittee shall
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utilize approved QA/QC practices that are adequate to
ensure continuing validity of data and proper perfor-
mance of the bag leak detection systems installed on ID
C301B and C301C. (e) The permittee shall calibrate and
check the accuracy of the pressure drop gauge taking into
account manufacturer’s specifications at least annually.
Once the bag leak detection systems have been installed,
calibrated and put into operation, the permittee shall
calibrate and check the accuracy of the bag leak detection
systems taking into account manufacturer’s specifications
at least annually. (f) The permittee shall maintain all
monitoring equipment and stock parts necessary for
routine repairs onsite. (g) The permittee shall ensure at
least 90% of the monitoring data has been properly and
accurately collected.

5. The injection rate for the ENCERTEC, Inc. model
C-5138-DIFF-07 sorbent (ID C301A) shall be at least
40 pounds per hour of hydrated lime and 10 pounds per
hour of sodium bicarbonate, when processing 100%
Watsontown shale and at least 72 pounds per hour of
sodium bicarbonate, when processing a mixture of 60%
clay (maximum) and the balance being Watsontown shale.

6. With respect to the bag leak detection systems
required for fabric collector C301B and C301C, the per-
mittee shall submit a monitoring plan to the Depart-
ment’s Northcentral Regional Office at least 90 days prior
to the scheduled source testing of Source ID P301 re-
quired by this plan approval. This monitoring plan shall
identify how the bag leak detection systems will comply
with the provisions of Condition # 007 of this plan
approval for Source ID P301. Additionally, the monitoring
plan shall also include the manufacturer’s recommended
procedures and specifications and good engineering prac-
tices for installing, testing and operating the bag leak
detection systems.

The facility is a major (Title V) facility. If the Depart-
ment determines that the source is modified in compli-
ance with the plan approval conditions and the specifica-
tions of the application for Plan Approval 49-00033F, the
requirements established in the plan approval will be
incorporated into Title V Operating Permit 49-00033
pursuant to the administrative amendment provisions of
25 Pa. Code § 127.450.

All pertinent documents used in the evaluation of the
application are available for public review during normal
business hours at the Department’s Northcentral Re-
gional Office, 208 West Third Street, Suite 101, Williams-
port, PA 17701. Appointments for scheduling a review
must be made by calling 570-327-3636.

OPERATING PERMITS

Intent to Issue Title V Operating Permits under the
Air Pollution Control Act (35 P.S. §§ 4001—4015)
and 25 Pa. Code Chapter 127, Subchapter G.

Southeast Region: Air Quality Program, 2 East Main
Street, Norristown, PA 19401.

Contact: Janine Tulloch-Reid, Facilities Permitting
Chief, (484) 250-5920.

09-00174: Liberty Coating Company (21 South Steel
Road, Morrisville, PA 19057-3614) for renewal of the Title
V Operating Permit located in the Falls Township, Bucks
County. The facility operations include grit blasting and
surface coating of steel pipes that are used by utility
(water/electric) companies. Due to the potential emissions
of Volatile Organic Compounds, the facility is a major
stationary source as defined in Title I, Part D of the

Clean Air Act Amendments, and is therefore subject to
the Title V permitting requirements adopted in
25 Pa. Code Chapter 127, Subchapter G. The proposed
Title V Operating Permit Renewal does not reflect any
change in air emissions from the facility. The Title V
Operating Permit contains monitoring and recordkeeping
condition along with work practice standards designed to
keep the facility operating within all applicable air
quality requirements.

Anyone wishing to request information regarding this
action can do so by contacting the Southeast Regional
Office through the contact person listed in the previously
listed header. Comments on the draft permit can be
submitted through the Air Quality resource account at
RA-EPSEROPUBCOM@pa.gov.

Intent to Issue Operating Permits under the Air
Pollution Control Act (35 P.S. §§ 4001—4015) and
25 Pa. Code Chapter 127, Subchapter F.

Northeast Region: Air Quality Program, 2 Public
Square, Wilkes-Barre, PA 18701-1915.

Contact: Norman Frederick, Facility Permitting Chief.
(570) 826-2409.

39-00078: Gateway Industrial Services (805 Harri-
son Street, Allentown, PA 18103). The Department in-
tends to issue a State-Only Operating Permit renewal for
their facility located in Allentown City, Lehigh County.
The renewal State-Only Operating Permit includes emis-
sion limits, work practice standards, testing, monitoring,
recordkeeping, and reporting requirements designed to
insure the operation of the facility within applicable air
quality requirements.

48-00016: Lehigh University (681 Taylor Street,
Bethlehem, PA 18015). The Department intends to issue a
State-Only Operating Permit renewal for their facility
located in Bethlehem City, Northampton County. The
renewal State-Only Operating Permit includes emission
limits, work practice standards, testing, monitoring,
recordkeeping, and reporting requirements designed to
insure the operation of the facility within applicable air
quality requirements.

54-00087: D.G. Yuengling & Sons, Inc. (310 Mill
Creek Ave, Pottsville, PA 17901). The Department intends
to issue a State-Only Operating Permit renewal for their
facility located in Port Carbon Borough, Schuylkill
County. The renewal State-Only Operating Permit in-
cludes emission limits, work practice standards, testing,
monitoring, recordkeeping, and reporting requirements
designed to insure the operation of the facility within
applicable air quality requirements.

66-00008: Oxbow Creek Energy, LLC (789 State
Route 29N, Tunkhannock, PA 18657). The Department
intends to issue a State-Only Operating Permit renewal
for their facility located in Nicholson Township, Wyoming
County. The renewal State-Only Operating Permit in-
cludes emission limits, work practice standards, testing,
monitoring, recordkeeping, and reporting requirements
designed to insure the operation of the facility within
applicable air quality requirements.

Northcentral Region: Air Quality Program, 208 West
Third Street, Williamsport, PA 17701.

Contact: Muhammad Q. Zaman, Program Manager,
570-327-3648.

17-00017: Eagle Railcar Services—DuBois PA, LLC
(450 Osborn Avenue, DuBois, PA 15801-1854) for the
State Only Operating Permit renewal authorization and
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Synthetic Minor permit for their railcar repair facility in
DuBois City, Clearfield County. The existing sources for
the Synthetic Minor facility are comprised of various
combustion units fired on natural gas (Sources ID 031
and 032), the misc. metal parts surface coating operations
(Sources ID P201 through P203), railcar abrasive blasting
operations (Sources ID P204 and P206) as well as the
railcar cleaning operations (Sources ID P205). The con-
trols for Sources ID P201 and P202 are overspray paint
filters, and the abrasive blasting emissions are to be
controlled by their own fabric collector devices. Several
controls, including an air assisted flare, a caustic scrub-
ber, and a carbon adsorption system, are used as add-on
controls for the vapor abatement systems associated with
the Source ID P205 railcar cleaning operation. The type
and quantity of pollutants emitted on a facility-wide
potential emissions basis are provided, as follows:
31.9 tpy of PM-10; 0.1 tpy of SOx; 13.3 tpy of NOx;
11.2 tpy of CO; 49.78 tpy of VOC; 24.9 TPY of HAP; and
15,964 tpy of CO2, based on the information provided to
the Department. No modifications to the facility occurred
over the permit term. All railcars processed at the facility
are subject to limitations or throughput restrictions and
required to be vented and/or cleaned in accordance with
the existing permit terms and conditions that will be
included in the renewal permit pursuant to BAT. The
railcar finishing operations will also be subject to
restrictions/limitations and its own existing BAT require-
ments, along with the standards and other requirements
from 25 Pa. Code § 129.52d. Additionally, the renewal
permit incorporates all other applicable requirements to
the facility including appropriate testing, monitoring,
recordkeeping, reporting and work practice conditions to
verify compliance. The applicable requirements are de-
rived from 25 Pa. Code Chapters 121 and 145 (relating to
Air Resources). All pertinent documents used in the
evaluation of the application are available for public
review during normal business hours at the PA DEP’s
Northcentral Regional Office, 208 West Third Street,
Suite 101, Williamsport, PA 17701. Appointments for
scheduling a review must be made by calling 570-
327-3636.

08-00043: Glenn O Hawbaker, Inc. (711 East College
Avenue, Pleasant Gap, PA 16823-1854) for the State Only
Operating Permit renewal authorization and Synthetic
Minor permit for their Greens Landing facility located in
Athens Township, Bradford County. The existing
sources for the Synthetic Minor facility are comprised of a
sand and gravel wash plant and a hot mix asphalt plant.
The controls for the hot mix asphalt plant is a knock-out
box and a fabric collector. The type and quantity of
pollutants emitted on a facility-wide potential emissions
basis are provided, as follows: 66.72 tpy of PM-10;
85.95 tpy of SOx; 62.09 tpy of NOx; 78.43 tpy of CO;
17.38 tpy of VOC; and 4.35 TPY of HAP based on the
information provided to the Department. No modifications
to the facility occurred over the permit term. Additionally,
the renewal permit incorporates all other applicable
requirements to the facility including appropriate testing,
monitoring, recordkeeping, reporting and work practice
conditions to verify compliance. The applicable require-
ments are derived from 25 Pa. Code Chapters 121 and
145 (relating to Air Resources) and 40 CFR Part 60
Subpart OOO and Subpart I. All pertinent documents
used in the evaluation of the application are available for
public review during normal business hours at the PA
DEP’s Northcentral Regional Office, 208 West Third
Street, Suite 101, Williamsport, PA 17701. Appointments
for scheduling a review must be made by calling 570-
327-3636.

18-00012: Lock Haven University (410 North Fair-
view Street, Lock Haven, PA 17745) for the State Only
Operating Permit renewal authorization and Synthetic
Minor permit for their campus located in Lock Haven
City, Clinton County. The facility’s main existing
sources for the Synthetic Minor facility are comprised of a
natural gas/No. 2 fuel oil fired combustion units and
emergency generators. The type and quantity of pollu-
tants emitted on a facility-wide potential emissions basis
are provided, as follows: 4.47 tpy of PM-10; 25.42 tpy of
SOx; 65.47 tpy of NOx; 35.03 tpy of CO; 3.30 tpy of VOC;
and 0.71 TPY of HAP based on the information provided
to the Department. No modifications to the facility oc-
curred over the permit term. Additionally, the renewal
permit incorporates all other applicable requirements to
the facility including appropriate testing, monitoring,
recordkeeping, reporting and work practice conditions to
verify compliance. The applicable requirements are de-
rived from 25 Pa. Code Chapters 121 and 145 (relating to
Air Resources) and 40 CFR Parts 60 and 63. All pertinent
documents used in the evaluation of the application are
available for public review during normal business hours
at the PA DEP’s Northcentral Regional Office, 208 West
Third Street, Suite 101, Williamsport, PA 17701. Appoint-
ments for scheduling a review must be made by calling
570-327-3636.

18-00027: Pine Creek Structures, LLC (P.O. Box
205, Mill Hall, PA 17751-0205) for issuance of a renewal
State-Only Operating Permit for operation of its facility
located in Lamar Township, Clinton County. The facility
is currently operating under State Only Operating Permit
18-00027. The facility’s sources include two propane-fired
combustion units with a combined maximum heat input
rating of 0.076 MMBtu/hr; one diesel-fired engine; one
wooden-structure surface coating operation; and one
woodworking operation consisting of table saws, chop
saws, and a grinder all controlled by a fabric collector.
The facility has the potential to emit up to 0.90 ton of
PM/PM10, 3.99 tons of HAPs, 2.51 tons of SOx, 3.23 tons
of NOx, 28.21 tons of VOCs, and 0.54 ton of CO per year
based on the information provided to the Department.
Additionally, the renewal permit incorporates all other
applicable requirements to the facility including appropri-
ate testing, monitoring, recordkeeping, reporting and
work practice conditions to verify compliance. The appli-
cable requirements are derived from 25 Pa. Code Chap-
ters 121 and 145 (relating to Air Resources) and 40 CFR
Parts 60 and 63. All pertinent documents used in the
evaluation of the application are available for public
review during normal business hours at the PA DEP’s
Northcentral Regional Office, 208 West Third Street,
Suite 101, Williamsport, PA 17701. Appointments for
scheduling a review must be made by calling 570-
327-3636.

Southwest Regional Office: 400 Waterfront Drive, Pitts-
burgh, PA 15222-4745.

Contact: Thomas Joseph, Facilities Permitting Chief,
412.442.4336.

63-00883: Pennsylvania Transformer Technology,
Inc. (30 Curry Avenue, Canonsburg, PA 15317). In accord-
ance with 25 Pa. Code §§ 127.424 and 127.425 the De-
partment of Environmental Protection (DEP) gives notice
that they intend to issue a Synthetic Minor State Only
Operating Permit (SOOP) renewal to Pennsylvania Trans-
former Technology to authorize the continued operation of
their facility located in Canonsburg Borough, Washing-
ton County.
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Pa Transformer manufactures large electrical power
transformers used in utility and large commercial appli-
cations. The facility consists of a paint spray booth with
fabric filter, an abrasive blasting booth controlled by a
baghouse, rotoblast, shell oven, plasma and torch cutter,
miscellaneous natural gas combustion sources, and parts
washers. There are several baghouses and filter to control
particulate emissions.

This facility has the potential to emit approximately
32.63 tons per year of VOC, 20.01 tons per year of HAPs,
1.62 tons per year of PM10, 0.05 ton per year of NOx, and
0.02 ton per year of SOx. The facility has a limit of 33
tons per year of VOCs and 17 tons per year of an
aggregated group of HAPs. The proposed SOOP renewal
contains emission restriction, testing, monitoring, record-
keeping, reporting and work practice conditions of the
proposed permit have been derived from the applicable
requirements of 25 Pa. Code Article III, Chapters 121—
145.

A person may oppose the proposed State Only Operat-
ing Permit by filing a written protest with the Depart-
ment through Noor Nahar via mail to Pennsylvania
Department of Environmental Protection, 400 Waterfront
Drive, Pittsburgh, PA 15222. Each protest or set of
written comments must contain the name, address and
telephone number of the person submitting the com-
ments, identification of the proposed State Only Operat-
ing Permit (63-00883) and a concise statement of the
objections to the Operating Permit issuance and the
relevant facts upon which the objections are based.

Pennsylvania Transformer Technology, Inc. State Only
Operating Permit Application, the Department’s Air Qual-
ity Review Memorandum, and the Proposed Air Quality
Operating Permit for this facility are available for review
by any interested party at the Pennsylvania Department
of Environmental Protection, Southwest Regional Office,
400 Waterfront Drive, Pittsburgh, PA 15222. To request a
review of the Pennsylvania Transformer Technology, Inc.
State Only Operating Permit application, to receive an
electronic copy of the Department’s Air Quality Review
Memorandum, or to receive an electronic copy of the
Department’s proposed air Quality Operating Permit for
this facility, a person may contact Noor Nahar at
nnahar@pa.gov or 412.442.5225.

All comments must be received prior to the close of
business 30 days after the date of this publication.

Philadelphia: Air Management Services, 321 University
Avenue, Philadelphia, PA 19104-4543, Contact: Edward
Wiener, Chief, Source Registration at 215-685-9426.

The City of Philadelphia, Air Management Services
(AMS) intends to issue an Initial Natural Minor Operat-
ing Permit for operation of air pollution sources at the
following facility:

OP20-000011: Martin Luther King High School
(6100 Stenton Ave, Philadelphia, PA 19138) for the opera-
tion of school, in the City of Philadelphia, Philadelphia
County. The facility’s air emission sources include four
(4) boilers firing natural gas and diesel fuel oil used for
backup each rated less than 5 MMBtu/hr and one (1)
water heater firing natural gas rated less than 1 MMBtu/
hr. The operating permit will contain operating, monitor-
ing, recordkeeping, and reporting requirements to ensure
operation within all applicable requirements.

The operating permit will be issued under 25 Pa. Code,
Philadelphia Code Title 3 and Air Management Regula-
tion XIII. Permit copies and other supporting information
are available for public inspection at AMS, 321 University

Avenue, Philadelphia, PA 19104. For further information,
contact Edward Wiener at (215) 685-9426.

Persons wishing to file protest, comments, or request a
public hearing on the previously listed operating permit
must submit the protest, comments or request for public
hearing within 30 days from the date of this notice. Any
protests or comments filed with AMS must include a
concise statement of the objections to the permit issuance
and the relevant facts upon which the objections are
based. Based upon the information received during the
public comment period, AMS may modify the operating
permit or schedule a public hearing. The hearing notice
will be published in the Pennsylvania Bulletin and a local
newspaper at least thirty days before the hearing.

The City of Philadelphia, Air Management Services
(AMS) intends to issue a Synthetic Minor Operating
Permit Renewal for operation of air pollution sources at
the following facility:

OP21-000010: PA Convention Center (1101 Arch St.,
Philadelphia, PA 19107) for the operation of convention
center, in the City of Philadelphia, Philadelphia
County. The facility’s air emission sources include two
(2) boilers firing natural gas or No. 2 oil each rated less
than 21 MMBtu/hr, one (1) boiler firing natural gas rated
less than 1 MMBtu/hr, two (2) chillers firing natural gas
or No. 2 oil each rated less than 9 MMBtu/hr, three (3)
emergency generators firing No. 2 oil rated 671 HP,
671 HP, and 805 HP respectively, and one (1) fire pump
firing No. 2 oil rated 270 HP. The operating permit will
contain operating, monitoring, recordkeeping, and report-
ing requirements to ensure operation within all applicable
requirements.

The operating permit will be issued under 25 Pa. Code,
Philadelphia Code Title 3 and Air Management Regula-
tion XIII. Permit copies and other supporting information
are available for public inspection at AMS, 321 University
Avenue, Philadelphia, PA 19104. For further information,
contact Edward Wiener at (215) 685-9426.

Persons wishing to file protest, comments, or request a
public hearing on the previously listed operating permit
must submit the protest, comments or request for public
hearing within 30 days from the date of this notice. Any
protests or comments filed with AMS must include a
concise statement of the objections to the permit issuance
and the relevant facts upon which the objections are
based. Based upon the information received during the
public comment period, AMS may modify the operating
permit or schedule a public hearing. The hearing notice
will be published in the Pennsylvania Bulletin and a local
newspaper at least thirty days before the hearing.

PLAN APPROVALS

Receipt of Plan Approval Applications and Intent to
Issue Plan Approvals, and Intent to Issue
Amended Operating Permits under the Air Pollu-
tion Control Act (35 P.S. §§ 4001—4015) and 25
Pa. Code Chapter 127, Subchapter B and
Subchapter F. These actions may include the
administrative amendments of an associated op-
erating permit.

Northeast Region: Air Quality Program, 2 Public
Square, Wilkes-Barre, PA 18701-1915.

Contact: Raymond Kempa, New Source Review Chief,
(570) 826-2531.

Notice is hereby given in accordance with 25 Pa. Code
§§ 127.44(a) and 127.45(a), that the Department of Envi-
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ronmental Protection (DEP) has received and intends to
issue a Plan Approval to Eureka Resources LLC (315
Second Street, Williamsport, PA 17701) for their facility
to be located in Dimock Twp., Susquehanna County.
This Plan Approval No. 58-00024A will be incorporated
into a State Only Permit through an administrative
amendment at a later date.

Plan Approval No. 58-00024A is for the installation
of a shale gas well water treatment facility. VOC emis-
sions form the plant will be under 50 TPY threshold
limit, 12-month rolling sum. Total HAP emissions from
the facility will be under 25 TPY, 12-month rolling sum.
Single HAP emissions will be under 10 TPY, 12-month
rolling sum. The company shall be subject to and comply
with 25 Pa. Code § 123.31 for malodorous emissions. The
company shall be subject to and comply with 25 Pa. Code
§ 123.41 for Visible emissions. These limits will meet
BAT requirements. The Plan Approval and Operating
permit will contain additional recordkeeping and operat-
ing restrictions designed to keep the facility operating
within all applicable air quality requirements.

Copies of the application, DEP’s analysis and other
documents used in the evaluation of the application are
available for public review during normal business hours
at Air Quality Program, 2 Public Square, Wilkes-Barre,
PA 18711.

Any person(s) wishing to provide DEP with additional
information, which they believe should be considered
prior to the issuance of this permit, may submit the
information to the address shown in the preceding para-
graph. Each written comment must contain the name,
address and telephone number of the person submitting
the comments, identification of the proposed permit No.
58-00024A and a concise statement regarding the rel-
evancy of the information or objections to the issuance of
the permit.

A public hearing may be held, if the Department of
Environmental Protection, in its discretion, decides that
such a hearing is warranted based on the comments
received. All persons submitting comments or requesting
a hearing will be notified of the decision to hold a hearing
by publication in the newspaper or the Pennsylvania
Bulletin or by telephone, where DEP determines such
notification is sufficient. Written comments or requests
for a public hearing should be directed to Ray Kempa,
Chief, New Source Review Section, Air Quality Program,
2 Public Square, Wilkes-Barre, PA 18711, Phone 570-
826-2511 within 30 days after publication date.

COAL & NONCOAL MINING ACTIVITY
APPLICATIONS

Applications under the Surface Mining Conservation
and Reclamation Act (52 P.S. §§ 1396.1—1396.31); the
Noncoal Surface Mining Conservation and Reclamation
Act (52 P.S. §§ 3301—3326); the Clean Streams Law
(35 P.S. §§ 691.1—691.1001); the Coal Refuse Disposal

Control Act (52 P.S. §§ 30.51—30.66); the Bituminous
Mine Subsidence and Land Conservation Act (52 P.S.
§§ 1406.1—1406.21). Mining activity permits issued in
response to such applications will also address the appli-
cable permitting requirements of the following statutes:
the Air Pollution Control Act (35 P.S. §§ 4001—4015); the
Dam Safety and Encroachments Act (32 P.S. §§ 693.1—
693.27); and the Solid Waste Management Act (35 P.S.
§§ 6018.101—6018.1003).

The following permit applications to conduct mining
activities have been received by the Department of Envi-
ronmental Protection. A copy of the application is avail-
able for inspection at the District Mining Office indicated
above each application. Notices of requests for 401 Water
Quality Certifications are included in individual applica-
tion notices, as noted.

Written comments or objections, or requests for an
informal conference, or a public hearing, as applicable, on
a mining permit application may be submitted by any
person or any officer or head of any Federal, State or
local government agency or authority to the Department
at the address of the District Mining Office indicated
above each application within 30-days of this publica-
ion, or within 30-days after the last publication of
the applicant’s newspaper advertisement, as provided by
25 Pa. Code §§ 77.121—77.123 and 86.31—86.34 (relating
to public notices of filing of permit applications, opportu-
nity for comment, and informal conferences).

Written comments or objections related to a mining
permit application should contain the name, address and
telephone number of persons submitting comments or
objections; application number; and a statement of suffi-
cient detail to inform the Department on the basis of
comment or objection and relevant facts upon which it is
based.

Requests for an informal conference, or a public hear-
ing, as applicable, on a mining permit application, as
provided by 25 Pa. Code § 77.123 (relating to public
hearing-informal conferences) or § 86.34 (relating to in-
formal conferences), must contain the name, address and
telephone number of the requestor; the application num-
ber; a brief summary of the issues to be raised by the
requestor at the conference; and a statement whether the
requestor desires to have the conference conducted in the
locality of the proposed mining activities.

Where a National Pollutant Discharge Elimination
System (NPDES) number is listed, the mining activity
permit application was accompanied by an application for
an individual NPDES permit. A separate notice will be
provided after the draft NPDES permit is prepared.

Coal Applications Received
Effluent Limits—The following range of effluent limits

will apply to NPDES permits issued in conjunction with
the associated coal mining activity permit and, in some
cases, noncoal mining permits:

Table 1
30-Day Daily Instantaneous

Parameter Average Maximum Maximum
Iron (total) 1.5 to 3.0 mg/l 3.0 to 6.0 mg/l 3.5 to 7.0 mg/l
Manganese (total) 1.0 to 2.0 mg/l 2.0 to 4.0 mg/l 2.5 to 5.0 mg/l
Suspended solids 10 to 35 mg/l 20 to 70 mg/l 25 to 90 mg/l
Aluminum (Total) 0.75 to 2.0 mg/l 1.5 to 4.0 mg/l 2.0 to 5.0 mg/l
pH1 greater than 6.0; less than 9.0
Alkalinity greater than acidity1

1 The parameter is applicable at all times.
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A settleable solids instantaneous maximum limit of 0.5 ml/l applied to: surface runoff (resulting from a precipitation
event of less than or equal to a 10-year 24-hour event) from active mining areas; active areas disturbed by coal refuse
disposal activities; and mined areas backfilled and revegetated; and drainage (resulting from a precipitation event of less
than or equal to a 1-year 24-hour event) from coal refuse disposal piles.

Cambria District Mining Office: 286 Industrial Park Road, Ebensburg, PA 15931, (814) 472-1900, (Contact: Melanie
Ford-Wigfield).

Permit 32210101 and NPDES No. PA0279811. Alverda Enterprises, Inc., 10860 Route 553, P.O. Box 245, Alverda,
PA 15710, commencement, operation and restoration of a bituminous surface mine in Pine Township, Indiana County
affecting 12.5 acres. Receiving stream: unnamed tributary to Yellow Creek and Yellow Creek classified for the following
use: cold water fishes & cold-water fishes. There are no potable water supply intakes within 10 miles downstream.
Application received: June 17, 2021.

Permit No. 56140106. Mountaineer Mining Corp., 1010 Garrett Shortcut Road, Berlin, PA 15530, permit renewal
for reclamation only of a bituminous surface & auger mine in Brothersvalley Township, Somerset County, affecting 36.0
acres. Receiving streams: unnamed tributaries to Piney Run classified for the following use: cold water fishes. There are
no potable water supply intakes within 10 miles downstream. Application received: June 28, 2021.

New Stanton District Office: P.O. Box 133, New Stanton, PA 15672, (724) 925-5500, (Contact: Tracy Norbert).

02880102. William J. Kisow, 82 South Petrie Road, Coraopolis, PA 15108. Renewal application for reclamation only to
an existing bituminous surface mine, located in Kennedy and Robinson Townships, Allegheny County, affecting 15.7
acres. Receiving streams: unnamed tributary to Chartiers Creek, to Chartiers Creek, to Ohio River. Renewal application
received: June 28, 2021.

Pottsville District Mining Office: 5 West Laurel Boulevard, Pottsville, PA 17901, (570) 621-3118, (Contact: Theresa
Reilly-Flannery).

Permit No. GP12-22851602R. Rausch Creek Coal Preparation Lykens, LLC, 978 Gap Street, Valley View, PA
17983, renewal application to operate a coal preparation plant whose pollution control equipment is required to meet all
applicable limitations, terms and conditions of General Permit, BAQ-GPA/GP-12 on Surface Mining Permit No. 22851602
in Wiconisco Township, Dauphin County. Application received: May 13, 2021.

Noncoal Applications Received Effluent Limits—The following effluent limits will apply to NPDES permits issued in
conjunction with a noncoal mining permit:

Table 2
30-day Daily Instantaneous

Parameter Average Maximum Maximum
Suspended solids 10 to 35 mg/l 20 to 70 mg/l 25 to 90 mg/l
Alkalinity exceeding acidity*
pH* greater than 6.0; less than 9.0
* The parameter is applicable at all times.

A settleable solids instantaneous maximum limit of 0.5 ml/l applied to surface runoff resulting from a precipitation
event of less than or equal to a 10-year 24-hour event. If coal will be extracted incidental to the extraction of noncoal
minerals, at a minimum, the technology-based effluent limitations identified under coal applications will apply to
discharges of wastewater to streams.

Cambria District Mining Office: 286 Industrial Park Road, Ebensburg, PA 15931, (814) 472-1900, (Contact: Melanie
Ford-Wigfield).

Permit 32212801 and NPDES No. PA0279803. ABM Mining Co., Inc., 3330 Johnston Road, Smicksburg, PA 16256,
commencement, operation and restoration of a small noncoal (industrial minerals) operation in Grant Township, Indiana
County, affecting 5.0 acres. Receiving stream(s): unnamed tributary to Little Mahoning Creek. Application received:
June 24, 2021.

Knox District Mining Office: P.O. Box 669, 310 Best Avenue, Knox, PA 16232-0669, (814) 797-1191, (Contact: Cayleigh
Boniger).

37150302 and NPDES No. PA0259683. Amerikohl Aggregates, Inc., 202 Sunset Drive, Butler, PA 16001, Revision
to an existing large industrial minerals surface mine to relocate the wetland mitigation area in Shenango Township,
Lawrence County. Receiving stream(s): Unnamed tributaries to McKee Run and McKee Run, classified for the following
use(s): WWF. There are no potable surface water supply intakes within 10 miles downstream. Application received: June
14, 2021.

Pottsville District Mining Office: 5 West Laurel Boulevard, Pottsville, PA 17901, (570) 621-3118, (Contact: Theresa
Reilly-Flannery).

Permit No. 64990802. Brian W. Smith, 1207 Calkins Road, Milanville, PA 18443, Stage I & II bond release of a
quarry operation in Damascus Township, Wayne County affecting 1.0 acre on quarry owned by Brian W. Smith.
Application received: June 20, 2021.

Permit No. 58202501 and NPDES Permit No. PA0226092. Wesley Newbury, 2432 US Route 11, Kirkwood, NY
13795, commencement, operation and restoration of a quarry operation and NPDES Permit for discharge of treated mine
drainage in Great Bend Township, Susquehanna County affecting 10.0 acres. Receiving stream: unnamed tributary to
Salt Lick Creek. Application received: February 24, 2020. Application withdrawn: July 1, 2021.
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Coal NPDES Draft Permits

Cambria District Mining Office: 286 Industrial Park Road, Ebensburg, PA 15931, (814) 472.1900.

NPDES No. PA0607606 (Mining Permit No. 32810135). M.B. Energy, Inc., 175 McKnight Road, Blairsville, PA
15717, renewal of an NPDES permit for bituminous surface mine in West Wheatfield Township, Indiana County,
affecting 5.3 acres. Receiving stream(s): unnamed tributary to Blacklick Creek, classified for the following use(s): cold
water fishes. This receiving stream is included in the Kiski-Conemaugh TMDL. Application received: June 8, 2021.

Unless otherwise noted for a specific outfall, the proposed effluent limits for all outfalls in this permit are the BAT
limits described previously for coal mining activities.

The following outfalls discharges to unnamed tributary to Blacklick Creek:
Outfall Nos. New Outfall (Y/N) Type

002 N TFO

The proposed effluent limits for the previously listed outfall are as follows:
Outfalls: 002 (All Weather Conditions) 30-Day Daily Instant.
Parameter Average Maximum Maximum
Iron (mg/l) 2.6 5.2 6.5
Manganese (mg/l) 1.4 2.8 3.5
Aluminum (mg/l) 1.1 2.2 2.7
Total Suspended Solids (mg/l) 35.0 70.0 90.0
pH (S.U.): Must be between 6.0 and 9.0 standard units at all times.
Alkalinity must exceed acidity at all times.

NPDES No. PA0279421 (Mining Permit No. 32150101). Amerikohl Mining, Inc., 202 Sunset Avenue, Butler, PA
16001, renewal of an NPDES permit for a post-mining discharge in West Wheatfield Township, Indiana County,
affecting 50.5 acres. Receiving stream(s): Unnamed Tributary to Roaring Run, classified for the following use(s): Cold
Water Fishes (CWF). This receiving stream is included in the Kiski-Conemaugh TMDL. Application received: May 18,
2021

The following outfall discharges to Unnamed Tributary to Roaring Run:
Outfall Nos. New Outfall (Y/N)

006 (ALD Passive Treatment System) N

The proposed effluent limits for the previously listed outfall are as follows:
Outfalls: (All Weather Conditions) 30-Day Daily Instant.
Parameter Average Maximum Maximum
Iron (mg/l) 3.0 6.0 7.0
Manganese (mg/l) 2.0 4.0 5.0
Aluminum (mg/l) 1.9 3.8 4.7
Total Suspended Solids (mg/l) 35.0 70.0 90.0
pH (S.U.): Must be between 6.0 and 9.0 standard units at all times.
Alkalinity must exceed acidity at all times.

NPDES No. PA0262951 (Mining Permit No. 56100101). PBS Coals, Inc., P.O. Box 260, Friedens, PA 15541,
renewal of an NPDES permit for bituminous surface mine in Paint Township, Somerset County, affecting 71.6.0 acres.
Receiving stream(s): Stonycreek River, classified for the following use(s): cold water fishery. This receiving stream is
included in the Kiski-Conemaugh TMDL. Application received: June 22, 2021.

Unless otherwise noted for a specific outfall, the proposed effluent limits for all outfalls in this permit are the BAT
limits described previously for coal mining activities.

The following outfalls discharge to Stonycreek River:
Outfall Nos. New Outfall (Y/N)

003 N
006 N

The proposed effluent limits for the previously listed outfalls are as follows:
Outfalls: 003 and 006 30-Day Daily Instant.
Parameter Average Maximum Maximum
Iron (mg/l) 1.5 3.0 3.7
Manganese (mg/l) 1.0 2.0 2.5
Aluminum (mg/l) 0.75 0.75 0.75
Total Suspended Solids (mg/l) 35.0 70.0 90.0
pH (S.U.): Must be between 6.0 and 9.0 standard units at all times.
Alkalinity must exceed acidity at all times.
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Knox District Mining Office: White Memorial Building, P.O. Box 669, Knox, PA 16232-0669, (814) 797.1191.

NPDES No. PA0259527 (Permit No. 33140105). Original Fuels, Inc., P.O. Box 343, Punxsutawney, PA 15767,
Renewal of an NPDES permit for a bituminous surface mine in Perry and Young Townships, Jefferson County, affecting
131.5 acres. Receiving stream(s): Unnamed tributaries to Mahoning Creek and Mahoning Creek, classified for the
following use(s): WWF. TMDL: None. Application received: May 12, 2021.

Unless otherwise noted for a specific outfall, the proposed effluent limits for all outfalls in this permit are the BAT
limits described previously for the coal mining activities.

The following outfalls discharge to unnamed tributaries to Mahoning Creek:
Outfall Nos. New Outfall (Y/N)

001 N
002 N
003 N
004 N
005 N
006 N

The proposed effluent limits for the previously listed outfalls are as follows:
30-Day Daily Instant.

Parameter Minimum Average Maximum Maximum
pH1 (S.U.) 6.0 9.0
Iron (mg/l) 3.0 6.0 7.0
Manganese (mg/l) 2.0 4.0 5.0
Aluminum (mg/l) 2.0 4.0 5.0
Total Suspended Solids (mg/l) 35.0 70.0 90.0
Alkalinity greater than acidity1

1 The parameter is applicable at all times.

The following outfalls discharge to unnamed tributaries to Mahoning Creek and Mahoning Creek:
Outfall Nos. New Outfall (Y/N)

011 N
012 N
013 N
014 N
015 N
016 N

The proposed effluent limits for the previously listed outfalls are as follows:
30-Day Daily Instant.

Parameter Minimum Average Maximum Maximum
pH1 (S.U.) 6.0 9.0
Iron (mg/l) 3.0 6.0 7.0
Manganese (mg/l) 2.0 4.0 5.0
Aluminum (mg/l) 2.0 4.0 5.0
Total Suspended Solids (mg/l) 35.0 70.0 90.0
Alkalinity greater than acidity1

1 The parameter is applicable at all times.

The following outfalls discharge to unnamed tributaries to Mahoning Creek:
Outfall Nos. New Outfall (Y/N)

007 N
008 N
009 N
010 N

The proposed effluent limits for the previously listed outfalls are as follows:
30-Day Daily Instant.

Parameter Minimum Average Maximum Maximum
pH1 (S.U.) 6.0 9.0
Iron (mg/l) 3.0 6.0 7.0
Manganese (mg/l) 2.0 4.0 5.0
Aluminum (mg/l) 2.0 4.0 5.0
Total Suspended Solids (mg/l) 35.0 70.0 90.0
Alkalinity greater than acidity1

1 The parameter is applicable at all times.
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The following outfalls discharge to unnamed tributaries to Mahoning Creek and Mahoning Creek:
Outfall Nos. New Outfall (Y/N)

017 N
018 N
019 N

The proposed effluent limits for the previously listed outfalls are as follows:
30-Day Daily Instant.

Parameter Minimum Average Maximum Maximum
pH1 (S.U.) 6.0 9.0
Iron (mg/l) 3.0 6.0 7.0
Manganese (mg/l) 2.0 4.0 5.0
Aluminum (mg/l) 2.0 4.0 5.0
Total Suspended Solids (mg/l) 35.0 70.0 90.0
Alkalinity greater than acidity1

1 The parameter is applicable at all times.

Moshannon District Mining Office: 186 Enterprise Drive, Philipsburg, PA 16866, (814) 342.8200.

NPDES No. PA0256498 (Mining Permit No. 17070103), Rosebud Mining Company, 301 Market Street,
Kittanning, PA 16201, modification of an NPDES permit for treatment of pre-existing pollutional discharges in Girard
Township, Clearfield County, affecting 326 acres. Receiving stream(s): Unnamed Tributaries to Little Deer Creek and to
Deer Creek, classified for the following use(s): CWF. This receiving stream is included in the Deer Creek Watershed
TMDL. Application received: January 7, 2021.

Unless otherwise noted for a specific outfall, the proposed effluent limits for all outfalls in this permit are the BAT
limits described previously for coal mining activities.

The following outfall discharges to Unnamed Tributary ‘A’ to Little Deer Creek:
Outfall Nos. New Outfall (Y/N) Type

012 Y Treatment Facility TF4

The proposed effluent limits for the previously listed outfall are as follows:
Outfalls: 012 (All Weather Conditions) 30-Day Daily Instant.
Parameter Average Maximum Maximum
Net Acidity (lbs/day) N/A N/A 112
Iron (lbs/day) N/A N/A 4.36
Manganese (lbs/day) N/A N/A 9.09
Aluminum (lbs/day) N/A N/A 13.7
Total Suspended Solids (mg/L) Monitor & Report
Sulfate (mg/L) Monitor & Report
Flow (gpm) Monitor & Report
Temperature (°C) Monitor & Report
Specific Conductivity (µmhos/cm) Monitor & Report
pH (S.U.): Must be between 6.0 and 9.0 standard units at all times.
Alkalinity must exceed acidity at all times.

This proposed mine site also contains or is hydrologically connected to substandard discharges for which there is no
responsible party. Pursuant to 25 Pa. Code Chapter 87, Subchapter F, effluent limits for those discharges will be based
upon the existing baseline pollution load, or the standards found at 25 Pa. Code Chapter 87.102(a) Group A, whichever is
least stringent.

Noncoal NPDES Draft Permits

Cambria District Mining Office: 286 Industrial Park Road, Ebensburg, PA 15931, (814) 472.1900.

NPDES No. PA0279803 (Mining Permit No. 32212801), ABM Mining Co., Inc., 3330 Johnston Road, Smicksburg,
PA 16256, new NPDES permit for commencement, operation, and restoration of a small noncoal (industrial minerals)
operation in Grant Township, Indiana County, affecting 5.0 acres. Receiving stream(s): unnamed tributary to Little
Mahoning Creek, classified for the following use(s): High Quality—Cold Water Fishes. This receiving stream is not a
TMDL stream. Application received: June 24, 2021.

All treatment and stormwater facilities will be addressed through non-discharge alternatives. There will be no point
source discharges for this mining permit.

Knox District Mining Office: White Memorial Building, P.O. Box 669, Knox, PA 16232-0669, (814) 797.1191.

NPDES No. PA0241962 (Permit No. 10010310). Allegheny Mineral Corporation, P.O. Box 1022, Kittanning, PA
16201, Renewal of an NPDES permit for a large industrial minerals surface mine in Mercer and Pine Townships, Butler
and Mercer Counties, affecting 253.8 acres. Receiving stream(s): Unnamed tributaries to Swamp Run, classified for the
following use(s): CWF. TMDL: None. Application received: May 13, 2021.
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Unless otherwise noted for a specific outfall, the proposed effluent limits for all outfalls in this permit are the BAT
limits described previously for noncoal mining activities.

The following outfalls discharge to unnamed tributaries to Swamp Run:

Outfall Nos. New Outfall (Y/N)
005 N
006 N
007 N

The proposed effluent limits for the previously listed outfalls are as follows:

30-Day Daily Instantaneous
Parameter Minimum Average Maximum Maximum
pH1 (S.U.) 6.0 9.0
Iron (mg/l) 3.0 6.0 7.0
Manganese (mg/l) 2.0 4.0 5.0
Total Suspended Solids (mg/l) 35.0 70.0 90.0
Alkalinity greater than acidity1

1 The parameter is applicable at all times.
The following outfalls discharge to unnamed tributaries to Swamp Run:

Outfall Nos. New Outfall (Y/N)

001 N
002 N
003 N

30-Day Daily Instantaneous
Parameter Minimum Average Maximum Maximum
pH1 (S.U.) 6.0 9.0
Iron (mg/l) 3.0 6.0 7.0
Manganese (mg/l) 2.0 4.0 5.0
Total Suspended Solids (mg/l) 35.0 70.0 90.0
Alkalinity greater than acidity1

1 The parameter is applicable at all times.
NPDES No. PA0258466 (Permit No. 10070304). Glacial Sand & Gravel Company, P.O. Box 1022, Kittanning, PA

16201, Renewal of an NPDES permit for a large industrial minerals surface mine in Worth Township, Butler County,
affecting 77.6 acres. Receiving stream(s): Unnamed tributary to Black Run, classified for the following use(s): CWF.
TMDL: None. Application received: May 13, 2021.

The following outfall discharges to unnamed tributaries to an unnamed tributary to Black Run:

Outfall Nos. New Outfall (Y/N)

002 N
The proposed effluent limits for the previously listed outfalls are as follows:

30-Day Daily Instantaneous
Parameter Minimum Average Maximum Maximum
pH1 (S.U.) 6.0 9.0
Iron (mg/l) 3.0 6.0 7.0
Manganese (mg/l) 2.0 4.0 5.0
Total Suspended Solids (mg/l) 35.0 70.0 90.0
Alkalinity greater than acidity1

1 The parameter is applicable at all times.
The following outfall discharges to an unnamed tributary to Black Run:

Outfall Nos. New Outfall (Y/N)

001 N
The proposed effluent limits for the previously listed outfalls are as follows:

30-Day Daily Instantaneous
Parameter Minimum Average Maximum Maximum
pH1 (S.U.) 6.0 9.0
Iron (mg/l) 3.0 6.0 7.0
Manganese (mg/l) 2.0 4.0 5.0
Total Suspended Solids (mg/l)’ 35.0 70.0 90.0
Alkalinity greater than acidity1

1 The parameter is applicable at all times.
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FEDERAL WATER POLLUTION
CONTROL ACT, SECTION 401

The following permit applications, requests for Environ-
mental Assessment approval and requests for 401 Water
Quality Certification have been received by the Depart-
ment of Environmental Protection. Section 401 of the
Federal Water Pollution Control Act (FWPCA)
(33 U.S.C.A. § 1341), requires the State to certify that
the involved projects will not violate the applicable
provisions of Sections 301—303, 306 and 307 of the
FWPCA (33 U.S.C.A. §§ 1311—1313, 1316 and 1317), as
well as relevant State requirements. Persons objecting to
approval of a request for certification under Section 401
or to the issuance of a Dam Permit or Water Obstruction
and Encroachment Permit, or the approval of an Environ-
mental Assessment must submit any comments, sugges-
tions or objections within 30-days of the date of this
notice, as well as any questions to the office noted above
the application. Comments should contain the name,
address and telephone number of the person commenting,
identification of the certification request to which the
comments or objections are addressed, and a concise
statement of comments, objections or suggestions includ-
ing the relevant facts upon which they are based.

The Department may conduct a fact-finding hearing or
an informal conference in response to comments if
deemed necessary. Each individual will be notified, in
writing, of the time and place of a scheduled hearing or
conference concerning the certification request to which
the comment, objection or suggestion relates. Maps, draw-
ings and other data pertinent to the certification request
are available for inspection between the hours of 8:00 AM
and 4:00 PM on each working day at the office noted
above the application.

If you are a person with a disability and wish to attend
the hearing and you require an auxiliary aid, service or
other accommodation to participate in the proceedings,
please contact the specified program. TDD users may
contact the Department through the Pennsylvania Hamil-
ton Relay Service at (800) 654-5984.
WATER OBSTRUCTIONS AND ENCROACHMENTS

Applications Received Under the Dam Safety and
Encroachments Act (32 P.S. §§ 693.1—693.27) and
Section 302 of the Flood Plain Management Act
(32 P.S. § 679.302) and Requests for Certification
Under Section 401 of the Federal Water Pollution
Control Act (33 U.S.C.A. § 1341(a)).

Northeast Region: Waterways & Wetlands Program,
2 Public Square, Wilkes-Barre, PA 18701-1915.

Contact: Gillian Ostrum, Clerk Typist 2, 570-830-3077.
E3502221-004. NLMS, LLC, 1170 Winola Road, Clarks

Summit, PA 18411, in Waverly Township, Lackawanna
County, U.S. Army Corps of Engineers, Baltimore Dis-
trict.

To construct and maintain the following water obstruc-
tions and encroachments associated with the Waverly Site
Development project proposing single family homes and a
senior center:

1. To relocate approximately 812 linear feet of a UNT
to Ackerly Creek (CWF, MF). The work consists of
creating approximately 1,200 linear feet of a new water-
course channel.

2. A 2-inch diameter sewer force main crossing 1 linear
foot of a UNT to Ackerly Creek (CWF, MF) and 156 linear
feet of floodway.

3. To construct and maintain a roadway crossing of a
UNT to Ackerly Creek (CWF, MF) consisting of a 55-foot
long, 34� x 22� RCP culvert depressed 6-inches below the
existing streambed elevation with upstream and down-
stream wingwalls.

4. To construct and maintain a roadway crossing of a
UNT to Ackerly Creek (CWF, MF) consisting of a 82-foot
long, 30� x 19� RCP culvert depressed 6-inches below the
existing streambed elevation with upstream and down-
stream wingwalls.

The project is located to the left of PA-407 while
traveling north approximately 0.8 mile after the intersec-
tion with Fairview Road (PA-4028) (Scranton, PA Quad-
rangle Latitude: 41° 30� 37� Longitude: -75° 42� 11�) in
Waverly Township, Northampton County.

Southcentral Region: Waterways & Wetlands Program,
909 Elmerton Avenue, Harrisburg, PA 17110.

E0603221-010. Berks County, 633 Court Street, 14th
Floor, Reading, PA 19601 in Exeter Township, Berks
County, U.S. Army Corps of Engineers Philadelphia
District.

To remove existing superstructure and to install and
maintain a (1) 54.04 foot x 63.5 foot superstructure over
Antietam Creek (CWF, MF) and (2) place 0.5 acre of fill
within the floodway of Antietam Creek (CWF, MF) and
0.2 ac UNT Antietam Creek (CWF, MF). The project
proposed to permanently impact 153 linear feet of stream
channel and 0.7 ac of floodway impacts.

Southwest Region: Dana Drake, Waterways and Wet-
lands Program Manager, 400 Waterfront Drive, Pitts-
burgh, PA 15222-4745, 412-442-4000.

E0205221-006, O’Hara Township, 325 Fox Chapel
Road, Pittsburgh, PA 15238, O’Hara Township, Alle-
gheny County; Pittsburgh ACOE District.

The applicant proposes to:
Remove 400 linear feet of existing 48-inch culvert, and

to construct and maintain, in its place, approximately
450 linear feet of a restored section of Powers Run
(WWF).

For the purpose of removing an undersized culvert and
re-establishing the existing stream channel to its more
natural condition. Construction will consist of approxi-
mately 0.97 acre of earth disturbance for the removal of
the existing culvert, re-establishment of the stream chan-
nel, and streambank stabilization.

Emergency Permit (EP0205220-001) was previously au-
thorized for the temporary stabilization of an existing
10-inch sanitary sewer line crossing. Failure of this
stabilization effort promoted the authorization of a second
Emergency Permit (EP0205220-012) for the temporary
installation of an additional 40 linear feet to the existing
48-inch culvert, to support the sanitary line. A General
Permit 5 registration (GP050200220-034) was acknowl-
edged by the Allegheny County Conservation District, to
replace and relocated the existing 10-inch sanitary sewer
line under the restored stream channel. The temporary
40 feet of additional culvert extension was removed as
part of authorization of the General Permit 5.

The project site is located north of Freeport Road and
west of Powers Run Road (Fox Chapel, PA USGS topo-
graphic quadrangle; N: 40°, 30�, 25.43�; W: -79°, 51�,
11.72�; Sub-basin 18A; USACE Pittsburgh District), in
O’Hara Township, Allegheny County.

E6505221-001, Westmoreland County Industrial
Development Corporation, 40 North Pennsylvania Av-
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enue, 5th Floor, Suite 520, Greensburg, PA 15601, Greens-
burg City, Westmoreland County; Pittsburgh ACOE
District.

The applicant proposes to:

1. Place and maintain fill within 5 separate wetlands as
follows: Wetland 2—0.04 acre (PEM), Wetland 3—0.10
acre (PEM/PSS), Wetland 4—0.03 acre (PEM), Wetland
5—0.66 acre (PEM/PSS); Wetland 7—0.02 acre (PEM/
PSS). Wetland impacts total 0.85 acre.

2. Mitigation is proposed through the purchase of
wetland mitigation bank credits from the Schrader Hol-
low Road Mitigation Bank.

For the purpose of site development to construct an
industrial park building and associated infrastructure.

The project site is located Waltz Mill Flats Road, Ruffs
Dale, PA 15679 Smithton, PA USGS topographic quad-

rangle; N: 40°, 12�, 51�; W: -79°, 40�, 22�; Sub-basin 19D;
USACE Pittsburgh District), in Sewickley Township,
Westmoreland County.

ENVIRONMENTAL ASSESSMENTS
Central Office: Bureau of Waterways Engineering and

Wetlands, Rachel Carson State Office Building, Floor 2,
400 Market Street, Harrisburg, PA 17101, Telephone num-
ber: 717-787-3411.

D64-027EA. Kathleen Hower, 14 Ferndale Road,
Madison, NJ 07940, Paupack Township, Wayne County,
USACOE Philadelphia District.

Project proposes to remove the Craft Pond Dam to
eliminate a threat to public safety and to restore approxi-
mately 1,700 feet of stream channel to a free-flowing
condition. The project is located across a tributary to
Purdy Creek (HQ-CWF, MF) (Lakeville, PA Quadrangle,
Latitude: 41.4348; Longitude: -75.2884).

ACTIONS

THE PENNSYLVANIA CLEAN STREAMS LAW AND THE FEDERAL CLEAN
WATER ACT

FINAL ACTIONS TAKEN FOR NPDES PERMITS AND WQM PERMITS
The Department has taken the following actions on previously received applications for new, amended, and renewed

NPDES and WQM permits, applications for permit waivers, and NOIs for coverage under General Permits, as listed in
the following tables. This notice of final action is published in accordance with 25 Pa. Code Chapters 91, 92a, and 102 and
40 CFR Part 122, implementing provisions of The Clean Streams Law (35 P.S. §§ 691.1—691.1001) and the Federal
Clean Water Act (33 U.S.C.A. §§ 1251—1376). The official file for each listed action can be reviewed at the DEP or
delegated county conservation district (CCD) office identified in the table for the action. DEP/CCD office contact
information is listed as follows for Section I and is contained within the table for Section II. Additional information for
permits issued under 25 Pa. Code Chapters 91 and 92a, including links to Individual NPDES and WQM Permits, may be
reviewed by generating the ‘‘Final Actions Report’’ on DEP’s website at www.dep.pa.gov/CWPublicNotice.

DEP office contact information to review official files relating to the final actions in Section I is as follows:
DEP Southeast Regional Office (SERO)—2 E. Main Street, Norristown, PA 19401-4915. File Review Coordinator:

484.250.5910. Email: RA-EPNPDES_SERO@pa.gov.
DEP Northeast Regional Office (NERO)—2 Public Square, Wilkes-Barre, PA 18701-1915. File Review Coordinator:

570.826.5472. Email: RA-EPNPDES_NERO@pa.gov.
DEP Southcentral Regional Office (SCRO)—909 Elmerton Avenue, Harrisburg, PA 17110. File Review Coordinator:

717.705.4732. Email: RA-EPNPDES_SCRO@pa.gov.
DEP Northcentral Regional Office (NCRO)—208 W. Third Street, Suite 101, Williamsport, PA 17701. File Review

Coordinator: 570.327.3693. Email: RA-EPNPDES_NCRO@pa.gov.
DEP Southwest Regional Office (SWRO)—400 Waterfront Drive, Pittsburgh, PA 15222. File Review Coordinator:

412.442.4286. Email: RA-EPNPDES_SWRO@pa.gov.

DEP Northwest Regional Office (NWRO)—230 Chestnut Street, Meadville, PA 16335. File Review Coordinator:
814.332.6340. Email: RA-EPNPDES_NWRO@pa.gov.

DEP Bureau of Clean Water (BCW)—400 Market Street, Harrisburg, PA 17105. File Review Coordinator: 717.787.5017.
Email: RA-EPNPDES_Permits@pa.gov.

Persons aggrieved by an action may appeal that action to the Environmental Hearing Board (Board) under section 4 of
the Environmental Hearing Board Act (35 P.S. § 7514) and 2 Pa.C.S. §§ 501—508 and 701—704 (relating to
Administrative Agency Law). The appeal should be sent to the Environmental Hearing Board, Second Floor, Rachel
Carson State Office Building, 400 Market Street, P.O. Box 8457, Harrisburg, PA 17105-8457, (717) 787-3483. TDD users
may contact the Board through the Pennsylvania Hamilton Relay Service, (800) 654-5984. Appeals must be filed with the
Board within 30-days of publication of this notice in the Pennsylvania Bulletin unless the appropriate statute provides a
different time period. Copies of the appeal form and the Board’s rules of practice and procedure may be obtained from the
Board. The appeal form and the Board’s rules of practice and procedure are also available in Braille or on audiotape from
the Secretary to the Board at (717) 787-3483. This paragraph does not, in and of itself, create a right of appeal beyond
that permitted by applicable statutes and decisional law.

For individuals who wish to challenge an action, the appeal must reach the Board within 30-days. A lawyer is not
needed to file an appeal with the Board.

Important legal rights are at stake, however, so individuals should contact a lawyer at once. Persons who cannot afford
a lawyer may qualify for free pro bono representation. Call the Secretary to the Board at (717) 787-3483 for more
information.
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I. Final Actions on NPDES and WQM Permit Applications and NOIs for Sewage, Industrial Waste, Industrial
Stormwater, MS4s, Pesticides and CAFOs.

Application
Number Permit Type Action Taken Permittee Name & Address Municipality, County

DEP
Office

0678202 Industrial Waste
Individual
WQM Permit

Issued Trogon Development, LLC
P.O. Box 1636
Canovanas, PR 00729-1636

Cumru Township
Berks County

SCRO

3684201 Industrial Waste
Individual
WQM Permit

Issued Burle Corp Park, LLC
1004 New Holland Avenue
Lancaster, PA 17601-5606

Lancaster City
Lancaster County

SCRO

0181201 Industrial Waste
Land Application
Individual
WQM Permit

Issued Knouse Foods Cooperative, Inc.
P.O. Box 53
53 East Hanover Street
Biglerville, PA 17307-0053

Biglerville Borough
Adams County

SCRO

0821801 Joint DEP/PFBC
Pesticides Permit

Issued Perkins Nancy
33 Perkins Lane
Rome, PA 18837-7895

Orwell Township
Bradford County

NCRO

3521801 Joint DEP/PFBC
Pesticides Permit

Issued Shiney Mountain Sportsman
4 Chapman Street
Dupont, PA 18641

Spring Brook Township
Lackawanna County

NERO

4513805 Joint DEP/PFBC
Pesticides Permit

Issued Meadow Lake Fishing Club
312 Wrangler Road
East Stroudsburg, PA
18302-9557

Middle Smithfield
Township
Monroe County

NERO

4513841 Joint DEP/PFBC
Pesticides Permit

Issued Price Ray
P.O. Box 127
Shawnee On Delaware, PA
18356-0127

Middle Smithfield
Township
Monroe County

NERO

4515806 Joint DEP/PFBC
Pesticides Permit

Issued Robinwood Village
HOA
323 W Windsor Road
Saylorsburg, PA 18353-8702

Chestnuthill Township
Monroe County

NERO

6017801 Joint DEP/PFBC
Pesticides Permit

Issued Millward Estates Condominium
Association
904 Lakeside Drive
Lewisburg, PA 17837-9382

Kelly Township
Union County

NCRO

PA0008508 Major Industrial
Waste Facility
� 250 MGD
Individual
NPDES Permit

Issued Burle Corp Park, LLC
1004 New Holland Avenue
Lancaster, PA 17601-5606

Lancaster City
Lancaster County

SCRO

PA0026620 Major Sewage
Facility
�= 1 MGD and
� 5 MGD
Individual
NPDES Permit

Issued Millersville Borough
Lancaster County
100 Municipal Drive
Millersville, PA 17551-1424

Millersville Borough
Lancaster County

SCRO

PA0008486 Minor Industrial
Waste Facility
with ELG
Individual
NPDES Permit

Issued Ahlstrom-Munksjo Filtration,
LLC
122 W Butler Street
Mount Holly Springs, PA
17065-1218

Mount Holly Springs
Borough
Cumberland County

SCRO

PA0010782 Minor Industrial
Waste Facility
with ELG
Individual
NPDES Permit

Issued Trogon Development, LLC
P.O. Box 1636
Canovanas, PR 00729-1636

Cumru Township
Berks County

SCRO

PA0085537 Minor Industrial
Waste Facility
without ELG
Individual
NPDES Permit

Issued Altoona Water Authority
900 Chestnut Avenue
Altoona, PA 16601-4617

Antis Township
Blair County

SCRO
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Application
Number Permit Type Action Taken Permittee Name & Address Municipality, County

DEP
Office

PA0252468 Minor Industrial
Waste Facility
without ELG
Individual
NPDES Permit

Issued Kittanning Suburban
Joint Water Authority
710 Tarrtown Road
Adrian, PA 16210-1220

East Franklin Township
Armstrong County

NWRO

PA0082601 Minor Sewage
Facility
� 0.05 MGD
Individual
NPDES Permit

Issued Shover Inv Group, LLC
225 Pine Hill Road
Landisburg, PA 17040-9218

Porter Township
Huntingdon County

SCRO

PA0083933 Minor Sewage
Facility
� 0.05 MGD
Individual
NPDES Permit

Issued Georgetown Area
Sewer Authority
46 Quarry Road
Quarryville, PA 17566-9454

Bart Township
Lancaster County

SCRO

PA0091413 Minor Sewage
Facility
� 0.05 MGD
Individual
NPDES Permit

Issued North Strabane Township
Municipal Authority
Washington County
1929B Route 519
Canonsburg, PA 15317-5128

North Strabane
Township
Washington County

SWRO

PA0094111 Minor Sewage
Facility
� 0.05 MGD
Individual
NPDES Permit

Issued UMH PA Wellington Estates,
LLC
3499 Rte 9 North
Suite 3C
Freehold, NJ 07728

Washington Township
Westmoreland County

SWRO

PA0228761 Minor Sewage
Facility
� 0.05 MGD
Individual
NPDES Permit

Issued Baker Donald
80 Baker Crest Lane
Millerton, PA 16936-9319

Rutland Township
Tioga County

NCRO

PA0252506 Minor Sewage
Facility
� 0.05 MGD
Individual
NPDES Permit

Issued Indiana County
Municipal Service Authority
602 Kolter Drive
Indiana, PA 15701-3570

Cowanshannock
Township
Armstrong County

NWRO

PA0028975 Minor Sewage
Facility
�= 0.05 MGD and
� 1 MGD
Individual
NPDES Permit

Issued Womelsdorf Sewer Authority
Berks County
498 N Water Street
Womelsdorf, PA 19567-9792

Womelsdorf Borough
Berks County

SCRO

PA0030970 Minor Sewage
Facility
�= 0.05 MGD and
� 1 MGD
Individual
NPDES Permit

Issued PA State System of Higher Ed
Cheyney University
P.O. Box 200
1837 University Circle
Cheyney, PA 19319-0200

Thornbury Township
Delaware County

SERO

PA0034797 Minor Sewage
Facility
�= 0.05 MGD and
� 1 MGD
Individual
NPDES Permit

Issued Fed Bureau Of Prisons
772 Saint Joseph Street
Cresson, PA 16630-6007

Allegheny Township
Cambria County

SWRO

PA0101290 Minor Sewage
Facility
�= 0.05 MGD and
� 1 MGD
Individual
NPDES Permit

Issued Sandy Township
Clearfield County
P.O. Box 267
Du Bois, PA 15801-0267

Sandy Township
Clearfield County

NCRO

NOEXNW140 No Exposure
Certification

Issued Roser Tech, Inc.
347 E Industrial Drive
Titusville, PA 16354-7805

Titusville City
Crawford County

NWRO
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Application
Number Permit Type Action Taken Permittee Name & Address Municipality, County

DEP
Office

NOEXSC260 No Exposure
Certification

Issued TE Connectivity Corp
627 N Grant Street
Waynesboro, PA 17268-8654

Waynesboro Borough
Franklin County

SCRO

PAG034882 PAG-03 NPDES
General Permit
for Industrial
Stormwater

Issued Digger Specialties, Inc.
3639 Destiny Drive
Bremen, IN 46506-9076

Montgomery Borough
Lycoming County

NCRO

PAG036297 PAG-03 NPDES
General Permit
for Industrial
Stormwater

Issued FMC Tech Surface
Integrated Service, Inc.
12 Arentzen Boulevard
Charleroi, PA 15022-1060

Speers Borough
Washington County

SWRO

PAR233510 PAG-03 NPDES
General Permit
for Industrial
Stormwater

Issued WR Grace & Co. Conn DBA
2858 Back Vail Road
Tyrone, PA 16686-8100

Tyrone Borough
Blair County

SCRO

PAG123675 PAG-12 NPDES
General Permit
for CAFOs

Issued Oberholtzer Anthony
1500 Pine Grove Road
Bethel, PA 19507-9513

Bethel Township
Berks County

SCRO

PAG123881 PAG-12 NPDES
General Permit
for CAFOs

Issued Nolt Matthew
131 Krumstown Road
Myerstown, PA 17067

Millcreek Township
Lebanon County

SCRO

PAG123886 PAG-12 NPDES
General Permit
for CAFOs

Issued Eric Newswanger
107 Awol Road
Jonestown, PA 17038

Union Township
Lebanon County

SCRO

0374402 Sewage
Treatment
Facilities
Individual
WQM Permit

Issued Ford City Borough Municipal
Sewer Disposal Authority
P.O. Box 66
Ford City, PA 16226-0066

Ford City Borough
Armstrong County

NWRO

2517410 Sewage
Treatment
Facilities
Individual
WQM Permit

Issued Barry & Karen Smock
13001 Kline Road
Edinboro, PA 16412-1767

Washington Township
Erie County

NWRO

2520421 Sewage
Treatment
Facilities
Individual
WQM Permit

Issued Hannah Lovell &
Thomas Shorts
12220 Lakeview Drive
Edinboro, PA 16412-1430

Washington Township
Erie County

NWRO

2521413 Sewage
Treatment
Facilities
Individual
WQM Permit

Issued Long Gordon
8881 Old Waterford Road
Erie, PA 16509-5647

Greene Township
Erie County

NWRO

2712402 Sewage
Treatment
Facilities
Individual
WQM Permit

Issued Hickory Township
Forest County
P.O. Box 44
Endeavor, PA 16322

Hickory Township
Forest County

NWRO

3681401 Sewage
Treatment
Facilities
Individual
WQM Permit

Issued Ephrata Borough Authority
Lancaster County
124 S State Street
Ephrata, PA 17522-2411

Ephrata Borough
Lancaster County

SCRO

3694404 Sewage
Treatment
Facilities
Individual
WQM Permit

Issued Earl Township Sewer Authority
Lancaster County
517 N Railroad Avenue
New Holland, PA 17557-9758

Earl Township
Lancaster County

SCRO
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Application
Number Permit Type Action Taken Permittee Name & Address Municipality, County

DEP
Office

6221402 Sewage
Treatment
Facilities
Individual
WQM Permit

Issued Green Buck Acres, LLC
8528 Gulf Road
North East, PA 16428-4312

Pleasant Township
Warren County

NWRO

6221401 Sewer Extensions
and Pump
Stations
Individual
WQM Permit

Issued Kinzua Warren Joint Authority
Warren County
119 Mead Boulevard
Clarendon, PA 16313-1119

Mead Township
Warren County

NWRO

PA0264105 Single Residence
STP Individual
NPDES Permit

Issued Gladden Crystal A
9229 Station Road
Erie, PA 16510-5623

Greenfield Township
Erie County

NWRO

PA0264351 Single Residence
STP Individual
NPDES Permit

Issued Lester Timothy
275 Hazeltine Avenue
Jamestown, NY 14701-7642

Farmington Township
Warren County

NWRO

PA0265381 Single Residence
STP Individual
NPDES Permit

Issued Barry & Karen Smock
13001 Kline Road
Edinboro, PA 16412-1767

Washington Township
Erie County

NWRO

PA0288691 Single Residence
STP Individual
NPDES Permit

Issued Hannah Lovell &
Thomas Shorts
12220 Lakeview Drive
Edinboro, PA 16412-1430

Washington Township
Erie County

NWRO

PA0289248 Single Residence
STP Individual
NPDES Permit

Issued Green Buck Acres, LLC
8528 Gulf Road
North East, PA 16428-4312

Pleasant Township
Warren County

NWRO

PA0289442 Single Residence
STP Individual
NPDES Permit

Issued Long Gordon
8881 Old Waterford Road
Erie, PA 16509-5647

Greene Township
Erie County

NWRO

PA0086444 Small Flow
Treatment
Facility
Individual
NPDES Permit

Issued Blue Ridge Sportsman
Association Inc.
3030 Waynesboro Pike
Fairfield, PA 17320-9801

Liberty Township
Adams County

SCRO

WQG02022101 WQG-02 WQM
General Permit

Issued Allegheny County
Sanitary Authority
ALCOSAN
3300 Preble Avenue
Pittsburgh, PA 15233-1025

Pittsburgh City
Allegheny County

SWRO

II. Final Actions on PAG-02 General NPDES Permit NOIs and Individual NPDES Permit Applications for
Construction Stormwater.

Permit Number
Permit
Type

Action
Taken Applicant Name & Address Municipality, County Office

PAC150272 PAG-02
General
Permit

Issued Borough of Phoenixville &
Franklin Phoenixville LP by
Odessa Real Estate
Investments, Inc., GP
1890 Rose Cottage Lane
Malvern, PA 19355

Phoenixville Borough
Chester County

SERO

PAC090361 A-1
Major Amendment

PAG-02
General
Permit

Issued FRES-CO System USA, Inc.
3005 State Road
Telford, PA 18969-1021

West Rockhill
Township
Bucks County

SERO

PAD090076 Individual
NPDES

Issued Faith Christian Academy
700 North Main Street
Sellersville, PA 18960-1830

Milford Township
Bucks County

SERO

PAD230039 Individual
NPDES

Issued Alliance Partners, HSP, LLC
40 Morris Avenue
Suite 230
Bryn Mawr, PA 19010

Eddystone Borough
Delaware County

SERO
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Permit Number
Permit
Type

Action
Taken Applicant Name & Address Municipality, County Office

PAD090071 Individual
NPDES

Issued NP Falls Township
Industrial, LLC
4805 Montgomery Road
Suite 310
Cincinnati, OH 45212

Falls Township
Bucks County

SERO

PAD450124 Individual
NPDES

Issued Suburban Realty, LP
330 Oakford Road
Clarks Summit, PA 18411

Stroud Township
Monroe County

NERO

PAD450130 Individual
NPDES

Issued Winds West, Inc.
P.O. Box 1672
Eagle, CO 81631

Middle Smithfield
Township
Monroe County

NERO

PAD060047 Individual
NPDES

Issued Cumru Township
1775 Welsh Road
Mohnton, PA 19540-8803

Cumru Township
Mohnton Borough
Berks County

SCRO

PAD210065 Individual
NPDES

Issued The GIANT Company, LLC
1149 Harrisburg Pike
Carlisle, PA 17013-1607

Middlesex Township
Cumberland County

SCRO

PAD210068 Individual
NPDES

Issued Victor Barrick
2653 Walnut Bottom Road
Carlisle, PA 17015

Penn Township
Cumberland County

SCRO

PAD220009 Individual
NPDES

Issued Jeffery C. Smith
540 Clark’s Valley Road
Dauphin, PA 17018

Middle Paxton
Township
Dauphin County

SCRO

PAD220010 Individual
NPDES

Issued PennDOT Engineering
District 8-0
2140 Herr Street
Harrisburg, PA 17103

City of Harrisburg
Paxtang Township
Swatara Township
Dauphin County

SCRO

PAD310010 Individual
NPDES

Issued Russell W. Culbertson
5526 Standing Stone Road
Huntingdon, PA 16652

Miller Township
Huntingdon County

SCRO

PAD360059 Individual
NPDES

Issued Salisbury Business Village,
LLC
6285 Plank Road
Narvon, PA 17555

Salisbury Township
Lancaster County

SCRO

PAD360067 Individual
NPDES

Issued Deerin Companies
(MTS Group, LLC)
120 North Pointe Boulevard
Suite 301
Lancaster, PA 17601

Manheim Township
Lancaster County

SCRO

PAD670051 Individual
NPDES

Issued William & Wendolyn Hewitt
4251 Orchard Hills Drive
York, PA 17402

Hellam Township
York County

SCRO

PAC220226 A-1 PAG-02
General
Permits

Issued Gary Graham
700 South Eisenhower
Boulevard
Middletown, PA 17057

Middletown Borough
Dauphin County

Dauphin County
Conservation District
1451 Peters Mountain
Road
Dauphin, PA 17018
717.921.8100

PAC220277 PAG-02
General
Permits

Issued Milton Hershey School
1201 Homestead Lane
P.O. Box 803
Hershey, PA 17033

Derry Township
Dauphin County

Dauphin County
Conservation District
1451 Peters Mountain
Road
Dauphin, PA 17018
717.921.8100

PAC220294 PAG-02
General
Permits

Issued Reuben Kauffman
402 Spruce Street
P.O. Box 441
Gratz, PA 17030

Lykens Township
Dauphin County

Dauphin County
Conservation District
1451 Peters Mountain
Road
Dauphin, PA 17018
717.921.8100
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Permit Number
Permit
Type

Action
Taken Applicant Name & Address Municipality, County Office

PAC220010 A-1 PAG-02
General
Permits

Issued Troegs Independent Brewing
200 East Hersheypark Drive
Hershey, PA 17033

Derry Township
Dauphin County

Dauphin County
Conservation District
1451 Peters Mountain
Road
Dauphin, PA 17018
717.921.8100

PAC220285 A-1 PAG-02
General
Permits

Issued Smucker’s Greenhouse
401 Shaffer Road
Millersburg, PA 17061

Upper Paxton
Township
Dauphin County

Dauphin County
Conservation District
1451 Peters Mountain
Road
Dauphin, PA 17018
717.921.8100

PAC500038 PAG-02
General
Permits

Issued Greenwood School District
405 East Sunbury Street
Millerstown, PA 17062

Millerstown Borough
Perry County

Perry County
Conservation District
31 West Main Street
P.O. Box 36
New Bloomfield, PA
17068
717.582.8988, ext. 4

PAC500035 PAG-02
General
Permits

Issued IBS Development Corp.
950 Homestead Road
Newport, PA 17074

Penn Township
Perry County

Perry County
Conservation District
31 West Main Street
P.O. Box 36
New Bloomfield, PA
17068
717.582.8988, ext. 4

PAC670474 PAG-02
General
Permits

Issued 717 Ranch, LLC
8210 Carlisle Pike
York Springs, PA 17372

Franklin Township
York County

York County
Conservation District
2401 Pleasant Valley
Road
Suite 101
Room 139
York, PA 17402
717.840.7430

PAC670478 PAG-02
General
Permits

Issued Rockville Road, LP
160 Ram Drive
Hanover, PA 17331

Jackson Township
York County

York County
Conservation District
2401 Pleasant Valley
Road
Suite 101
Room 139
York, PA 17402
717.840.7430

PAC140117 PAG-02
General
Permit

Issued Geisinger Clinic
199 Scenery Drive
State College, PA 16801

College Township
Centre County

Centre County
Conservation District
414 Holmes Ave
Ste 4
Bellefonte, PA
16823-1400

PAD140074 PAG-02
Individual
Permit

Issued DCNR—Bureau of
State Parks
4216 Beaver Road
Philipsburg, PA 16866-9519

Rush Township
Centre County

NCRO

PAD140037
Renewal

PAG-02
Individual
Permit

Issued S&A Homes, Inc.
Zion Back Road
Bellefonte, PA 16823

Walker Township
Centre County

NCRO

PAD140037 A-1
(Major
Modification)

PAG-02
Individual
Permit

Issued S&A Homes, Inc.
Zion Back Road
Bellefonte, PA 16823

Walker Township
Centre County

NCRO

PAC410064 PAG-02
General
Permit

Issued Fishlips, LLC
1500 Sycamore Rd
Montoursville, PA 17754

Clinton Township
Lycoming County

Lycoming County
Conservation District
542 County Farm Rd
Suite 202
Montoursville, PA
17754-9209
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Permit Number
Permit
Type

Action
Taken Applicant Name & Address Municipality, County Office

PAC040106 PAG-02
General
Permit

Issued Bridgewater Crossing II, LLC
100 Bet-Tech Drive
Aliquippa, PA 15001

Bridgewater
Borough
Beaver County

Beaver County
Conservation District
156 Cowpath Road
Aliquippa, PA 15001
724-378-1701

PAC560056 PAG-02
General
Permit

Issued PennDOT District 9-0
1620 North Juniata Street
Hollidaysburg, PA 16648

Elk Lick Township
Somerset County

Somerset County
Conservation District
Somerset County
Ag Center
6024 Glades Pike
Suite 103
Somerset, PA 15501
814-445-4652

PAC560057 PAG-02
General
Permit

Issued J. E. Herring Motor
Company
286 Neilan Road
Somerset, PA 15501

Somerset Township
Somerset County

Somerset County
Conservation District
Somerset County
Ag Center
6024 Glades Pike
Suite 103
Somerset, PA 15501
814-445-4652

PAC630045 A-2 PAG-02
General
Permit

Issued Pennsylvania Trolley
Museum
One Museum Road
Washington, PA 15301

Chartiers Township
Washington County

Washington County
Conservation District
Suite 1
50 Old Hickory Ridge
Road
Washington, PA 15301
724-705-7098

PAC630122 A-2 PAG-02
General
Permit

Issued Redevelopment Authority of
the County of Washington
100 West Beau Street
Suite 603
Washington, PA 15301

South Franklin
Township
Washington County

Washington County
Conservation District
Suite 1
50 Old Hickory Ridge
Road
Washington, PA 15301
724-705-7098

PAC630190 PAG-02
General
Permit

Issued Maronda Homes, LLC
11 Timberglen Drive
Imperial, PA 15126

Peters Township
Washington County

Washington County
Conservation District
Suite 1
50 Old Hickory Ridge
Road
Washington, PA 15301
724-705-7098

PAC630212 PAG-02
General
Permit

Issued Ridgewood Heights
Development, LLC
30 Ridgewood Drive
McDonald, PA 15057

Cecil Township
Washington County

Washington County
Conservation District
Suite 1
50 Old Hickory Ridge
Road
Washington, PA 15301
724-705-7098

PAC650142 A-2 PAG-02
General
Permit

Issued GM Federal Acquisitions,
LLP
199 Lee Avenue
Suite 185
Brooklyn, NY 11211

Hempfield Township
Westmoreland
County

Westmoreland County
Conservation District
218 Donohoe Road
Greensburg, PA 15601
724-837-5271

PAC650252 PAG-02
General
Permit

Issued Ligonier Township
Municipal Authority
1 Municipal Drive
Ligonier, PA 15658

Ligonier Township &
Fairfield Township
Westmoreland
County

Westmoreland County
Conservation District
218 Donohoe Road
Greensburg, PA 15601
724-837-5271

PAC650260 PAG-02
General
Permit

Issued Bushy Run Investments, LP
Suite 302
6536 William Penn Highway
Delmont, PA 15636

Municipality of
Murrysville
Westmoreland
County

Westmoreland County
Conservation District
218 Donohoe Road
Greensburg, PA 15601
724-837-5271
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Permit Number
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Type

Action
Taken Applicant Name & Address Municipality, County Office

PAC650263 PAG-02
General
Permit

Issued Columbia Gas of
Pennsylvania
4000 Energy Drive
Bridgeville, PA 15017

South Huntingdon
Township
Westmoreland
County

Westmoreland County
Conservation District
218 Donohoe Road
Greensburg, PA 15601
724-837-5271

PAC650271 PAG-02
General
Permit

Issued Peoples Natural Gas, LLC
195 Donohoe Road
Greensburg, PA 15601

Municipality of
Murrysville
Westmoreland
County

Westmoreland County
Conservation District
218 Donohoe Road
Greensburg, PA 15601
724-837-5271

PAD020041 Individual
NPDES

Issued Riverfront 47, LP
535 Smithfield Street
Suite 715
Pittsburgh, PA 15222

Sharpsburg Borough
Allegheny County

Allegheny County
Conservation District
33 Terminal Way
Suite 325B
Pittsburgh, PA 15219
412-291-8010

PAD020044 Individual
NPDES

Issued Duquesne University
1323 Forbes Avenue
Pittsburgh, PA 15219

City of Pittsburgh
Allegheny County

Allegheny County
Conservation District
33 Terminal Way
Suite 325B
Pittsburgh, PA 15219
412-291-8010

PAC370056 PAG-02
General
Permit

Issued Lindy Paving, Inc.
1807 Shenango Road
New Galilee, PA 16141

Taylor Township
Lawrence County

Lawrence County
Conservation District
430 Court Street
New Castle, PA 16101
724-652-4512

PAC430050A1 PAG-02
General
Permit

Issued Buhl Park Corporation
715 Hazed Road
Hermitage, PA 16148

Hermitage City
Mercer County

Mercer County
Conservation District
24 Avalon Court
Suite 300
Mercer, PA 16137
724-662-2242

PAD240010 Individual
NPDES

Issued Penelec, A FirstEnergy
Company
341 White Pond Drive
Akron, OH 44320

Ridgway Township
Elk County

NWRO

PAD610004 Individual
NPDES

Issued National Fuel Gas
Distribution Corp
1100 State Street
Erie, PA 16501

Sugarcreek Borough
Venango County

NWRO

PAC250139 PAG-02
General
Permit

Issued Edinboro Volunteer Fire
Department
11800 Edinboro Road
Edinboro, PA 16412

Washington
Township Erie
County

Erie County
Conservation District
1927 Wager Road
Erie, PA 16509
814-825-6403

PAD070017 Individual
NPDES

Issued Oak Grove Partnership
50 West Pine Street
P.O. Box 688
Phillipsburg, PA 16866

Antis Township
Blair County

Regional Permit
Coordination Office
(RPCO)—Rachel
Carson State Office
Building
400 Market Street
Harrisburg, PA 17101
Email:
RA-EPREGIONAL
PERMIT@pa.gov
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Type

Action
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PAC060293 Individual
NPDES

Issued Core5 Industrial Partners,
LLC
1250 North Mountain Road
Harrisburg, PA 17112

Upper Tulpehocken
Township Berks
County

Regional Permit
Coordination Office
(RPCO)—Rachel
Carson State Office
Building
400 Market Street
Harrisburg, PA 17101
Email:
RA-EPREGIONAL
PERMIT@pa.gov

PUBLIC WATER SUPPLY PERMITS
The Department has taken the following actions on

applications received under the Pennsylvania Safe Drink-
ing Water Act (35 P.S. §§ 721.1—721.17) for the construc-
tion, substantial modification or operation of a public
water system.

Persons aggrieved by an action may appeal that action
to the Environmental Hearing Board (Board) under sec-
tion 4 of the Environmental Hearing Board Act and
2 Pa.C.S. §§ 501—508 and 701—704. The appeal should
be sent to the Environmental Hearing Board, Second
Floor, Rachel Carson State Office Building, 400 Market
Street, P.O. Box 8457, Harrisburg, PA 17105-8457, (717)
787-3483. TDD users may contact the Board through the
Pennsylvania Hamilton Relay Service, (800) 654-5984.
Appeals must be filed with the Board within 30 days of
publication of this notice in the Pennsylvania Bulletin
unless the appropriate statute provides a different time
period. Copies of the appeal form and the Board’s rules of
practice and procedure may be obtained from the Board.
The appeal form and the Board’s rules of practice and
procedure are also available in Braille or on audiotape
from the Secretary to the Board at (717) 787-3483. This
paragraph does not, in and of itself, create a right of
appeal beyond that permitted by applicable statutes and
decisional law.

For individuals who wish to challenge an action, the
appeal must reach the Board within 30-days. A lawyer is
not needed to file an appeal with the Board.

Important legal rights are at stake, however, so indi-
viduals should show this document to a lawyer at once.
Persons who cannot afford a lawyer may qualify for free
pro bono representation. Call the Secretary to the Board
at (717) 787-3483 for more information.

SAFE DRINKING WATER

Actions taken under the Pennsylvania Safe Drink-
ing Water Act (35 P.S. §§ 721.1—721.17).

Southeast Region: Safe Drinking Water Program Man-
ager, 2 East Main Street, Norristown, PA 19401.

Permit No. 1521503, Public Water Supply.
Applicant The Whip Tavern

1383 N. Chatham Road
Coatesville, PA 19320

Township West Marlborough
County Chester
Type of Facility PWS
Consulting Engineer CSC Technology, Inc.

170 Netherwood Drive
Coatesville, PA 19320

Permit Issued February 9, 2021

Northcentral Region: Safe Drinking Water Program
Manager, 208 West Third Street, Williamsport, PA 17701.

Operations Permit issued to: Aqua Pennsylvania,
Inc., 204 East Sunbury Street, Shamokin, PA 17872
PWSID No. 4550024, Penn Township, Snyder County
on June 30, 2021, for the operation of facilities approved
under construction permit # 5518502. This permit autho-
rizes operation of Well No. 4 as a mechanical back-up to
the existing Well No. 3 and as a replacement for Well
No. 1, which was physically disconnected from the water
system prior to issuance of this operation permit.

Operations Permit issued to: Wellsboro Municipal
Authority, 14 Crafton St., Wellsboro, PA 16901 PWSID
No. 5920502MA, Wellsboro Borough, Tioga County on
June 28, 2021, for the operation of facilities approved
under construction permit # 5920502MA. This permit
authorizes the water system for operation of monitoring
and shutdown capabilities, 2 new flow meters, new
chlorine analyzers, new digital data recorder, and new
entry point sampling tap at the Wellsboro Water Treat-
ment Plant.

Southwest Region: Safe Drinking Water Program Man-
ager, 400 Waterfront Drive, Pittsburgh, PA 15222-4745.

Permit No. 0221503MA, Minor Amendment. Public
Water Supply.
Applicant Hampton Shaler Water

Authority
3101 McCully Road
Allison Park, PA 15101

Borough or Township Etna Borough and
Shaler Township

County Allegheny
Type of Facility Discharge piping to Replacement

Wells 1 and 2
Consulting Engineer KLH Engineers, Inc.

5173 Campbells Run Road
Pittsburgh, PA 15205

Permit Issued July 2, 2021
Operations Permit issued to: Municipal Water Au-

thority of Aliquippa, 160 Hopewell Avenue, Aliquippa,
PA 15001, PWSID No. 5040006, City of Aliquippa,
Beaver County on July 1, 2021 for the operation of
facilities approved under permit # 0421507 for the Shef-
field Terrace Booster Station.

Operations Permit issued to: Beaver Borough Mu-
nicipal Authority, 469 Third Street, Beaver, PA 15009,
PWSID No. 5040009, Beaver Borough, Beaver County
on June 30, 2021 for the operation of facilities approved
under permit # 0419511MA for the sodium hypochlorite
liquid chlorination system at the Beaver Borough water
plant.
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HAZARDOUS SITES CLEAN-UP
UNDER THE ACT OF

OCTOBER 18, 1988
PUBLIC NOTICE OF PROPOSED CONSENT

ORDER AND AGREEMENT

Perkasie TCE HSCA Site, 7th and Spruce Streets,
Perkasie, PA 18944, Perkasie Borough, Bucks County.

The Department of Environmental Protection (‘‘Depart-
ment’’), under the authority of the Pennsylvania Hazard-
ous Sites Cleanup Act (‘‘HSCA’’), 35 P.S. § 6020.1113, has
entered a Consent Order and Agreement (‘‘CO&A’’) with
601 Perkasie Owner, LLC (‘‘601 Perkasie’’) to resolve this
party’s liability for the Department’s response costs in-
curred to abate the release of hazardous substances at
the property located at 7th and Spruce Streets in
Perkasie, PA (‘‘the Site’’), which is located within the
larger Perkasie TCE HSCA Site. 601 Perkasie is a new
company which was created by the present owner, 601
Spruce St Investment Partners, LLC for the purpose of
financing the redevelopment of the Site. On or about June
21, 2021, 601 Perkasie purchased the Site from the
present owner.

The larger Perkasie TCE HSCA Site is an area of
commercial and residential properties which have been
impacted by groundwater contamination from multiple
sources including the Site. From 1946 until approxi-
mately 2008, the Site was used by another party which
used hazardous substances including trichlorethylene
(‘‘TCE’’) as a degreasing solvent for onsite operations. In
2013, the Department investigated the Site and found
TCE and its breakdown products in groundwater on and
in the vicinity of the Site.

The Department has determined that hazardous sub-
stances within the meaning of Section 103 of the Hazard-
ous Sites Cleanup Act, 35 P.S. § 6020.103, were released
and threatened to be released on the Site. Pursuant to
Section 501(a) of HSCA, 35 P.S. § 6020.501(a), the De-
partment has incurred response costs associated with its
investigation and other response actions at the Site. As
an owner of the Site where hazardous substances were
released and threatened to be released, 601 Perkasie is a
responsible party which, pursuant to Section 701 of the
Hazardous Sites Cleanup Act, (‘‘HSCA’’) 35 P.S.
§ 6020.70, is potentially liable for the Department’s re-
sponse costs.

The Department and 601 Perkasie have signed a CO&A
to resolve this company’s proportionate liability in the
amount of Ten Thousand Dollars ($10,000) for response
costs incurred at the Site. In consideration for this
payment, 601 Perkasie will receive contribution protec-
tion as well as a Covenant Not to Sue regarding hazard-
ous substances released and threatened to be released at
the Site.

This notice is provided under Section 1113 of HSCA,
35 P.S. § 6020.1113, which states that, ‘‘settlement shall
become final upon the filing of the Department’s response
to significant written comments’’. The CO&A is available
for public review and comment. A public comment period
on the CO&A will extend for 60 days from today’s date.
Persons may submit written comments regarding the
agreement by mail to Dustin Armstrong, Environmental
Protection Specialist, Department of Environmental Pro-
tection, 2 East Main Street, Norristown, PA 19401 or by
email to darmstrong@pa.gov. Further information or a
copy of the Settlement Agreement can be obtained by
contacting Mr. Armstrong at darmstrong@pa.gov or (484)

250-5723 or Gina M. Thomas, Esquire, Office of Chief
Counsel at githomas@pa.gov or (484) 250-5930.

The Department has reserved the right to withdraw its
consent to the CO&A if comments submitted during the
public comment period disclose facts or considerations
which indicate, in the Department’s discretion, that the
CO&A is inappropriate or not in the public interest.

LAND RECYCLING AND
ENVIRONMENTAL REMEDIATION

UNDER ACT 2, 1995
PREAMBLE 2

The following plans and reports were submitted
under the Land Recycling and Environmental
Remediation Standards Act (35 P.S. §§ 6026.101—
6026.908).

Provisions of Sections 301—308 of the Land Recycling
and Environmental Remediation Standards Act (act)
(35 P.S. §§ 6026.301—6026.308) require the Department
to publish in the Pennsylvania Bulletin a notice of
submission of plans and reports. A final report is submit-
ted to document cleanup of a release of a regulated
substance at a site to one of the act’s remediation
standards. A final report provides a description of the site
investigation to characterize the nature and extent of
contaminants in environmental media, the basis for se-
lecting the environmental media of concern, documenta-
tion supporting the selection of residential or nonresiden-
tial exposure factors, a description of the remediation
performed and summaries of sampling analytical results
which demonstrate that remediation has attained the
cleanup standard selected. Submission of plans and re-
ports, other than the final report, will also be published
in the Pennsylvania Bulletin. These include the remedial
investigation report, risk assessment report and cleanup
plan for a site-specific standard remediation. A remedial
investigation report includes conclusions from the site
investigation; concentration of regulated substances in
environmental media; benefits of reuse of the property;
and, in some circumstances, a fate and transport analy-
sis. If required, a risk assessment report describes poten-
tial adverse effects caused by the presence of regulated
substances. If required, a cleanup plan evaluates the
abilities of potential remedies to achieve remedy require-
ments.

For further information concerning plans or reports,
contact the environmental cleanup program manager in
the Department Regional Office under which the notice of
receipt of plans or reports appears. If information con-
cerning plans or reports is required in an alternative
form, contact the community relations coordinator at the
appropriate Regional Office. TDD users may telephone
the Department through the Pennsylvania Hamilton Re-
lay Service at (800) 654-5984.

The Department has received the following plans and
reports:

Southeast Region: Environmental Cleanup & Brown-
fields Program Manager, 2 East Main Street, Norristown,
PA 19401, 484-250-5787, Charline Bass.

1405-1407 Bridgewater Road, 1405-1407 Bridgewater
Road, Bensalem, PA 19020, Bensalem Township, Bucks
County. Peter Lamont, PG, Penn E&R Inc., 2755 Bergey
Road, Hatfield, PA 19440 on behalf of Kurt Hecht, 935
Tower View Circle, New Hope, PA 18938 submitted a
Remedial Investigation Report/Cleanup Plan/Final Report
concerning remediation of site groundwater contaminated
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with PCE. The report is intended to document remedia-
tion of the site to meet the site-specific standard.

Thorndale West, 3233 Lincoln Highway, Thorndale,
PA 19372, Caln Township, Chester County. Geoff
Kristof, Aquaterra Technologies, Inc., 901 South Bolmar
Street, Suite A, West Chester, PA 19382 on behalf of Arne
Andersen, Thorndale West, LP, 309 Lancaster Avenue,
Suite C-3, Malvern, PA 19355 submitted a Final Report
concerning remediation of site soil and groundwater
contaminated with PCE, TCE and cis-1,2-dichloro-
ethylene. The report is intended to document remediation
of the site to meet the site-specific standard.

Broad and Washington & U-Haul Site, 1223-1245
Washington Street, 1301-1333 Washington Street, 1001-
1029 South Broad Street, and 1300-1342 Carpenter
Street, Philadelphia, PA 19147, City of Philadelphia,
Philadelphia County. Shad Manning, REPSG, Inc., P.O.
Box 5377, 6901 Kingsessing Avenue, Suite 201, Philadel-
phia, PA 19142 on behalf of Tina Roberts, Broad &
Washington Partners, LP, 817 North 3rd Street, Philadel-
phia, PA 19123 submitted a Cleanup Plan concerning
remediation of site soil and groundwater contaminated
with petroleum compounds and chlorinated solvents. The
report is intended to document remediation of the site to
meet the site-specific standard.

Northeast Region: Environmental Cleanup & Brown-
fields Program Manager, 2 Public Square, Wilkes-Barre,
PA 18701-1915, 570-826-2511.

Contact: Eric Supey, Environmental Program Manager.

364 West Susquehanna Street, 364 West Susque-
hanna Street, Allentown, PA 18103, Allentown City,
Lehigh County. Earth Engineering, 115 West German-
town Pike, Suite 200, East Norriton, PA 19401, on behalf
of HRES Allentown Susquehanna, LLC, 5601 Mariner
Street, Suite 100, Tampa, FL 33609, submitted a submit-
ted a Final Report concerning remediation of soil con-
taminated by petroleum from underground storage tanks.
The report is intended to document remediation of the
site to meet Statewide health standards.

Air Products & Chemicals—Schoeneck Road Lot
1, 3262 Schoeneck Road, Macungie, PA 18062 Lower
Macungie Township, Lehigh County. Leidos, 4640
Trindle Road, Camp Hill, PA 17011, on behalf of Air
Products and Chemicals, Inc., 7201 Hamilton Boulevard,
Allentown, PA 18195, submitted a Final Report concern-
ing remediation of soil contaminated petroleum and pesti-
cides. The report is intended to document remediation of
the site to meet Statewide health standards.

Church Hill Mall (former Hazleton Custom Clean-
ers), 1099 North Church Street, Hazle Township,
Luzerne County. AEI Consultants, 211 Forrest Drive,
Chalfont, PA 18914, on behalf of Timmus Development
Corporation, 1065 North Church Street, Hazleton, PA
18202, submitted a revised, combined Risk Assessment,
and Cleanup Plan concerning soil and groundwater con-
taminated with TCE, PCE, and cis-1,2 DCE from a
former dry-cleaning operation. The report is intended to
document the remedial actions for meeting site specific
standards.

Henry’s Service Station, 4024 Mountain View Drive,
Danielsville, PA 18038, Lehigh Township, Northampton
County. JMT Industrial & Environmental Contracting
Services, 710 Uhler Road, Easton, PA 18040, on behalf of
Preston Henry, 4024 Mountain View Drive, Danielsville,
PA 18038, submitted a Final Report concerning remedia-
tion of soil contaminated by gasoline from a tanker truck.

The report is intended to document remediation of the
site to meet Statewide health standards.

Southcentral Region: Environmental Cleanup and
Brownfields Program Manager, 909 Elmerton Avenue,
Harrisburg, PA 17110.

Clean Enterprises, 315 West State Street, Quarry-
ville, PA 17566, Quarryville Borough, Lancaster
County. Reliance Environmental, Inc., 235 North Duke
Street, Lancaster, PA 17602, on behalf of GEN 2 3, LLC,
315 West State Street, Quarryville, PA 17566 and Stoner-
Wade Ford, Inc., 415 West Fourth Street, Quarryville, PA
17566, submitted a Remedial Investigation Report and
Cleanup Plan concerning remediation of site soil and
groundwater contaminated with PERC and PCE. The
Report is intended to document remediation of the site to
meet the site-specific standard.

Chesapeake Estates New Oxford—97 Sherrill
Drive, 575 Kohler School Road, New Oxford, PA 17350,
Mt. Pleasant Township, Adams County. Environmental
Maintenance, 1420 East Mermaid Lane, Glenside, PA
19038, on behalf of RHP Properties, 575 Kohler School
Road, New Oxford, PA 17350, submitted a Final Report
concerning remediation of site soil contaminated with No.
2 fuel oil from an above ground storage tank. The Final
Report is intended to document remediation of the site to
meet the residential Statewide health standard.

Former Danskin Factory, 300 North State Street,
York, PA 17403, York City, York County. ECS Mid-
Atlantic, LLC, 56 Grumbacher Road, York, PA 17406, on
behalf of Pennrose, LLC, One Brewery Park, 1301 North
31st Street, Philadelphia, PA 19121, and the Redevelop-
ment Authority of the City of York, 101 South George
Street, 17405, submitted a Final Report concerning
remediation of site soil and groundwater contaminated
with heating oil. The Final Report is intended to docu-
ment remediation of the site to meet the site-specific
standard.

Northwest Region: Environmental Cleanup and
Brownfields Program Manager, 230 Chestnut Street,
Meadville, PA 16335-3481.

FirstEnergy Bradford Office Diesel AST Release,
475 High Street, Bradford, PA 16701-3736, City of Brad-
ford, McKean County. Environmental Remediation &
Recovery, Inc., 4250 Route 6N, Edinboro, PA 16412 on
behalf of FirstEnergy, 800 Cabin Hill Drive, Greensburg,
PA 15601 has submitted a Final Report concerning
remediation of site soil contaminated with Benzene, Tolu-
ene, Ethylbenzene, Xylenes, Methyl tertiary butyl ether
(MTBE), Cumene, Naphthalene, 1,2,4 Trimethylbenzene,
and 1,3,5 Trimethylbenzene. The report is intended to
document remediation of the site to meet the Statewide
health standard.

Vertical Seal Company, 162 Chapman Road, Pleasant-
ville, PA 16341, Harmony Township, Forest County. SE
Technologies, LLC, 500 Mosites Way, Suite 100, Pitts-
burgh, PA 15205 on behalf of Ampco-Pittsburgh Corpora-
tion, 726 Bell Avenue # 301, Carnegie, PA 15106 has
submitted a Remedial Investigation Report concerning
remediation of site groundwater contaminated with Co-
balt, Manganese, and Chloride. The report is intended to
document remediation of the site to meet a combination
of site-specific and Statewide health standards.
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LAND RECYCLING AND
ENVIRONMENTAL REMEDIATION

UNDER ACT 2, 1995
PREAMBLE 3

The Department has taken action on the following
plans and reports under the Land Recycling and
Environmental Remediation Standards Act
(35 P.S. §§ 6026.101—6026.907).

Section 250.8 of 25 Pa. Code and administration of the
Land Recycling and Environmental Remediation Stan-
dards Act (act) require the Department to publish in the
Pennsylvania Bulletin a notice of its final actions on plans
and reports. A final report is submitted to document
cleanup of a release of a regulated substance at a site to
one of the remediation standards of the act. A final report
provides a description of the site investigation to charac-
terize the nature and extent of contaminants in environ-
mental media, the basis of selecting the environmental
media of concern, documentation supporting the selection
of residential or nonresidential exposure factors, a de-
scription of the remediation performed and summaries of
sampling methodology and analytical results which dem-
onstrate that the remediation has attained the cleanup
standard selected. Plans and reports required by the act
for compliance with selection of remediation to a site-
specific standard, in addition to a final report, include a
remedial investigation report, risk assessment report and
cleanup plan. A remedial investigation report includes
conclusions from the site investigation; concentration of
regulated substances in environmental media; benefits of
reuse of the property; and, in some circumstances, a fate
and transport analysis. If required, a risk assessment
report describes potential adverse effects caused by the
presence of regulated substances. If required, a cleanup
plan evaluates the abilities of potential remedies to
achieve remedy requirements. A work plan for conducting
a baseline remedial investigation is required by the act
for compliance with selection of a special industrial area
remediation. The baseline remedial investigation, based
on the work plan, is compiled into the baseline environ-
mental report to establish a reference point to show
existing contamination, describe proposed remediation to
be done and include a description of existing or potential
public benefits of the use or reuse of the property. The
Department may approve or disapprove plans and reports
submitted. This notice provides the Department’s decision
and, if relevant, the basis for disapproval.

For further information concerning the plans and re-
ports, contact the environmental cleanup program man-
ager in the Department Regional Office under which the
notice of the plan or report appears. If information
concerning a final report is required in an alternative
form, contact the community relations coordinator at the
appropriate Regional Office. TDD users may telephone
the Department through the Pennsylvania Hamilton Re-
lay Service at (800) 654-5984.

The Department has received the following plans and
reports:

Southeast Region: Environmental Cleanup Program
Manager, 2 East Main Street, Norristown, PA 19401,
Charline Bass, 484-250-5787.

Cramp Shipyard Parcels B and C, 2001 and 2005
Richmond Street, Philadelphia, PA 19125, City of Phila-
delphia, Philadelphia County. Craig Herr, PG, RT
Environmental Services, 215 West Church Road, King of
Prussia, PA 19406 on behalf of Craig Hoogstraten, Dyott

Corporation, 6958 Torresdale Avenue, Suite 200, Philadel-
phia, PA 19135 submitted a Remedial Investigation
Report/Cleanup Plan concerning the remediation of site
soil contaminated with PCBs, PAHs and inorganics. The
Report was approved by the Department on June 22,
2021.

PECO Energy Company, 2nd and Crosby Street,
Chester, PA 19013, City of Chester, Delaware County.
W. Scott McCartney, PE, Wood Environment & Infrastruc-
ture Solutions, Inc., 4600 J Barry Court, Suite 210,
Canonsburg, PA 15317 on behalf of Peter Farrand, PECO
Energy Company, 2301 Market Street, Philadelphia, PA
19013 submitted a Remedial Investigation Report/
Cleanup Plan/Final Report concerning the remediation of
site soil and groundwater contaminated with anthracene,
acenaphthene, acenaphthylene, benzene, benzo(a)-
anthracene, benzo(a)pyrene, benzo(b)fluoranthene, benzo-
(g,h,i)perylene, benzo(k)fluoranthene, chrysene, dibenzo-
(a,h)anthracene, fluoranthene, fluorene, naphthalene,
phenanthrene, pyrene, styrene, total cyanide, toluene,
and xylenes. The Final Report demonstrated attainment
of the site-special standard and was approved by the
Department on June 22, 2021.

City of Philadelphia Streets Department North-
west Transfer Station, 5201 Umbria Street, Philadel-
phia, PA 19128, City of Philadelphia, Philadelphia
County. Sheila Innella, Matrix New World, 442 on behalf
of Stephen L. Massa, PE, City of Philadelphia, Sanitation
Division, Streets Department, 1401 JFK Boulevard, Phila-
delphia, PA 19102 submitted a Remedial Investigation
Report/Cleanup Plan concerning the remediation of site
soil contaminated with benzene, arsenic, cadmium, cop-
per, iron, lead, selenium, zinc and ammonia. The Report
was reviewed by the Department which issued an admin-
istrative deficiency letter on June 22, 2021.

Northeast Region: Environmental Cleanup & Brown-
fields Program Manager, 2 Public Square, Wilkes-Barre,
PA 18701-1915, 570-826-2511.

Contact: Eric Supey, Environmental Program Manager.

2363 Macarthur Road Property, 2363 Macarthur
Road, Whitehall, PA 18052, Whitehall Township, Lehigh
County. Bluestone Environmental, 196 Beach Lake
Highway, Honesdale, PA 18431, on behalf of Saint Luke’s
Bethlehem Campus, 801 Ostrum Street, Fountain Hill,
PA 18015, submitted a Final Report concerning remedia-
tion of soil contaminated by heating oil from an under-
ground storage tank. The Final Report demonstrated
attainment of Statewide health standards and was ap-
proved by DEP on July 6, 2021.

Cintas/Former RUS Facility, 164 East Main Street,
Emmaus, PA 18049, Emmaus Borough, Lehigh County,
Arcadis, 10 Friends Lane, Newtown, PA 18940, on behalf
of Cintas, 27 Whitney Drive, Milford, OH 45150, submit-
ted a Risk Assessment concerning remediation of soil and
groundwater contaminated with chlorinated solvents from
historical dry cleaning operations. The report was in-
tended to document remediation of the site to meet
site-specific standards but was disapproved by DEP on
July 6, 2021.

Groce-Brown Property, 1101 West Walnut Street,
Allentown, PA 18102, Allentown City, Lehigh County.
JMT Industrial & Environmental Contracting Services,
710 Uhler Road, Easton, PA 18040, on behalf of Angela
Groce-Brown, 615 North 23rd Street, Allentown, PA
18104, submitted a Final Report concerning remediation
of soil contaminated by a release of heating oil from an
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aboveground storage tank. The Final Report demon-
strated attainment of Statewide health standards and
was approved by DEP on June 30, 2021.

Parkway Shopping Center—Valley Cleaners, 1471
Lehigh Street, Allentown City, Lehigh County. Langan
Engineering and Environmental Services, 1818 Market
Street, Suite 3300, Philadelphia, PA 19103, on behalf of
Parkway Allentown, LLC, 1875 Century Park E # 1380,
Los Angeles, CA 90067, submitted a submitted a com-
bined Remedial Investigation Report, Cleanup Plan, and
Final Report concerning remediation of site soils and
groundwater contaminated with tetrachloroethylene
(PCE) in the vicinity of a dry cleaner. The report demon-
strated attainment of a combination of Site-Specific and
Statewide health standards and was approved by DEP on
June 29, 2021.

Former Shapiro Steel, 592 South Main Street,
Wilkes-Barre, PA 18701, Wilkes-Barre City, Luzerne
County. Langan Engineering & Environmental Services,
2700 Kelly Road, Warrington, PA 18976, on behalf of
South Main Plaza LP, 580 Third Avenue, Kingston, PA
18704, submitted a Final Report concerning remediation
of soil contaminated with metals, PCBs and polycyclic
aromatic hydrocarbons from historic operations at this
former scrap yard. The Final Report demonstrated attain-
ment of site-specific standards and was approved by DEP
on July 2, 2021.

Quillman Property, 333 East Norwegian Street, Potts-
ville, PA 17901, Pottsville City, Schuylkill County.
Envirosearch Consultants, P.O. Box 940, Springhouse, PA
19477, on behalf National Federal Mortgage Association,
14221 Dallas Parkway # 1000, Dallas, TX 75265, submit-
ted a Final Report concerning remediation of soil con-
taminated by a release of heating oil from an above-
ground storage tank. The Final Report demonstrated
attainment of Statewide health standards and was ap-
proved by DEP on June 30, 2021.

Southcentral Region: Environmental Cleanup and
Brownfields Program Manager, 909 Elmerton Avenue,
Harrisburg, PA 17110.

The Steel Works, 102, 106, 116-118, 120, 140, 154,
180, 202, 216, 220, and 230 North Front Street, Borough
of Steelton, Dauphin County. BL Companies, 2601
Market Place, Harrisburg, PA 17110, on behalf of Steel
Works, LLC, 430 North Front Street, Wormleysburg, PA
17043, submitted a Remedial Investigation Report and
Cleanup Plan concerning remediation of site soil contami-
nated with formaldehyde, metals, and SVOCs. The Report
was approved by the Department on June 25, 2021.

Bedford PA Industrial Property, 50 Sunnyside
Road, Bedford, PA 15522, Bedford Township, Bedford
County. Civil & Environmental Consultants, Inc., 333
Baldwin Road, Pittsburgh, PA 15205, on behalf of 550
Sunnyside Road, LLC, 630 Freedom Business Center
Drive, King of Prussia, PA 19406, submitted a Final
Report concerning remediation of site soil and groundwa-
ter contaminated petroleum hydrocarbons. The Final Re-
port demonstrated attainment of the site-specific stan-
dard and was approved by the Department on June 28,
2021.

Plaza 2331, 2331 East Market Street, York, PA 17402,
Springettsbury Township, York County. ARM Group,
Inc., P.O. Box 797, Hershey, PA 17033, on behalf of
Barbara Elliot, 2331 East Market Street, Suite 12, York,
PA 17402, submitted a Remedial Investigation Report and
Cleanup Plans concerning remediation of site soil and

groundwater contaminated with chlorinated solvents from
a historic dry cleaning facility. The combined report was
disapproved by the Department on July 1, 2021.

Cornwall Pump Station, 370 Horseshoe Pike, Leba-
non, PA 17402, West Cornwall Township, Lebanon
County. Aquaterra Technologies, Inc., P.O. Box 744, West
Chester, PA 19381, on behalf of Pipeline Operations,
Evergreen Resources Management Group, LLC, 2 Righter
Parkway, Suite 120, Wilmington, DE 19803, submitted a
Remedial Investigation Report concerning remediation of
site groundwater and soil contaminated with petroleum
hydrocarbons. The Report was disapproved by the Depart-
ment on July 1, 2021

Northwest Region: Environmental Cleanup and
Brownfields Program Manager, 230 Chestnut Street,
Meadville, PA 16335-3481.

F. Kinter No. 3, 5160 PA-286 W, Indiana, PA 15701,
Center Township, Indiana County. Moody & Associates,
Inc., 1720 Washington Road, Suite 100, Washington, PA
15301 on behalf of Diversified Production, LLC, 125
Industry Road # 201, Waynesburg, PA 15370 has submit-
ted a Final Report concerning the remediation of site soil
contaminated with Aluminum, Barium, Boron, Iron,
Lithium, Manganese, Selenium, Strontium, Vanadium,
and Zinc. The Final Report did not demonstrate attain-
ment of the Statewide health standard and was disap-
proved by the Department on June 24, 2021.

Vertical Seal Company, 162 Chapman Road, Pleasant-
ville, PA 16341, Harmony Township, Forest County. SE
Technologies, LLC, 500 Mosites Way, Suite 100, Pitts-
burgh, PA 15205 on behalf of Ampco-Pittsburgh Corpora-
tion, 726 Bell Avenue # 301, Carnegie, PA 15106 has
submitted a combination Risk Assessment/Remedial
Investigation/Final Report concerning remediation of site
groundwater contaminated with Cobalt, Manganese, and
Chloride. The Risk Assessment/Remedial Investigation/
Final Report demonstrated attainment of the site-specific
and Statewide health standards and was approved by the
Department on July 2, 2021.

DETERMINATION OF APPLICABILITY FOR
RESIDUAL WASTE GENERAL PERMITS

Determination of Applicability for General Permit
Approval Under the Solid Waste Management Act
(35 P.S. §§ 6018.101—6018.1003); the Municipal
Waste Planning, Recycling and Waste Reduction
Act (53 P.S. §§ 4000.101—4000.1904); and Residual
Waste Regulations for a General Permit to Oper-
ate Residual Waste Processing Facilities and/or
the Beneficial Use of Residual Waste Other Than
Coal Ash.

Northeast Region: Regional Solid Waste Manager, 2
Public Square, Wilkes-Barre, PA 18701-1915.

General Permit No. WMGR066-NE002. LTC Truck-
ing Corp., 2 Madison Avenue, Suite 209, Larchmont, NY
10538, Port Carbon Borough, Schuylkill County. A
determination of applicability for the processing (collec-
tion, bulking, storage and incidental oil/water separation)
of waste oil, virgin fuel oil tank bottoms, spent antifreeze
and waste oil/water mixtures prior to beneficial use. The
Department approved the determination of applicability
on July 1, 2021.
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Persons interested in reviewing the general permit may
contact Roger Bellas, Environmental Program Manager,
Waste Management Program, Northeast Regional Office,
2 Public Square, Wilkes-Barre, PA 18701-1915 at 570-
826-2511. TDD users may contact the Department
through the Pennsylvania Relay Service, (800) 654-5984.

OPERATE WASTE PROCESSING OR DISPOSAL
AREA OR SITE

Permit(s) Withdrawn Under the Solid Waste Man-
agement Act (35 P.S. §§ 6018.101—6018.1003), the
Municipal Waste Planning, Recycling and Waste
Reduction Act (53 P.S. §§ 4000.101—4000.1904) and
Regulations to Operate Solid Waste Processing or
Disposal Area or Site.

Southeast Region: Regional Solid Waste Manager, 2
East Main Street, Norristown, PA 19401, 484-250-5960.

Permit No. 100930. Philadelphia City Streets De-
partment, Municipal Services Building, 1401 John F
Kennedy Boulevard, Philadelphia PA 19102. Pursuant to
the request by the applicant to withdraw the application
for a major permit modification to construct a new top
load facility on the property of the existing facility at
Northwest Transfer Station Facility located in the City of
Philadelphia, Philadelphia County, the withdrawal re-
quest of the previously listed application was approved by
the Southeast Regional Office on July 1, 2021.

Persons interested in reviewing the permit application
may contact the Pennsylvania Department of Environ-
mental Protection (‘‘DEP’’) Waste Management Program
Manager, Southeast Regional Office, 2 East Main
Street, Norristown, PA 19401-4915, or by telephone at
484.250.5960. TDD users may contact the DEP through
the Pennsylvania Hamilton Relay Service, (800) 654.5984.

AIR QUALITY

General Plan Approval and Operating Permit Usage
Authorized under the Air Pollution Control Act
(35 P.S. §§ 4001—4015) and 25 Pa. Code Chapter
127 to construct, modify, reactivate or operate air
contamination sources and associated air clean-
ing devices.

Northeast Region: Air Quality Program, 2 Public
Square, Wilkes-Barre, PA 18711-0790.

Contact: Raymond Kempa, New Source Review Chief—
Telephone: 570-826-2531.

GP9-48-035: Bethlehem Landfill, Co. (2335 Apple-
butter Road, Bethlehem, PA 18015) on July 6, 2021, for
the construction and operation of a diesel fired I C engine
at the facility located in Lower Saucon Township, North-
ampton County.

GP3-48-035: Bethlehem Landfill, Co. (2335 Apple-
butter Road, Bethlehem, PA 18015) on July 6, 2021, for
the construction and operation of a portable stone crush-
ing plant at the facility located in Lower Saucon Town-
ship, Northampton County.

GP3-35-013A: ER Linde Construction Corporation
(239 Golf Hill Road, Honesdale, PA 18431) on July 2,
2021 for the operation of a portable crushing operation
with water sprays located at the Valley View Business
Park Lot 19 site in Jessup Borough, Lackawanna
County.

GP11-35-013A: ER Linde Construction Corpora-
tion (239 Golf Hill Road, Honesdale, PA 18431) on July 2,

2021 for the operation of diesel IC engines located at the
Valley View Business Park Lot 19 site in Jessup Borough,
Lackawanna County.

Northcentral Region: Air Quality Program, 208 West
Third Street, Williamsport, PA 17701.

Contact: Muhammad Q. Zaman, Program Manager,
(570) 327-3648.

GP14-41-00087: Knight-Confer Funeral Home, Inc.
(1914 Memorial Avenue, Williamsport, PA 17701) on June
21, 2021, to authorize the operation of a human crema-
tory pursuant to the General Plan Approval and General
Operating Permit for Human Crematories (BAQ-GPA/
GP-14) at their facility in Williamsport, Lycoming
County.

GP3-49-00054B: Meckleys Limestone Products,
Inc. (1543 State Route 225, Herndon, PA 17830) on June
14, 2021, to continue operation of one Terex Finlay jaw
crusher, equipped with two hoppers/grizzly screens, one
Extec double deck screen and seven conveyors pursuant
to General Plan Approval and/or General Operating Per-
mit For Portable Nonmetallic Mineral Processing Plants
(BAQ-GPA/GP-3) at the East/Mandata Quarry located in
Lower Mahanoy Township, Northumberland County.

GP9-49-00054B: Meckleys Limestone Products,
Inc. (1543 State Route 225, Herndon, PA 17830) on June
14, 2021, to continue operation of one 350 bhp Scania
DC09 diesel-fired engine and one 100 bhp Deutz
BF4M2012 diesel-fired engine pursuant to the General
Plan Approval and/or General Operating Permit for Die-
sel or No. 2 Fuel-fired Internal Combustion Engines
(BAQ-GPA/GP-9) at the East/Mandata Quarry located in
Lower Mahanoy Township, Northumberland County.

Southwest Regional Office, 400 Waterfront Drive, Pitts-
burgh, PA 15222-4745.

Contact: Edward Orris, New Source Review Chief,
412.442.4168.

GP5-63-000960E: MarkWest Liberty Midstream &
Resources, LLC (1515 Arapahoe St., Tower 1, Suite
1600, Denver, CO 80202-2137) issued authorization on
June 28, 2021, for the continued operation of their
existing and modified sources which include: Five (5)
natural gas-fired Caterpillar engines each rated at 1,380
bhp, two (2) diesel-fired John Deere engines each rated at
197 bhp, one (1) Glycol dehydration unit rated at 110
MMscfd, one (1) natural gas fired reboiler rated at 2.0
MMBtu/hr, one (1) 400-bbl storage tank, one (1) enclosed
flare rated at 7.0 MMBtu/hr, ten (10) intermittent pneu-
matic devices, truck loadout, fugitives, rod-packing,
crankcase venting, and blowdowns operations at their
existing Baker Compressor Station located in Amwell
Township, Washington County.

GP5-63-00962: MarkWest Liberty Midstream and
Resources, LLC (1515 Arapahoe Street, Tower 1, Suite
1600, Denver, CO 80202-2137) on May 18, 2011, to allow
the continued operation of a new natural gas production
facility consisting of two rich burn natural gas-fired
compressor engines rated at 1,480 bhp each and con-
trolled by three-way catalysts, one dehydrator unit con-
trolled by a flare with a reboiler rated at 1.0 MMBtu/hr,
and three produced water and condensate tanks two with
a capacity of 400 bbl each and one 500 bbl capacity at
their existing Redd Compressor Station located in Amwell
Township, Washington County.
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AIR QUALITY
Plan Approvals Issued under the Air Pollution Con-

trol Act (35 P.S. §§ 4001—4015) and regulations in
25 Pa. Code Chapter 127, Subchapter B relating to
construction, modification and reactivation of air
contamination sources and associated air clean-
ing devices.

Southeast Region: Air Quality Program, 2 East Main
Street, Norristown, PA 19401.

Contact: James Beach, New Source Review Chief—
Telephone: 484-250-5920.

09-0024L: 09-0024L: Waste Management of Penn-
sylvania, Inc. (1000 New Ford Mill Rd, Morrisville, PA
19067) for the installation of a landfill gas fired 2,242
horsepower (HP) generator engine, which replaces an
existing like-kind engine, at the Tullytown Resource
Recovery Facility (TRFF) in Tullytown Borough, Bucks
County.

Southcentral Region: Air Quality Program, 909 Elmer-
ton Avenue, Harrisburg, PA 17110.

Contact: Thomas Hanlon, Facilities Permitting Chief,
717-705-4862, Thomas Bianca, New Source Review Chief,
717-705-4863, or William Weaver, Regional Air Quality
Manager, 717-705-4702.

07-05041C: Fort Dearborn Co., 13985 South Eagle
Valley Road, Tyrone, PA 16686 on June 28, 2021, for the
installation of a new flexographic printing press and
regenerative thermal oxidizer at the label and packaging
printing facility located in Snyder Township, Blair
County.

Northcentral Region: Air Quality Program, 208 West
Third Street, Williamsport, PA 17701.

Contact: Muhammad Q. Zaman, Program Manager,
(570) 327-3648.

41-00084C: Hamilton Patriot, LLC (50 Patriot Lane,
Montgomery, PA 17752-6501) on June 24, 2021, to replace
the rotor and upgrade electrical generation capacity for
the natural gas-fired combined cycle combustion turbine
Source P103 at the Hamilton Patriot Generation Plant
facility located in Clinton Township, Lycoming County.
The plan approval contains requirements including moni-
toring, recordkeeping, reporting and testing conditions to
ensure compliance with applicable Federal and State
regulations.

AIR QUALITY
Plan Approval Revisions Issued including Exten-

sions, Minor Modifications and Transfers of Own-
ership under the Air Pollution Control Act (35 P.S.
§§ 4001—4015) and 25 Pa. Code §§ 127.13, 127.13a
and 127.32.

Southeast Region: Air Quality Program, 2 East Main
Street, Norristown, PA 19401.

Contact: James Beach, New Source Review Chief—
Telephone: 484-250-5920.

23-0003AC: Monroe Energy, LLC (4101 Post Road,
Trainer, PA 19061-5052) on July 2, 2021 an extension for
the installation of an Ultra-Low Sulfur Gasoline (ULSG)
unit and for a crude rate throughout increase in Trainer
Borough, Delaware County.

15-0110B: Pepperidge Farm, Inc. (421 Boot Road,
Downingtown, PA 19335-3043) on June 30, 2021 an

extension for the installation and operation of two (2)
25-ton capacity use bins for deliveries of flour to Pep-
peridge Farm, Inc. Each use bin has bin vent filters to
prevent loss of flour to the atmosphere. Downingtown
Borough, Chester County.

46-0221B: Upper Moreland Hatboro Joint Sewer
Authority (2875 Terwood Road, Willow Grove, PA 19090-
1434) on June 30, 2021 to remove three odor control
scrubbers (C04, C05 and C06) and replace with like kind
scrubber (C04 and biological oxidation (C08, C09) in
Upper Moreland Township, Montgomery County.

Southcentral Region: Air Quality Program, 909 Elmer-
ton Avenue, Harrisburg, PA 17110.

Contact: Thomas Hanlon, Facilities Permitting Chief,
717-705-4862, Thomas Bianca, New Source Review Chief,
717-705-4863, or William Weaver, Regional Air Quality
Manager, 717-705-4702.

06-05069AC: East Penn Manufacturing Co., Inc.
(P.O. Box 147, Lyon Station, PA 19536) on July 2, 2021,
for the installation of a new fabric filter dust collector in
the S-1 Facility and modification of dust collectors C59/
C59A and C64/C64A in the A-3 Facility. These facilities
are located at the lead acid battery assembly facility in
Richmond Township, Berks County. The plan approval
was extended.

06-05159A: CarbonLITE P, LLC (4030 Pottsville Pike,
Reading, PA 19605) on June 30, 2021, for the installation
of four (4) Caterpillar, 2,069 HP, natural gas-fired engines
for their combined heat and power system and three (3)
natural gas-fired, 7.877 MMBtu/hr, Miura boilers at the
pcrPET bottles and container recycle plant located in
Muhlenberg Township, Berks County. The plan approval
was extended.

28-05002J: Letterkenny Army Depot—US Depart-
ment of Defense (One Overcash Avenue, Chambersburg,
PA 17201) on June 30, 2020, for a new AP Rocket Motor
Destruction (ARMD) Facility within the Letterkenny Mu-
nitions Center ammunition storage area, at the Let-
terkenny Army Depot in Greene/Letterkenny Townships,
Franklin County. Air emissions from the ARMD will be
controlled by a wet scrubber system, followed by an
ADIOX packed bed scrubber tower absorption system.
The plan approval was extended.

Northcentral Region: Air Quality Program, 208 West
Third Street, Williamsport, PA 17701.

Contact: Muhammad Q. Zaman, Program Manager,
(570) 327-3648.

18-00005E: Eastern Gas Transmission and Storage,
Inc. (6603 West Broad Street, Richmond, VA 23230) on
July 2, 2021, to authorize temporary operation of the
source covered by this plan approval at their Finnefrock
Station located in Leidy Township, Clinton County. The
plan approval has been extended to December 30, 2021.

59-00035A: Empire Pipeline, Inc. (6363 Main Street,
Williamsville, NY 14221) on July 6, 2021, to authorize
temporary operation of the sources covered by this plan
approval at their Jackson Compressor Station located in
Jackson Township, Tioga County. The plan approval has
been extended to January 2, 2022.

Southwest Regional Office, 400 Waterfront Drive, Pitts-
burgh, PA 15222-4745.

Contact: Edward Orris, New Source Review Chief,
412.442.4168.

63-01003A: EQM Gathering Opco, LLC (2200 En-
ergy Drive, Canonsburg, PA 15317-1001) plan approval
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extension effective on June 28, 2021, with expiration on
December 28, 2021, to extend the period of temporary
operation of sources and controls at the McIntosh Com-
pressor Station located in Union Township, Washington
County.

AIR QUALITY
Title V Operating Permits Issued under the Air

Pollution Control Act (35 P.S. §§ 4001—4015) and
25 Pa. Code Chapter 127, Subchapter G.

Northeast Region: Air Quality Program, 2 Public
Square, Wilkes-Barre, PA 18701-1915.

Contact: Norman Frederick, Facility Permitting Chief—
Telephone: 570-826-2409.

39-00004: Mack Trucks, Inc. (7000 Alburtis Road,
Macungie, PA 18062). The Department issued, on June
21, 2021, a Title V Operating Permit for the operation of
sources at their facility located in Lower Macungie Town-
ship, Lehigh County. The Operating Permit contains all
applicable requirements for emission limitations, work
practice standards, testing, monitoring, recordkeeping,
and reporting standards used to verify facility compliance
with Federal and State air pollution regulations.

Northcentral Region: Air Quality Program, 208 West
Third Street, Williamsport, PA 17701.

Contact: Muhammad Q. Zaman, Program Manager,
570-327-3648.

49-00004: Resilite Sports Products, Inc. (200 Point
Township Drive, Northumberland, PA 17857) was issued
a Title V Operating Permit renewal permit on June 28,
2021, for the Resilite Sports Products facility located in
Northumberland Borough, Northumberland County.
The Operating Permit contains all applicable require-
ments including emission limits, monitoring, recordkeep-
ing and reporting conditions to ensure compliance with
all State and Federal regulations.

AIR QUALITY
Operating Permits for Non-Title V Facilities Issued

under the Air Pollution Control Act (35 P.S.
§§ 4001—4015) and 25 Pa. Code Chapter 127,
Subchapter F.

Southeast Region: Air Quality Program, 2 East Main
Street, Norristown, PA 19401.

Contact: Janine Tulloch-Reid, Facilities Permitting
Chief—Telephone: 484-250-5920.

15-00157: USSC Acquisition Corp. (101 Gordon
Drive, Exton, PA 19341) on July 2, 2021, Initial State-
only Operating Permit for four (4) glue booths used to
glue foam to fabric, two (2) paint booths and two (2)
cold-cleaning immersion part washers to manufacture
seating for first responder and military vehicles to its
facility located in Uwchlan Township, Chester County.
The company was previously permitted under the State-
Only Operating Permit No. 15-00155.

Northeast Region: Air Quality Program, 2 Public
Square, Wilkes-Barre, PA 18701-1915.

Contact: Norman Frederick, Facility Permitting Chief—
Telephone: 570-826-2409.

40-00059: Reilly Plating Company, Inc. (130 Alden
Road, Nanticoke, PA 18634). The Department issued, on
June 22, 2021, a State-Only Operating Permit for the
operation of sources at their facility located in Nanticoke

City, Luzerne County. The Operating Permit contains
all applicable requirements for emission limitations, work
practice standards, testing, monitoring, recordkeeping,
and reporting standards used to verify facility compliance
with Federal and State air pollution regulations.

40-000139: Gonnella Frozen Products, LLC (301
Parkview Road, Hazle Township, PA 18202). The Depart-
ment issued, on May 27, 2021, a State-Only Operating
Permit for the operation of sources at their facility located
in Hazle Township, Luzerne County. The Operating
Permit contains all applicable requirements for emission
limitations, work practice standards, testing, monitoring,
recordkeeping, and reporting standards used to verify
facility compliance with Federal and State air pollution
regulations.

35-00075: Process Tech & Packaging, LLC (102 Life
Science Drive, Olyphant, PA 18447). The Department
issued, on May 7, 2021, a State-Only Operating Permit
for the operation of sources at their facility located in
Olyphant Borough, Lackawanna County. The Operat-
ing Permit contains all applicable requirements for emis-
sion limitations, work practice standards, testing, moni-
toring, recordkeeping, and reporting standards used to
verify facility compliance with Federal and State air
pollution regulations.

Southcentral Region: Air Quality Program, 909 Elmer-
ton Avenue, Harrisburg, PA 17110.

Contact: Thomas Hanlon, Facilities Permitting Chief,
717-705-4862, Thomas Bianca, New Source Review Chief,
717-705-4863, or William Weaver, Regional Air Quality
Manager, 717-705-4702.

06-03096: Lucas Lane, Inc. (10 Lucas Lane, Bernville,
PA 19506) on June 29, 2021, for the oil filter recycling
facility located in Upper Tulpehocken Township, Berks
County. The State-Only Permit was renewed.

28-03040: New Enterprise Stone & Lime Co., Inc.
(3587 Stone Quarry Road, Chambersburg, PA 17201-7729)
on June 25, 2021, for the Chambersburg Quarry opera-
tions located in Guilford Township, Franklin County.
The State-Only Permit was renewed.

01-03020: Genlyte Thomas Group, LLC (100 Craft-
way, Littlestown, PA 17340-1651) on June 24, 2021, for
the lighting products manufacturing facility located in
Littlestown Borough, Adams County. The State-Only
Permit was renewed.

Northcentral Region: Air Quality Program, 208 West
Third Street, Williamsport, PA 17701.

Contact: Muhammad Q. Zaman, Program Manager,
570-327-3648.

41-00065: Fisher Mining Company (40 Choate
Circle, Montoursville, PA 17754-9791) on June 24, 2021
was issued a renewal State only Operating Permit for the
Thomas Site located in Pine Township, Lycoming
County. The State only Operating Permit contains all
applicable regulatory requirements including monitoring,
recordkeeping and reporting conditions.

41-00064: Glenn O. Hawbaker, Inc. (711 East College
Avenue, Bellefonte, PA 16823) was issued a renewal State
Only (Synthetic Minor) Operating Permit on June 29,
2021, for their Armstrong Township Crushing Plant facil-
ity located in Armstrong Township, Lycoming County.
The State Only (Synthetic Minor) Operating Permit con-
tains requirements including monitoring, recordkeeping,
and reporting conditions to ensure compliance with appli-
cable Federal and State regulations.
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17-00075: Kinkead Aggregates, Inc. (2311 Route 56
Hwy E, Homer City, PA 15748) was issued on July 1,
2021, a State Only Natural Minor Operating Permit for
their nonmetallic mineral crushing plant and other source
operations within the Buena Vista Mine facility in Bell
Township, Clearfield County. All applicable Federal and
State regulatory requirements derived from 25 Pa. Code
Chapters 121—145, including appropriate testing, moni-
toring, recordkeeping, reporting, and work practice to
verify compliance are included in the permit.

Southwest Regional Office, 400 Waterfront Drive, Pitts-
burgh, PA 15222-4745.

Contact: Thomas Joseph, Facilities Permitting Chief,
412.442.4336.

30-00116: Columbia Gas Transmission, LLC (455
Racetrack Road, Washington, PA 15301) on July 2, 2021,
the Department issued a renewal Synthetic Minor Oper-
ating Permit for operation of the Waynesburg Compressor
Station located in Franklin Township, Greene County.

Equipment covered by this Operating Permit includes
five (5) natural gas-fired Solar Saturn turbines, one (1)
natural gas-fired Solar Centaur turbine, one (1)
Waukesha natural gas-fired emergency generator engine,
one (1) natural gas-fired fuel line heat exchanger, forty
(40) natural gas-fired catalytic space heaters, gasoline
storage tanks, and pipeline liquids storage tanks.

The facility is subject to the applicable requirements of
25 Pa. Code Article III, Chapters 121—145. The final
Operating Permit includes conditions incorporating re-
quirements for applicable emission limitations, monitor-
ing, work practice standards, reporting, and recordkeep-
ing.

63-01007: Sunoco Pipeline L.P. (525 Fritztown Road,
Sinking Spring, PA 19608) On June 30, 2021, the Depart-
ment issued an initial Air Quality Natural Minor State
Only Operating Permit to authorize the operation of the
Houston Tank Farm located in Chartiers Township,
Washington County.

Emission sources at the facility include collected pump
station seal leaks, gas chromatograph emissions, pilot
fuel gas emissions, pig launcher and receivers, filter,
prover, and other miscellaneous maintenance activities
controlled by a 70.0 MMBtu/hr enclosed flare; fugitive
VOC emissions from pump seal leaks, relief valve seats,
flanges, and miscellaneous component types; a 11.92
MMBtu/hr LPG vaporizer heater; a 4.94 MMBtu/hr Bu-
tane vaporizer heater; and two (2) diesel-fired emergency
firewater pump engines rated at 617 Bhp each. The
facility is subject to the applicable requirements of
25 Pa. Code Article III, Chapters 121—145. The final
Operating Permit includes conditions incorporating re-
quirements for applicable emission limitations, monitor-
ing, work practice standards, reporting, and recordkeep-
ing.

65-00962: CCF Industries, Inc. (4716 State Route 66,
Apollo, PA 15613-1404) on June 29, 2021, a State Only
Operating Permit (SOOP) Modification to CCF Industries,
Inc. to remove special conditions under 25 Pa. Code
§§ 129.101—129.107 from the current Operating Permit.
The facility is located in Washington Township, West-
moreland County.

Northwest Region: Air Quality Program, 230 Chestnut
Street, Meadville, PA 16335-3481.

Contact: Matthew Williams, Facilities Permitting
Chief—Telephone: 814-332-6940.

32-00207: Sprankle Mills Tipple Valier Coal Yard
(91 Coolspring Road, Punxsutawney, PA 15767). On June
29, 2021 the Department issued a renewal of the State
Only Operating Permit for operating of a coal preparation
plant located in North Mahoning Township, Indiana
County. The subject facility consists of an enclosed coal
crusher, shaker/screen, front end loader, dump trucks and
rail cars. Emissions from the facility are based on the coal
throughput limit of 195,000 tpy and AP-42 emission
factors. The facility has the potential to emit 2.54 tpy
PM-10. The facility is a natural minor and is subject to
State and Federal Regulations (40 CFR Part 60 Subpart
Y). The renewal permit includes operation requirements,
monitoring requirements, and recordkeeping require-
ments to ensure compliance with the Clean Air Act and
the Air Pollution Control Act.

43-00360: Cronimet Specialty Metals USA, Inc.
(40 Council Avenue, Wheatland, PA 16161). On July 1,
2021, the Department renewed the State Only Operating
Permit for the melting and foundry operations in the
Borough of Wheatland, Mercer County. The primary
emission sources at the facility include 4 Electric Induc-
tion Furnaces, a 1.5 million Btu/hr natural gas fueled
shot dryer, shakeout operations, shot blasting, a ball mill,
a Next Gen2 Mixer, and other natural gas combustion
sources with ratings of less than 1 million Btu/hr. The
facility is a natural minor. Estimated potential emissions
for the facility are as follows: 1.3 tpy NOx; 0.008 tpy SOx;
1.09 tpy CO; 3.17 tpy PM; 0.07 tpy VOC; and 1,564 tpy
CO2. The permit contains emission restrictions, record-
keeping, and work practice requirements to ensure com-
pliance with the Clean Air Act and the Air Pollution
Control Act.

AIR QUALITY
Operating Permit Revisions Issued including Ad-

ministrative Amendments, Minor Modifications or
Transfers of Ownership under the Air Pollution
Control Act (35 P.S. §§ 4001—4015) and
25 Pa. Code §§ 127.412, 127.450, 127.462 and
127.464.

Southeast Region: Air Quality Program, 2 East Main
Street, Norristown, PA 19401.

Contact: Janine Tulloch-Reid, Facilities Permitting
Chief—Telephone: 484-250-5920.

46-00081: Optinova Valley Forge, Inc. (435 School
Lane, Plymouth Meeting, PA 19462), for an Administra-
tive Amendment for their facility located in Plymouth
Township, Montgomery County. Optinova submitted a
change of ownership form and administrative amendment
application to the Department and has requested to
transfer the existing Synthetic Minor Operating Permit
from Markel Corporation (Markel) to Optinova Valley
Forge, Inc. (Optinova). Optinova has purchased all the
equipment (Air emission sources) from Markel. Optinova
specializes in advanced tubing solutions for the extrusion,
medical, and specialty industries and will continue simi-
lar operations as Markel. The facility will maintain its
status as a synthetic minor facility for VOC emissions.
With the transfer of the Operating Permit there have
been no changes to any of the conditions in the permit.
The Operating Permit contains testing, monitoring and
recordkeeping condition along with work practice stan-
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dards designed to keep the sources and the facility
operating within all applicable air quality requirements.

Southcentral Region: Air Quality Program, 909 Elmer-
ton Avenue, Harrisburg, PA 17110.

Contact: Thomas Hanlon, Facilities Permitting Chief,
717-705-4862, Thomas Bianca, New Source Review Chief,
717-705-4863, or William Weaver, Regional Air Quality
Manager, 717-705-4702.

67-05113: Oldcastle Building Envelope, Inc. (1551
Mt. Rose Avenue, York, PA 17403) on June 30, 2021, for
operation of a metal window and door manufacturing
facility in Spring Garden Township, York County. The
Title V permit was administratively amended to reflect a
change of ownership.

AIR QUALITY
De Minimis Emissions Increases Authorized under

25 Pa. Code § 127.449.

Southwest Regional Office, 400 Waterfront Drive, Pitts-
burgh, PA 15222-4745.

Contact: Edward Orris, New Source Review Chief,
412.442.4168.

TVOP-65-00853: Cleveland-Cliffs Monessen Coke,
LLC (345 Donner Avenue, Monessen, PA 15062). Per
25 Pa. Code § 127.449(i), this Notice is for the following
de minimis emission increase at the Monessen Coke Plant
located in Monessen City, Westmoreland County: This
project is for the installation and operation of the Battery
2 Emergency Flare with 99% destruction efficiency. The
emission increase resulting from this project will not
exceed 0.10 ton of CO, 0.12 ton of NOx, 0.01 ton of SOx,
0.01 ton of PM-10, and 0.01 ton of VOCs per year. The
following conditions of this de minimis emission increase
will be included in the Operating Permit:

• The permittee shall comply with the applicable
40 CFR Part 63 Subpart L requirements.

• The permittee shall operate and maintain Battery 2
Emergency Flare in accordance with manufacturers rec-
ommended specifications.

The list of de minimis increases for this facility in-
cludes only this project.

ACTIONS ON COAL AND NONCOAL
MINING ACTIVITY APPLICATIONS

Actions on applications under the Surface Mining
Conservation and Reclamation Act (52 P.S.
§§ 1396.1—1396.31); the Noncoal Surface Mining
Conservation and Reclamation Act (52 P.S.
§§ 3301—3326); the Clean Streams Law (35 P.S.
§§ 691.1—691.1001); the Coal Refuse Disposal Con-
trol Act (52 P.S. §§ 30.51—30.66); the Bituminous
Mine Subsidence and Land Conservation Act
(52 P.S. §§ 1406.1—1406.21). The final action on
each application also constitutes action on the
NPDES permit application and, if noted, the re-
quest for a Section 401 Water Quality Certifica-
tion. Mining activity permits issued in response
to such applications will also address the applica-
tion permitting requirements of the following
statutes; the Air Quality Control Act (35 P.S.
§§ 4001—4015); the Dam Safety and Encroach-
ments Act (32 P.S. §§ 693.1—693.27); and the Solid
Waste Management Act (35 P.S. §§ 6018.101—
6018.1003).

Coal Permits Issued

Cambria District Mining Office: 286 Industrial Park
Road, Ebensburg, PA 15931, 814-472-1900, (Contact:
Melanie Ford-Wigfield).

Permit 11150103. Amerikohl Mining, Inc., 202 Sun-
set Drive, Butler, PA 16001, permit renewal for reclama-
tion only of a bituminous surface mine in West Carroll
Township, Cambria County, affecting 104.0 acres. Re-
ceiving streams: unnamed tributaries # 1 and # 2 to/and
the West Branch of the Susquehanna River, classified for
the following uses: cold water fishes and warm water
fishes. There are no potable water supply intakes within
10 miles downstream. Application received: May 11, 2021.
Permit issued: June 29, 2021.

Noncoal Permits Issued

Cambria District Mining Office: 286 Industrial Park
Road, Ebensburg, PA 15931, 814-472-1900, (Contact:
Melanie Ford-Wigfield).

PAM418012-GP104. Hess Excavating, Inc., 1130
West Dutch Corner, McConnellsburg, PA 17233. Renew
Coverage General NPDES Permit for Stormwater Dis-
charges Associated with Mining Activities on Noncoal
Permit No. 29910801 located in Todd Township, Fulton
County. Receiving stream: unnamed tributary to Big
Cove Creek classified for the following uses: cold water
fishes, Migratory Fishes. There are no potable water
supplies located within 10 miles downstream. Notice of
Intent for Coverage received: April 29, 2021. Coverage
Approved: June 29, 2021.

PAM419002-GP104. Kirby W. Kitner Excavating,
7214 Spring Road, New Bloomfield, PA 17068. Renew
Coverage General NPDES Permit for Stormwater Dis-
charges Associated with Mining Activities on Noncoal
Permit No. 50192801 located in Centre Township, Perry
County. Receiving stream: unnamed tributary to Little
Juniata Creek, classified for the following uses: cold
water fishes, migratory fishes. There are no potable water
supply intakes within 10 miles downstream. Notice of
Intent for Coverage received: April 12, 2021. Coverage
Approved: June 29, 2021.

PAM418024-GP104. Melvin Hostetler, 51 County
Line Lane, Newburg, PA 17240. Renew Coverage General
NPDES Permit for Stormwater Discharges Associated
with Mining Activities on Noncoal Permit No. 21180801
located in Hopewell Township, Cumberland County.
Receiving streams: unnamed tributary to Paxton Run,
Laughlin Run, classified for the following uses: Warm
Water Fishes, Migratory Fishes. There are no potable
water supplies located within 10 miles downstream.
Notice of Intent for Coverage received: May 4, 2021.
Coverage Approved: June 28, 2021.

PAM420003-GP104. Gettysburg Granite, LLC,
31 Center Mills Road, Aspers, PA 17304. Renew Coverage
under the General NPDES Permit for Stormwater Dis-
charges Associated with Mining Activities (BMP GP-104)
on Noncoal Permit No. 0179301 located in Mt. Joy
Township, Adams County. Receiving stream(s): Un-
named Tributary to Rock Creek classified for the follow-
ing use(s): Warm Water Fishes (WWF). There are no
potable water supply intakes within 10 miles down-
stream. Notice of Intent for Coverage received: May 5,
2021. Coverage Approved: June 28, 2021.

PAM419004-GP104. Quarry Cut, Inc., Box 1020,
77 Wells Road, Parker Ford, PA 19457. Renew Coverage
under the General NPDES Permit for Stormwater Dis-
charges Associated with Mining Activities (BMP GP-104)
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on Noncoal Permit No. 34190301 located in Spruce Hill
and Turbett Townships, Juniata County. Receiving
stream(s): unnamed tributary to Hunter’s Creek classified
for the following use(s): cold water fishes, migratory
fishes. There are no potable water supply intakes within
10 miles downstream. Notice of Intent for Coverage
received: April 14, 2021. Coverage Approved: June 28,
2021.

PAM419006-GP104. Zimmerman’s Excavation,
LLC, 7270 Licking Creek Road, Mifflintown, PA 17059.
Renew Coverage under the General NPDES Permit for
Stormwater Discharges Associated with Mining Activities
(BMP GP-104) on Noncoal Permit No. 34190802 located
in Milford Township, Juniata County. Receiving
stream(s): unnamed tributary to East Licking Creek
classified for the following use(s): cold water fishes and
migratory fishes. There are no potable water supply
intakes within 10 miles downstream. Notice of Intent for
Coverage received: May 12, 2021. Coverage Approved:
June 28, 2021.

PAM419007-GP104. Weaver Hauling & Excavating,
LLC, 688 Walnut Bottom Road, Shippensburg, PA 17257.
Renew Coverage under the General NPDES Permit for
Stormwater Discharges Associated with Mining Activities
(BMP GP-104) on Noncoal Permit No. 29192801 located
in North Newton Township, Cumberland County. Re-
ceiving stream(s): unnamed tributary to Green Spring
Creek, classified for the following use(s): CWF, MF. There
are no potable water supply intakes within 10 miles
downstream. Notice of Intent for Coverage received: April
14, 2021. Coverage Approved: June 28, 2021.

PAM420001-GP104. Alan H. Book, 18270 Shade Val-
ley Road, Blairs Mills, PA 17213. Renew Coverage under
the General NPDES Permit for Stormwater Discharges
Associated with Mining Activities (BMP GP104) on
Noncoal Permit No. 31200801 located in Tell Township.
Huntingdon County. Receiving stream: unnamed tribu-
tary to Trough Spring Branch classified for the following
uses: cold water fishes. There are no potable water supply
intakes within 10 miles downstream. Notice of Intent for
Coverage received: April 19, 2021. Coverage Approved:
June 28, 2021.

PAM420002-GP104. Samuel P. Hostetler, 55 Hooley
Lane, Reedsville, PA 17084. Renew Coverage under the
General NPDES Permit for Stormwater Discharges Asso-
ciated with Mining Activities (BMP GP-104) on Noncoal
Permit No. 44200801 located in Brown Township, Mifflin
County. Receiving stream: Kishacoquillas Creek classi-
fied for the following uses: CWF, MF. There are no
potable water supply intakes within 10 miles down-
stream. Notice of Intent for Coverage Approved: April 20,
2021. Approved: June 28, 2021.

PAM418010-GP104. Troy A. Crist, 2496 North Imler
Valley Road, Imler, PA 16655. Renew Coverage General
NPDES Permit for Stormwater Discharges Associated
with Mining Activities on Noncoal Permit No. 05090801
located in Kimmel Township, Bedford County. Receiv-
ing stream: Beaver Dam Creek classified for the following
uses: warm water fishes, Migratory Fishes. There are no
potable water supplies located within 10 miles down-
stream. Notice of Intent for Coverage received: April 22,
2021. Coverage Approved: June 28, 2021.

PAM419001-GP104. Rockwood Stone, LLC, 195 Lost
Mountain Lane, Rockwood, PA 15557. Renew Coverage
under the General NPDES Permit for Stormwater Dis-
charges Associated with Mining Activities (BMP GP-104)
on Noncoal Permit No. 56190801 located in Black Town-

ship, Somerset County. Receiving stream: Casselman
River, classified for the following use: warm water fishes.
There are no potable water supply intakes within
10 miles downstream. Notice of Intent for Coverage
received: April 27, 2021. Approved: June 28, 2021.

PAM417039-GP104. Ezra S. Peachey, 92 Sunnyhill
Lane, Belleville, PA 17004. Renew Coverage General
NPDES Permit for Stormwater Discharges Associated
with Mining Activities on Noncoal Permit No. 44170803
located in Menno Township, Mifflin County. Receiving
stream: unnamed tributary to Little Kishacoquillas
Creek, classified for the following uses: cold water fishes,
Migratory Fishes. There are no potable water supplies
located within 10 miles downstream. Notice of Intent for
Coverage received: April 22, 2021. Coverage Approved:
June 28, 2021.

PAM417040-GP104. David H. Martin Excavating,
Inc., 4961 Cumberland Highway, Chambersburg, PA
17202. Renew Coverage General NPDES Permit for
Stormwater Discharges Associated with Mining Activities
on Noncoal Permit No. 28042801 located in Hamilton
Township, Franklin County. Receiving stream: Un-
named Tributary to Rocky Spring Branch of Back Creek,
a tributary to Conococheague Creek classified for the
following uses: TSF. There are no potable water supplies
located within 10 miles downstream. Notice of Intent for
Coverage received: April 22, 2021. Coverage Approved:
June 25, 2021.

PAM418013-GP104. David H. Martin Excavating,
Inc., 4961 Cumberland Highway, Chambersburg, PA
17202. Renew Coverage General NPDES Permit for
Stormwater Discharges Associated with Mining Activities
on Noncoal Permit No. 28832501 located in Hamilton
Township, Franklin County. Receiving streams: un-
named tributary to Rocky Spring Branch of Back Creek, a
tributary to Conococheague Creek classified for the fol-
lowing use: Trout Stock Fishes. There are no potable
water supplies located within 10 miles downstream.
Notice of Intent for Coverage received: April 22, 2021.
Coverage Approved: June 25, 2021.

PAM418022-GP104. Scott’s Hauling & Excavating
Inc., 1462 No. Franklin Street, Chambersburg, PA 17202.
Renew Coverage General NPDES Permit for Stormwater
Discharges Associated with Mining Activities on Noncoal
Permit No. 28180801 located in St. Thomas Township,
Franklin County. Receiving streams: unnamed tribu-
tary to Back Creek, classified for the following uses: trout
stocked fishes and migratory fishes. Notice of Intent for
Coverage received: April 26, 2021. Coverage Approved:
June 25, 2021.

PAM418009-GP104. Grannas Bros. Stone & As-
phalt Co., Inc., P.O. Box 488, Hollidaysburg, PA 16648.
Renew Coverage General NPDES Permit for Stormwater
Discharges Associated with Mining Activities on Noncoal
Permit No. 07020301 located in Catharine Township,
Blair County. Receiving stream: unnamed tributary to
Frankstown Branch of the Juniata River, classified for
the following uses: warm water fishes, Migratory Fishes.
There are no potable water supplies located within 10
miles downstream. Notice of Intent for Coverage received:
April 5, 2021. Coverage Approved: June 25, 2021.

PAM417034-GP104. Jesse M. Kauffman, 9 Meadow-
side Lane, Belleville, PA 17004. Renew Coverage General
NPDES Permit for Stormwater Discharges Associated
with Mining Activities on Noncoal Permit No. 44012801
located in Menno Township, Mifflin County. Receiving
stream: Little Kishacoquillas Creek classified for the
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following uses: Cold Water Fishes, Migratory Fishes.
There are no potable water supplies located within 10
miles downstream. Notice of Intent for Coverage received:
April 14, 2021. Coverage Approved: June 25, 2021.

Moshannon District Mining Office: 186 Enterprise
Drive, Philipsburg, PA 16866, 814-342-8200, (Contact:
Ashley Smith).

08112502. Johnson Quarries, Inc., P.O. Box 136,
LeRaysville, PA 18829. Commencement, operation and
restoration of a GP-105 (industrial minerals) operation
located in Warren Township, Bradford County affecting
18.0 acres. Receiving stream(s): Unnamed tributary to
Dewings Creek to Dewing Creek to Apalachin Creek
classified for the following use(s): CWF, MF. Application
received: February 16, 2021. Permit issued: June 30,
2021.

PAM211005-GP104. Johnson Quarries, Inc., P.O.
Box 136, LeRaysville, PA 18829. Coverage under the
General NPDES Permit for Stormwater Discharges Asso-
ciated with Mining Activities (BMP GP-104) on Noncoal
Permit No. 08112502 located in Warren Township, Brad-
ford County. Receiving stream(s): Unnamed tributary to
Dewings Creek to Dewing Creek to Apalachin Creek
classified for the following use(s): CWF, MF. There are no
potable water supply intakes within 10 miles down-
stream. Notice of Intent for Coverage received: February
16, 2021. Approval of Coverage issued: June 30, 2021.

08202504. Meshoppen Stone, Inc., P.O. Box 127,
Meshoppen, PA 18630. Commencement, operation and
restoration of a GP-105 (industrial minerals) operation
located in Rome Township, Bradford County affecting
8.4 acres. Receiving stream(s): Unnamed tributary to
Parks Creek classified for the following use(s): CWF, MF.
Application received: August 3, 2020. Permit issued: June
30, 2021.

PAM221007-GP104. Meshoppen Stone, Inc., P.O.
Box 127, Meshoppen, PA 18630. Coverage under the
General NPDES Permit for Stormwater Discharges Asso-
ciated with Mining Activities (BMP GP-104) on Noncoal
Permit No. 08202504 located in Rome Township, Brad-
ford County. Receiving stream(s): Unnamed tributary to
Parks Creek classified for the following use(s): CWF, MF.
Notice of Intent for Coverage received: January 25, 2021.
Approval of Coverage issued: June 30, 2021.

ACTIONS ON BLASTING ACTIVITY
APPLICATIONS

Actions on applications under the Explosives Acts
of 1937 and 1957 and 25 Pa. Code § 211.124. Blast-
ing activity performed as part of a coal or
noncoal mining activity will be regulated by the
mining permit for that coal or noncoal mining
activity.

Blasting Permits Issued

Moshannon District Mining Office: 186 Enterprise
Drive, Philipsburg, PA 16866, 814-342-8200, (Contact:
Ashley Smith).

57214103. John H. Brainard, P.O. Box 66, Clifford,
PA 18413. Blasting for Residential Development located
in Dushore Borough, Sullivan County with an expira-
tion date of December 31, 2021. Permit issued: June 28,
2021.

14214105. Douglas Explosives, Inc., 2052 Philips-
burg Bigler Hwy, Philipsburg, PA 16866-8116. Blasting for

Residential Development located in Ferguson Township,
Centre County with an expiration date of July 5, 2022.
Permit issued: July 1, 2021.

08214106. MD Drilling & Blasting, Inc., 88 Gold-
ledge Ave, Suite 2, Auburn, NH 03032. Blasting for
Pipeline located in Monroe Township, Bradford County
with an expiration date of June 21, 2022. Permit issued:
July 1, 2021.

New Stanton District Office: P.O. Box 133, New Stanton,
PA 15672, 724-925-5500, (Contact: Tracy Norbert).

65214103. Senex Explosives, Inc., 710 Millers Run
Road, Cuddy, PA 15031-9742. Blasting activity permit for
the construction of the Waste Management, Valley Land-
fill, located in Penn Township, Westmoreland County
with an expiration date of June 22, 2022. Blasting permit
issued: June 28, 2021.

Pottsville District Mining Office: 5 West Laurel Boule-
vard, Pottsville, PA 17901, 570-621-3118, (Contact:
Theresa Reilly-Flannery).

Permit No. 48214110. American Rock Mechanics,
Inc., 7531 Chestnut Street, Zionsville, PA 18092, con-
struction blasting for 248 Warehouse B in Lower Naza-
reth Township, Northampton County with an expira-
tion date of June 17, 2022. Permit issued: June 25, 2021.

Permit No. 64214106. Explosive Services, Inc.,
7 Pine Street, Bethany, PA 18431, construction blasting
for Camp Freedom in Clinton Township, Wayne County
with an expiration date of June 15, 2022. Permit issued:
June 28, 2021.

Permit No. 09214105. Rock Work, Inc., 1257 DeKalb
Pike, Blue Bell, PA 19422, construction blasting for
Lincoln Highway SR1 RC2 in Bensalem Township, Bucks
County with an expiration date of July 1, 2022. Permit
issued: June 29, 2021.

Permit No. 13214103. Maine Drilling & Blasting,
Inc., P.O. Box 1140, Gardiner, ME 04345, construction
blasting for Exeter Blue Ridge in Kidder Township,
Carbon County with an expiration date of February 5,
2022. Permit issued: June 29, 2021.

Permit No. 36214130. Keystone Blasting Service,
15 Hopeland Road, Lititz, PA 17543, construction blasting
for Ivan Fisher Dwelling in Strasburg Township, Lan-
caster County with an expiration date of July 30, 2021.
Permit issued: June 30, 2021.

Permit No. 36214131. Abel Construction Co., Inc.,
3925 Columbia Avenue, Mountville, PA 17554, construc-
tion blasting for Stoner Farm Phase 1 in Manheim
Township, Lancaster County with an expiration date of
January 31, 2022. Permit issued: June 30, 2021.

Permit No. 66214101. Meshoppen Blasting, Inc.,
P.O. Box 127, Meshoppen, PA 18630, construction blasting
for Rossi Dwelling in Factoryville Borough, Wyoming
County with an expiration date of June 29, 2022. Permit
issued: July 1, 2021.

FEDERAL WATER POLLUTION
CONTROL ACT SECTION 401

The Department has taken the following actions on
previously received permit applications, requests for Envi-
ronmental Assessment approval, and requests for Water
Quality Certification under Section 401 of the Federal
Water Pollution Control Act (FWPCA) (33 U.S.C.A.
§ 1341).

Except as otherwise noted, the Department has granted
401 Water Quality Certification certifying that the con-
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struction and operation described will comply with the
applicable provisions of Sections 301—303, 306 and 307 of
the FWPCA (33 U.S.C.A. §§ 1311—1313, 1316 and 1317),
and that the construction will not violate applicable
Federal and State Water Quality Standards.

Any person aggrieved by these actions may appeal,
pursuant to Section 4 of the Environmental Hearing
Board Act, 35 P.S. § 7514, and the Administrative Agency
Law, 2 Pa.C.S. Chapter 5A, to the Environmental Hear-
ing Board, Second Floor, Rachel Carson State Office
Building, 400 Market Street, P.O. Box 8457, Harrisburg,
PA 17105-8457, (717) 787-3483. TDD users may contact
the Board through the Pennsylvania Hamilton Relay
Service, (800) 654-5984. Appeals must be filed with the
Environmental Hearing Board within 30-days of publica-
tion of this notice in the Pennsylvania Bulletin, unless the
appropriate statute provides a different time period.
Copies of the appeal form and the Board’s rules of
practice and procedure may be obtained from the Board.
The appeal form and the Board’s rules of practice and
procedure are also available in braille or on audiotape
from the Secretary to the Board at (717) 787-3483. This
paragraph does not, in and of itself, create any right of
appeal beyond that permitted by applicable statutes and
decisional law.

If you want to challenge this action, your appeal must
reach the Board within 30-days. You do not need a lawyer
to file an appeal with the Board.

Important legal rights are at stake, however, so you
should show this notice to a lawyer at once. If you cannot
afford a lawyer, you may qualify for free pro bono
representation. Call the Secretary to the Board (717)
787-3483 for more information.
WATER OBSTRUCTIONS AND ENCROACHMENTS

Actions on applications for the following activities
filed under the Dam Safety and Encroachments
Act (32 P.S. §§ 693.1—693.27), section 302 of the
Flood Plain Management Act (32 P.S. § 679.302)
and The Clean Streams Law and Notice of Final
Action for Certification under section 401 of the
FWPCA.

Northeast Region: Waterways and Wetlands Program
Manager, 2 Public Square, Wilkes-Barre, PA 18701-1915.

Contact: Gillian Ostrum, Clerk Typist 2, 570-830-3077.
E4802220-026. Lehigh Township Municipal Au-

thority, 1069 Municipal Road, Walnutport, PA 18088-
9718, Lehigh Township, Northampton County, U.S.
Army Corps of Engineers, Philadelphia District.

To construct and maintain the following water obstruc-
tions and encroachments associated with the Pennsville
Water Booster Station and Watermain Extension Project:

1. A utility line crossing of Indian Creek (CWF, MF)
and associated floodway consisting of an 18-inch diameter
HPDE water main pipe installed via directional boring.

2. A utility line crossing of 15-LF of PF wetlands (EV)
consisting of an 18-inch diameter HPDE water main pipe
installed via directional boring.

3. A utility line crossing of 50-LF of PF wetlands (EV)
consisting of an 18-inch diameter HPDE water main pipe
installed via directional boring.

4. A utility line crossing of Indian Creek (CWF, MF)
and associated floodway consisting of an 8-inch diameter
PVC sanitary sewer force main having a 16-inch diameter
steel casing and installed via directional boring.

5. A utility line installed within the floodway of the
western bank of Indian Creek (CWF, MF) consisting of a
220-LF, 8-inch diameter PVC sanitary sewer force main
installed via directional boring as well as four (4) concrete
manholes.

The project is located approximately 0.14 mile south of
the intersection of Lehigh Drive and Indian Trail Road
(Cemeton, PA Quadrangle, Latitude: 40° 44� 23.33�; Lon-
gitude: -75° 30� 37.54�) in Lehigh Township, Northampton
County.

Southcentral Region: Waterways and Wetlands Program
Manager, 909 Elmerton Avenue, Harrisburg, PA 17110.

E6703219-004. Fairview Crossroads, LLC, 217 High-
land Terrace Way, Boiling Springs, PA 17007. Fairview
Township, York County, U.S. Army Corps of Engineers
Baltimore District.

To enclose 1,575 linear feet of Unnamed Tributaries
(UNTs) to Yellow Breeches Creek (CWF) and place and
maintain fill in ten (10) separate Palustrine Emergent
(PEM) and Palustrine Scrub Shrub (PSS) wetlands in the
watershed of Yellow Breeches Creek (CWF) totaling 1.15
acres for the purpose of constructing a mixed use com-
mercial building site (Latitude: 40° 12� 22.19�; Longitude:
-76° 52� 36.36�). The project is located in the southwest
quadrant of the intersection of I-83 and the PA Turnpike
in Fairview Township, York County. The permittee will
purchase 1,575 linear feet of watercourse and 1.15 acres
of wetland credits for compensatory mitigation from the
First Pennsylvania Resource, LLC Codorus Creek Mitiga-
tion Bank (PADEP Permit # MB990367-001). Permit
issued June 28, 2021.

Northcentral Region: Waterways & Wetlands Program
Manager, 208 West Third Street, Williamsport, PA 17701,
570-327-3636.

E4904221-001. Pennsylvania American Water Com-
pany, 852 Wesley Drive, Mechanicsburg, PA 17055. Mil-
ton Water Treatment Plant, in Milton Borough, North-
umberland County, ACOE Baltimore District (Milton,
PA Quadrangle; Latitude: 41° 0� 33.3�; Latitude -76° 51�
46.7�).

To construct, operate and maintain a clearwell tank
measuring 103 ft by 52.7 ft and associated fill around the
tank will contain a total of 10,485 cf of permanent
floodway fill, an infiltration basin measuring a volume of
16,702 cf of permanent floodway cut, and irregular slope
grading resulting in a temporary disturbance of 22,281 sf
within the Floodway of the west Branch of the
Susquehanna River, WWF. This permit also authorizes
the installation of a 40 ft by 38 ft High Service Pump
Station and associated fill around the pump station
containing 3,910 cf of permanent floodplain fill, and
irregular slope grading resulting in a temporary distur-
bance of 17,155 sf within the floodplain of the West
Branch of the Susquehanna River (WWF). This project is
located 0.6 mile south on SR 405 from the intersection of
SR 405 and SR 642 Milton Borough, Northumberland
County.

E3803221-001. Fort Indiantown Gap National
Guard Training Center, Fort Indiantown Gap, Bldg
0-1, Fisher Avenue, Annville, PA 17003 Fort Indiantown
Gap—Perimeter Security Fence, in East Hanover Town-
ship and Union Township, Lebanon County, ACOE
Baltimore District (Indiantown Gap, PA Quadrangle; Lati-
tude: 40° 25� 48.89�; Latitude: -76° 32� 53.39�). Fort
Indiantown Gap National Guard Training Center, Fort
Indiantown Gap Post (FIG) is providing the enclosed
Joint Permit Application for a Pennsylvania Water Ob-
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struction and Encroachment Permit for the Perimeter
Security Fence Project (Project). The Project is in East
Hanover and Union Townships, Lebanon County, Pennsyl-
vania. The Project proposes to construct a perimeter
security fence around the west, south, and eastern perim-
eter of Fort Indiantown Gap Training Facility. The fence
will not be installed in one continuous fence, but rather
sections of fencing that ultimately connects to existing
fence and encloses the facilities. The fence will limit
public accessibility and improve the safety of the facility.
The proposed fence will be a 12-foot tall chain-link fence.
A barbed wire apron on extension arms will be placed on
top of the fence. The fence posts will be supported by
concrete bases spaced at 10-foot intervals. Approximately
4.1 miles of fence will be installed as a part of this
Project. The project area is not continuous and is com-
prised of multiple fence segments. For the most part, the
fence is located adjacent to roadways or existing infra-
structure and connects with existing sections of fence.
The proposed design is the same as the existing fence.

E4904221-003. Turbot Township, 1190 Broadway
Road, Milton, PA 17847. Stamm Road and Muddy Run
Road improvements, in Turbot Township, Northumber-
land County, ACOE Baltimore District (Milton, PA
Quadrangle; Latitude: 41° 2� 7�; Latitude: -76° 48� 57�).

To construct, operate and maintenance cart path resur-
facing and shoulder widening of 2.6 miles of roadway
(Stamm Road & Muddy Run Road) within Turbot Town-
ship. A total of twenty-five (25) floodway and or floodplain
impacts are proposed along the 2.6 miles of roadway.
These impacts include temporary and permanent distur-
bances to two (2) unnamed tributaries to Limestone Run;
Warm Water Fisheries (Watercourses 1 and 2), to Muddy
Run; Warm Water Fishery (Watercourse 3) and an un-

named tributary to Muddy Run; Warm Water Fishery
(Watercourse 4). The southern portion of the roadway
improvements project is located within the watershed of
an unnamed tributary to Limestone Run (Watercourses 1
and 2). The northern portion of the project is located
within the watershed of Muddy Run (Watercourses 3, 4).
Twelve (12) wetland areas (Wetlands 1—12) were ob-
served within or along the study area for the proposed
roadway improvements project, but no temporary or
permanent wetland impacts are proposed as part of this
project. Most of the work will occur within the cart path
and along the shoulders of the existing roadways. This
project is located 0.2 mile east on Broadway Street from
the Township Office.

Southwest Region: Oil and Gas Management Program
Manager 400 Waterfront Drive, Pittsburgh PA 15222.

E:10-07-001. ETC Northeast Pipeline, LLC, 6051
Wallace Road Extension, Third Floor, Suite 300, Wexford,
PA 15090, Jackson Township, Butler County, ACOE
Pittsburgh District. ETC Northeast Pipeline, LLC (‘‘ETC’’)
proposes the installation of a permanent access road for
the Mainline Valve Site # 1 (‘‘MLV # 1’’) located in
Jackson Township, Butler County. The permanent access
road was installed without prior authorization from the
Pennsylvania Department of Environmental Protection.
The permanent access road was installed across three
streams and one wetland. The culvert pipes for the access
road were inadequately sized. As part of this project, ETC
plans to reconstruct the stream crossings with appropri-
ately sized culverts. The purpose of the MLV # 1 project is
to provide safe and reliable access to the valve site for
operational and maintenance activities. The MLV # 1 is
along the Revolution Pipeline.

Resource
Identifier

Resource
Type

Permanent
Direct
Impacts
(acres)

Temporary
Direct
Impacts
(acres)

Permanent
Indirect
Impacts
(acres)

Temporary
Indirect
Impact
(acres)

Stream 10-16 Riverine 0.020 0.030 - -
Stream 10-15 Riverine 0.037 0.093 - -
Wetland 9-DP Wetland 0.018 - - -
Stream 9-90 Riverine 0.014 0.013 - -
Total 0.089 0.136 0.000 0.000
Grand Total 0.225

The project is located within the Zelienople USGS 7 1/2
Minute Quadrangle Map.

Northwest Region: Waterways & Wetlands Program, 230
Chestnut Street, Meadville, PA 16335-3481.

E2406221-001. Penelec, A FirstEnergy Company, 341
White Pond Drive, Akron, OH 44320. Forest Substation
Expansion, in Ridgway Township, Elk County, ACOE
Pittsburgh District (Ridgway, PA Quadrangle Lat:
41.450026°, Long: -78.741565�).

Fill 0.023 acre of PEM wetlands, temporarily impact
0.420 acre of PEM wetlands, and temporarily impact 19
linear feet of UNT Mason Creek for the expansion of an
existing substation pad area and associated electric lines
and structures at the Forest Substation along the north
side of Jakes Hollow Road approximately 0.3 mile east of
S.R. 948 (Ridgway, PA Quadrangle Lat: 41.450026°, Long:
-78.741565�) in Ridgway Township, Elk County.

ENVIRONMENTAL ASSESSMENTS

Northwest Region: Waterways & Wetlands Program, 230
Chestnut Street, Meadville, PA 16335-3481.

EA2006221-001. Crawford County, 903 Diamond
Park, Meadville, PA 16335. South Perry Street Bridge
Removal, in Titusville City, Crawford County, ACOE
Pittsburgh District (Titusville South, PA Quadrangle N:
41°, 37�, 21.88�; W: -79°, 40�, 36.99�).

Removing the existing single span thru truss bridge
that spans Oil Creek in Titusville City, Crawford County.
The project will temporarily impact 231 linear feet of Oil
Creek (CWF, TSF). No wetland impacts are proposed.

EROSION AND SEDIMENT CONTROL

The following Erosion and Sediment Control permits
have been issued.
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Persons aggrieved by an action may appeal that action
to the Environmental Hearing Board (Board) under sec-
tion 4 of the Environmental Hearing Board Act and
2 Pa.C.S. §§ 501—508 and 701—704. The appeal should
be sent to the Environmental Hearing Board, Second
Floor, Rachel Carson State Office Building, 400 Market
Street, P.O. Box 8457, Harrisburg, PA 17105-8457, (717)
787-3483. TDD users may contact the Board through the
Pennsylvania Hamilton Relay Service, (800) 654-5984.
Appeals must be filed with the Board within 30-days of
publication of this notice in the Pennsylvania Bulletin
unless the appropriate statute provides a different time
period. Copies of the appeal form and the Board’s rules of
practice and procedure may be obtained from the Board.
The appeal form and the Board’s rules of practice and
procedure are also available in Braille or on audiotape
from the Secretary to the Board at (717) 787-3483. This
paragraph does not, in and of itself, create a right of
appeal beyond that permitted by applicable statutes and
decisional law.

For individuals who wish to challenge an action, the
appeal must reach the Board within 30-days. A lawyer is
not needed to file an appeal with the Board.

Important legal rights are at stake, however, so indi-
viduals should show this notice to a lawyer at once.
Persons who cannot afford a lawyer may qualify for free
pro bono representation. Call the Secretary to the Board
at (717) 787-3483 for more information.

Eastern Region: Oil and Gas Management Program
Manager, 208 West Third Street, Suite 101, Williamsport,
PA 17701-6448.

ESCGP-3 # ESG294121009-00
Applicant Name Pennsylvania General
Energy Co., LLC
Contact Person Nathan Harris
Address 120 Market St
City, State, Zip Warren, PA 16365
County Lycoming
Township(s) Plunketts Creek
Receiving Stream(s) and Classification(s) UNT to Little

Mill Creek # 72871 (HQ-TSF-MF), UNT to Little Mill
Creek # 13397 (HQ-TSF-MF), UNT to Little Bear Creek
# 12478 (HQ-CWF-MF), UNT to Little Bear Creek
# 40506 (HQ-CWF-MF)
Secondary: UNT to Little Mill Creek (HQ-TSF-MF),
UNT to Little Mill Creek (HQ-TSF-MF), UNT to Little
Bear Creek (HQ-CWF-MF), UNT to Little Bear Creek
(HQ-CWF-MF)

ESCGP-3 # ESG295821017-00
Applicant Name Cabot Oil & Gas Corp
Contact Person Kenneth Marcum
Address 2000 Park Lane, Suite 300
City, State, Zip Pittsburgh, PA 15275
County Susquehanna
Township(s) Gibson
Receiving Stream(s) and Classification(s) Tunkhannock

Creek (CWF)
Secondary: Bear Swamp Creek (CWF)

ESCGP-3 # ESG295821010-00
Applicant Name Cabot Oil & Gas Corp
Contact Person Kenneth Marcum
Address 2000 Park Lane, Suite 300
City, State, Zip Pittsburgh, PA 15275
County Susquehanna
Township(s) Bridgewater
Receiving Stream(s) and Classification(s) UNT to Meshop-

pen Creek (CWF)
Secondary: Meshoppen Creek (CWF)
Southwest Region: Dana Drake, Waterways and Wet-

lands Program, 400 Waterfront Drive, Pittsburgh, PA
15222-474, Sandy Kalchthaler, 412-442-4000.
ESCGP-2 # ESG0063210001-00
Applicant Name EQM Gathering OPCO, LLC
Contact Person Address 2200 Energy Drive
City, State, Zip Canonsburg, PA 15317
County Washington County
Township(s) Amwell Township; North Bethlehem Town-

ship; Somerset Township; and South Strabane Town-
ships

Receiving Stream(s) and Classification(s) North Branch
Pigeon Creek (WWF); Center Branch Pigeon Creek
(WWF); South Branch Pigeon Creek (WWF); Little
Chartiers Creek (HQ-WWF); Redd Run (TSF); Shipe
Run (TSF); Little Tenmile Creek (TSF)
Northwest Region: Oil and Gas Management Program

Manager, 230 Chestnut Street, Meadville, PA 16335-3481.
ESCGP-3 # ESG081021004-00-PER W76 WELL PAD
Applicant Name Pennenergy Resources, LLC
Contact Person Douglas Mehan
Address 1000 Commerce Dr., Park Place One, Ste 400
City, State, Zip Pittsburgh, PA 15275-1011
County Butler County
Township(s) Buffalo Township
Receiving Stream(s) and Classification(s) Trib 42578 to

Sarver Run (HQ-TSF); UNTs to Sarver Run (HQ-TSF)
Secondary: Sarver Run (HQ-TSF)

STORAGE TANKS
SITE-SPECIFIC INSTALLATION PERMITS

The following Storage Tank Site-Specific Installation Permits, under the authority of the Storage Tank Spill
Prevention Act (35 P.S. §§ 6021.304, 6021.504, 6021.1101 and 6021.1102) and under 25 Pa. Code Chapter 245,
Subchapter C, have been issued by the Bureau of Environmental Cleanup and Brownfields, Director, P.O.
Box 8763, Harrisburg, PA 17105-8763.

SSIP
Permit No.

Applicant Name &
Address County Municipality

Tank
Type

Tank
Capacity

21-28-006 Willard Agri-Service, Inc.
P.O. Box 321
Marion, PA 17235
Attn: Peter Surgeon

Franklin Guilford Township 1 AST storing
hazardous
substance

30,000 gallons
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SSIP
Permit No.

Applicant Name &
Address County Municipality

Tank
Type

Tank
Capacity

21-48-007 United Parcel Service
1620 Van Buren Road
Easton, PA 18045
Attn: Jason Fahrer

Northampton Palmer Township 2 ASTs storing
petroleum
products

40,000 gallons
total

CORRECTIVE ACTION UNDER
ACT 32, 1989

PREAMBLE 2

The following plans and reports were submitted
under the Storage Tank and Spill Prevention Act
(35 P.S. §§ 6021.101—6021.2104).

Provisions of 25 Pa. Code Chapter 245, Subchapter D,
Administration of the Storage Tank and Spill Prevention
Program, require the Department of Environmental Pro-
tection (DEP) to publish in the Pennsylvania Bulletin a
notice of submission of plans and reports. A remedial
action plan is submitted to summarize the site character-
ization, document the design and construction details for
the remedial action, and describe how the remedial action
will attain the selected remediation standard. The reme-
dial action plan also provides results of studies performed
and data collected to support the remedial action and a
description of postremediation care requirements. A reme-
dial action completion report is submitted to document
cleanup of a release of a regulated substance at a site to
the selected remediation standard. A remedial action
completion report provides a description of the site inves-
tigation to characterize the nature and extent of contami-
nants in environmental media, the basis of selecting the
environmental media of concern, documentation support-
ing the selection of residential or nonresidential exposure
factors, a description of the remediation performed and
summaries of sampling methodology and analytical re-
sults which demonstrate that the remediation has at-
tained the cleanup standard selected.

For further information concerning plans or reports,
please contact the Environmental Cleanup Program Man-
ager in the DEP Regional Office under which the notice of
receipt of plans or reports appears. If information con-
cerning plans or reports is required in an alternative
form, contact the Community Relations Coordinator at
the appropriate Regional Office listed. TDD users may
telephone the DEP through the Pennsylvania Hamilton
Relay Service at (800) 654-5984.

The Department has received the following plans and
reports:

Southeast Regional Office: Environmental Cleanup &
Brownfields Program, 2 East Main Street, Norristown, PA
19401, 484-250-5960.

Contact: Richard Staron, Professional Geologist Man-
ager.

2401 Haverford Rd Ardmore, 23-06919, 2401 Haver-
ford Rd., Ardmore, PA 19003, Haverford Township, Dela-
ware County. Synergy Environmental, Inc., 155 Rail
Road Plaza, First Floor, Royersford, PA 19468, on behalf
of Cross America Partners, 645 Hamilton Street, Allen-
town, PA 18101 submitted a Remedial Action Plan con-
cerning remediation of soil and groundwater contami-
nated with unleaded gasoline. The report is intended to
document remediation of the site to meet residential
Statewide health and site-specific standards.

Mobil Car Wash, 23-27099, 3150 Pennell Rd., Media,
PA 19064, Aston Township, Delaware County. Aqua-
terra Technologies, Inc., P.O. Box 744, West Chester, PA
19381, on behalf of American Autowash, Inc., 512 King
Road, Malvern, PA 19355, submitted a Remedial Action
Plan concerning remediation of soil and groundwater
contaminated with unleaded gasoline. The report is in-
tended to document remediation of the site to meet
nonresidential site-specific standards.

HERTZ RENT A CAR, 51-44283, 31 Arrivals Rd.,
Philadelphia PA 19153, City of Philadelphia.
EnviroTrac, Ltd., 6 Terri Lane, Suite # 350, Burlington,
NJ 08016, on behalf of The Hertz Corporation, Gordon L.
Walters Jr., P.E., M.B.A., 8501 Williams Road, Estero, FL
33928, submitted a Remedial Action Plan concerning
remediation of soil and groundwater contaminated with
petroleum products. The report is intended to document
remediation of the site to meet nonresidential Statewide
health and site-specific standards.

Northeast Region: Environmental Cleanup & Brown-
fields Program Manager, 2 Public Square, Wilkes-Barre,
PA 18701-1915, 570-826-2511.

Contact: Eric Supey, Environmental Program Manager.

Convenient Food Mart 3029, Storage Tank ID
# 35-08517, 330 Northern Boulevard, Clarks Summit, PA
18411, South Abington Township, Lackawanna County.
MEA, 1365 Ackermanville Road, Bangor, PA 18013, on
behalf of Convenient Food Marts of Pennsylvania, 215
Clark Avenue, Clarks Summit, PA 18411, has submitted a
revised Remedial Action Plan concerning remediation of
soil and groundwater contaminated with gasoline. The
report is intended to document remediation of the site to
meet Statewide health standards.

8523 Hensingersville Road Property, Storage Tank
ID # 39-97898, 8523 Hensingersville Road, Macungie, PA
18062, Lower Macungie Township, Lehigh County.
Barry Isett & Associates, 85 South Route 100, Allentown,
PA 18106, on behalf of 8523 Hensingersville Road, LLC,
4528 Reservoir Hill Road, Macungie, PA 18062, has
submitted a combined Site Characterization Report and
Remedial Action Completion Report concerning remedia-
tion of soil and groundwater contaminated with petro-
leum. The report is intended to document remediation of
the site to meet Statewide health standards.

Southcentral Regional Office: Environmental Cleanup &
Brownfields Program, 909 Elmerton Avenue, Harrisburg,
PA 17110, 717-705-4705.

Contact: Robin L. Yerger, LPG.

Hoffman’s Service Center, Storage Tank Primary
Facility ID # 67-08276, 60 South Main Street, Dover, PA
17315, Dover Borough, York County. Comstock Environ-
mental Services, P.O. Box 509, Lafayette Hill, PA 19444,
on behalf of Hoffman’s Service Center submitted a Reme-
dial Action Plan concerning remediation of soil and
groundwater contaminated with petroleum constituents.
The report is intended to document remediation of the
site to meet the Statewide health standard.
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Rutters Farm Store 38, Storage Tank Primary Facil-
ity ID # 67-26968, 700 West Market Street, Hallam, PA
17406, Hellam Township, York County. United Environ-
mental Services, Inc., P.O. Box 701, Schuylkill Haven, PA
17972, on behalf of CHR Corporation submitted a Reme-
dial Action Plan concerning remediation of soil and
groundwater contaminated with petroleum constituents.
The report is intended to document remediation of the
site to meet the Statewide health standard.

CORRECTIVE ACTION UNDER
ACT 32, 1989

PREAMBLE 3

The DEP has taken action on the following plans
and reports under the Storage Tank and Spill
Prevention Act (35 P.S. §§ 6021.101—6021.2104).

Provisions of 25 Pa. Code Chapter 245, Subchapter D,
Administration of the Storage Tank and Spill Prevention
Program, require the Department of Environmental Pro-
tection (DEP) to publish in the Pennsylvania Bulletin a
notice of its final actions on plans and reports.

A remedial action plan is submitted to summarize the
site characterization, document the design and construc-
tion details for the remedial action, and describe how the
remedial action will attain the selected remediation stan-
dard. The remedial action plan also provides results of
studies performed and data collected to support the
remedial action and a description of postremediation care
requirements. A remedial action completion report is
submitted to document cleanup of a release of a regulated
substance at a site to the selected remediation standard.
A remedial action completion report provides a descrip-
tion of the site investigation to characterize the nature
and extent of contaminants in environmental media, the
basis of selecting the environmental media of concern,
documentation supporting the selection of residential or
nonresidential exposure factors, a description of the
remediation performed and summaries of sampling meth-
odology and analytical results which demonstrate that the
remediation has attained the cleanup standard selected.

The DEP may approve or disapprove plans and reports
submitted. This notice provides the DEP’s decision and, if
relevant, the basis for disapproval.

For further information concerning the plans and re-
ports, please contact the Environmental Cleanup Program
Manager in the DEP Regional Office under which the
notice of the plan or report appears. If information
concerning a report is required in an alternative form,
contact the Community Relations Coordinator at the
appropriate Regional Office listed. TDD users may tele-
phone the DEP through the Pennsylvania Hamilton Relay
Service at (800) 654-5984.

The DEP has received the following plans and reports:

Southeast Regional Office: Environmental Cleanup &
Brownfields Program, 2 East Main Street, Norristown, PA
19401, 484-250-5960.

Contact: Richard Staron, Professional Geologist Man-
ager.

Lukoil 69238, 681 E. Broad St., Souderton, PA 18964,
Souderton Borough, Montgomery County. EnviroTrac
Ltd., 602 S. Bethlehem Pike, Suite A-2&3, Ambler, PA
19002, on behalf of Lukoil North America, LLC, 302
Harper Drive, Suite 303, Moorestown, NJ 08057, submit-
ted a Remedial Action Completion Report concerning
remediation of soil and groundwater contaminated with

unleaded gasoline and used motor oil. The report demon-
strated attainment of nonresidential Statewide health
and site-specific standards and was approved by DEP on
July 1, 2021.

Glenolden EXXON PA0197, 23-45011, 330 N. Chester
Pike, Glenolden, PA 19036, Glenolden Borough, Dela-
ware County. Synergy Environmental, Inc., 155 Rail-
road Plaza, First Floor, Royersford, PA 19468, on behalf of
Cross America Partners, LP, 600 W. Hamilton St, Suite
500, Allentown, PA 18101, submitted a Remedial Action
Completion Report concerning remediation of soil and
groundwater contaminated with unleaded gasoline. The
report demonstrated attainment of residential Statewide
health and site-specific standards and was approved by
DEP on July 6, 2021.

EZ Gas Sta, 51-43054, 1701 Cottman Ave., Philadel-
phia, PA 19111-3802, City of Philadelphia. Keith Valley
Environmental, Inc., P.O. Box 5376, Deptford, NJ 08096,
on behalf of the Guru Krupa, Inc., 1701 Cottman Ave.,
Philadelphia, PA 19111-3802, submitted a Site Remedial
Action Completion Report concerning remediation of soil
and groundwater contaminated with unleaded gasoline.
The report demonstrated attainment of nonresidential
Statewide health and site-specific standards and was
approved by DEP on June 23, 2021.

Northeast Region: Environmental Cleanup & Brown-
fields Program Manager, 2 Public Square, Wilkes-Barre,
PA 18701-1915, 570-826-2511.

Contact: Eric Supey, Environmental Program Manager.

Weis Gas N Go 202 (former Luk Oil), Storage Tank
ID # 39-42588, 1340 North Cedar Crest Boulevard,
Allentown, PA 18104, South Whitehall Township, Lehigh
County. Synergy Environmental, 155 Railroad Plaza,
First Floor, Royersford, PA 19468, on behalf of Cross
America Partners, 600 Hamilton Street, Suite 500, Allen-
town, PA 18101, submitted a Remedial Action Completion
Report concerning remediation of soil and groundwater
contaminated with petroleum. The Remedial Action
Completion Report demonstrated attainment of Statewide
health standards and was approved by DEP on July 6,
2021.

Southcentral Regional Office: Environmental Cleanup &
Brownfields Program, 909 Elmerton Avenue, Harrisburg,
PA 17110, 717-705-4705.

Contact: Michael Stefanic, P.G., Project Officer.

Reeds Service Center, Storage Tank Facility ID
# 22-28292, 700 Market Street, Millersburg, PA 17061,
Millersburg Borough, Dauphin County. Reliance Envi-
ronmental, Inc., 235 North Duke Street, Lancaster, PA
17602, on behalf of Mr. Ronald Martz, submitted a
Remedial Action Completion Report concerning remedia-
tion of soil and groundwater contaminated with petro-
leum. The Remedial Action Completion Report demon-
strated attainment of the Statewide Health and site-
specific standards and was approved by DEP on July 1,
2021.

Gettysburg Liberty, Storage Tank Facility ID
# 01-06949, 243 Steinwehr Avenue, Gettysburg, PA 17325-
2815, Gettysburg Borough, Adams County. Synergy
Environmental, Inc., 155 Railroad Plaza, 1st Floor,
Royersford, PA 19468, on behalf of KZ Station Corpora-
tion, 14708 Albert Staub Court, Thurmont, MD 21788,
submitted a Remedial Action Completion Report concern-
ing remediation of groundwater contaminated with petro-
leum constituents. The Remedial Action Completion Re-
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port did not demonstrate attainment of the Statewide
health and site-specific standard and was disapproved by
DEP on July 1, 2021.

Rutters Farm Store 38, Storage Tank Primary Facil-
ity ID # 67-26968, 700 West Market Street, Hellam, PA
17406, Hellam Township, York County. United Environ-
mental Services, Inc., P.O. Box 701, Schuylkill Haven, PA
17972, on behalf of CHR Corporation submitted a Reme-
dial Action Plan concerning remediation of soil and
groundwater contaminated with petroleum constituents.
The Remedial Action Plan was unacceptable to meet the
Statewide health standard and was disapproved by the
DEP on July 6, 2021.

Hoffman’s Service Center, Storage Tank Primary
Facility ID # 67-08276, 60 South Main Street, Dover, PA
17315, Dover Borough, York County. Comstock Environ-
mental Services, P.O. Box 509, Lafayette Hill, PA 19444,
on behalf of Hoffman’s Service Center submitted a Reme-
dial Action Plan concerning remediation of soil and
groundwater contaminated with petroleum constituents.
The Remedial Action Plan was acceptable to meet the
Statewide health standard and was approved by the DEP
on July 7, 2021.

SPECIAL NOTICES
OIL AND GAS MANAGEMENT

Northwest District Oil and Gas Operations: Brian Babb,
230 Chestnut Street, Meadville, PA 16335-3481.

Notice of Projects under the Environmental Good
Samaritan Act

The Environmental Good Samaritan Act (27 Pa.C.S.A.
§§ 8001—8114) provides certain protections and immuni-
ties from civil liability for landowners and persons who
voluntarily undertake reclamation and abatement proj-
ects to address land and water adversely affected by
mining or oil or gas extraction or exploration for natural
resources and left in an unreclaimed condition or left
discharging water pollution. In order for landowners and
persons to qualify for immunity, the projects must be
approved by the Department.

The following project proposals have been received by
the Department of Environmental Protection. A copy of
the proposals is available for inspection at the DEP
Northwest (Meadville) Regional Office at 230 Chestnut
Street, Meadville, PA 16335 between the hours of 9 a.m.
and 4 p.m. Written comments or objections may be
submitted by any person or any office or head of any
Federal, State, or local government agency or authority to
the Department at the same address within 30 days of
this publication.

Written comments or objections should contain the
name, address and telephone number of the person
submitting comments or objections; the proposal identifi-
cation number; and a statement of sufficient detail to
inform the Department of the basis of the comment or
objection and the relevant facts upon which it is based.

PROJECT PROPOSALS RECEIVED
EGSOG16-0001. Charles Wagner 01 Abandoned

Well Plugging. Z Train Corp, P.O. Box 571, 119 Bauer
Road, Clarion, PA 16214. Z Train Corp is planning to plug
an abandoned oil and gas well (API No. 031-01789)
located in Paint Township, Clarion County. The well is
in close proximity of several potentially sensitive environ-
mental receptors. It is located approximately 25 feet from
cold water fishes unnamed tributary within the Toby
Creek watershed. Additionally, the well is situated among

settling ponds associated with surface mining. Due to the
presence of this pooled surface water, there is concern
that the well could experience accelerated corrosion as a
result of exposure to continuous, near-surface moisture.
The well plugging project will affect an area of less than 1
acre. Complete project proposal received June 7, 2020.

EGSOG16-0002. Zion Baptist Church Lot 01 Aban-
doned Well Plugging. Z Train Corp, P.O. Box 571, 119
Bauer Road, Clarion, PA 16214. Z Train Corp is planning
to plug an abandoned oil and gas well (API No.
031-01786) located in Monroe Township, Clarion
County. An unsafe scenario resulted after the church
proceeded with its expansion due to the well emitting gas
below roof height, the unknown subsurface condition of
the well, and its proximity to the church’s water source.
The well plugging project will affect an area of less than 1
acre. Complete project proposal received June 7, 2020.

EGSOG16-0003. W Scott and John W Port 01
Abandoned Well Plugging. Z Train Corp, P.O. Box
571, 119 Bauer Road, Clarion, PA 16214. Z Train Corp is
planning to plug an abandoned oil and gas well (API No.
031-01891) located in Clarion Township, Clarion
County. Most of the original production equipment re-
mains attached to the well and each equipment connec-
tion represents a potential leak. The structural integrity
of the well and equipment is in fair condition and there
was no sign of surface pollution noted at the time of
inspection. However, this does not suggest that the well is
mechanically sound below the surface. Due to the pres-
ence of gas measure by the PADEP, there is an elevated
possibility of potential surface leaks and subsurface gas
migration. The well plugging project will affect an area of
less than 1 acre. Complete project proposal received June
7, 2020.

EGSOG16-0004. Joh F Kuhn 01 Abandoned Well
Plugging. Z Train Corp, P.O. Box 571, 119 Bauer Road,
Clarion, PA 16214. Z Train Corp is planning to plug an
abandoned oil and gas well (API No. 031-01526) located
in Clarion Borough, Clarion County. Due to the pres-
ence of gas, there is an elevated possibility of dangerous
surface leaks and subsurface gas migration. The well
plugging project will affect an area of less than 1 acre.
Complete project proposal received June 7, 2020.

EGSOG16-0005. Clarion University Foundation 01
Abandoned Well Plugging. Z Train Corp, P.O. Box
571, 119 Bauer Road, Clarion, PA 16214. Z Train Corp is
planning to plug an abandoned oil and gas well (API No.
031-01954) located in Clarion Township, Clarion
County. Due to the lack of evidence suggesting that
measures were taken to plug the well upon the conclusion
of drilling and production it is imperative that action is
taken to properly plug the well. There does not appear to
be any indication of past surface pollution associated with
the well, but it is unknown if any pollution is occurring at
the subsurface. The well plugging project will affect an
area of less than 1 acre. Complete project proposal
received June 7, 2020.

[Pa.B. Doc. No. 21-1127. Filed for public inspection July 16, 2021, 9:00 a.m.]

DEPARTMENT OF
ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION

Availability of Technical Guidance

Technical guidance documents (TGD) are available on
the Department of Environmental Protection’s (Depart-
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ment) web site at www.depgreenport.state.pa.us/elibrary/.
The ‘‘Technical Guidance Final Documents’’ heading is the
link to a menu of the various Department bureaus where
each bureau’s final TGDs are posted. The ‘‘Technical
Guidance Draft Documents’’ heading is the link to the
Department’s draft TGDs.
Ordering Paper Copies of Department Technical Guidance

The Department encourages the use of the Internet to
view and download TGDs. When this option is not
available, persons can order a paper copy of any of the
Department’s draft or final TGDs by contacting the
Department at (717) 783-8727.

In addition, bound copies of some of the Department’s
documents are available as Department publications.
Check with the appropriate bureau for more information
about the availability of a particular document as a
publication.

Changes to TGDs

Following is the current list of recent changes. Persons
who have questions or comments about a particular
document should contact the person whose name and
phone number are listed with each document.

Final TGD: Minor Revision

DEP ID: 563-2112-656. Title: Liners—Impoundments,
Stockpiles, and Coal Refuse Disposal Areas. Descrip-
tion: This minor revision will change the name of this
policy from Liners—Impoundments, Stockpiles, and Coal
Refuse Disposal Areas, to Liners and Caps for Coal
Refuse Disposal Areas.

This guidance document is used in the design of
groundwater and surface water protection systems for
coal refuse disposal areas and coal processing areas to
prevent groundwater contamination. The TGD applies to
impoundments and storage areas at coal refuse disposal
or coal processing sites, or both, used for the storage or
treatment of mine drainage, runoff contaminated by
metals or sulfate, leachate from coal refuse disposal areas
and water from coal processing operations.

Coal refuse disposal areas are regulated under
25 Pa. Code Chapters 88 and 90 (relating to anthracite
coal; and coal refuse disposal), which is currently under-
going a proposed rulemaking in response to statutory
changes. Concurrently, the Department will revise this
TGD to incorporate caps used at coal refuse disposal sites
in the future. A title change is part of that revision.
Because the title of this document appears in the existing
25 Pa. Code Chapter 90, the Department is changing the
title in this minor revision to allow the corrected title to
be applied within the 25 Pa. Code Chapter 90 proposed
rulemaking.

Written Comments: This revision reflects a minor ad-
ministrative change with no substantive changes. Be-
cause this is a minor revision, no public comment period
is warranted.

Contact: Questions regarding this TGD can be directed
to Sharon Hill at shill@pa.gov or (717) 787-6842.

Effective Date: July 17, 2021

Draft TGD: New Guidance

DEP ID: 563-2112-613. Title: Implementation of Remin-
ing Regulations. Description: This guidance reflects the
current Subchapter F/G regulations that were published
October 22, 2016. The purpose of this guidance is to
identify and explain conditions that must be met to
qualify for and obtain a Subchapter F/G permit authoriza-

tion (remining of areas of pre-existing pollutional dis-
charges) and the obligations of a mine operator under
that permit. This guidance will also address procedures to
be followed to modify these permit types and the stan-
dards to be met to qualify for bond release.

Written Comments: Interested persons may submit
written comments on this draft TGD through Monday,
August 16, 2021. Comments submitted by facsimile will
not be accepted. All comments, including comments sub-
mitted by e-mail must include the commentator’s name
and address. Commentators must submit comments using
the Department’s online eComment tool at www.ahs.
dep.pa.gov/eComment or ecomment@pa.gov. Written com-
ments can be mailed to the Technical Guidance Coordina-
tor, Department of Environmental Protection, Policy
Office, Rachel Carson State Office Building, P.O. Box
2063, Harrisburg, PA 17105-2063.

Contact: Questions regarding this TGD can be directed
to Sharon Hill at shill@pa.gov or (717) 787-6842.

Effective Date: Upon publication of notice as final in
the Pennsylvania Bulletin.

PATRICK McDONNELL,
Secretary

[Pa.B. Doc. No. 21-1128. Filed for public inspection July 16, 2021, 9:00 a.m.]

DEPARTMENT OF
ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION

Renaming of the Small Water Systems Technical
Assistance Center Advisory Board to the Public
Water System Technical Assistance Center
Board; Meeting Information

At the January 28, 2021, meeting of the Small Water
Systems Technical Assistance Center Advisory Board
(Board), the Board voted to amend the bylaws to rename
the Board to the Public Water System Technical Assist-
ance Center Board.

The Public Water System Technical Assistance Center
Board will meet at 9 a.m. on Thursday, July 29, 2021, as
previously noticed for the Board. With the lifting of
pandemic restrictions and the reopening of many State
office buildings, the meeting may still occur virtually, or
the meeting may occur in-person with a virtual participa-
tion option. Individuals interested in providing public
comments during the meeting must sign up prior to the
start of the meeting by contacting Dawn Hissner at
dhissner@pa.gov or (717) 772-2189.

Information on how to join the meeting, as well as
agenda and meeting materials, will be available on the
Board’s webpage, found through the Public Participation
tab on the Department of Environmental Protection’s
(Department) web site at www.dep.pa.gov (select ‘‘Public
Participation,’’ then ‘‘Advisory Committees,’’ then ‘‘Water,’’
then ‘‘Public Water System Technical Assistance Center
(TAC) Advisory Board’’).

Individuals are encouraged to visit the Board’s webpage
to confirm meeting date, time and location prior to each
meeting. Questions concerning the July 29, 2021, meeting
can be directed to Dawn Hissner at dhissner@pa.gov or
(717) 772-2189.
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Persons in need of accommodations as provided for in
the Americans with Disabilities Act of 1990 should con-
tact the Department at (717) 772-2189 or through the
Pennsylvania Hamilton Relay Service at (800) 654-5984
(TDD users) or (800) 654-5988 (voice users) to discuss
how the Department may accommodate their needs.

PATRICK McDONNELL,
Secretary

[Pa.B. Doc. No. 21-1129. Filed for public inspection July 16, 2021, 9:00 a.m.]

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH
Organ Donation Advisory Committee Virtual Public

Meeting

The Organ Donation Advisory Committee established
under 20 Pa.C.S. § 8622 (relating to The Governor Robert
P. Casey Memorial Organ and Tissue Donation Awareness
Trust Fund), will hold a virtual public meeting on
Thursday, August 5, 2021, from 10 a.m. to 1:30 p.m. The
purpose of the virtual public meeting is to review prog-
ress in the area of organ and tissue donation in this
Commonwealth, recommend education and awareness ac-
tivities, recommend priorities in expenditures from the

Organ and Tissue Donation Awareness Fund (Fund) and
advise the Secretary of Health on matters relating to the
administration of the Fund. The virtual public meet-
ing will be conducted using Microsoft Teams. The call-in
number is (267) 332-8737 and the conference ID is
737 204 133#. Contact the Organ Donation Program at
(717) 787-5876 or ra-dhorgandonation@pa.gov with ques-
tions regarding connecting to the virtual public meeting.

For additional information or for persons with a disabil-
ity who wish to attend the virtual public meeting and
require an auxiliary aid, service or other accommodation
to do so contact Amy Flaherty, Director, Division of
Nutrition and Physical Activity, Bureau of Health Promo-
tion and Risk Reduction, Room 1000, Health and Welfare
Building, Harrisburg, PA, (717) 787-5876, or for speech
and/or hearing impaired persons, call the Pennsylvania
Hamilton Relay Service at (800) 654-5984 (TDD users) or
(800) 654-5988 (voice users).

This virtual public meeting is subject to cancellation
without notice.

ALISON BEAM,
Acting Secretary

[Pa.B. Doc. No. 21-1130. Filed for public inspection July 16, 2021, 9:00 a.m.]

DEPARTMENT OF HUMAN SERVICES
Medical Assistance Program Fee Schedule Revisions

The Department of Human Services (Department) announces revisions to the Medical Assistance (MA) Program Fee
Schedule. These changes were effective for dates of services on and after December 21, 2020.

The Department made updates to the MA Program Fee Schedule based upon payment indicators specified by the
Centers for Medicare & Medicaid Services, in response to requests received from providers, and based on clinical reviews
conducted by Department staff related to standards of practice, prior authorization, provider type (PT)/ specialty (Spec)
combinations, places of service (POS) and procedure code/modifier combinations.

Procedure Codes Being Added or End-dated

The Department added the following procedure code and modifier combinations to the MA Program Fee Schedule based
upon provider requests and/or clinical review. These procedure codes may include the modifiers SG (ASC/SPU facility
support component), RT (right), LT (left), 50 (bilateral), 80 (assistant surgeon) and/or GT (telemedicine).

Procedure Codes and Modifiers
29893 (SG) 29893 (RT) 29893 (LT) 29893 (50) 60650 (RT)
60650 (LT) 60650 (50) 60650 (RT) (80) 60650 (LT) (80) 60650 (50) (80)
81221 81222 81223 90662 96136
96136 (GT) 96137 96137 (GT)

The Department end-dated the following vaccine procedure codes as they are obsolete, or the vaccine is no longer
available.

Procedure Codes
90634 90649 90650 90654 90655
90657 90658 90660 90661 90673
90676 90682 90690 90733 90748

Fiscal Impact

These changes are estimated to result in no fiscal impact for the MA Fee-for-Service Program.

Public Comment

Interested persons are invited to submit written comments regarding this notice to the Department of Human Services,
Office of Medical Assistance Programs, c/o Deputy Secretary’s Office, Attention: Regulations Coordinator, Room 515,
Health and Welfare Building, Harrisburg, PA 17120. Comments received will be reviewed and considered for any
subsequent revisions to the MA Program Fee Schedule.
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Persons with a disability who require an auxiliary aid or service may submit comments using the Pennsylvania
Hamilton Relay Service (800) 654-5984 (TDD users) or (800) 654-5988 (voice users).

MEG SNEAD,
Acting Secretary

Fiscal Note: 14-NOT-1453. No fiscal impact; (8) recommends adoption.
[Pa.B. Doc. No. 21-1131. Filed for public inspection July 16, 2021, 9:00 a.m.]

DEPARTMENT OF HUMAN SERVICES
Medical Assistance Program Fee Schedule Updates

The Department of Human Services (Department) announces changes to the Medical Assistance (MA) Program Fee
Schedule.

Fee Schedule Revisions

On March 13, 2020, the novel coronavirus (COVID-19) was declared a Nationwide emergency under the Robert T.
Stafford Disaster Relief and Emergency Assistance Act (42 U.S.C.A. §§ 5121—5207) retroactive to March 1, 2020. Due to
the COVID-19 pandemic, providers are dispensing a higher than normal amount of personal protective equipment. The
Department is increasing the fee for disposable gloves.

Effective with dates of services on and after July 1, 2021, the Department increased the fee for disposable gloves
provided to MA beneficiaries as follows:

Procedure Code Procedure Description Current MA Fee Revised MA Fee
A4927 Disposable gloves, non-sterile, per 100 $8.00 $14.00

The MA Program Outpatient Fee Schedule has been updated to reflect this fee revision effective with dates of service
on and after July 1, 2021. The Department will reprocess provider claims submitted for dates of service on and after July
1, 2021, to pay the revised MA fees. The Department will issue an MA Bulletin to providers notifying them of these fee
revisions and the reprocessing of claims.

Fiscal Impact

These changes are expected to result in annualized increased costs of $0.582 million in total funds.

Public Comment

Interested persons are invited to submit written comments regarding this notice to the Department of Human Services,
Office of Medical Assistance Programs, c/o Regulations Coordinator, Room 515, Health and Welfare Building, Harrisburg,
PA 17120. Comments received within 30 days will be reviewed and considered for any subsequent revisions of the MA
Program Fee Schedule.

Persons with a disability who require auxiliary aid or service may submit comments using the Pennsylvania Hamilton
Relay Service at (800) 654-5984 (TDD users) or (800) 654-5988 (voice users).

MEG SNEAD,
Acting Secretary

Fiscal Note: 14-NOT-1455. (1) General Fund; (2) Implementing Year 2020-2021 is $0; (3) 1st Succeeding Year 2021-22
through 5th Succeeding Year 2025-26 are $256,000; (4) 2019-20 Program—$344,107,000; 2018-19 Program—$342,544,000;
2017-18 Program—$477,690,000; (7) MA—Fee-for-Service; (8) recommends adoption. Funds have been included in the
budget to cover this increase.

[Pa.B. Doc. No. 21-1132. Filed for public inspection July 16, 2021, 9:00 a.m.]

DEPARTMENT OF
HUMAN SERVICES

Nursing Facility Assessment Program for Fiscal
Year 2021-2022

This notice announces the proposed assessment
amount, the proposed assessment methodology and the
estimated aggregate impact on nursing facilities that will
be subject to the assessment under the Nursing Facility
Assessment Program (Assessment Program) beginning in
Fiscal Year (FY) 2021-2022.

Background

Article VIII-A of the Human Services Code (code)
(62 P.S. §§ 801-A—815-A) authorizes the Department of
Human Services (Department) to impose an annual mon-
etary assessment on nonpublic and county nursing facil-
ities in this Commonwealth each fiscal year until June
30, 2022. See 62 P.S. §§ 803-A and 815-A.

Under Article VIII-A of the code, the Department may
impose the assessment only to the extent that the
assessment revenues qualify as the State share of Med-
ical Assistance (MA) Program expenditures eligible for
Federal financial participation (FFP). To ensure receipt of
FFP, Article VIII-A of the code requires the Department
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to seek a waiver from the Centers for Medicare &
Medicaid Services (CMS), if necessary, to implement the
Assessment Program. See 62 P.S. § 812-A. For FY 2021-
2022, the Department will submit a waiver request to
CMS to implement changes to the Assessment Program
as described in this notice. The implementation of these
changes is contingent on CMS’s approval of the waiver
request.

For each fiscal year that the Assessment Program is
implemented, the Secretary of the Department (Secre-
tary) determines the aggregate amount of the assessment
and the annual assessment rates in consultation with the
Secretary of the Budget. See 62 P.S. § 804-A. The annual
assessment rates must be sufficient to generate at least
$50 million in additional revenue, but not more than the
maximum aggregate assessment amount that qualifies for
FFP. See 62 P.S. § 804-A.

Before imposing an annual assessment for a fiscal year,
the Secretary must publish a notice in the Pennsylvania
Bulletin. The notice must specify the amount of the
assessment being proposed, explain the proposed assess-
ment methodology, identify the estimated assessment
amount and aggregate impact on nursing facilities subject
to the assessment and provide interested persons a
30-day period to comment. See 62 P.S. § 805-A.

This notice announces the assessment amounts, rates
and methodology that the Department is proposing to
implement in FY 2021-2022 and the estimated aggregate
impact on nursing facilities that will be subject to the
assessment in FY 2021-2022.
Proposed Assessment Methodology and Rates

During FY 2021-2022, the Department is proposing to
modify the assessment methodology by now including in
the lower rate tier nursing facilities with at least 115,000
MA days and with an overall occupancy rate of 90% or
higher based on FY 2019-2020 resident days data. No
other changes to the current assessment methodology
have been made. For FY 2021-2022 the Department is
also proposing a uniform $0.95 increase to the FY
2020-2021 assessment rates for both tiers. The Depart-
ment is proposing to calculate the annual assessment
amount for each nonexempt nursing facility by multiply-
ing its assessment rate by the facility’s historical non-
Medicare resident days for FY 2019-2020. The Depart-
ment intends to continue its policy of annually updating
the basis of the assessment to the most current year for
which complete data is available. The Department will
continue to collect the annual assessment amount in four
equal quarterly installments. With these modifications,
the Assessment Program will be implemented as follows:

For FY 2021-2022, the assessment will be imposed on
all licensed nursing facilities in this Commonwealth
except the following nursing facilities, which will be
exempt from the Assessment Program:

(1) State-owned and operated nursing facilities.
(2) Veteran’s Administration nursing facilities.
(3) Nursing facilities that provide nursing facility ser-

vices free of charge to all residents.
(4) Newly licensed nursing facilities that have not been

licensed and operated by the current or previous owner
until the nursing facility’s days are included in the data
used as the basis of the assessment. A nursing facility
that changes ownership is not considered a newly li-
censed nursing facility for assessment purposes.

For FY 2021-2022, the Department is proposing to
continue to assess nonexempt nursing facilities at two

rates. The Department is proposing to assess a rate of
$5.56 to the following five categories of nursing facilities:

• County nursing facilities.

• Nursing facilities that have 44 or fewer licensed beds.

• Certain continuing care retirement community
(CCRC) nursing facilities (see 40 Pa.B. 7297 (December
18, 2010)).

• Nursing facilities with an MA occupancy rate of at
least 94% based on FY 2019-2020 resident days as of
March 17, 2021. For the purpose of qualifying for the
lower assessment rate, a nursing facility’s MA occupancy
rate will be calculated as follows: MA Occupancy Rate
= Sum of Total PA MA Days from the FY 2019-2020
resident days data � Sum of Total Resident Days from
the FY 2019-2020 resident days data, rounded to two
decimals.

• Nursing facilities with at least 115,000 MA days and
with an overall occupancy rate of 90% or higher based on
the FY 2019-2020 resident days as of March 17, 2021. For
the purpose of qualifying for the lower assessment rate, a
nursing facility’s overall occupancy rate will be calculated
as follows: Overall Occupancy Rate = Sum of Total
Resident Days from FY 2019-2020 resident days as of
March 17, 2021 � (number of licensed beds as of March
23, 2021 × 365), rounded to two decimals.

For all other nonexempt facilities, including nursing
facilities that began participation in a CCRC on or after
July 1, 2010, the Department is proposing to assess these
facilities at a rate of $29.65.

Aggregate Assessment Amounts and Fiscal Impact

The Department estimates that if the proposed assess-
ment rates are implemented the annual aggregate assess-
ment fees for nonexempt nursing facilities will total
$436.313 million. The Department will use the State
revenue derived from the assessment fees and any associ-
ated FFP to support payments to qualified MA nursing
facility providers in accordance with applicable laws and
regulations.

Public Comment

Interested persons are invited to submit written com-
ments regarding this proposed assessment to the Depart-
ment of Human Services, Office of Long-Term Living,
Bureau of Policy and Regulatory Management, Attention:
Montrell Fletcher, P.O. Box 8025, Harrisburg, PA 17105-
8025 or at RA-PWOLTLNFPUBLICCOM@pa.gov. Com-
ments must be submitted within 30 days of publication of
this notice. See 62 P.S. § 805-A. After considering the
comments, the Secretary will publish a second notice
announcing the final assessment rates for FY 2021-2022.
The Department will not begin collecting assessment fees
until after the publication of the final assessment rate
notice.

Persons with a disability who require an auxiliary aid
or service may submit comments using the Pennsylvania
Hamilton Relay Service at (800) 654-5984 (TDD users) or
(800) 654-5988 (voice users).

MEG SNEAD,
Acting Secretary

Fiscal Note: 14-NOT-1454. (1) General Fund; (2)
Implementing Year 2021-2022 is $436,313,000; (3) 1st
Succeeding Year 2022-23 through 5th Succeeding Year
2026-27 are $0; (4) 2020-21 Program—$2,328,000,000;
2019-20 Program—$662,269,000,000; 2018-19 Program—
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$0; (7) Community HealthChoices; (8) recommends adop-
tion. Funds have been included in the budget to cover
this increase.

[Pa.B. Doc. No. 21-1133. Filed for public inspection July 16, 2021, 9:00 a.m.]

DEPARTMENT OF
HUMAN SERVICES

Supplemental Payments to Qualifying Hospitals

The Department of Human Services (Department) is
announcing its intent to discontinue the Medical Assist-
ance (MA) stability payments beginning with Fiscal Year
(FY) 2021-2022. In addition, the Department intends to
revise the payment reconciliation process to account for
the discontinuation of these payments.

Background

The Department imposes a monetary assessment on the
net inpatient revenue and net outpatient revenue of
licensed hospitals in this Commonwealth, other than
exempt hospitals under Article VIII-G of the Human
Services Code (code) (62 P.S. §§ 801-G—816-G). The
funds generated by the hospital assessment are used to
make MA payments to hospitals and managed care
organizations for inpatient and outpatient services, de-
scribed in section 805-G(a)(1) and (2) of the code (62 P.S.
§ 805-G(a)(1) and (2)), as well as other purposes as
approved by the Secretary for inpatient hospital, outpa-
tient hospital and hospital-related services. The Depart-
ment has used a portion of these funds for fee-for-service
(FFS) MA Stability Payments annually beginning in FY
2010-2011 and continuing through FY 2020-2021. This
payment is in the approved State Plan.

Discontinuation of MA Stability Payments

Previously, the Commonwealth’s budget included appro-
priated funds for the MA Stability payments. The Com-
monwealth’s budget for FY 2021-2022 does not include
appropriated funding for the MA Stability payments. For
this reason, the Department intends to submit a State
Plan Amendment to provide for the discontinuation of MA
Stability Payments for all hospitals, including what is
referred to in the State Plan as new hospitals (new
hospitals), beginning with FY 2021-2022. The Department
is not otherwise changing its approved State Plan provi-
sions addressing the qualifying criteria or payment meth-
odology for other payments to new hospitals.

Payment Reconciliation

The Department also intends to amend the State Plan
to modify the payment reconciliation process used to
determine the available funding for certain MA payments
funded with assessment revenues. Specifically, effective
with the reconciliation of payments for FY 2021-2022 and
continuing for subsequent years the Department is pro-
posing to:

a) Specify the periods for which the MA Stability
Payment is subject to reconciliation; and,

b) Change the amount of available funding for pay-
ments to be reconciled to $201.847 million (and of this
amount, specify that the portion attributable to the
inpatient disproportionate share payments and direct
medical education payments is $40.959 million).

The Department is not otherwise changing its approved
State Plan provisions addressing the payment reconcilia-
tion process.

Fiscal Impact

Effective FY 2021-2022, and subject to approval by the
Centers for Medicare & Medicaid Service, the Department
will no longer fund $150.335 million in total funds for
this supplemental payment. The Department has in-
creased the available funding for outpatient hospital
services made available through the Physical Health
HealthChoices managed care program by $150.000 mil-
lion in total funds effective January 1, 2021.

Public Comment

Interested persons are invited to submit written com-
ments regarding this notice to the Department of Human
Services, Office of Medical Assistance Programs, c/o Regu-
lations Coordinator, Room 515, Health and Welfare Build-
ing, Harrisburg, PA 17120. The Department will review
and consider comments received within 30 days.

Persons with a disability who require an auxiliary aid
or service may submit comments using the Pennsylvania
Hamilton Relay Service at (800) 654-5984 (TDD users) or
(800) 654-5988 (voice users).

MEG SNEAD,
Acting Secretary

Fiscal Note: 14-NOT-1452. (1) General Fund;

(7) MA—FFS; (2) Implementing Year 2020-21 is $0;
(3) 1st Succeeding Year 2021-22 through 5th Succeeding
Year 2025-26 is -$33,780,000; (4) 2019-20 Program—
$334,085,000; 2018-19 Program—$342,544,000; 2017-18
Program—$477,690,000;

(7) MA—Capitation; (2) Implementing Year 2020-21 is
$0; (3) 1st Succeeding Year 2021-22 through 5th Succeed-
ing Year 2025-26 is $33,705,000; (4) 2019-20 Program—
$2,507,000,000; 2018-19 Program—$3,303,000,000;
2017-18 Program—$3,106,000,000;

(8) recommends adoption. Funds have been included in
the budget to cover this increase.

[Pa.B. Doc. No. 21-1134. Filed for public inspection July 16, 2021, 9:00 a.m.]

DEPARTMENT OF
LABOR AND INDUSTRY

Pennsylvania Workforce Development Board Vir-
tual Public Engagement Sessions

The Pennsylvania Workforce Development Board
(Board) is hosting two virtual public engagement sessions
to be held on August 6, 2021, and August 11, 2021, from
12 p.m. to 2 p.m. for the Workforce Innovation
and Opportunity Act Combined State Plan modification.
Individuals can visit the Board’s web site for connec-
tion information at https://www.dli.pa.gov/Businesses/
Workforce-Development/wdb/Pages/default.aspx. Details
will be posted by August 2, 2021.

JENNIFER BERRIER,
Secretary

[Pa.B. Doc. No. 21-1135. Filed for public inspection July 16, 2021, 9:00 a.m.]
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DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE
Pennsylvania $3,000,000 Payout Instant Lottery

Game 1530

Under the State Lottery Law (72 P.S. §§ 3761-101—
3761-314) and 61 Pa. Code § 819.203 (relating to notice of
instant game rules), the Secretary of Revenue hereby
provides public notice of the rules for the following
instant lottery game:

1. Name: The name of the game is Pennsylvania
$3,000,000 Payout (hereafter ‘‘$3,000,000 Payout’’). The
game number is PA-1530.

2. Price: The price of a $3,000,000 Payout instant
lottery game ticket is $30.

3. Play symbols: Each $3,000,000 Payout instant lot-
tery game ticket will contain one play area featuring a
‘‘WINNING NUMBERS’’ area, a ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ area
and a ‘‘BONUS’’ area. The ‘‘BONUS’’ area is played
separately. The play symbols and their captions, located
in the ‘‘WINNING NUMBERS’’ area, are: 1 (ONE), 2
(TWO), 3 (THREE), 4 (FOUR), 5 (FIVE), 6 (SIX), 7
(SEVEN), 8 (EIGHT), 9 (NINE), 10 (TEN), 11 (ELEVN),
12 (TWLV), 13 (THRTN), 14 (FORTN), 15 (FIFTN), 16
(SIXTN), 17 (SVNTN), 18 (EGHTN), 19 (NINTN), 20
(TWENT), 21 (TWYONE), 22 (TWYTWO), 23 (TWYTHR),
24 (TWYFOR), 25 (TWYFIV), 26 (TWYSIX), 27
(TWYSVN), 28 (TWYEGT), 29 (TWYNIN), 30 (THIRT), 31
(THYONE), 32 (THYTWO), 33 (THYTHR), 34 (THYFOR),
35 (THYFIV), 36 (THYSIX), 37 (THYSVN), 38 (THYEGT),
39 (THYNIN) and 40 (FORT). The play symbols and their
captions, located in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ area, are: 1
(ONE), 2 (TWO), 3 (THREE), 4 (FOUR), 5 (FIVE), 6
(SIX), 7 (SEVEN), 8 (EIGHT), 9 (NINE), 10 (TEN), 11
(ELEVN), 12 (TWLV), 13 (THRTN), 14 (FORTN), 15
(FIFTN), 16 (SIXTN), 17 (SVNTN), 18 (EGHTN), 19
(NINTN), 20 (TWENT), 21 (TWYONE), 22 (TWYTWO),
23 (TWYTHR), 24 (TWYFOR), 25 (TWYFIV), 26
(TWYSIX), 27 (TWYSVN), 28 (TWYEGT), 29 (TWYNIN),
30 (THIRT), 31 (THYONE), 32 (THYTWO), 33
(THYTHR), 34 (THYFOR), 35 (THYFIV), 36 (THYSIX), 37
(THYSVN), 38 (THYEGT), 39 (THYNIN), 40 (FORT),
Moneybag (MNYBG) symbol, $3,000 Burst (WIN$3K)
symbol and a PAYOUT (WINALL) symbol. The prize play
symbols and their captions, located in the ‘‘BONUS’’ area,
are: $30.00 (THIRTY), $40.00 (FORTY), $50.00 (FIFTY),
$100 (ONE HUN), $150 (ONEHUNFTY), $300 (THR
HUN), $500 (FIV HUN), $1,000 (ONE THO), $10,000
(TEN THO) and a $$$ (30TIMES) symbol.

4. Prize Symbols: The prize symbols and their cap-
tions, located in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ area, are: $30.00

(THIRTY), $40.00 (FORTY), $50.00 (FIFTY), $100 (ONE
HUN), $150 (ONEHUNFTY), $300 (THR HUN), $500
(FIV HUN), $1,000 (ONE THO), $3,000 (THR THO),
$30,000 (THRTYTHO), $300,000 (THRHUNTHO) and
$3MILL (THR MIL).

5. Prizes: The prizes that can be won in the ‘‘YOUR
NUMBERS’’ area, are: $30, $40, $50, $100, $150, $300,
$500, $1,000, $3,000, $30,000, $300,000 and $3,000,000.
The prizes that can be won in the ‘‘BONUS’’ area, are:
$30, $40, $50, $100, $150, $300, $500, $1,000 and
$10,000. $3,000,000 Payout contains a feature that can
multiply certain prizes. For a complete list of prizes, and
how those prizes can be won, see section 8 (relating to
number and description of prizes and approximate odds).
A player can win up to 26 times on a ticket.

6. Approximate number of tickets printed for the
game: Approximately 7,800,000 tickets will be printed for
the $3,000,000 Payout instant lottery game.

7. Determination of prize winners:
(a) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the

‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches any of the
‘‘WINNING NUMBERS’’ play symbols, and a prize symbol
of $3MILL (THR MIL) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under
the matching ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a
single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $3,000,000.
The prize shall be paid as a one-time, lump-sum cash
payment.

(b) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the
‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches any of the
‘‘WINNING NUMBERS’’ play symbols, and a prize symbol
of $300,000 (THRHUNTHO) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area
under the matching ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on
a single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $300,000.

(c) Holders of tickets where two matching prize play
symbols of $10,000 (TEN THO) and a $$$ (30TIMES)
symbol appear in the ‘‘BONUS’’ area, on a single ticket,
shall be entitled to a prize of $300,000.

(d) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the
‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches any of the
‘‘WINNING NUMBERS’’ play symbols, and a prize symbol
of $30,000 (THRTYTHO) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area
under the matching ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on
a single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $30,000.

(e) Holders of tickets where two matching prize play
symbols of $1,000 (ONE THO) and a $$$ (30TIMES)
symbol appear in the ‘‘BONUS’’ area, on a single ticket,
shall be entitled to a prize of $30,000.

(f) Holders of tickets upon which a PAYOUT (WINALL)
symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ area, and a
prize symbol of $3,000 (THR THO) appears in two of the
‘‘prize’’ areas, a prize symbol of $1,000 (ONE THO)
appears in 16 of the ‘‘prize’’ areas and a prize symbol of
$500 (FIV HUN) appears in seven of the ‘‘prize’’ areas, on
a single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $25,500.

(g) Holders of tickets where two matching prize play
symbols of $500 (FIV HUN) and a $$$ (30TIMES) symbol
appear in the ‘‘BONUS’’ area, on a single ticket, shall be
entitled to a prize of $15,000.

(h) Holders of tickets where two matching prize play
symbols of $150 (ONEHUNFTY) and a $$$ (30TIMES)
symbol appear in the ‘‘BONUS’’ area, on a single ticket,
shall be entitled to a prize of $4,500.

(i) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the ‘‘YOUR
NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches any of the ‘‘WINNING
NUMBERS’’ play symbols, and a prize symbol of $3,000
(THR THO) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under the match-
ing ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a single ticket,
shall be entitled to a prize of $3,000.

(j) Holders of tickets upon which a $3,000 Burst
(WIN$3K) symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’
area and a prize symbol of $3,000 (THR THO) appears in
the ‘‘prize’’ area under that $3,000 Burst (WIN$3K)
symbol, on a single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of
$3,000.

(k) Holders of tickets upon which a PAYOUT
(WINALL) symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’
area, and a prize symbol of $500 (FIV HUN) appears in
four of the ‘‘prize’’ areas, a prize symbol of $40.00 (FORTY)
appears in ten of the ‘‘prize’’ areas, a prize symbol of
$30.00 (THIRTY) appears in ten of the ‘‘prize’’ areas and a
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prize symbol of $150 (ONEHUNFTY) appears in one of
the ‘‘prize’’ areas, on a single ticket, shall be entitled to a
prize of $2,850.

(l) Holders of tickets where two matching prize play
symbols of $50.00 (FIFTY) and a $$$ (30TIMES) symbol
appear in the ‘‘BONUS’’ area, on a single ticket, shall be
entitled to a prize of $1,500.

(m) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the
‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches any of the
‘‘WINNING NUMBERS’’ play symbols, and a prize symbol
of $1,000 (ONE THO) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under
the matching ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a
single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $1,000.

(n) Holders of tickets upon which a Moneybag
(MNYBG) symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’
area, and a prize symbol of $1,000 (ONE THO) appears in
the ‘‘prize’’ area under that Moneybag (MNYBG) symbol,
on a single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $1,000.

(o) Holders of tickets where three matching prize play
symbols of $1,000 (ONE THO) appear in the ‘‘BONUS’’
area, on a single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of
$1,000.

(p) Holders of tickets upon which a PAYOUT
(WINALL) symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’
area, and a prize symbol of $40.00 (FORTY) appears in all
25 of the ‘‘prize’’ areas, on a single ticket, shall be entitled
to a prize of $1,000.

(q) Holders of tickets upon which a PAYOUT
(WINALL) symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’
area, and a prize symbol of $40.00 (FORTY) appears in 20
of the ‘‘prize’’ areas and a prize symbol of $30.00 (THIRTY)
appears in five of the ‘‘prize’’ areas, on a single ticket,
shall be entitled to a prize of $950.

(r) Holders of tickets where two matching prize play
symbols of $30.00 (THIRTY) and a $$$ (30TIMES) symbol
appear in the ‘‘BONUS’’ area, on a single ticket, shall be
entitled to a prize of $900.

(s) Holders of tickets upon which a PAYOUT (WINALL)
symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ area, and a
prize symbol of $50.00 (FIFTY) appears in five of the
‘‘prize’’ areas and a prize symbol of $30.00 (THIRTY)
appears in 20 of the ‘‘prize’’ areas, on a single ticket, shall
be entitled to a prize of $850.

(t) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the ‘‘YOUR
NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches any of the ‘‘WINNING
NUMBERS’’ play symbols, and a prize symbol of $500
(FIV HUN) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under the match-
ing ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a single ticket,
shall be entitled to a prize of $500.

(u) Holders of tickets upon which a Moneybag
(MNYBG) symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’
area, and a prize symbol of $500 (FIV HUN) appears in
the ‘‘prize’’ area under that Moneybag (MNYBG) symbol,
on a single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $500.

(v) Holders of tickets where three matching prize play
symbols of $500 (FIV HUN) appear in the ‘‘BONUS’’ area,
on a single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $500.

(w) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the
‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches any of the
‘‘WINNING NUMBERS’’ play symbols, and a prize symbol
of $300 (THR HUN) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under the
matching ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a single
ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $300.

(x) Holders of tickets upon which a Moneybag
(MNYBG) symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’

area, and a prize symbol of $300 (THR HUN) appears in
the ‘‘prize’’ area under that Moneybag (MNYBG) symbol,
on a single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $300.

(y) Holders of tickets where three matching prize play
symbols of $300 (THR HUN) appear in the ‘‘BONUS’’
area, on a single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of
$300.

(z) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the
‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches any of the
‘‘WINNING NUMBERS’’ play symbols, and a prize symbol
of $150 (ONEHUNFTY) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under
the matching ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a
single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $150.

(aa) Holders of tickets upon which a Moneybag
(MNYBG) symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’
area, and a prize symbol of $150 (ONEHUNFTY) appears
in the ‘‘prize’’ area under that Moneybag (MNYBG)
symbol, on a single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of
$150.

(bb) Holders of tickets where three matching prize play
symbols of $150 (ONEHUNFTY) appear in the ‘‘BONUS’’
area, on a single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of
$150.

(cc) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the
‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches any of the
‘‘WINNING NUMBERS’’ play symbols, and a prize symbol
of $100 (ONE HUN) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under the
matching ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a single
ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $100.

(dd) Holders of tickets upon which a Moneybag
(MNYBG) symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’
area, and a prize symbol of $100 (ONE HUN) appears in
the ‘‘prize’’ area under that Moneybag (MNYBG) symbol,
on a single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $100.

(ee) Holders of tickets where three matching prize play
symbols of $100 (ONE HUN) appear in the ‘‘BONUS’’
area, on a single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of
$100.

(ff) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the
‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches any of the
‘‘WINNING NUMBERS’’ play symbols, and a prize symbol
of $50.00 (FIFTY) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under the
matching ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a single
ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $50.

(gg) Holders of tickets upon which a Moneybag
(MNYBG) symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’
area, and a prize symbol of $50.00 (FIFTY) appears in the
‘‘prize’’ area under that Moneybag (MNYBG) symbol, on a
single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $50.

(hh) Holders of tickets where three matching prize play
symbols of $50.00 (FIFTY) appear in the ‘‘BONUS’’ area,
on a single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $50.

(ii) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the
‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches any of the
‘‘WINNING NUMBERS’’ play symbols, and a prize symbol
of $40.00 (FORTY) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under the
matching ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a single
ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $40.

(jj) Holders of tickets upon which a Moneybag
(MNYBG) symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’
area, and a prize symbol of $40.00 (FORTY) appears in
the ‘‘prize’’ area under that Moneybag (MNYBG) symbol,
on a single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $40.
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(kk) Holders of tickets where three matching prize play
symbols of $40.00 (FORTY) appear in the ‘‘BONUS’’ area,
on a single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $40.

(ll) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the
‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches any of the
‘‘WINNING NUMBERS’’ play symbols, and a prize symbol
of $30.00 (THIRTY) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under the
matching ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a single
ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $30.

(mm) Holders of tickets upon which a Moneybag
(MNYBG) symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’

area, and a prize symbol of $30.00 (THIRTY) appears in
the ‘‘prize’’ area under that Moneybag (MNYBG) symbol,
on a single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $30.

(nn) Holders of tickets where three matching prize play
symbols of $30.00 (THIRTY) appear in the ‘‘BONUS’’ area,
on a single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $30.

8. Number and description of prizes and approximate
odds: The following table sets forth the approximate
number of winners, amounts of prizes and approximate
odds of winning:

When Any Of YOUR NUMBERS
Match Any WINNING NUMBER,
Win Prize Shown Under The
Matching Number.
Win With: BONUS: Win:

Approximate Odds
Are 1 In:

Approximate No.
Of Winners Per

7,800,000 Tickets:
3—$30s $30 25 312,000

$30 w/ MONEYBAG $30 20 390,000
$30 $30 30 260,000

3—$40s $40 60 130,000
$40 w/ MONEYBAG $40 18.75 416,000
$40 $40 60 130,000

3—$50s $50 50 156,000
$50 w/ MONEYBAG $50 30 260,000
$50 $50 42.86 182,000
$50 × 2 $100 300 26,000
$30 × 2 3—$40s $100 150 52,000
$40 + $30 3—$30s $100 150 52,000
$50 w/ MONEYBAG 3—$50s $100 100 78,000

3—$100s $100 100 78,000
$100 w/ MONEYBAG $100 150 52,000
$100 $100 150 52,000
$50 × 3 $150 2,400 3,250
(($30 w/ MONEYBAG) × 2) +
($30 × 2)

3—$30s $150 800 9,750

($50 w/ MONEYBAG) + $50 3—$50s $150 800 9,750
$50 w/ MONEYBAG 3—$100s $150 800 9,750

3—$150s $150 1,200 6,500
$150 w/ MONEYBAG $150 1,200 6,500
$150 $150 1,200 6,500
$30 × 10 $300 4,000 1,950
$150 × 2 $300 3,000 2,600
(($50 w/ MONEYBAG) × 2) +
(($30 w/ MONEYBAG) × 3) +
($30 × 2)

3—$50s $300 2,400 3,250

($100 w/ MONEYBAG) + ($50 × 2) 3—$100s $300 2,400 3,250
$150 w/ MONEYBAG 3—$150s $300 1,200 6,500
($30 w/ MONEYBAG) × 10 $300 1,200 6,500

3—$300s $300 800 9,750
$300 w/ MONEYBAG $300 2,400 3,250
$300 $300 3,000 2,600
$50 × 10 $500 24,000 325
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When Any Of YOUR NUMBERS
Match Any WINNING NUMBER,
Win Prize Shown Under The
Matching Number.
Win With: BONUS: Win:

Approximate Odds
Are 1 In:

Approximate No.
Of Winners Per

7,800,000 Tickets:
$100 × 5 $500 24,000 325
($50 × 5) + $150 3—$100s $500 12,000 650
(($50 w/ MONEYBAG) × 4) +
($30 × 5)

3—$150s $500 6,000 1,300

($100 w/ MONEYBAG) + ($30 × 10) 3—$100s $500 6,000 1,300
($100 w/ MONEYBAG) +
($50 w/ MONEYBAG) + $50

3—$300s $500 6,000 1,300

(($150 w/ MONEYBAG) × 2) +
($30 × 2) + $40

3—$100s $500 6,000 1,300

($300 w/ MONEYBAG) +
($50 w/ MONEYBAG)

3—$150s $500 6,000 1,300

3—$500s $500 12,000 650
$500 w/ MONEYBAG $500 12,000 650
$500 $500 12,000 650
PAYOUT w/ (($50 × 5) + ($30 × 20)) 3—$150s $1,000 4,800 1,625
PAYOUT w/ (($40 × 20) + ($30 × 5)) 3—$50s $1,000 4,800 1,625
PAYOUT w/ ($40 × 25) $1,000 3,000 2,600
$50 × 2 2—$30s w/ $$$

SYMBOL
$1,000 12,000 650

$100 2—$30s w/ $$$
SYMBOL

$1,000 12,000 650

($300 w/ MONEYBAG) + ($50 × 8) 3—$300s $1,000 120,000 65
$500 w/ MONEYBAG 3—$500s $1,000 120,000 65

3—$1,000s $1,000 120,000 65
$1,000 w/ MONEYBAG $1,000 12,000 650
$1,000 $1,000 120,000 65
PAYOUT w/ (($500 × 4) + ($40 × 10) +
($30 × 10) + $150)

3—$150s $3,000 120,000 65

$300 × 5 2—$50s w/ $$$
SYMBOL

$3,000 120,000 65

$3,000 w/ $3,000 BURST $3,000 6,000 1,300
$3,000 $3,000 120,000 65
PAYOUT w/ (($3,000 × 2) +
($1,000 × 16) + ($500 × 7))

2—$150s w/ $$$
SYMBOL

$30,000 780,000 10

($3,000 w/ $3,000 BURST) × 5 2—$500s w/ $$$
SYMBOL

$30,000 780,000 10

2—$1,000s w/ $$$
SYMBOL

$30,000 1,560,000 5

$30,000 $30,000 1,560,000 5
2—$10,000s w/
$$$ SYMBOL

$300,000 1,560,000 5

$300,000 $300,000 1,560,000 5
$3,000,000 $3,000,000 1,560,000 5

Reveal a ‘‘Moneybag’’ (MNYBG) symbol, win prize shown under that symbol automatically.

Reveal a ‘‘$3,000 Burst’’ (WIN$3K) symbol, win $3,000 instantly.

Reveal a ‘‘PAYOUT’’ (WINALL) symbol, win all 25 prizes shown!

BONUS: Reveal 3 like amounts, win that amount. Reveal 2 like amounts and a ‘‘$$$’’ (30TIMES) symbol, win
30 TIMES the prize shown! BONUS is played separately.
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Prizes, including top prizes, are subject to availability
at the time of purchase.

9. Retailer incentive awards: The Lottery may conduct
a separate Retailer Incentive Program for retailers who
sell $3,000,000 Payout instant lottery game tickets.

10. Retailer bonus: The Lottery may offer a retailer
bonus in connection with the sale of Pennsylvania instant
lottery game tickets. If a retailer bonus is offered, a
Lottery retailer shall be eligible for a bonus as described
in this section. Lottery retailers who sell a winning ticket
that entitles the ticket holder to a prize, either payable in
a single installment or having a guaranteed minimum
payout, of at least $100,000 and not exceeding $500,000
shall be paid a bonus of $500. Lottery retailers who sell a
winning ticket that entitles the ticket holder to a prize,
either payable in a single installment or having a guaran-
teed minimum payout, of at least $500,001 and not
exceeding $1,000,000 shall be paid a bonus of $5,000.
Lottery retailers who sell a winning ticket that entitles
the ticket holder to a prize, either payable in a single
installment or having a guaranteed minimum payout, of
at least $1,000,001 and not exceeding $10,000,000 shall
be paid a bonus of $10,000. A Lottery retailer is entitled
only to the largest bonus for which they qualify on a
winning ticket. A bonus will be initiated for payment after
the instant ticket is claimed and validated. A bonus will
not be awarded to a Lottery retailer that sells a non-
winning Pennsylvania Lottery instant ticket used to enter
a Pennsylvania Lottery second-chance drawing or promo-
tion that is subsequently selected to win a prize.

11. Unclaimed prize money: For a period of 1 year from
the announced close of $3,000,000 Payout, prize money
from winning $3,000,000 Payout instant lottery game
tickets will be retained by the Secretary for payment to
the persons entitled thereto. If no claim is made within
1 year of the announced close of the $3,000,000 Payout
instant lottery game, the right of a ticket holder to claim
the prize represented by the ticket, if any, will expire and
the prize money will be paid into the State Lottery Fund
and used for purposes provided for by statute.

12. Governing law: In purchasing a ticket, the cus-
tomer agrees to comply with and abide by the State
Lottery Law (72 P.S. §§ 3761-101—3761-314), 61 Pa. Code
Part V (relating to State Lotteries) and the provisions
contained in this notice.

13. Termination of the game: The Secretary may an-
nounce a termination date, after which no further tickets
from this game may be sold. The announcement will be
disseminated through media used to advertise or promote
$3,000,000 Payout or through normal communications
methods.

C. DANIEL HASSELL,
Secretary

[Pa.B. Doc. No. 21-1136. Filed for public inspection July 16, 2021, 9:00 a.m.]

DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE
Pennsylvania Bonus Buck$ Instant Lottery Game

1533

Under the State Lottery Law (72 P.S. §§ 3761-101—
3761-314) and 61 Pa. Code § 819.203 (relating to notice of
instant game rules), the Secretary of Revenue hereby
provides public notice of the rules for the following
instant lottery game:

1. Name: The name of the game is Pennsylvania Bo-
nus Buck$ (hereafter ‘‘Bonus Buck$’’). The game number
is PA-1533.

2. Price: The price of a Bonus Buck$ instant lottery
game ticket is $2.

3. Play symbols: Each Bonus Buck$ instant lottery
game ticket will contain one play area featuring a
‘‘WINNING NUMBERS’’ area, a ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ area
and two ‘‘BONUS’’ spots. The two ‘‘BONUS’’ spots are
each played separately. The play symbols and their
captions, located in the ‘‘WINNING NUMBERS’’ area,
are: 1 (ONE), 2 (TWO), 3 (THREE), 4 (FOUR), 5 (FIVE),
6 (SIX), 7 (SEVEN), 8 (EIGHT), 9 (NINE), 10 (TEN), 11
(ELEVN), 12 (TWLV), 13 (THRTN), 14 (FORTN), 15
(FIFTN), 16 (SIXTN), 17 (SVNTN), 18 (EGHTN), 19
(NINTN), 20 (TWENT), 21 (TWYONE), 22 (TWYTWO),
23 (TWYTHR), 24 (TWYFOR) and 25 (TWYFIV). The play
symbols and their captions, located in the ‘‘YOUR NUM-
BERS’’ area, are: 1 (ONE), 2 (TWO), 3 (THREE), 4
(FOUR), 5 (FIVE), 6 (SIX), 7 (SEVEN), 8 (EIGHT), 9
(NINE), 10 (TEN), 11 (ELEVN), 12 (TWLV), 13 (THRTN),
14 (FORTN), 15 (FIFTN), 16 (SIXTN), 17 (SVNTN), 18
(EGHTN), 19 (NINTN), 20 (TWENT), 21 (TWYONE), 22
(TWYTWO), 23 (TWYTHR), 24 (TWYFOR), 25 (TWYFIV)
and a BUCK$ (WINALL) symbol. The prize play symbols
and their captions, located in the two ‘‘BONUS’’ spots,
are: Bank (TRY AGAIN) symbol, Stack of Coins (NO
BONUS) symbol, Piggybank (TRY AGAIN) symbol, Wallet
(NO BONUS) symbol, Gold Bar (TRY AGAIN) symbol,
Purse (TRY AGAIN) symbol, Diamond Ring (NO BONUS)
symbol, Necklace (TRY AGAIN) symbol, Vault (NO BO-
NUS) symbol, Star (TRY AGAIN) symbol, $2.00 (TWO
DOL), $4.00 (FOR DOL), $5.00 (FIV DOL), $10.00 (TEN
DOL), $20.00 (TWENTY), $30.00 (THIRTY), $50.00
(FIFTY), $100 (ONE HUN) and $200 (TWO HUN).

4. Prize Symbols: The prize symbols and their cap-
tions, located in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ area, are: $2.00

(TWO DOL), $4.00 (FOR DOL), $5.00 (FIV DOL), $10.00

(TEN DOL), $20.00 (TWENTY), $30.00 (THIRTY), $50.00

(FIFTY), $100 (ONE HUN), $200 (TWO HUN), $1,000
(ONE THO) and $20,000 (TWY THO).

5. Prizes: The prizes that can be won in this game,
are: $2, $4, $5, $10, $20, $30, $50, $100, $200, $1,000
and $20,000. The prizes that can be won in the two
‘‘BONUS’’ spots, are: $2, $4, $5, $10, $20, $30, $50, $100
and $200. A player can win up to 12 times on a ticket.

6. Approximate number of tickets printed for the
game: Approximately 8,400,000 tickets will be printed for
the Bonus Buck$ instant lottery game.

7. Determination of prize winners:
(a) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the

‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches either of the
‘‘WINNING NUMBERS’’ play symbols, and a prize symbol
of $20,000 (TWY THO) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under
the matching ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a
single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $20,000.

(b) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the
‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches either of the
‘‘WINNING NUMBERS’’ play symbols, and a prize symbol
of $1,000 (ONE THO) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under
the matching ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a
single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $1,000.

(c) Holders of tickets upon which a BUCK$ (WINALL)
symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ area, and a
prize symbol of $100 (ONE HUN) appears in all ten of
the ‘‘prize’’ areas, on a single ticket, shall be entitled to a
prize of $1,000.
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(d) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the
‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches either of the
‘‘WINNING NUMBERS’’ play symbols, and a prize symbol
of $200 (TWO HUN) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under
the matching ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a
single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $200.

(e) Holders of tickets upon which a prize play symbol of
$200 (TWO HUN) appears in either ‘‘BONUS’’ spot, on a
single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $200.

(f) Holders of tickets upon which a BUCK$ (WINALL)
symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ area, and a
prize symbol of $20.00 (TWENTY) appears in all ten of the
‘‘prize’’ areas, on a single ticket, shall be entitled to a
prize of $200.

(g) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the
‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches either of the
‘‘WINNING NUMBERS’’ play symbols, and a prize symbol
of $100 (ONE HUN) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under the
matching ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a single
ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $100.

(h) Holders of tickets upon which a prize play symbol
of $100 (ONE HUN) appears in either ‘‘BONUS’’ spot, on
a single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $100.

(i) Holders of tickets upon which a BUCK$ (WINALL)
symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ area, and a
prize symbol of $10.00 (TEN DOL) appears in all ten of
the ‘‘prize’’ areas, on a single ticket, shall be entitled to a
prize of $100.

(j) Holders of tickets upon which a BUCK$ (WINALL)
symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ area, and a
prize symbol of $10.00 (TEN DOL) appears in six of the
‘‘prize’’ areas and a prize symbol of $5.00 (FIV DOL)
appears in four of the ‘‘prize’’ areas, on a single ticket,
shall be entitled to a prize of $80.

(k) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the
‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches either of the
‘‘WINNING NUMBERS’’ play symbols, and a prize symbol
of $50.00 (FIFTY) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under the
matching ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a single
ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $50.

(l) Holders of tickets upon which a prize play symbol of
$50.00 (FIFTY) appears in either ‘‘BONUS’’ spot, on a
single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $50.

(m) Holders of tickets upon which a BUCK$ (WINALL)
symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ area, and a
prize symbol of $5.00 (FIV DOL) appears in all ten of the
‘‘prize’’ areas, on a single ticket, shall be entitled to a
prize of $50.

(n) Holders of tickets upon which a BUCK$ (WINALL)
symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ area, and a
prize symbol of $4.00 (FOR DOL) appears in all ten of the
‘‘prize’’ areas, on a single ticket, shall be entitled to a
prize of $40.

(o) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the
‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches either of the
‘‘WINNING NUMBERS’’ play symbols, and a prize symbol
of $30.00 (THIRTY) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under the
matching ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a single
ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $30.

(p) Holders of tickets upon which a prize play symbol
of $30.00 (THIRTY) appears in either ‘‘BONUS’’ spot, on a
single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $30.

(q) Holders of tickets upon which a BUCK$ (WINALL)
symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ area, and a

prize symbol of $4.00 (FOR DOL) appears in five of the
‘‘prize’’ areas and a prize symbol of $2.00 (TWO DOL)
appears in five of the ‘‘prize’’ areas, on a single ticket,
shall be entitled to a prize of $30.

(r) Holders of tickets upon which a BUCK$ (WINALL)
symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ area, and a
prize symbol of $5.00 (FIV DOL) appears in two of the
‘‘prize’’ areas and a prize symbol of $2.00 (TWO DOL)
appears in eight of the ‘‘prize’’ areas, on a single ticket,
shall be entitled to a prize of $26.

(s) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the
‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches either of the
‘‘WINNING NUMBERS’’ play symbols, and a prize symbol
of $20.00 (TWENTY) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under the
matching ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a single
ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $20.

(t) Holders of tickets upon which a prize play symbol of
$20.00 (TWENTY) appears in either ‘‘BONUS’’ spot, on a
single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $20.

(u) Holders of tickets upon which a BUCK$ (WINALL)
symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ area, and a
prize symbol of $2.00 (TWO DOL) appears in all ten of the
‘‘prize’’ areas, on a single ticket, shall be entitled to a
prize of $20.

(v) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the
‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches either of the
‘‘WINNING NUMBERS’’ play symbols, and a prize symbol
of $10.00 (TEN DOL) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under
the matching ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a
single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $10.

(w) Holders of tickets upon which a prize play symbol
of $10.00 (TEN DOL) appears in either ‘‘BONUS’’ spot, on
a single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $10.

(x) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the
‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches either of the
‘‘WINNING NUMBERS’’ play symbols, and a prize symbol
of $5.00 (FIV DOL) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under the
matching ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a single
ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $5.

(y) Holders of tickets upon which a prize play symbol of
$5.00 (FIV DOL) appears in either ‘‘BONUS’’ spot, on a
single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $5.

(z) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the
‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches either of the
‘‘WINNING NUMBERS’’ play symbols, and a prize symbol
of $4.00 (FOR DOL) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under the
matching ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a single
ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $4.

(aa) Holders of tickets upon which a prize play symbol
of $4.00 (FOR DOL) appears in either ‘‘BONUS’’ spot, on a
single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $4.

(bb) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the
‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches either of the
‘‘WINNING NUMBERS’’ play symbols, and a prize symbol
of $2.00 (TWO DOL) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under the
matching ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a single
ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $2.

(cc) Holders of tickets upon which a prize play symbol
of $2.00 (TWO DOL) appears in either ‘‘BONUS’’ spot, on
a single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $2.

8. Number and description of prizes and approximate
odds: The following table sets forth the approximate
number of winners, amounts of prizes and approximate
odds of winning:
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When Any Of YOUR
NUMBERS Match Either
WINNING NUMBER, Win Prize
Shown Under The Matching
Number.
Win With: BONUS Spots: Win:

Approximate Odds
Are 1 In:

Approximate No.
Of Winners Per

8,400,000 Tickets:
$2 $2 25 336,000

$2 $2 21.43 392,000
$2 × 2 $4 150 56,000
$2 $2 $4 75 112,000

$2 × 2 $4 100 84,000
$4 $4 75 112,000

$4 $4 150 56,000
$5 $5 32.61 257,600

$5 $5 50 168,000
$2 × 5 $10 500 16,800
$5 × 2 $10 500 16,800
$2 × 2 $4 + $2 $10 214.29 39,200
$5 $5 $10 300 28,000

$5 × 2 $10 300 28,000
$10 $10 150 56,000

$10 $10 500 16,800
BUCK$ w/ ($2 × 10) $20 1,500 5,600
$4 × 5 $20 1,500 5,600
$2 × 8 $2 × 2 $20 1,500 5,600

$10 × 2 $20 150 56,000
$20 $20 500 16,800

$20 $20 1,500 5,600
BUCK$ w/ (($5 × 2) + ($2 × 8)) $2 × 2 $30 960 8,750
BUCK$ w/ (($4 × 5) + ($2 × 5)) $30 1,000 8,400
$10 × 3 $30 12,000 700
$2 × 10 $5 × 2 $30 4,000 2,100

$20 + $10 $30 12,000 700
$30 $30 4,000 2,100

$30 $30 12,000 700
BUCK$ w/ ($4 × 10) $5 × 2 $50 2,000 4,200
BUCK$ w/ ($5 × 10) $50 2,400 3,500
$10 × 5 $50 12,000 700
$5 × 5 $20 + $5 $50 6,000 1,400

$50 $50 3,000 2,800
$50 $50 12,000 700
BUCK$ w/ (($10 × 6) + ($5 × 4)) $10 × 2 $100 12,000 700
BUCK$ w/ ($10 × 10) $100 12,000 700
$20 × 5 $100 120,000 70
$5 × 10 $30 + $20 $100 60,000 140
($30 × 2) + ($5 × 2) $20 + $10 $100 24,000 350

$50 × 2 $100 60,000 140
$100 $100 24,000 350

$100 $100 120,000 70
BUCK$ w/ ($20 × 10) $200 120,000 70
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When Any Of YOUR
NUMBERS Match Either
WINNING NUMBER, Win Prize
Shown Under The Matching
Number.
Win With: BONUS Spots: Win:

Approximate Odds
Are 1 In:

Approximate No.
Of Winners Per

8,400,000 Tickets:
$100 × 2 $200 120,000 70

$200 $200 120,000 70
$200 $200 120,000 70
BUCK$ w/ ($100 × 10) $1,000 840,000 10
$200 × 5 $1,000 840,000 10
$1,000 $1,000 840,000 10
$20,000 $20,000 840,000 10

Reveal a ‘‘BUCK$’’ (WINALL) symbol, win all 10 prizes shown!
BONUS SPOTS: Reveal a cash prize amount, win that amount!
BONUS spots played separately.

Prizes, including top prizes, are subject to availability
at the time of purchase.

9. Retailer incentive awards: The Lottery may conduct
a separate Retailer Incentive Program for retailers who
sell Bonus Buck$ instant lottery game tickets.

10. Retailer bonus: The Lottery may offer a retailer
bonus in connection with the sale of Pennsylvania instant
lottery game tickets. If a retailer bonus is offered, a
Lottery retailer shall be eligible for a bonus as described
in this section. Lottery retailers who sell a winning ticket
that entitles the ticket holder to a prize, either payable in
a single installment or having a guaranteed minimum
payout, of at least $100,000 and not exceeding $500,000
shall be paid a bonus of $500. Lottery retailers who sell a
winning ticket that entitles the ticket holder to a prize,
either payable in a single installment or having a guaran-
teed minimum payout, of at least $500,001 and not
exceeding $1,000,000 shall be paid a bonus of $5,000.
Lottery retailers who sell a winning ticket that entitles
the ticket holder to a prize, either payable in a single
installment or having a guaranteed minimum payout, of
at least $1,000,001 and not exceeding $10,000,000 shall
be paid a bonus of $10,000. A Lottery retailer is entitled
only to the largest bonus for which they qualify on a
winning ticket. A bonus will be initiated for payment after
the instant ticket is claimed and validated. A bonus will
not be awarded to a Lottery retailer that sells a non-
winning Pennsylvania Lottery instant ticket used to enter
a Pennsylvania Lottery second-chance drawing or promo-
tion that is subsequently selected to win a prize.

11. Unclaimed prize money: For a period of 1 year from
the announced close of Bonus Buck$, prize money from
winning Bonus Buck$ instant lottery game tickets will be
retained by the Secretary for payment to the persons
entitled thereto. If no claim is made within 1 year of the
announced close of the Bonus Buck$ instant lottery game,
the right of a ticket holder to claim the prize represented
by the ticket, if any, will expire and the prize money will
be paid into the State Lottery Fund and used for
purposes provided for by statute.

12. Governing law: In purchasing a ticket, the cus-
tomer agrees to comply with and abide by the State
Lottery Law (72 P.S. §§ 3761-101—3761-314), 61 Pa. Code
Part V (relating to State Lotteries) and the provisions
contained in this notice.

13. Termination of the game: The Secretary may an-
nounce a termination date, after which no further tickets
from this game may be sold. The announcement will be
disseminated through media used to advertise or promote
Bonus Buck$ or through normal communications meth-
ods.

C. DANIEL HASSELL,
Secretary

[Pa.B. Doc. No. 21-1137. Filed for public inspection July 16, 2021, 9:00 a.m.]

DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE
Pennsylvania Hot Ticket Instant Lottery Game 1534

Under the State Lottery Law (72 P.S. §§ 3761-101—
3761-314) and 61 Pa. Code § 819.203 (relating to notice of
instant game rules), the Secretary of Revenue hereby
provides public notice of the rules for the following
instant lottery game:

1. Name: The name of the game is Pennsylvania Hot
Ticket (hereafter ‘‘Hot Ticket’’). The game number is
PA-1534.

2. Price: The price of a Hot Ticket instant lottery game
ticket is $1.

3. Play symbols: Each Hot Ticket instant lottery game
ticket will contain one play area featuring a ‘‘WINNING
NUMBER’’ area and a ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ area. The play
symbols and their captions, located in the ‘‘WINNING
NUMBER’’ area, are: 1 (ONE), 2 (TWO), 3 (THREE), 4
(FOUR), 5 (FIVE), 6 (SIX), 7 (SEVEN), 8 (EIGHT), 9
(NINE), 10 (TEN), 11 (ELEVN), 12 (TWLV), 13 (THRTN),
14 (FORTN), 15 (FIFTN), 16 (SIXTN), 17 (SVNTN), 18
(EGHTN), 19 (NINTN) and 20 (TWENT). The play sym-
bols and their captions, located in the ‘‘YOUR NUM-
BERS’’ area, are: 1 (ONE), 2 (TWO), 3 (THREE), 4
(FOUR), 5 (FIVE), 6 (SIX), 7 (SEVEN), 8 (EIGHT), 9
(NINE), 10 (TEN), 11 (ELEVN), 12 (TWLV), 13 (THRTN),
14 (FORTN), 15 (FIFTN), 16 (SIXTN), 17 (SVNTN), 18
(EGHTN), 19 (NINTN), 20 (TWENT) and a Match
(WINALL) symbol.

4. Prize Symbols: The prize symbols and their cap-
tions, located in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ area, are: FREE
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(TICKET), $1.00 (ONE DOL), $2.00 (TWO DOL), $5.00

(FIV DOL), $10.00 (TEN DOL), $15.00 (FIFTEEN), $20.00

(TWENTY), $40.00 (FORTY), $100 (ONE HUN), $500
(FIV HUN) and $5,000 (FIV THO).

5. Prizes: The prizes that can be won in this game, are:
Free $1 Ticket, $1, $2, $5, $10, $15, $20, $40, $100, $500
and $5,000. A player can win up to five times on a ticket.

6. Approximate number of tickets printed for the
game: Approximately 8,400,000 tickets will be printed for
the Hot Ticket instant lottery game.

7. Determination of prize winners:
(a) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the

‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches the ‘‘WIN-
NING NUMBER’’ play symbol, and a prize symbol of
$5,000 (FIV THO) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under the
matching ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a single
ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $5,000.

(b) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the
‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches the ‘‘WIN-
NING NUMBER’’ play symbol, and a prize symbol of $500
(FIV HUN) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under the match-
ing ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a single ticket,
shall be entitled to a prize of $500.

(c) Holders of tickets upon which a Match (WINALL)
symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ area, and a
prize symbol of $100 (ONE HUN) appears in all five of
the ‘‘prize’’ areas, on a single ticket, shall be entitled to a
prize of $500.

(d) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the
‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches the ‘‘WIN-
NING NUMBER’’ play symbol, and a prize symbol of $100
(ONE HUN) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under the
matching ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a single
ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $100.

(e) Holders of tickets upon which a Match (WINALL)
symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ area, and a
prize symbol of $15.00 (FIFTEEN) appears in four of the
‘‘prize’’ areas and a prize symbol of $40.00 (FORTY)
appears in one of the ‘‘prize’’ areas, on a single ticket,
shall be entitled to a prize of $100.

(f) Holders of tickets upon which a Match (WINALL)
symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ area, and a
prize symbol of $20.00 (TWENTY) appears in all five of
the ‘‘prize’’ areas, on a single ticket, shall be entitled to a
prize of $100.

(g) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the
‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches the ‘‘WIN-
NING NUMBER’’ play symbol, and a prize symbol of
$40.00 (FORTY) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under the
matching ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a single
ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $40.

(h) Holders of tickets upon which a Match (WINALL)
symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ area, and a
prize symbol of $5.00 (FIV DOL) appears in four of the
‘‘prize’’ areas and a prize symbol of $20.00 (TWENTY)
appears in one of the ‘‘prize’’ areas, on a single ticket,
shall be entitled to a prize of $40.

(i) Holders of tickets upon which a Match (WINALL)
symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ area, and a
prize symbol of $10.00 (TEN DOL) appears in three of the
‘‘prize’’ areas and a prize symbol of $5.00 (FIV DOL)
appears in two of the ‘‘prize’’ areas, on a single ticket,
shall be entitled to a prize of $40.

(j) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the ‘‘YOUR
NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches the ‘‘WINNING NUM-

BER’’ play symbol, and a prize symbol of $20.00

(TWENTY) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under the match-
ing ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a single ticket,
shall be entitled to a prize of $20.

(k) Holders of tickets upon which a Match (WINALL)
symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ area, and a
prize symbol of $1.00 (ONE DOL) appears in three of the
‘‘prize’’ areas, a prize symbol of $15.00 (FIFTEEN) appears
in one of the ‘‘prize’’ areas and a prize symbol of $2.00

(TWO DOL) appears in one of the ‘‘prize’’ areas, on a
single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $20.

(l) Holders of tickets upon which a Match (WINALL)
symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ area, and a
prize symbol of $2.00 (TWO DOL) appears in two of the
‘‘prize’’ areas, a prize symbol of $10.00 (TEN DOL) appears
in one of the ‘‘prize’’ areas, a prize symbol of $5.00 (FIV
DOL) appears in one of the ‘‘prize’’ areas, and a prize
symbol of $1.00 (ONE DOL) appears in one of the ‘‘prize’’
areas, on a single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of
$20.

(m) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the
‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches the ‘‘WIN-
NING NUMBER’’ play symbol, and a prize symbol of
$15.00 (FIFTEEN) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under the
matching ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a single
ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $15.

(n) Holders of tickets upon which a Match (WINALL)
symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ area, and a
prize symbol of $1.00 (ONE DOL) appears in three of the
‘‘prize’’ areas, a prize symbol of $10.00 (TEN DOL) appears
in one of the ‘‘prize’’ areas and a prize symbol of $2.00

(TWO DOL) appears in one of the ‘‘prize’’ areas, on a
single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $15.

(o) Holders of tickets upon which a Match (WINALL)
symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ area, and a
prize symbol of $5.00 (FIV DOL) appears in two of the
‘‘prize’’ areas, a prize symbol of $2.00 (TWO DOL) appears
in two of the ‘‘prize’’ areas and a prize symbol of $1.00

(ONE DOL) appears in one of the ‘‘prize’’ areas, on a
single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $15.

(p) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the
‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches the ‘‘WIN-
NING NUMBER’’ play symbol, and a prize symbol of
$10.00 (TEN DOL) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under the
matching ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a single
ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $10.

(q) Holders of tickets upon which a Match (WINALL)
symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ area, and a
prize symbol of $1.00 (ONE DOL) appears in three of the
‘‘prize’’ areas, a prize symbol of $5.00 (FIV DOL) appears
in one of the ‘‘prize’’ areas and a prize symbol of $2.00

(TWO DOL) appears in one of the ‘‘prize’’ areas, on a
single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $10.

(r) Holders of tickets upon which a Match (WINALL)
symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ area, and a
prize symbol of $2.00 (TWO DOL) appears in all five of
the ‘‘prize’’ areas, on a single ticket, shall be entitled to a
prize of $10.

(s) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the
‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches the ‘‘WIN-
NING NUMBER’’ play symbol, and a prize symbol of $5.00
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(FIV DOL) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under the match-
ing ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a single ticket,
shall be entitled to a prize of $5.

(t) Holders of tickets upon which a Match (WINALL)
symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ area, and a
prize symbol of $1.00 (ONE DOL) appears in all five of the
‘‘prize’’ areas, on a single ticket, shall be entitled to a
prize of $5.

(u) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the
‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches the ‘‘WIN-
NING NUMBER’’ play symbol, and a prize symbol of $2.00

(TWO DOL) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under the
matching ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a single
ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $2.

(v) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the
‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches the ‘‘WIN-

NING NUMBER’’ play symbol, and a prize symbol of $1.00

(ONE DOL) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under the match-
ing ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a single ticket,
shall be entitled to a prize of $1.

(w) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the
‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches the ‘‘WIN-
NING NUMBER’’ play symbol, and a prize symbol of
FREE (TICKET) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under the
matching ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a single
ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of one Hot Ticket
instant game ticket or one Pennsylvania Lottery instant
game ticket of equivalent sale price which is currently on
sale.

8. Number and description of prizes and approximate
odds: The following table sets forth the approximate
number of winners, amounts of prizes and approximate
odds of winning:

When Any Of YOUR NUMBERS
Match The WINNING NUMBER,
Win Prize Shown Under The
Matching Number.
Win With: Win:

Approximate Odds
Are 1 In:

Approximate No.
Of Winners Per

8,400,000 Tickets:
FREE FREE $1 TICKET 10 840,000
$1 × 2 $2 25 336,000
$2 $2 33.33 252,000
MATCH SYMBOL w/ ($1 × 5) $5 40 210,000
($2 × 2) + $1 $5 1,000 8,400
$5 $5 1,000 8,400
MATCH SYMBOL w/ ($2 × 5) $10 200 42,000
MATCH SYMBOL w/ (($1 × 3) + $5 +
$2)

$10 200 42,000

$5 × 2 $10 1,000 8,400
($2 × 2) + $5 + $1 $10 1,000 8,400
$10 $10 1,000 8,400
MATCH SYMBOL w/ (($5 × 2) +
($2 × 2) + $1)

$15 500 16,800

MATCH SYMBOL w/ (($1 × 3) + $10
+ $2)

$15 500 16,800

$5 × 3 $15 1,000 8,400
($2 × 2) + $10 + $1 $15 1,000 8,400
$15 $15 1,000 8,400
MATCH SYMBOL w/ (($2 × 2) + $10
+ $5 + $1)

$20 3,000 2,800

MATCH SYMBOL w/ (($1 × 3) + $15
+ $2)

$20 3,429 2,450

$5 × 4 $20 12,000 700
$10 × 2 $20 12,000 700
($5 × 2) + $10 $20 12,000 700
$20 $20 24,000 350
MATCH SYMBOL w/ (($10 × 3) +
($5 × 2))

$40 12,000 700

MATCH SYMBOL w/ (($5 × 4) + $20) $40 12,000 700
$10 × 4 $40 120,000 70
$20 × 2 $40 120,000 70
($15 × 2) + ($5 × 2) $40 120,000 70
$40 $40 120,000 70
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When Any Of YOUR NUMBERS
Match The WINNING NUMBER,
Win Prize Shown Under The
Matching Number.
Win With: Win:

Approximate Odds
Are 1 In:

Approximate No.
Of Winners Per

8,400,000 Tickets:
MATCH SYMBOL w/ ($20 × 5) $100 60,000 140
MATCH SYMBOL w/ (($15 × 4) +
$40)

$100 60,000 140

$20 × 5 $100 120,000 70
($20 × 3) + $40 $100 120,000 70
$100 $100 120,000 70
MATCH SYMBOL w/ ($100 × 5) $500 840,000 10
$500 $500 840,000 10
$5,000 $5,000 840,000 10

Reveal a ‘‘Match’’ (WINALL) symbol, win all 5 prizes shown!

Prizes, including top prizes, are subject to availability
at the time of purchase.

9. Retailer incentive awards: The Lottery may conduct
a separate Retailer Incentive Program for retailers who
sell Hot Ticket instant lottery game tickets.

10. Retailer bonus: The Lottery may offer a retailer
bonus in connection with the sale of Pennsylvania instant
lottery game tickets. If a retailer bonus is offered, a
Lottery retailer shall be eligible for a bonus as described
in this section. Lottery retailers who sell a winning ticket
that entitles the ticket holder to a prize, either payable in
a single installment or having a guaranteed minimum
payout, of at least $100,000 and not exceeding $500,000
shall be paid a bonus of $500. Lottery retailers who sell a
winning ticket that entitles the ticket holder to a prize,
either payable in a single installment or having a guaran-
teed minimum payout, of at least $500,001 and not
exceeding $1,000,000 shall be paid a bonus of $5,000.
Lottery retailers who sell a winning ticket that entitles
the ticket holder to a prize, either payable in a single
installment or having a guaranteed minimum payout, of
at least $1,000,001 and not exceeding $10,000,000 shall
be paid a bonus of $10,000. A Lottery retailer is entitled
only to the largest bonus for which they qualify on a
winning ticket. A bonus will be initiated for payment after
the instant ticket is claimed and validated. A bonus will
not be awarded to a Lottery retailer that sells a non-
winning Pennsylvania Lottery instant ticket used to enter
a Pennsylvania Lottery second-chance drawing or promo-
tion that is subsequently selected to win a prize.

11. Unclaimed prize money: For a period of 1 year from
the announced close of Hot Ticket, prize money from
winning Hot Ticket instant lottery game tickets will be
retained by the Secretary for payment to the persons
entitled thereto. If no claim is made within 1 year of the
announced close of the Hot Ticket instant lottery game,
the right of a ticket holder to claim the prize represented
by the ticket, if any, will expire and the prize money will
be paid into the State Lottery Fund and used for
purposes provided for by statute.

12. Governing law: In purchasing a ticket, the cus-
tomer agrees to comply with and abide by the State
Lottery Law (72 P.S. §§ 3761-101—3761-314), 61 Pa. Code
Part V (relating to State Lotteries) and the provisions
contained in this notice.

13. Termination of the game: The Secretary may an-
nounce a termination date, after which no further tickets

from this game may be sold. The announcement will be
disseminated through media used to advertise or promote
Hot Ticket or through normal communications methods.

C. DANIEL HASSELL,
Secretary

[Pa.B. Doc. No. 21-1138. Filed for public inspection July 16, 2021, 9:00 a.m.]

DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE
Pennsylvania On the Money Instant Lottery Game

1532

Under the State Lottery Law (72 P.S. §§ 3761-101—
3761-314) and 61 Pa. Code § 819.203 (relating to notice of
instant game rules), the Secretary of Revenue hereby
provides public notice of the rules for the following
instant lottery game:

1. Name: The name of the game is Pennsylvania On
the Money (hereafter ‘‘On the Money’’). The game number
is PA-1532.

2. Price: The price of an On the Money instant lottery
game ticket is $5.

3. Play symbols: Each On the Money instant lottery
game ticket will contain one play area featuring a
‘‘WINNING NUMBERS’’ area, a ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ area
and a ‘‘MONEY SPOT’’ area. The play symbols and their
captions, located in the ‘‘WINNING NUMBERS’’ area,
are: 1 (ONE), 2 (TWO), 3 (THREE), 4 (FOUR), 5 (FIVE),
6 (SIX), 7 (SEVEN), 8 (EIGHT), 9 (NINE), 10 (TEN), 11
(ELEVN), 12 (TWLV), 13 (THRTN), 14 (FORTN), 15
(FIFTN), 16 (SIXTN), 17 (SVNTN), 18 (EGHTN), 19
(NINTN), 20 (TWENT), 21 (TWYONE), 22 (TWYTWO),
23 (TWYTHR), 24 (TWYFOR), 25 (TWYFIV), 26
(TWYSIX), 27 (TWYSVN), 28 (TWYEGT), 29 (TWYNIN)
and 30 (THIRT). The play symbols and their captions,
located in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ area, are: 1 (ONE), 2
(TWO), 3 (THREE), 4 (FOUR), 5 (FIVE), 6 (SIX), 7
(SEVEN), 8 (EIGHT), 9 (NINE), 10 (TEN), 11 (ELEVN),
12 (TWLV), 13 (THRTN), 14 (FORTN), 15 (FIFTN), 16
(SIXTN), 17 (SVNTN), 18 (EGHTN), 19 (NINTN), 20
(TWENT), 21 (TWYONE), 22 (TWYTWO), 23 (TWYTHR),
24 (TWYFOR), 25 (TWYFIV), 26 (TWYSIX), 27
(TWYSVN), 28 (TWYEGT), 29 (TWYNIN), 30 (THIRT)
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and an ON THE MONEY (MONEY) symbol. The play
symbols and their captions, located in the ‘‘MONEY
SPOT’’ area, are: Gold Bar (TRY AGAIN) symbol,
Moneybag (TRY AGAIN) symbol, Stack of Coins (TRY
AGAIN) symbol, Horseshoe (TRY AGAIN) symbol, Crown
(TRY AGAIN) symbol, Vault (TRY AGAIN) symbol and a
Bullseye (WINALL) symbol.

4. Prize symbols: The prize symbols and their captions,
located in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ area, are: $5.00 (FIV
DOL), $10.00 (TEN DOL), $20.00 (TWENTY), $30.00

(THIRTY), $50.00 (FIFTY), $100 (ONE HUN), $200 (TWO
HUN), $500 (FIV HUN), $1,000 (ONE THO), $5,000 (FIV
THO) and $250,000 (TWHNFYTH).

5. Prizes: The prizes that can be won in this game, are:
$5, $10, $20, $30, $50, $100, $200, $500, $1,000, $5,000
and $250,000. A player can win up to 12 times on a
ticket.

6. Approximate number of tickets printed for the
game: Approximately 12,000,000 tickets will be printed
for the On the Money instant lottery game.

7. Determination of prize winners:

(a) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the
‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches any of the
‘‘WINNING NUMBERS’’ play symbols, and a prize symbol
of $250,000 (TWHNFYTH) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area
under the matching ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on
a single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $250,000.

(b) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the
‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches any of the
‘‘WINNING NUMBERS’’ play symbols, and a prize symbol
of $5,000 (FIV THO) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under
the matching ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a
single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $5,000.

(c) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the ‘‘YOUR
NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches any of the ‘‘WINNING
NUMBERS’’ play symbols, and a prize symbol of $1,000
(ONE THO) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under the match-
ing ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a single ticket,
shall be entitled to a prize of $1,000.

(d) Holders of tickets upon which a Bullseye (WINALL)
symbol appears in the ‘‘MONEY SPOT’’ area, and a prize
symbol of $200 (TWO HUN) appears in four of the ‘‘prize’’
areas, a prize symbol of $30.00 (THIRTY) appears in six of
the ‘‘prize’’ areas and a prize symbol of $10.00 (TEN DOL)
appears in two of the ‘‘prize’’ areas, on a single ticket,
shall be entitled to a prize of $1,000.

(e) Holders of tickets upon which a Bullseye (WINALL)
symbol appears in the ‘‘MONEY SPOT’’ area, and a prize
symbol of $100 (ONE HUN) appears in eight of the
‘‘prize’’ areas and a prize symbol of $50.00 (FIFTY)
appears in four of the ‘‘prize’’ areas, on a single ticket,
shall be entitled to a prize of $1,000.

(f) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the ‘‘YOUR
NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches any of the ‘‘WINNING
NUMBERS’’ play symbols, and a prize symbol of $500
(FIV HUN) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under the match-
ing ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a single ticket,
shall be entitled to a prize of $500.

(g) Holders of tickets upon which an ON THE MONEY
(MONEY) symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’
area, and a prize symbol of $500 (FIV HUN) appears in
the ‘‘prize’’ area under that ON THE MONEY (MONEY)
symbol, on a single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of
$500.

(h) Holders of tickets upon which a Bullseye (WINALL)
symbol appears in the ‘‘MONEY SPOT’’ area, and a prize
symbol of $100 (ONE HUN) appears in three of the
‘‘prize’’ areas, a prize symbol of $50.00 (FIFTY) appears in
two of the ‘‘prize’’ areas, a prize symbol of $20.00

(TWENTY) appears in three of the ‘‘prize’’ areas and a
prize symbol of $10.00 (TEN DOL) appears in four of the
‘‘prize’’ areas, on a single ticket, shall be entitled to a
prize of $500.

(i) Holders of tickets upon which a Bullseye (WINALL)
symbol appears in the ‘‘MONEY SPOT’’ area, and a prize
symbol of $50.00 (FIFTY) appears in six of the ‘‘prize’’
areas, a prize symbol of $20.00 (TWENTY) appears in five
of the ‘‘prize’’ areas and a prize symbol of $100 (ONE
HUN) appears in one of the ‘‘prize’’ areas, on a single
ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $500.

(j) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the ‘‘YOUR
NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches any of the ‘‘WINNING
NUMBERS’’ play symbols, and a prize symbol of $200
(TWO HUN) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under the
matching ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a single
ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $200.

(k) Holders of tickets upon which an ON THE MONEY
(MONEY) symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’
area, and a prize symbol of $200 (TWO HUN) appears in
the ‘‘prize’’ area under that ON THE MONEY (MONEY)
symbol, on a single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of
$200.

(l) Holders of tickets upon which a Bullseye (WINALL)
symbol appears in the ‘‘MONEY SPOT’’ area, and a prize
symbol of $50.00 (FIFTY) appears in two of the ‘‘prize’’
areas and a prize symbol of $10.00 (TEN DOL) appears in
ten of the ‘‘prize’’ areas, on a single ticket, shall be
entitled to a prize of $200.

(m) Holders of tickets upon which a Bullseye
(WINALL) symbol appears in the ‘‘MONEY SPOT’’ area,
and a prize symbol of $20.00 (TWENTY) appears in six of
the ‘‘prize’’ areas, a prize symbol of $10.00 (TEN DOL)
appears in five of the ‘‘prize’’ areas and a prize symbol of
$30.00 (THIRTY) appears in one of the ‘‘prize’’ areas, on a
single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $200.

(n) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the
‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches any of the
‘‘WINNING NUMBERS’’ play symbols, and a prize symbol
of $100 (ONE HUN) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under the
matching ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a single
ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $100.

(o) Holders of tickets upon which an ON THE MONEY
(MONEY) symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’
area, and a prize symbol of $100 (ONE HUN) appears in
the ‘‘prize’’ area under that ON THE MONEY (MONEY)
symbol, on a single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of
$100.

(p) Holders of tickets upon which a Bullseye (WINALL)
symbol appears in the ‘‘MONEY SPOT’’ area, and a prize
symbol of $10.00 (TEN DOL) appears in eight of the
‘‘prize’’ areas and a prize symbol of $5.00 (FIV DOL)
appears in four of the ‘‘prize’’ areas, on a single ticket,
shall be entitled to a prize of $100.

(q) Holders of tickets upon which a Bullseye (WINALL)
symbol appears in the ‘‘MONEY SPOT’’ area, and a prize
symbol of $10.00 (TEN DOL) appears in five of the ‘‘prize’’
areas, a prize symbol of $5.00 (FIV DOL) appears in six of
the ‘‘prize’’ areas and a prize symbol of $20.00 (TWENTY)
appears in one of the ‘‘prize’’ areas, on a single ticket,
shall be entitled to a prize of $100.
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(r) Holders of tickets upon which a Bullseye (WINALL)
symbol appears in the ‘‘MONEY SPOT’’ area, and a prize
symbol of $5.00 (FIV DOL) appears in ten of the ‘‘prize’’
areas, a prize symbol of $30.00 (THIRTY) appears in one
of the ‘‘prize’’ areas and a prize symbol of $20.00

(TWENTY) appears in one of the ‘‘prize’’ areas, on a single
ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $100.

(s) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the
‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches any of the
‘‘WINNING NUMBERS’’ play symbols, and a prize symbol
of $50.00 (FIFTY) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under the
matching ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a single
ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $50.

(t) Holders of tickets upon which an ON THE MONEY
(MONEY) symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’
area, and a prize symbol of $50.00 (FIFTY) appears in the
‘‘prize’’ area under that ON THE MONEY (MONEY)
symbol, on a single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of
$50.

(u) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the
‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches any of the
‘‘WINNING NUMBERS’’ play symbols, and a prize symbol
of $30.00 (THIRTY) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under the
matching ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a single
ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $30.

(v) Holders of tickets upon which an ON THE MONEY
(MONEY) symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’
area, and a prize symbol of $30.00 (THIRTY) appears in
the ‘‘prize’’ area under that ON THE MONEY (MONEY)
symbol, on a single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of
$30.

(w) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the
‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches any of the
‘‘WINNING NUMBERS’’ play symbols, and a prize symbol
of $20.00 (TWENTY) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under the

matching ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a single
ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $20.

(x) Holders of tickets upon which an ON THE MONEY
(MONEY) symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’
area, and a prize symbol of $20.00 (TWENTY) appears in
the ‘‘prize’’ area under that ON THE MONEY (MONEY)
symbol, on a single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of
$20.

(y) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the
‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches any of the
‘‘WINNING NUMBERS’’ play symbols, and a prize symbol
of $10.00 (TEN DOL) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under
the matching ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a
single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $10.

(z) Holders of tickets upon which an ON THE MONEY
(MONEY) symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’
area, and a prize symbol of $10.00 (TEN DOL) appears in
the ‘‘prize’’ area under that ON THE MONEY (MONEY)
symbol, on a single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of
$10.

(aa) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the
‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches any of the
‘‘WINNING NUMBERS’’ play symbols, and a prize symbol
of $5.00 (FIV DOL) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under the
matching ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a single
ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $5.

(bb) Holders of tickets upon which an ON THE
MONEY (MONEY) symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUM-
BERS’’ area, and a prize symbol of $5.00 (FIV DOL)
appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under that ON THE MONEY
(MONEY) symbol, on a single ticket, shall be entitled to a
prize of $5.

8. Number and description of prizes and approximate
odds: The following table sets forth the approximate
number of winners, amounts of prizes and approximate
odds of winning:

When Any Of YOUR
NUMBERS Match Any
WINNING NUMBER,
Win Prize Shown Under The
Matching Number.
Win With: MONEY SPOT: Win:

Approximate Odds
Are 1 In:

Approximate No.
Of Winners Per

12,000,000 Tickets:
$5 w/ ON THE MONEY $5 20 600,000
$5 $5 20 600,000
$5 × 2 $10 60 200,000
$10 w/ ON THE MONEY $10 20 600,000
$10 $10 60 200,000
$5 × 4 $20 300 40,000
$10 × 2 $20 300 40,000
(($5 w/ ON THE MONEY) × 2)
+ ($5 × 2)

$20 120 100,000

($10 w/ ON THE MONEY) × 2 $20 100 120,000
$20 w/ ON THE MONEY $20 85.71 140,000
$20 $20 300 40,000
$5 × 6 $30 600 20,000
($20 w/ ON THE MONEY) +
($5 × 2)

$30 300 40,000

$30 w/ ON THE MONEY $30 120 100,000
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When Any Of YOUR
NUMBERS Match Any
WINNING NUMBER,
Win Prize Shown Under The
Matching Number.
Win With: MONEY SPOT: Win:

Approximate Odds
Are 1 In:

Approximate No.
Of Winners Per

12,000,000 Tickets:
$30 $30 600 20,000
$10 × 5 $50 600 20,000
$30 + $20 $50 600 20,000
($5 w/ ON THE MONEY) × 10 $50 600 20,000
$50 w/ ON THE MONEY $50 600 20,000
$50 $50 600 20,000

BULLSEYE w/
(($5 × 10) + $30 +

$20)

$100 2,000 6,000

BULLSEYE w/
(($10 × 5) + ($5 × 6)

+ $20)

$100 2,182 5,500

BULLSEYE w/
(($10 × 8) + ($5 ×

4))

$100 2,182 5,500

$20 × 5 $100 120,000 100
$50 × 2 $100 120,000 100
(($10 w/ ON THE MONEY) × 5)
+ ($10 × 5)

$100 60,000 200

($10 w/ ON THE MONEY) × 10 $100 60,000 200
$100 w/ ON THE MONEY $100 60,000 200
$100 $100 120,000 100

BULLSEYE w/
(($20 × 6) + ($10 ×

5) + $30)

$200 4,000 3,000

BULLSEYE w/
(($50 × 2) + ($10 ×

10))

$200 4,000 3,000

$100 × 2 $200 24,000 500
$200 w/ ON THE MONEY $200 12,000 1,000
$200 $200 24,000 500

BULLSEYE w/
(($50 × 6) +

($20 × 5) + $100)

$500 24,000 500

BULLSEYE w/
(($100 × 3) +

($50 × 2) + ($20 × 3)
+ ($10 × 4))

$500 24,000 500

$100 × 5 $500 120,000 100
($50 w/ ON THE MONEY) × 10 $500 120,000 100
$500 w/ ON THE MONEY $500 120,000 100
$500 $500 120,000 100

BULLSEYE w/
(($100 × 8) +

($50 × 4))

$1,000 1,200,000 10

BULLSEYE w/
(($200 × 4) +

($30 × 6) + ($10 ×
2))

$1,000 1,200,000 10

NOTICES 3943

PENNSYLVANIA BULLETIN, VOL. 51, NO. 29, JULY 17, 2021



When Any Of YOUR
NUMBERS Match Any
WINNING NUMBER,
Win Prize Shown Under The
Matching Number.
Win With: MONEY SPOT: Win:

Approximate Odds
Are 1 In:

Approximate No.
Of Winners Per

12,000,000 Tickets:
$100 × 10 $1,000 1,200,000 10
$1,000 $1,000 1,200,000 10
$500 × 10 $5,000 1,200,000 10
$5,000 $5,000 1,200,000 10
$250,000 $250,000 1,200,000 10

Reveal an ‘‘ON THE MONEY’’ (MONEY) symbol, win prize shown under that symbol automatically.
Reveal a ‘‘BULLSEYE’’ (WINALL) symbol in the MONEY SPOT area, win all 12 prizes shown!

Prizes, including top prizes, are subject to availability
at the time of purchase.

9. Retailer incentive awards: The Lottery may conduct
a separate Retailer Incentive Program for retailers who
sell On the Money instant lottery game tickets.

10. Retailer bonus: The Lottery may offer a retailer
bonus in connection with the sale of Pennsylvania instant
lottery game tickets. If a retailer bonus is offered, a
Lottery retailer shall be eligible for a bonus as described
in this section. Lottery retailers who sell a winning ticket
that entitles the ticket holder to a prize, either payable in
a single installment or having a guaranteed minimum
payout, of at least $100,000 and not exceeding $500,000
shall be paid a bonus of $500. Lottery retailers who sell a
winning ticket that entitles the ticket holder to a prize,
either payable in a single installment or having a guaran-
teed minimum payout, of at least $500,001 and not
exceeding $1,000,000 shall be paid a bonus of $5,000.
Lottery retailers who sell a winning ticket that entitles
the ticket holder to a prize, either payable in a single
installment or having a guaranteed minimum payout, of
at least $1,000,001 and not exceeding $10,000,000 shall
be paid a bonus of $10,000. A Lottery retailer is entitled
only to the largest bonus for which they qualify on a
winning ticket. A bonus will be initiated for payment after
the instant ticket is claimed and validated. A bonus will
not be awarded to a Lottery retailer that sells a non-
winning Pennsylvania Lottery instant ticket used to enter
a Pennsylvania Lottery second-chance drawing or promo-
tion that is subsequently selected to win a prize.

11. Unclaimed prize money: For a period of 1 year from
the announced close of On the Money, prize money from
winning On the Money instant lottery game tickets will
be retained by the Secretary for payment to the persons
entitled thereto. If no claim is made within 1 year of the
announced close of the On the Money instant lottery
game, the right of a ticket holder to claim the prize
represented by the ticket, if any, will expire and the prize
money will be paid into the State Lottery Fund and used
for purposes provided for by statute.

12. Governing law: In purchasing a ticket, the cus-
tomer agrees to comply with and abide by the State
Lottery Law (72 P.S. §§ 3761-101—3761-314), 61 Pa. Code
Part V (relating to State Lotteries) and the provisions
contained in this notice.

13. Termination of the game: The Secretary may an-
nounce a termination date, after which no further tickets
from this game may be sold. The announcement will be

disseminated through media used to advertise or promote
On the Money or through normal communications
methods.

C. DANIEL HASSELL,
Secretary

[Pa.B. Doc. No. 21-1139. Filed for public inspection July 16, 2021, 9:00 a.m.]

DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE
Pennsylvania Show Me $500,000 Instant Lottery

Game 1531

Under the State Lottery Law (72 P.S. §§ 3761-101—
3761-314) and 61 Pa. Code § 819.203 (relating to notice of
instant game rules), the Secretary of Revenue hereby
provides public notice of the rules for the following
instant lottery game:

1. Name: The name of the game is Pennsylvania Show
Me $500,000 (hereafter ‘‘Show Me $500,000’’). The game
number is PA-1531.

2. Price: The price of a Show Me $500,000 instant
lottery game ticket is $10.

3. Play symbols: Each Show Me $500,000 instant lot-
tery game ticket will contain one play area featuring a
‘‘WINNING NUMBERS’’ area and a ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’
area. The play symbols and their captions, located in the
‘‘WINNING NUMBERS’’ area, are: 1 (ONE), 2 (TWO), 3
(THREE), 4 (FOUR), 6 (SIX), 7 (SEVEN), 8 (EIGHT), 9
(NINE), 10 (TEN), 11 (ELEVN), 12 (TWLV), 13 (THRTN),
14 (FORTN), 15 (FIFTN), 16 (SIXTN), 17 (SVNTN), 18
(EGHTN), 19 (NINTN), 20 (TWENT), 21 (TWYONE), 22
(TWYTWO), 23 (TWYTHR), 24 (TWYFOR), 25 (TWYFIV),
26 (TWYSIX), 27 (TWYSVN), 28 (TWYEGT), 29
(TWYNIN), 30 (THIRT), 31 (THYONE), 32 (THYTWO),
33 (THYTHR), 34 (THYFOR), 35 (THYFIV), 36 (THYSIX),
37 (THYSVN), 38 (THYEGT), 39 (THYNIN) and 40
(FORT). The play symbols and their captions, located in
the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ area, are: 1 (ONE), 2 (TWO), 3
(THREE), 4 (FOUR), 6 (SIX), 7 (SEVEN), 8 (EIGHT), 9
(NINE), 10 (TEN), 11 (ELEVN), 12 (TWLV), 13 (THRTN),
14 (FORTN), 15 (FIFTN), 16 (SIXTN), 17 (SVNTN), 18
(EGHTN), 19 (NINTN), 20 (TWENT), 21 (TWYONE), 22
(TWYTWO), 23 (TWYTHR), 24 (TWYFOR), 25 (TWYFIV),
26 (TWYSIX), 27 (TWYSVN), 28 (TWYEGT), 29
(TWYNIN), 30 (THIRT), 31 (THYONE), 32 (THYTWO),
33 (THYTHR), 34 (THYFOR), 35 (THYFIV), 36 (THYSIX),
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37 (THYSVN), 38 (THYEGT), 39 (THYNIN), 40 (FORT),
5X (5TIMES) symbol, Fistful of Cash (WINALL) symbol
and a SHOW ME ($500K) symbol.

4. Prize Symbols: The prize symbols and their cap-
tions, located in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ area, are: $10.00

(TEN DOL), $20.00 (TWENTY), $30.00 (THIRTY), $50.00

(FIFTY), $100 (ONE HUN), $200 (TWO HUN), $500 (FIV
HUN), $1,000 (ONE THO), $10,000 (TEN THO) and
$500,000 (FIVHUNTHO).

5. Prizes: The prizes that can be won in this game, are:
$10, $20, $30, $50, $100, $200, $500, $1,000, $10,000 and
$500,000. Show Me $500,000 contains a feature that can
multiply the prize won. For a complete list of prizes, and
how those prizes can be won, see section 8 (relating to
Number and description of prizes and approximate odds).
A player can win up to 15 times on a ticket.

6. Approximate number of tickets printed for the
game: Approximately 13,200,000 tickets will be printed
for the Show Me $500,000 instant lottery game.

7. Determination of prize winners:

(a) Holders of tickets upon which a SHOW ME ($500K)
symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ area, and a
prize symbol of $500,000 (FIVHUNTHO) appears in the
‘‘prize’’ area under that SHOW ME ($500K) symbol, on a
single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $500,000.

(b) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the
‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches any of the
‘‘WINNING NUMBERS’’ play symbols, and a prize symbol
of $10,000 (TEN THO) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under
the matching ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a
single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $10,000.

(c) Holders of tickets upon which a 5X (5TIMES)
symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ area, and a
prize symbol of $500 (FIV HUN) appears in the ‘‘prize’’
area under that 5X (5TIMES) symbol, on a single ticket,
shall be entitled to a prize of $2,500.

(d) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the
‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches any of the
‘‘WINNING NUMBERS’’ play symbols, and a prize symbol
of $1,000 (ONE THO) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under
the matching ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a
single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $1,000.

(e) Holders of tickets upon which a 5X (5TIMES)
symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ area, and a
prize symbol of $200 (TWO HUN) appears in the ‘‘prize’’
area under that 5X (5TIMES) symbol, on a single ticket,
shall be entitled to a prize of $1,000.

(f) Holders of tickets upon which a Fistful of Cash
(WINALL) symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’
area, and a prize symbol of $200 (TWO HUN) appears in
two of the ‘‘prize’’ areas, a prize symbol of $100 (ONE
HUN) appears in three of the ‘‘prize’’ areas and a prize
symbol of $30.00 (THIRTY) appears in ten of the ‘‘prize’’
areas, on a single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of
$1,000.

(g) Holders of tickets upon which a Fistful of Cash
(WINALL) symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’
area, and a prize symbol of $100 (ONE HUN) appears in
five of the ‘‘prize’’ areas and a prize symbol of $50.00

(FIFTY) appears in ten of the ‘‘prize’’ areas, on a single
ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $1,000.

(h) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the
‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches any of the
‘‘WINNING NUMBERS’’ play symbols, and a prize symbol
of $500 (FIV HUN) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under the

matching ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a single
ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $500.

(i) Holders of tickets upon which a 5X (5TIMES)
symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ area and a
prize symbol of $100 (ONE HUN) appears in the ‘‘prize’’
area under that 5X (5TIMES) symbol, on a single ticket,
shall be entitled to a prize of $500.

(j) Holders of tickets upon which a Fistful of Cash
(WINALL) symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’
area, and a prize symbol of $100 (ONE HUN) appears in
two of the ‘‘prize’’ areas, a prize symbol of $20.00

(TWENTY) appears in 11 of the ‘‘prize’’ areas, a prize
symbol of $50.00 (FIFTY) appears in one of the ‘‘prize’’
areas and a prize symbol of $30.00 (THIRTY) appears in
one of the ‘‘prize’’ areas, on a single ticket, shall be
entitled to a prize of $500.

(k) Holders of tickets upon which a Fistful of Cash
(WINALL) symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’
area, and a prize symbol of $50.00 (FIFTY) appears in five
of the ‘‘prize’’ areas, a prize symbol of $30.00 (THIRTY)
appears in five of the ‘‘prize’’ areas and a prize symbol of
$20.00 (TWENTY) appears in five of the ‘‘prize’’ areas, on
a single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $500.

(l) Holders of tickets upon which a 5X (5TIMES)
symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ area and a
prize symbol of $50.00 (FIFTY) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area
under that 5X (5TIMES) symbol, on a single ticket, shall
be entitled to a prize of $250.

(m) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the
‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches any of the
‘‘WINNING NUMBERS’’ play symbols, and a prize symbol
of $200 (TWO HUN) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under
the matching ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a
single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $200.

(n) Holders of tickets upon which a Fistful of Cash
(WINALL) symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’
area, and a prize symbol of $20.00 (TWENTY) appears in
five of the ‘‘prize’’ areas and a prize symbol of $10.00 (TEN
DOL) appears in ten of the ‘‘prize’’ areas, on a single
ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $200.

(o) Holders of tickets upon which a 5X (5TIMES)
symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ area and a
prize symbol of $30.00 (THIRTY) appears in the ‘‘prize’’
area under that 5X (5TIMES) symbol, on a single ticket,
shall be entitled to a prize of $150.

(p) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the
‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches any of the
‘‘WINNING NUMBERS’’ play symbols, and a prize symbol
of $100 (ONE HUN) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under the
matching ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a single
ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $100.

(q) Holders of tickets upon which a 5X (5TIMES)
symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ area and a
prize symbol of $20.00 (TWENTY) appears in the ‘‘prize’’
area under that 5X (5TIMES) symbol, on a single ticket,
shall be entitled to a prize of $100.

(r) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the ‘‘YOUR
NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches any of the ‘‘WINNING
NUMBERS’’ play symbols, and a prize symbol of $50.00

(FIFTY) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under the matching
‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a single ticket, shall
be entitled to a prize of $50.

(s) Holders of tickets upon which a 5X (5TIMES)
symbol appears in the ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ area and a
prize symbol of $10.00 (TEN DOL) appears in the ‘‘prize’’
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area under that 5X (5TIMES) symbol, on a single ticket,
shall be entitled to a prize of $50.

(t) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the ‘‘YOUR
NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches any of the ‘‘WINNING
NUMBERS’’ play symbols, and a prize symbol of $30.00

(THIRTY) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under the matching
‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a single ticket, shall
be entitled to a prize of $30.

(u) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the
‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches any of the
‘‘WINNING NUMBERS’’ play symbols, and a prize symbol
of $20.00 (TWENTY) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under the

matching ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a single
ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $20.

(v) Holders of tickets upon which any one of the
‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbols matches any of the
‘‘WINNING NUMBERS’’ play symbols, and a prize symbol
of $10.00 (TEN DOL) appears in the ‘‘prize’’ area under
the matching ‘‘YOUR NUMBERS’’ play symbol, on a
single ticket, shall be entitled to a prize of $10.

8. Number and description of prizes and approximate
odds: The following table sets forth the approximate
number of winners, amounts of prizes and approximate
odds of winning:

When Any Of YOUR NUMBERS
Match Any WINNING NUMBER,
Win Prize Shown Under The
Matching Number.
Win With: Win:

Approximate Odds
Are 1 In:

Approximate No.
Of Winners Per

13,200,000 Tickets:
$10 $10 8.57 1,540,000
$10 × 2 $20 30 440,000
$20 $20 26.09 506,000
$10 × 3 $30 100 132,000
$20 + $10 $30 120 110,000
$30 $30 50 264,000
$10 × 5 $50 600 22,000
($10 × 2) + $30 $50 600 22,000
$30 + $20 $50 600 22,000
$10 w/ 5X $50 46.15 286,000
$50 $50 600 22,000
$10 × 10 $100 600 22,000
($10 w/ 5X) + ($10 × 5) $100 600 22,000
($10 w/ 5X) × 2 $100 600 22,000
$20 w/ 5X $100 300 44,000
$100 $100 600 22,000
FISTFUL OF CASH w/ (($20 × 5) +
($10 × 10))

$200 600 22,000

$20 × 10 $200 24,000 550
(($10 w/ 5X) × 2) + ($10 × 10) $200 12,000 1,100
($30 w/ 5X) + ($10 × 5) $200 12,000 1,100
($20 w/ 5X) × 2 $200 6,000 2,200
$200 $200 24,000 550
FISTFUL OF CASH w/ (($50 × 5) +
($30 × 5) + ($20 × 5))

$500 6,000 2,200

FISTFUL OF CASH w/ (($100 × 2) +
($20 × 11) + $50 + $30)

$500 6,000 2,200

$100 × 5 $500 60,000 220
($10 w/ 5X) × 10 $500 60,000 220
($50 w/ 5X) × 2 $500 40,000 330
$100 w/ 5X $500 24,000 550
$500 $500 60,000 220
FISTFUL OF CASH w/ (($100 × 5) +
($50 × 10))

$1,000 24,000 550

FISTFUL OF CASH w/ (($200 × 2) +
($100 × 3) + ($30 × 10))

$1,000 24,000 550

3946 NOTICES

PENNSYLVANIA BULLETIN, VOL. 51, NO. 29, JULY 17, 2021



When Any Of YOUR NUMBERS
Match Any WINNING NUMBER,
Win Prize Shown Under The
Matching Number.
Win With: Win:

Approximate Odds
Are 1 In:

Approximate No.
Of Winners Per

13,200,000 Tickets:
$100 × 10 $1,000 120,000 110
($20 w/ 5X) × 10 $1,000 120,000 110
$200 w/ 5X $1,000 120,000 110
$1,000 $1,000 120,000 110
($500 w/ 5X) × 4 $10,000 1,320,000 10
$10,000 $10,000 1,320,000 10
$500,000 w/ SHOW ME $500,000 1,320,000 10

Reveal a ‘‘5X’’ (5TIMES) symbol, win 5 TIMES the prize shown under that symbol.
Reveal a ‘‘Fistful of Cash’’ (WINALL) symbol, win all 15 prizes shown.
Reveal a ‘‘SHOW ME’’ ($500K) symbol, win $500,000 instantly!

Prizes, including top prizes, are subject to availability
at the time of purchase.

9. Retailer incentive awards: The Lottery may conduct
a separate Retailer Incentive Program for retailers who
sell Show Me $500,000 instant lottery game tickets.

10. Retailer bonus: The Lottery may offer a retailer
bonus in connection with the sale of Pennsylvania instant
lottery game tickets. If a retailer bonus is offered, a
Lottery retailer shall be eligible for a bonus as described
in this section. Lottery retailers who sell a winning ticket
that entitles the ticket holder to a prize, either payable in
a single installment or having a guaranteed minimum
payout, of at least $100,000 and not exceeding $500,000
shall be paid a bonus of $500. Lottery retailers who sell a
winning ticket that entitles the ticket holder to a prize,
either payable in a single installment or having a guaran-
teed minimum payout, of at least $500,001 and not
exceeding $1,000,000 shall be paid a bonus of $5,000.
Lottery retailers who sell a winning ticket that entitles
the ticket holder to a prize, either payable in a single
installment or having a guaranteed minimum payout, of
at least $1,000,001 and not exceeding $10,000,000 shall
be paid a bonus of $10,000. A Lottery retailer is entitled
only to the largest bonus for which they qualify on a
winning ticket. A bonus will be initiated for payment after
the instant ticket is claimed and validated. A bonus will
not be awarded to a Lottery retailer that sells a non-
winning Pennsylvania Lottery instant ticket used to enter
a Pennsylvania Lottery second-chance drawing or promo-
tion that is subsequently selected to win a prize.

11. Unclaimed prize money: For a period of 1 year from
the announced close of Show Me $500,000, prize money
from winning Show Me $500,000 instant lottery game
tickets will be retained by the Secretary for payment to
the persons entitled thereto. If no claim is made within
1 year of the announced close of the Show Me $500,000
instant lottery game, the right of a ticket holder to claim
the prize represented by the ticket, if any, will expire and
the prize money will be paid into the State Lottery Fund
and used for purposes provided for by statute.

12. Governing law: In purchasing a ticket, the cus-
tomer agrees to comply with and abide by the State
Lottery Law (72 P.S. §§ 3761-101—3761-314), 61 Pa. Code
Part V (relating to State Lotteries) and the provisions
contained in this notice.

13. Termination of the game: The Secretary may an-
nounce a termination date, after which no further tickets
from this game may be sold. The announcement will be
disseminated through media used to advertise or promote
Show Me $500,000 or through normal communications
methods.

C. DANIEL HASSELL,
Secretary

[Pa.B. Doc. No. 21-1140. Filed for public inspection July 16, 2021, 9:00 a.m.]

DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE
Realty Transfer Tax; 2020 Common Level Ratio;

Real Estate Valuation Factors

The following real estate valuation factors are based on
sales data compiled by the State Tax Equalization Board
in 2020. These factors are the mathematical reciprocals of
the actual common level ratio (CLR). For Pennsylvania
Realty Transfer Tax purposes, these factors are applicable
for documents accepted from July 1, 2021, to June 30,
2022. The date of acceptance of a document is rebuttably
presumed to be its date of execution, that is, the date
specified in the body of the document as the date of the
instrument (61 Pa. Code § 91.102 (relating to acceptance
of documents)).

County CLR Factor
Adams 1.04
Allegheny 1.23
Armstrong 2.54
Beaver 6.06
Bedford 1.31
Berks 1.92
Blair 1.07
Bradford 3.80
Bucks 12.05
Butler 12.66
Cambria 5.68

NOTICES 3947

PENNSYLVANIA BULLETIN, VOL. 51, NO. 29, JULY 17, 2021



County CLR Factor
Cameron 3.38
Carbon 3.33
Centre 4.29
Chester 2.22
Clarion 2.98
Clearfield 8.70
Clinton 1.36
Columbia 5.18
Crawford 4.13
Cumberland 1.14
Dauphin 1.69
Delaware 1.00
Elk 3.68
Erie 1.23
Fayette 1.79
Forest 6.76
Franklin 9.43
Fulton 3.29
Greene 2.04
Huntingdon 5.71
Indiana 1.02
Jefferson 3.13
Juniata 9.09
Lackawanna 10.87
Lancaster 1.28
Lawrence 1.45
Lebanon 1.22
Lehigh 1.38
Luzerne 1.12
Lycoming 1.64
McKean 1.24
Mercer 6.49
Mifflin 3.28
Monroe 1.31
Montgomery 2.24
Montour 1.64
Northampton 4.00
Northumberland 7.14
Perry 1.21
Philadelphia 1.07
Pike 6.71
Potter 4.22
Schuylkill 3.12
Snyder 7.52
Somerset 3.68
Sullivan 1.71
Susquehanna 3.95
Tioga 1.72

County CLR Factor
Union 1.60
Venango 1.37
Warren 4.83
Washington 1.15
Wayne 1.39
Westmoreland 8.13
Wyoming 6.37
York 1.32

C. DANIEL HASSELL,
Secretary

[Pa.B. Doc. No. 21-1141. Filed for public inspection July 16, 2021, 9:00 a.m.]

DEPARTMENT OF STATE
Election for the Office of Judge of the Philadelphia

Municipal Court

On June 9, 2021, the Acting Secretary of the Common-
wealth (Acting Secretary) received written notice that
Judge Gerard A. Kosinski has revoked his declaration of
candidacy for retention as a judge of the Philadelphia
Municipal Court. Under the Constitution and laws of the
Commonwealth, an election for the judicial office held by
Judge Kosinski will occur as part of the municipal
election to be held November 2, 2021.

In the Municipal Election, the electors of Philadelphia
County will elect four judges of the Philadelphia Munici-
pal Court. Each elector will be entitled to vote for up to
four candidates, with the four candidates receiving the
largest number of valid votes being elected.

In the Municipal Primary held May 18, 2021, the
electors of the Democratic Party and the Republican
Party each nominated three candidates for the office of
judge of the Philadelphia Municipal Court. By law, each
of the certified Statewide political parties of the Common-
wealth—the Democratic Party, the Republican Party, the
Libertarian Party and the Green Party—will be permitted
to nominate one additional candidate for the Philadelphia
Municipal Court by submitting to the Acting Secretary, no
later than September 13, 2021, a nomination certificate in
the form prescribed by law and prepared in accordance
with the applicable rules of the political party. See 25 P.S.
§§ 2938.3, 2953 and 2954. Political bodies will be permit-
ted to nominate a candidate by filing with the Acting
Secretary, no later than September 13, 2021, nomination
papers prepared and submitted in accordance with the
requirements of the Pennsylvania Election Code (25 P.S.
§§ 2600—3591).

Additional information is available on the Department
of State’s publicly accessible web site at www.dos.pa.gov.

VERONICA DEGRAFFENREID,
Acting Secretary

[Pa.B. Doc. No. 21-1142. Filed for public inspection July 16, 2021, 9:00 a.m.]
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FISH AND BOAT COMMISSION
Temporary Change to Fishing Regulations; Rac-

coon Creek State Park Upper Pond (Group
Camping Area Lake), Beaver County

The Executive Director of the Fish and Boat Commis-
sion, acting under the authority of 58 Pa. Code § 65.25
(relating to temporary changes to fishing regulations), has
taken immediate action to modify temporary fishing
regulations at Raccoon Creek State Park Upper Pond
(Group Camping Area Lake), Beaver County, in anticipa-
tion of a complete and permanent drawdown of the lake.
The Executive Director is lifting all seasons, sizes and
creel limits for all species, effective July 17, 2021. The

Executive Director has found that this action is necessary
and appropriate for the management of fish and to
conserve and preserve fishing opportunities at this lake.

The Executive Director will cause these temporary
modifications to fishing regulations to be posted in the
vicinity of the lake, and the modified regulations will be
fully effective and enforceable when posted. These tempo-
rary modifications will remain in effect until further
notice.

TIMOTHY D. SCHAEFFER,
Executive Director

[Pa.B. Doc. No. 21-1143. Filed for public inspection July 16, 2021, 9:00 a.m.]

INDEPENDENT REGULATORY REVIEW COMMISSION
Notice of Filing of Final Rulemakings

The Independent Regulatory Review Commission (Commission) received the following regulations. They are scheduled
to be considered on the dates noted. The Commission’s public meetings are held at 333 Market Street, 14th Floor,
Harrisburg, PA at 10 a.m. To obtain a copy of the regulations, interested parties should first contact the promulgating
agency. If a copy cannot be obtained from the promulgating agency, the Commission will provide a copy or it can be
viewed on the Commission’s web site at www.irrc.state.pa.us.

Final-Form
Reg. No. Agency/Title Received Public Meeting
125-234 Pennsylvania Gaming Control Board

Sports Wagering
5/26/21 7/15/21

54-90 Pennsylvania Liquor Control Board
Responsible Alcohol Management Program

6/9/21 7/15/21

54-102 Pennsylvania Liquor Control Board
Purchases, Sales and Returns; General

Provisions

6/25/21 9/1/21

Final-Omit
Reg. No. Agency/Title Resubmitted Public Meeting
74-4 Department of Drug and Alcohol Programs

Standards for Drug and Alcohol Recovery House
Licensure

6/14/21 7/15/21

GEORGE D. BEDWICK,
Chairperson

[Pa.B. Doc. No. 21-1144. Filed for public inspection July 16, 2021, 9:00 a.m.]

INSURANCE DEPARTMENT
Application for Approval to Reinsure the Entire

Book of Business of a Domestic Fraternal Ben-
efit Society and Subsequent Voluntary Surrender
of Pennsylvania Certificate of Authority

National Council of the Junior Order of United Ameri-
can Mechanics of the United States of North America, a
fraternal benefit society organized under the laws of the
Commonwealth, has submitted an application for approval
to: (1) reinsure its entire schedule of policies with GBU
Financial Life, also a fraternal benefit society organized
under the laws of the Commonwealth; and (2) subse-
quently voluntarily surrender its certificate of authority to
do the business of insurance in this Commonwealth. The
filing was submitted under section 2424 of The Insurance
Company Law of 1921 (40 P.S. § 991.2424).

Persons wishing to comment on the transaction are
invited to submit a written statement to the Insurance
Department (Department) within 30 days of publication
of this notice in the Pennsylvania Bulletin. Each written
statement must include the name, address and telephone
number of the interested party; identification of the
application to which the statement is addressed; and a
concise statement with sufficient detail and relevant facts
to inform the Department of the exact basis of the
statement. Written statements must be e-mailed to Lori
Bercher at lbercher@pa.gov.

JESSICA K. ALTMAN,
Insurance Commissioner

[Pa.B. Doc. No. 21-1145. Filed for public inspection July 16, 2021, 9:00 a.m.]
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INSURANCE DEPARTMENT
Genworth Life Insurance Company Rate Increase

Filing for AARP LTC Forms 7044 and 744 Rev
(GEFA-132882395); Rate Filing

Genworth Life Insurance Company is requesting ap-
proval to increase the premium 52.6% on 732 policyhold-
ers with the following individual LTC policy form num-
bers: 7044 and 744 Rev (also called CHOICE 2 and 2.1).

These policies were sold to AARP members in the
Commonwealth. AARP policies are subject to a special
contractual agreement with AARP governing rate in-
creases; consequently, these policies are filed separately
from non-AARP policies.

Unless formal administrative action is taken prior to
September 30, 2021, the subject filing may be deemed
approved by operation of law.

A copy of the filing is available on the Insurance
Department’s web site at www.insurance.pa.gov (hover
the cursor over the ‘‘Consumers’’ tab, then select ‘‘Pending
Long Term Care Rate Filings’’).

Interested parties are invited to submit written com-
ments, suggestions or objections to James Laverty, Actu-
ary, Insurance Department, Insurance Product Regula-
tion, Room 1311, Strawberry Square, Harrisburg, PA
17120, jlaverty@pa.gov within 30 days after publication of
this notice in the Pennsylvania Bulletin.

JESSICA K. ALTMAN,
Insurance Commissioner

[Pa.B. Doc. No. 21-1146. Filed for public inspection July 16, 2021, 9:00 a.m.]

INSURANCE DEPARTMENT
Genworth Life Insurance Company Rate Increase

Filing for Non-AARP LTC Forms 7044 and 744
Rev (GEFA-132882371); Rate Filing

Genworth Life Insurance Company is requesting ap-
proval to increase the premium 54.3% on 13,687 policy-
holders with the following individual LTC policy form
numbers: 7044 and 744 Rev (also called CHOICE 2 and
2.1).

These policies were not sold to AARP members in the
Commonwealth. AARP policies are subject to a special
contractual agreement with AARP governing rate in-
creases; consequently, these policies are filed separately
from AARP policies.

Unless formal administrative action is taken prior to
September 30, 2021, the subject filing may be deemed
approved by operation of law.

A copy of the filing is available on the Insurance
Department’s web site at www.insurance.pa.gov (hover
the cursor over the ‘‘Consumers’’ tab, then select ‘‘Pending
Long Term Care Rate Filings’’).

Interested parties are invited to submit written com-
ments, suggestions or objections to James Laverty, Actu-
ary, Insurance Department, Insurance Product Regula-

tion, Room 1311, Strawberry Square, Harrisburg, PA
17120, jlaverty@pa.gov within 30 days after publication of
this notice in the Pennsylvania Bulletin.

JESSICA K. ALTMAN,
Insurance Commissioner

[Pa.B. Doc. No. 21-1147. Filed for public inspection July 16, 2021, 9:00 a.m.]

LEGISLATIVE REFERENCE
BUREAU

Documents Filed But Not Published

The Legislative Reference Bureau (Bureau) accepted
the following document during the preceding calendar
month for filing without publication under 1 Pa. Code
§ 3.13(b) (relating to contents of Bulletin). The Bureau
will continue to publish on a monthly basis either a
summary table identifying the documents accepted during
the preceding calendar month under this subsection or a
statement that no documents have been received. For
questions concerning or copies of documents filed, but not
published, call (717) 783-1530.

Governor’s Office

Administrative Circular No. 21-10—Accounting for
COVID-19 Related Activity in SAP, Dated June 24, 2021.

AMY J. MENDELSOHN,
Director

Pennsylvania Code and Bulletin
[Pa.B. Doc. No. 21-1148. Filed for public inspection July 16, 2021, 9:00 a.m.]

MILK MARKETING BOARD
Hearing and Presubmission Schedule for All Milk

Marketing Areas; Over-Order Premium

Under the provisions of the Milk Marketing Law
(31 P.S. §§ 700j-101—700j-1302), the Milk Marketing
Board (Board) will conduct a public hearing for Milk
Marketing Areas 1—6 on September 1, 2021, at 10 a.m.
in Room 309 of the Agriculture Building, 2301 North
Cameron Street, Harrisburg, PA.

The purpose of the hearing is to receive testimony and
exhibits concerning the level and duration of the Class I
over-order premium.

The staff of the Board is deemed to be a party to this
hearing, and the attorney representing staff is deemed
to have entered his appearance. Other persons who wish
to present evidence may be included on the Board’s list
of parties by: (1) having their attorney file with the Board
on or before 12 p.m. on July 30, 2021, a notice
of appearance substantially in the form prescribed by
1 Pa. Code § 31.25 (relating to form of notice of appear-
ance); or (2) if unrepresented by counsel, filing with the
Board on or before 12 p.m. on July 30, 2021, notification
of their desire to be included as a party. Parties should
indicate in their notices of appearance if alternate means
of service, that is, e-mail or fax, are acceptable. Notices of
appearance should be filed electronically and be directed
to deberly@pa.gov.
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The parties shall observe the following requirements for
advance filing of witness information and exhibits. The
Board may exclude witnesses or exhibits of a party that
fails to comply with these requirements. Copies of the
filings will be available on the Board web site at http://
www.mmb.pa.gov/Public%20Hearings/.

1. By 2 p.m. on August 6, 2021, the petitioner shall file
with the Board, in person or by mail, one original and
five copies and ensure receipt by all other parties of one
copy of:

a. A list of witnesses who will testify for the petitioner,
along with a statement of the subjects concerning which
each witness will testify. A witness who will be offered as
an expert shall be so identified, along with the witness’s
area or areas of proposed expertise. For expert witnesses
there shall also be filed a written report or written
testimony explaining the substance of the facts and
opinions to which the expert is expected to testify and a
summary of the grounds for each opinion.

b. Each exhibit to be presented, including testimony to
be offered in written form.

2. By 2 p.m. on August 19, 2021, each responding party
shall file and serve as set forth in paragraph 1 informa-
tion concerning rebuttal witnesses and copies of rebuttal
exhibits.

3. By 2 p.m. on August 26, 2021, parties shall file and
serve as set forth in paragraph 1 information concerning
surrebuttal witnesses and copies of surrebuttal exhibits.

Parties that wish to offer in evidence documents on file
with the Board, public documents, or records in other
proceedings before the Board, or wish the Board to take
official notice of facts, shall comply with, respectively,
1 Pa. Code § 35.164, § 35.165, § 35.167 or § 35.173.
Whenever these rules require production of a document
as an exhibit, five copies shall be provided for Board use
and one copy shall be provided to each interested party.

Requests by parties for Board staff to provide data
pertinent to the hearing shall be made in writing directed
to chardbarge@pa.gov and received in the Board office by
2 p.m. on August 12, 2021.

The filing address for the Board is Milk Marketing
Board, Room 110, Agriculture Building, 2301 North Cam-
eron Street, Harrisburg, PA 17110.

CAROL HARDBARGER,
Secretary

[Pa.B. Doc. No. 21-1149. Filed for public inspection July 16, 2021, 9:00 a.m.]

PENNSYLVANIA PUBLIC
UTILITY COMMISSION

Service of Notice of Motor Carrier Applications

The following temporary authority and/or permanent
authority applications for the right to render service as a
common carrier or contract carrier in this Commonwealth
have been filed with the Pennsylvania Public Utility
Commission (Commission). Formal protests, petitions to
intervene and answers must be filed in accordance with
52 Pa. Code (relating to public utilities) on or before
August 2, 2021. Filings must be made electronically
through eFiling to the Secretary of the Pennsylvania
Public Utility Commission, 400 North Street, Harrisburg,

PA 17120, with a copy served on the applicant by August
2, 2021. In accordance with the Commission’s Emergency
Order at M-2020-3019262, all parties participating in
matters pending before the Commission are required to
eFile their submissions by opening an eFiling account and
accepting eService. Individuals can sign up for a free
eFiling account with the Secretary of the Commission
through the Commission’s eFiling system at https://www.
puc.pa.gov/efiling/Default.aspx. A protest shall indicate
whether it applies to the temporary authority application,
the permanent authority application, or both. Protests
may only be filed if there is evidence that the applicant
lacks fitness. Protests based on endangering or impairing
operations of an existing carrier will not be honored. The
documents filed in support of the application are only
available for inspection through the Commission’s web
site at www.puc.pa.gov by searching under the previously
listed docket number or by searching the applicant’s web
site.

Applications of the following for approval to begin
operating as common carriers for transportation
of persons as described under each application.

A-2021-3026890. Penn Home Health Care, LLC (405
Avenue of the States, Chester, Delaware County, PA
19013) in paratransit service, from points in Delaware
County, and the City and County of Philadelphia, to
points in the Counties of Berks, Bucks, Chester and
Montgomery, and return.

A-2021-3026941. Braden Scott Kennedy, t/a Here-2-
There Taxi (137 West 3rd Street, Oil City, Venango
County, PA 16301) for the right to begin to transport, as a
common carrier, by motor vehicle, persons in airport
transfer service, from points in Venango County to Pitts-
burgh International Airport and Erie International Air-
port, and vice versa.

Application of the following for approval of the
beginning of the exercise of the right and privi-
lege of operating motor vehicles as common carri-
ers for the transportation of household goods as
described under the application.

A-2021-3026824. Remarkable Solutions, Inc. (1650
Market Street, Suite # 3600, Philadelphia, Philadelphia
County, PA 19103) for the right to begin to transport, as a
common carrier, by motor vehicle, household goods in use,
between points in Pennsylvania.

Applications of the following for the approval of the
right and privilege to discontinue/abandon oper-
ating as common carriers by motor vehicle and
for cancellation of the certificate of public conve-
nience as described under each application.

A-2020-3021186. Kate’s Karriage, LLC (25 Skyview
Drive, Honey Brook, Lancaster County, PA 19344) for the
discontinuance and cancellation of the right to transport,
as a common carrier, by motor vehicle, persons in
paratransit service, limited to persons whose personal
convictions prevent them from owning or operating motor
vehicles, from points in the Counties of Berks and
Lancaster, and that portion of the County of Chester west
of Route 841 beginning at the Pennsylvania-Maryland
border and continuing north along Route 841 to the
intersection with Route 82, then west of Route 82 extend-
ing north to Elverson, PA, to points in Pennsylvania, and
return, as originally docketed at Docket A-2017-2626235.

A-2021-3026801. Fun Time Travel, Inc. (108 Elmwood
Road, Lancaster, Lancaster County, PA 17602) for the
discontinuance and cancellation of the right and privilege
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to operate as a broker, to arrange for the transportation
of persons, between points in Pennsylvania, as originally
docketed at Docket A-00120065.

A-2021-3026821. Best Limousine Company, Inc.
(3070 Bristol Pike, Building I, Suite 100-B, Bensalem,
Bucks County, PA 19020) for the discontinuance and
cancellation of the right to transport, by motor vehicle,
persons, in airport transfer service, from points in the
Counties of Bucks and Montgomery, to the North Phila-
delphia Airport located in the City and County of Phila-
delphia, and the Philadelphia International Airport lo-
cated in the City and County of Philadelphia and the
Township of Tinicum, Delaware County, subject to the
following condition: That no right, power or privilege is
granted to provide service from points in Lower Merion
Township, Montgomery County, as originally docketed at
Dockets A-00105095, F.2, Am-A, Am-B, Am-C and Am-D.

A-2021-3026871. Lifestar Response of Maryland,
Inc. (3710 Commerce Drive, Suite 1006, Baltimore, MD
21227) discontinuance of service and cancellation of its
certificate to transport as a common carrier, by motor
vehicle, persons, in paratransit service, between points in
the City and County of Philadelphia, and the County of
Delaware.

A-2021-3026876. Baughman Transport & Hauling,
LLC (1000 Georgetown Road, Paradise, PA 17562) discon-
tinuance of service and cancellation of its certificate—to
transport, as a common carrier, by motor vehicle, persons
in paratransit service, limited to persons whose personal
convictions prevent them from owning or operating motor
vehicles, from points in Lancaster County, to points in
Pennsylvania, and return.

ROSEMARY CHIAVETTA,
Secretary

[Pa.B. Doc. No. 21-1150. Filed for public inspection July 16, 2021, 9:00 a.m.]

PENNSYLVANIA PUBLIC
UTILITY COMMISSION

Service of Notice of Motor Carrier Formal Com-
plaints

Formal complaints have been issued by the Pennsylva-
nia Public Utility Commission. Answers must be filed in
accordance with 52 Pa. Code (relating to public utilities).
Answers are due August 2, 2021, and must be made with
the Secretary, Pennsylvania Public Utility Commission,
400 North Street, Harrisburg, PA 17120, with a copy to
the First Deputy Chief Prosecutor, Pennsylvania Public
Utility Commission.

Pennsylvania Public Utility Commission; Bureau of
Investigation and Enforcement v. Cranberry Taxi,

Inc., t/a Veterans Taxi, t/a Veteran’s Taxi and
Cranberry-X; Docket No. C-2021-3025964

COMPLAINT

The Pennsylvania Public Utility Commission (Commis-
sion) is a duly constituted agency of the Commonwealth
of Pennsylvania empowered to regulate public utilities
within the Commonwealth. The Commission has del-
egated its authority to initiate proceedings which are
prosecutory in nature to the Bureau of Investigation and

Enforcement and other bureaus with enforcement respon-
sibilities. Pursuant to that delegated authority and Sec-
tion 701 of the Public Utility Code, the Bureau of
Investigation and Enforcement hereby represents as fol-
lows:

1. That all authority issued to Cranberry Taxi, Inc., t/a
Veterans Taxi, t/a Veteran’s Taxi and Cranberry-X, (re-
spondent) is under suspension effective May 10, 2021 for
failure to maintain evidence of insurance on file with this
Commission.

2. That respondent maintains a principal place of
business at 8541 Peters Road Unit 2, Cranberry Town-
ship, PA 16066.

3. That respondent was issued a Certificate of Public
Convenience by this Commission on December 08, 2003,
at A-00119935.

4. That respondent has failed to maintain evidence of
Liability insurance on file with this Commission. The
Bureau of Investigation and Enforcement’s proposed civil
penalty for this violation is $500.00 and cancellation of
the Certificate of Public Convenience.

5. That respondent, by failing to maintain evidence
of insurance on file with this Commission, violated
66 Pa.C.S. § 512, 52 Pa. Code § 32.2(c), and 52 Pa. Code
§ 32.11(a), § 32.12(a) or § 32.13(a).

Wherefore, unless respondent pays the penalty of
$500.00 or files an answer in compliance with the at-
tached notice and/or causes its insurer to file evidence of
insurance with this Commission within twenty (20) days
of the date of service of this Complaint, the Bureau of
Investigation and Enforcement will request that the
Commission issue an Order which (1) cancels the Certifi-
cate of Public Convenience held by respondent at
A-00119935 for failure to maintain evidence of current
insurance on file with the Commission, (2) fines Respon-
dent the sum of five hundred dollars ($500.00) for the
illegal activity described in this Complaint, (3) orders
such other remedy as the Commission may deem to be
appropriate, which may include the suspension of a
vehicle registration and (4) imposes an additional fine on
the respondent should cancellation occur.

Respectfully submitted,
Andrew Turriziani
Chief of Motor Carrier Enforcement
Bureau of Investigation and Enforcement
400 North Street
Harrisburg, PA 17120

VERIFICATION
I, Andrew Turriziani, Chief of Motor Carrier Enforce-

ment, Bureau of Investigation and Enforcement, hereby
state that the facts above set forth are true and correct to
the best of my knowledge, information and belief and that
I expect that the Bureau will be able to prove same at
any hearing held in this matter. I understand that the
statements herein are made subject to the penalties of
18 Pa.C.S. § 4904 relating to unsworn falsification to
authorities.
Date: May 24, 2021

Andrew Turriziani
Chief of Motor Carrier Enforce-

ment
Bureau of Investigation and En-

forcement
NOTICE

A. You must file an Answer within 20 days of the date
of service of this Complaint. The date of service is the
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mailing date as indicated at the top of the Secretarial
Letter. See 52 Pa. Code § 1.56(a). The Answer must raise
all factual and legal arguments that you wish to claim in
your defense, include the docket number of this Com-
plaint, and be verified. You may file your Answer by
mailing an original to:

Rosemary Chiavetta, Secretary
Pennsylvania Public Utility Commission
400 North Street
Harrisburg, PA 17120

Or, you may eFile your Answer using the Commission’s
website at www.puc.pa.gov. The link to eFiling is located
under the Filing & Resources tab on the homepage. If
your Answer is 250 pages or less, you are not required to
file a paper copy. If your Answer exceeds 250 pages, you
must file a paper copy with the Secretary’s Bureau.

Additionally, a copy should either be mailed to:

Michael L. Swindler, Deputy Chief Prosecutor
Pennsylvania Public Utility Commission
Bureau of Investigation and Enforcement
400 North Street
Harrisburg, PA 17120

Or, emailed to Mr. Swindler at: RA-PCCmplntResp@pa.gov

B. If you fail to answer this Complaint within 20 days,
the Bureau of Investigation and Enforcement will request
that the Commission issue an Order imposing the pen-
alty.

C. You may elect not to contest this Complaint by
causing your insurer to file proper evidence of current
insurance in accordance with the Commission’s regula-
tions and by paying the fine proposed in this Complaint
by certified check or money order within twenty (20) days
of the date of service of this Complaint. Accord certificates
of insurance and faxed form Es and Hs are unacceptable
as evidence of insurance.

The proof of insurance must be filed with the:

Compliance Office, Bureau of Technical Utility
Services

Pennsylvania Public Utility Commission
400 North Street
Harrisburg, PA 17120

Payment of the fine must be made to the Common-
wealth of Pennsylvania and should be forwarded to:

Rosemary Chiavetta, Secretary
Pennsylvania Public Utility Commission
400 North Street
Harrisburg, PA 17120

Your payment is an admission that you committed the
alleged violation and an agreement to cease and desist
from further violations. Upon receipt of the evidence of
insurance from your insurer, and upon receipt of your
payment, the Complaint proceeding shall be closed.

D. If you file an Answer which either admits or fails to
deny the allegations of the Complaint, the Bureau of
Investigation and Enforcement will request the Commis-
sion to issue an Order imposing the penalty set forth in
this Complaint.

E. If you file an Answer which contests the Complaint,
the matter will be assigned to an Administrative Law
Judge for hearing and decision. The Judge is not bound
by the penalty set forth in the Complaint, and may
impose additional and/or alternative penalties as appro-
priate.

F. If you are a corporation, you must be represented by
legal counsel. 52 Pa. Code § 1.21.

Alternative formats of this material are available for
persons with disabilities by contacting the Commission’s
ADA Coordinator at 717-787-8714. Do not call this num-
ber if you have questions as to why you received this
complaint. For those questions you may call 717-783-
3847.

ROSEMARY CHIAVETTA,
Secretary

[Pa.B. Doc. No. 21-1151. Filed for public inspection July 16, 2021, 9:00 a.m.]

PHILADELPHIA
PARKING AUTHORITY

Service of Notice of Motor Carrier Applications in
the City of Philadelphia

The following permanent authority applications to ren-
der service as common carriers in the City of Philadelphia
have been filed with the Philadelphia Parking Authority’s
(PPA) Taxicab and Limousine Division (TLD). Formal
protests must be filed in accordance with 52 Pa. Code
Part II (relating to Philadelphia Parking Authority) with
the TLD’s Office of the Clerk, 2415 South Swanson
Street, Philadelphia, PA 19148, no later than August 2,
2021. The nonrefundable protest filing fee is $5,000
payable to the PPA by certified check or money order. The
applications are available for inspection at the TLD
between 9 a.m. and 4 p.m., Monday through Friday
(contact TLD Director Christine Kirlin, Esq. at (215)
683-9653 to make an appointment) or may be inspected
at the business addresses of the respective applicants or
attorneys, or both.

Doc. No. A-21-06-05. Chatgao Transportation, Inc.
(162 Copley Road, Upper Darby, PA 19082): An applica-
tion for a medallion taxicab certificate of public conve-
nience (CPC) to transport, as a common carrier, persons
in taxicab service between points within the City of
Philadelphia and from points in the City of Philadelphia
to points in Pennsylvania, and return.

Doc. No. A-21-06-06. Syma Transportation, Inc.
(22 South Fairview Avenue, Upper Darby, PA 19082): An
application for a medallion taxicab CPC to transport, as a
common carrier, persons in taxicab service between points
within the City of Philadelphia and from points in the
City of Philadelphia to points in Pennsylvania, and
return.

Doc. No. A-21-07-01. Diakite Cab, LLC (2552 South
Carroll Street, Philadelphia, PA 19142): An application for
a medallion taxicab CPC to transport, as a common
carrier, persons in taxicab service between points within
the City of Philadelphia and from points in the City of
Philadelphia to points in Pennsylvania, and return. Attor-
ney for Applicant: David R. Alperstein, Esq., 314 Cherry
Avenue, Voorhees, NJ 08043.

Doc. No. A-21-07-02. Sonink Cab, LLC (1345 Far-
rington Road, Philadelphia, PA 19151): An application for
a medallion taxicab CPC to transport, as a common
carrier, persons in taxicab service between points within
the City of Philadelphia and from points in the City of
Philadelphia to points in Pennsylvania, and return. Attor-
ney for Applicant: David R. Alperstein, Esq., 314 Cherry
Avenue, Voorhees, NJ 08043.
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Doc. No. A-21-07-03. Aras Taxi, LLC (3201 Welling-
ton Street, Philadelphia, PA 19149): An application for a
medallion taxicab CPC to transport, as a common carrier,
persons in taxicab service between points within the City
of Philadelphia and from points in the City of Philadel-
phia to points in Pennsylvania, and return. Attorney for
Applicant: David R. Alperstein, Esq., 314 Cherry Avenue,
Voorhees, NJ 08043.

SCOTT PETRI,
Executive Director

[Pa.B. Doc. No. 21-1152. Filed for public inspection July 16, 2021, 9:00 a.m.]

PHILADELPHIA
PARKING AUTHORITY

Taxicab and Limousine Division Fee Schedule for
the 2022 Fiscal Year Beginning July 1, 2021

All Fees are Non-Refundable

Fee Description Fee
Limousine Replacement Registration Sticker $50
Dispatcher Change in Name or Markings
Scheme Application Fee

$350

Duplicate Driver Certificate Replacement Fee $25
New or Renewal of Driver Certificate Fee (per
designation: Taxicab or Limousine)**

$25.75

Driver Training $100
Individual Medallion or CPC
Ownership/Securities Transfer Fee

$2,000

New and Annual Renewal Broker Registration
Fee

$1,200

New Dispatcher Certificate of Public
Convenience Application Fee

$7,500

New Limousine Certificate of Public
Convenience Application Fee for One Class of
Service

$7,500

Application Fee for Each Additional
Classification for Limousine Service for New
Applicants for Any Limousine Service

$1,500

Application Fee for Each Additional Limousine
Certificate of Public Convenience for One
Class of Service by a Current Limousine
Certificate Holder

$3,000

Transportation Network Company License
Application Fee

$50,000

Protest Fee $5,000
Petition Filing Fee $250
New Car and Replacement Vehicle Transfer $100
Age or Mileage Compliance Inspection Fee $100
PPA Compliance Inspection Fee (Taxicab,
Limousine or TNC)

$25

PA State Inspection Fee (Taxicab, Limousine
or TNC)

$50

Emission Inspection Waiver Fee $100
Inspection Rescheduling Fee $100

Fee Description Fee
Administrative Hearing Fee (upon
determination of liability)

$75

Check Declined for Payment $100
Voluntary Suspension Application (CPC-1) Fee $75
Stand-By Vehicle Fleet Owner Application $250

**Subject to increase on January 1, 2022, under the
percentage annual increase in the gross domestic product
price index from the amount determined on or after
January 1, 2021.

SCOTT PETRI,
Executive Director

[Pa.B. Doc. No. 21-1153. Filed for public inspection July 16, 2021, 9:00 a.m.]

STATE TAX EQUALIZATION BOARD
2020 Common Level Ratio

The State Tax Equalization Board (Board) has estab-
lished a Common Level Ratio (CLR) for each county in
this Commonwealth for the calendar year 2020. The
Board is governed by sections 1500—1521 of the Commu-
nity and Economic Development Enhancement Act (act)
(71 P.S. §§ 1709.1500—1709.1521).

The act requires the Board to use statistically accept-
able techniques, to make the methodology for computing
ratios public and to certify, prior to July 1, the ratio to
the Chief Assessor of each county annually.

The statistically acceptable technique which the Board
used for the 2020 CLR is to determine the arithmetic
median of the individual sales ratios for every valid sale
received from the county for the calendar year 2020.

The methodology used is to include every valid sale as
verified by the county assessor. The Board has defined
high and low limits by computing outliers based on an
interquartile range (IQR-factor of 3) to establish an upper
and lower boundary. This outlier trimming is based on
standards recommended by the International Association
of Assessing Officers. After the boundary limits are
defined, the Board has utilized the remaining valid sales,
rejecting those sales which exceed the limits. The result-
ing arithmetic median ratio is the ratio which the Board
is certifying as the CLR for each county for 2020.

The CLRs for 2020 are listed as follows.

2020 Common Level Ratios

County CLR
*Adams 96.3
*Allegheny 81.1
Armstrong 39.3
Beaver 16.5
*Bedford 76.4
*Berks 52.0
*Blair 93.2
Bradford 26.3
*Bucks 8.3
*Butler 7.9
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County CLR
*Cambria 17.6
Cameron 29.6
Carbon 30.0
Centre 23.3
*Chester 45.0
*Clarion 33.6
Clearfield 11.5
*Clinton 73.5
Columbia 19.3
Crawford 24.2
*Cumberland 88.0
*Dauphin 59.2
^*Delaware 49.4
Elk 27.2
*Erie 81.4
*Fayette 55.8
*Forest 14.8
*Franklin 10.6
*Fulton 30.4
*Greene 48.9
Huntingdon 17.5
*Indiana 98.4
*Jefferson 31.9
*Juniata 11.0
*Lackawanna (missing
September to December
sales)

9.2

*Lancaster 78.1
*Lawrence 69.2
*Lebanon 82.1
*Lehigh 72.7
*Luzerne 88.9
*Lycoming 61.0
*McKean 80.9
Mercer 15.4
Mifflin 30.5
*Monroe 76.6

County CLR
*Montgomery 44.7
*Montour 61.1
Northampton 25.0
*Northumberland 14.0
*Perry 82.8
*Philadelphia 93.2
Pike 14.9
*Potter 23.7
Schuylkill 32.1
*Snyder 13.3
Somerset 27.2
*Sullivan 58.4
Susquehanna 25.3
*Tioga 58.3
*Union 62.6
*Venango 73.0
Warren 20.7
*Washington 86.8
*Wayne 72.0
*Westmoreland 12.3
Wyoming 15.7
*York 75.5

*Counties with a predetermined assessment ratio of
100%

^Countywide Reassessment for 2021

Delaware County—use 100%

CLR’s are to be used in the appeal process only and not
used to set market value.

CLR factors can be found on the Department of Rev-
enue’s web site at https://www.revenue.pa.gov/TaxTypes/
RTT/Pages/Common%20Level%20Ratios.aspx.

PETER BARSZ,
Chairperson

[Pa.B. Doc. No. 21-1154. Filed for public inspection July 16, 2021, 9:00 a.m.]
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